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MINUTES OF THE REGULAR MEETING OF THE NAPLES CITY COUNCIL HELD IN THE PARKS &
RECREATION DEPARTMENT, NAPLES, FLORIDA, WEDNESDAY, MAY 17, 1978, AT 9:00 A.M.

?-- Present: R. B. Anderson, Mayor

C. C. Holland
James F. McGrath
Wade H. Schroeder
Randolph I. Thornton
Edward A. Twerdahl
Kenneth A. Wood

Councilmen

Also Present: George Patterson, City Manager
John Fletcher, City Attorney (arrived 10:05 a.m.)
Bradley Estes, Assistant to the City Manager
Mark Wiltsie, Purchasing
John McCord, City Engineer
Anders Sandquist, Building & Zoning Official
Roger Barry, Planning Director

Reverend Richard Mapes
Robert Russell
Mr. A. Beran
Manley Baker
James Dennis Murphy
William E. Campbell
John Pistor
Roberto Suarez
Jim Spiniola

Ben Anderson
Paul f-iirschberger
Robert Boston
Walter Cooper
Dan Burglund
Mrs. R. W. Humphrey
Dorothy Grant
Charles Rhoades
Harry Davis

Sergio E. G.-Montes
William Shearston
Ted Smallwood
Harry Rothchild

• Clayton Bigg
Ron Hogue
Ocy Richardson
Clare Rigby
Merlyn Almack
Sy Green
John Rouse
Robert McCauley

r--



a U

News Media: David Swartzlander, Naples Daily News
Allen Bartlett, Ft. Myers News Press
Mike Johnson, TV-9
Jerry. Pugh, TV-9
Dave Crawley, TV-9
Tom Martino, WBBH-TV
Susanne McGee, Naples Star
Kent Weissinger, WRGI
Bella English, Miami Herald
John Runde, WEVU-TV

Other interested citizens aiid visitors.

Mayor Anderson called the meeting to order; whereupon Reverend Richard Mapes
of the United Church of Naples gave the Invocation, followed by the Pledge of
Allegiance to the Flag.

AGENDA ITEM 3. Approval of Minutes.

Mayor Anderson called Council's attention to minutes of Council Workshop
Meeting, February 14, 1978; Briefing Session, February 24, 1978; Briefing Session,
February 26, 1978; Council Workshop Meeting, February 28, 1978; Briefing Session,
March 7, 1978; Aviation Committee Presentation, March 7, 1978; Council Workshop
Meeting, March 14, 1978; Briefing Session, March 21, 1978; Council Workshop
Meeting, April 4, 1978; Council Workshop Meeting, April 18, 1978; and Council
Workshop Meeting, May 2, 1978. Motion was made by Mr. McGrath to accept all
these minutes as presented, seconded by Mr. Schroeder and carried on voice vote

unanimously.

Mayor Anderson then called Council's attention to the minutes of the Regular f
Meeting of May 3, 1978. Motion was made by Mr. Thornton to accept these minutes
as presented, seconded by Mr. Schroeder and carried on voice vote, unanimously.

AGENDA ITEM 4 . Recommendation by Planning Advisory Board with
reference to newspaper vending machines. Requested by City Council.

At the request of Roberto Suarez of the Miami Herald, Council agreed to discuss
this matter after 10:30 a.m. at which time the legal representative of the Miami

Herald would be present to add his comments.

AGENDA ITEM 5. PUBLIC HEARINGS: Second Readings of ordinances.

AGENDA ITEM S--a. An ordinance amending the Charter of the City of
Naples, Florida, as amended, by repealing therefrom Section 2.7, entitled
"Ordinances; Effective Date" of Article 2; further, amending the Code
of Ordinances of the City of Naples, by repealing Section 1-7.1, relating
to procedures for the adoption of resolutions and ordinances; repealing
all ordinances and laws, or parts thereof, in conflict with the provi-
sions of Section 166.041, F.S., to the extent of such conflict; and
providing an effective date.

Mayor Anderson opened the Public Hearing at 9:20 a.m.; whereupon City Manager
Patterson read the above titled ordinance by title for Council's consideration on
Second Reading. Mr. Robert Russell suggested that the ordinance contain a stateme
concerning Council's intent to have the ordinances interpreted in layman's lanquag
within the ordinance itself. Mr. James Dennis Murphy spoke in opposition of the
ordinance. Mr. Harry Rothchild spoke supporting Mr. Russell's suggestion and also
made some technical objections. Mayor Anderson closed the Public Hearing at 9:41 a.m.
Mr. Tho rnton moved that further consideration of this agenda item be postponed until
the ar rival o f Mr. Fletcher, seconded byMr.. McGrath and carried unanimously by voice vol
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A GENDA ITEM 5-b . An ordinance amending the Code of Ordinances of the

y; F N 1es Florida h am ending the introductory paragraph (2) ofCit y L- f Y
Subsection (B) of Section 10-9, relating
service rates, by deleting therefrom the
Type I refuse container service will not
apartments served is less than twelve li
effective date.

to garbage and refuse container
provision that garbage and
be provided if the number of

ving units; and providing an
I

Mayor Anderson opened the Public Hearing at 9:45 a.m.; whereupon City Manager
Patterson read the above titled ordinance by title for Council's consideration on
Second Reading. There being no one to speak for or against, the Mayor closed the
Public Hearing at 9:46 a.m. Mr. Thornton moved adoption of Ordinance 2969 on Second
Reading, seconded by Mr. McGrath , and carried on roll call vote, 7-0.

AGENDA ITEM 5-c. An ordinance amending the budget for the fiscal
year 1977-78 to provide an appropriation for capital improvements to
the City's water system to be funded from proceeds of the sale of
Water-Sewer Revenue bonds and from revenues derived from the Water
system and the water system development charge; and providing an
effective date.

• Mayor Anderson opened the Public Hearing at 9:47 a.m.; whereupon City Manager
Patterson read the above captioned ordinance by title for consideration by Council
on Second Reading. There being no one to speak for or against, the Mayor closed

• the Public Hearing at 9:48 a.m. Mr. Thornton moved adoption of Ordinance 2970 on

Second Reading, seconded b Mr. Holland and carried on roll call vote, 7-0.

A GENDA ITEM 5-d . An ordinance amending the Code of Ordinances of the
City of Naples, Florida, by amending Section 8-22 thereof, relating
to adoption of the National Electrical Code, providing for the adoption
of the National Electrical Code, 1973 edition; and providing an

effective date.

Mayor Anderson opened the Public Hearing at 9:49 a.m.; whereupon City Manager
Patterson read the above titled ordinance by title for consideration by Council on
Second Reading. There being no one to speak for or against, the Mayor closed the

Public Hearing at 9:50 a.m. Mr. Thornton moved adoption of Ordinance 2971 on Second

Reading, seconded by Mr. McGrath and carried on roll call vote, 7-0.

AGENDA ITEM 5-e . An ordinance authorizing expansion of a previously
approved special exception for extension of a four foot high chain
link fence in the required front yard at 3131 Fort Charles Drive,
Naples, Florida, more particularly described herein, subject to the
condition set forth herein; and providing an effective date.

Mayor Anderson opened the Public Hearing at 9:51 a.m.; whereupon City Manager
Patterson read the above captioned ordinance for consideration by Council on Second

Reading. There being no one to speak for or against, the Mayor closed the Public

Hearing at 9:52 a.m. Mr. Thornton moved adoption of Ordinance 2972 on Second

Reading, second ed by Mr. McGrath. After a brief discussion by Council, motion was
carried on roll call vote, 5-2, with Mr. Holland and Mr. Schroeder voting no.

AGENDA ITEM 6 . BID AWARD: East Golden Gate Raw Water Transmission

Main, Parts I, II and III.

City Manager Patterson read the below titled resolution in its entirety for

Council's consideration.

A RESOLUTION AWARDING BID FOR CONSTRUCTION OF TIIE EAST GOLDEN GATE RAW
WATER TRANSMISSION MAIN, PARTS I, II AND III; AND AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR
AND CITY CLERK TO EXECUTE A CONTRACT THEREFOR.,

- 3 -



152

Ted Smallwood spoke regarding Black, Crow and Eidsness' analysis of the bids

and their recommendation as per his letter of May 8, 1978 (Attachment #1).
Mr. Walter Cooper addressed Council noting the points made in a letter from United
States Pipe and Foundry Company (Attachment #2). Mr. Thornton moved approval of

Resolution 2973, seconded by Mr. S chroeder and carried on roll call vote, 7-0.

Let the record show that City Attorney Fletcher arrived at 10:05 a.m.

Mr. Holland moved that Agenda Item 31 be taken up at this time, seconded
Mr. McGrath and carried on voice vote unanimously.

AGENDA ITEM 31 . Action on professional services contract with
reference to the Naples Landing project. Requested by City Manager.

Mayor Anderson ascertained that Sergio E. G.-Montes was duly authorized to represent
Stanley W. Hole & Associates at this time. After negotiations, Mr. Montes and Council
arrived at a fixed total fee of $15,000 for Stanley W. Hole & Associates to provide
design service and construction administration services. City Attorney Fletcher
read the below titled resolution in its entirety for consideration by Council.

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR AND CITY CLERK TO EXECUTE A CONTRACT WITH
THE FIRM HEREINAFTER NAMED TO PERFORM PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RELATIVE TO THE
NAPLES LANDING PROJECT; AND PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

Mr. Schroeder moved approval of Resolution 2974 authorizing a contract w ith S
Stanley W. Hole & Associates for $15,000 fixed total fee, seconded by Mr. Wood and
carried on roll call vote 6-1, with Mr. Twerdahl voting no.

Let the record show that Mayor Anderson called a break at 10:45 a.m.

Council reconvened at 11:00 a.m.

RETURN TO AGENDA ITEM 4.

Mr. Jim Spiniola, legal counsel for the Miami Herald, commented on the May 8th
memorandum from Roger Barry, Planning Director (Attachment #3) and noted his feeling
that there was a constitutional right to distribute newspapers and he indicated a
reluctance to comply with the suggestions in the proposed agreement. Mayor Anderson
defended the work of the staff and the voluntary agreement.. Mr.. Schroeder stated
his feeling that the ordinances should be enforced or changed. Mr. Barry was directed
to proceed with the agreement.

RETURN TO AGENDA ITEM 5a.

Mr. Rothchild again presented his technical questions to this ordinance to
which City Attorney Fletcher responded. After discussion, Mr. Fletcher suggested
the addition of another Section 5, "Each ordinance shall contain as part of its titer,
a brief introductory paragraph explaining in simple terms its intent". Mr. Schroeder
moved adoption of Ordinance 2975 as amended, on Secon d Reading, seconded by
Mr. Thornton and carried on roll call vote, 7-0.
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AG ENDA ITEM 7 . An ordinance amending Chapter 8 of the Code of
Ordinances of the City of Naples, Florida, by amending Section 8-3
thereof, relating to amendments to the Standard Building Code, by
adding a new Paragraph (c) to Section 105.2 of the Standard Building
Code, 1976 edition, requiring a time schedule prior to issuance of a
building permit for construction which will exceed eighteen months;
further, by amending Section 8.5 thereof, providing a time limitation
on building permits; and providing an effective date. ( Action deferred
from Regular Meeting of April 19, 1978.)

City Manager . Patterson noted that the sale of the Towers had not yet been
recorded and he recommended removing this item from the agenda until such time
as it has been. - Mr. McGrath moved to remove this item from the agenda until
after the recordation of the sale of the Towers, seconded by Mr. Thornton
and carried on roll call vote, 7-0.

AGENDA ITEM 8. A resolution retaining the firm of Seyfarth, Shaw,
Fairweather & Geraldson to handle labor relations matters for the City
of Naples. Requested by City Council.

City Attorney Fletcher read the below captioned resolution by title for
Council's consideration.

A RESOLUTION RETAINING THE FIRM OF SEYFARTH, SHAW, FAIRWEATHER & GERALDSON
TO PROVIDE LEGAL ASSISTANCE TO THE CITY IN CARRYING OUT THE CITY'S RESPONSI-
BILITIES UNDER THE FLORIDA PUBLIC EMPLOYEES RELATIONS ACT; AND PROVIDING AN
EFFECTIVE DATE.

Mayor Anderson cited a letter from this law firm outlining their proposed
services and fees (Attachment 44). Mr. Thornton moved for approval of Resolution
2976, seconded by Mr. Schroeder and carried on roll call vote, 5-2, with Mr. Holland
and Mr. Wood voting no. Mr. Harry Rothchild and Mr. Charles Rhoades spoke briefly
against this resolution.

AGENDA ITEM 9. Discussion and action on request for taxi rate
increase. Deferred from City Council Workshop of February 28, 1978.

City Manager Patterson noted that Attorney Ron Hogue was present to speak
to this subject. Mr. Hogue, representing five of the six taxi cab companies in
town, spoke in favor of regulation of rate schedules, if an increase were allowed,
and regulat.i_ons on safety factors. Only one of his clients favored deregulation
of fares. Ocy Richardson, Yellow Cab Company, spoke in favor of regulation in
both areas, but requested a rate increase. City Manager Patterson was directed
to proceed in this matter using regulations in both rate structure and safety.

AGENDA ITEM 10. A resolution adopting a Civil Defense Plan for the
City of Naples. Requested by Fire Chief. - -

City Attorney Fletcher read the below titled resolution by title for considera-
tion by Council.

A RESOLUTION ADOPTING A CIVIL DEFENSE PLAN FOR THE CITY OF NAPLES, FLORIDA,
PURSUANT TO ORDINANCE NO. 2824, COPY OF WHICH IS ATTACHED HERETO AND MADE
A PART OF THIS RESOLUTION; AND PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

City Manager Patterson reported that as per the discussion at the Workshop
May 16, 1978, the National Guard had been contacted and will work cooperatively
on the Plan after the Plan has been approved by the State. Mr. Twerdahl moved to
approve Resolution 2977, seconded by Mr. McGrath and carried on roll call vote, 7-0.
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AGENDA ITEM 11 . An ordinance amending the Code of Ordinances of

the City of Naples, Florida, by amending Paragraph (2) of Subsection

( a) of Section 8-1, relating to adoption of the Standard Building
Code, providing for the adoption by reference of the 1977 and 1978
revisions to the 1976 edition of the Standard Building Code, together
with Appendix "J" thereof; and providing an effective date. ( First

Reading) Requested by Building & Zoning Administrator.

City Attorney Fletcher read the above titled ordinance by title for Council's

consideraton on First Reading. Mr. Thornton moved a proval of this ordinance on

First Reading, seconded by Mr. McGrath and carried on roll call vote, 7-0.

AGENDA ITEM 12 . An ordinance amending the Code of Ordinances of

the City of Naples, Florida, as amended, by adding a new paragraph
to Section 8-91, relating to the adoption of the Standard Mechanical
Code, providing for the adoption by reference of the 1977 and the
1978 revisions to the 1976 edition of the Standard Mechanical Code;

and providing an effective date. (First Reading) Requested by

Building & Zoning Administrator.

City Attorney read the above captioned ordinance by title for Council's
consideration on First Reading. •Mr. Thornton moved approval of this ordinance on

First Reading, seconded by Mr. McGrath 
and carried on roll call vote, 7-0.

AGENDA ITEM 13 . An ordinance amending the Code of Ordinances of the

City of Naples, Florida, by adding a new paragraph to Section 5--31,
relating to adoption of the Standard Plumbing Code, providing for the
adoption by reference of the 1976, 1977 and 1978 revisions to the 1975
edition of the Standard Plumbing Code; and providing an effective dat

( First Reading) Requested by Building & Zoning Administrator. -

City Attorney Fletcher read the above captioned ordinance by title for consideration

by Council on First Reading. Mr. Thornton moved for a oroval of this ordinance on

First Reading, seconded by Mr. McGrath and carried on roll call vote, 7-0.

AGENDA ITEM 14 . An ordinance amending the Code of Ordinances of the

City of Naples, Florida, by repealing therefrom Section 19-9, relating
to the planting of shrubbery, trees and other plants in dedicated

easements, and substituti
ng a new Section 19-9 therefor, requiring a

permit prior to the planting or replanting of sod, shrubbery, trees and

other plants within rights-of-
way of any street or road within the City

and establishing a fee therefor; providing for the removal of plantings

which have been installed in violation of this ordinanc
e and plantings

which obstruct ingress and egress over dedicated easements; providing
a penalty for violation of the provisions of this ordinance; and

providing an effective date. ( First Reading) Requeste
d by Public

works Director.

City Attorney Fletcher read the above referenced ordinance by' title for Council's
consideration on First Reading. City Engineer John McCord cited the reasons for the
need for this type of ordinance. Mayor Anderson suggested requesting some input on

this matter from some of the civic associatio
ns around Naples. Mr. Thornton moved for

approval of this ordinance on First Reading, seconded by Mr. EIolland 
and carried on

roll call vote, 6-1, with Mr. McGrath voting no.

AGENDA ITEM 15 . An ordinance authorizing the City Manager to advert
and accept bids for the furnishing of certain equipment set forth he
in, providing that payment therefor shall be made from the budget for
the fiscal year 1978-79, pursuant to Section 8.14 of the Charter, and

providing an effective date. ( First Reading) Requested by City

Manager.
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City Attorney Fletcher read the above referenced ordinance by title for considera-
tion by Council on First Reading. Mr. Thorn ton moved approval of this ordinance on
First Reading, seconded by Mr. Holland and carried on roll call vote, 7-0. City
Attorney suggested that this be read in its entirety on Second Reading.

AGENDA ITEM 16 . An ordinance granting a Special Exception to
construct an 8 foot 4 inch high masonry wall in the required front
yard on Lot 39, Kingstown Drive Section of Port Royal, and providing
an effective date. ( First Reading)

City Attorney Fletcher read the above titled ordinance by title for considera-
by Council on First Reading. Mr. Thornton moved for adoption of this ordinance on
First Reading, seconded by Mr. Holland and carried on roll call vote, 7-0.

AGENDA ITE M 17 . A resolution appointing two members to the Naples
Planning Advisory Board. Requested by City Council.

City Attorney Fletcher read the below titled resolution in its entirety for
Council's consideration.

A RESOLUTION APPOINTING TWO MEMBERS TO THE PLANNING ADVISORY BOARD FOR A
TERM OF THREE YEARS EACH; AND PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

Mr. Holland moved to approve Resolution 2978_ appointing Clayton Bigg and
Donald Boyes to the Planning Advisory Board for a term of three years each, seconded_
by Mr. McGrath and carried on roll call vote, 7-0.

AGENDA ITEM 18 . A resolution reappointing the civilian member to
the Board of Trustees of the City of Naples Police Officers'
Retirement Trust Fund. Requested by Councilman Thornton.

Mr. Thornton nominated Alden C. Smith to be reappointed as the resilient
member of the Board of Trustees of the City of Naples Police Officers' • Retirement
Fund, seconded by Mr. Holland. City Attorney Fletcher read the below captioned
resolution in its entirety for consideration by Council.

A RESOLUTION APPOINTING A CITY RESIDENT TO THE BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF THE
CITY OF NAPLES POLICE OFFICERS RETIREMENT TRUST FUND FOR A TERM OF TWO
YEARS; AND PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

Mr. Thornton moved__approva l of Resolution 2979 appointing Alden C. Smith to serve
on this Board, seconded by Mr. McGrath and carried on roll call vote, 7-0.

AGENDA ITEM 19. A resolution supporting a proposed bill to exclude
applications and interviews for governmental employment from the
provisions of Florida's Government in the Sunshine Law; and directing
that copies of this resolution be forwarded to the Collier County
legislative delegation. Requested by Councilman Schroeder.

After discussion of the above titled resolution, Mr. Schroeder moved approval
of Resolution 2980, seconded by Mr. Twerdahl and carried on roll call vote, 6-1
with Mr. Holland voting no.

AGENDA ITEM 20 . Request for subdivision approval of Half Moon Lake
Addition, Port Royal, by Wilson, Miller, Barton, Soil & Peek, Inc.,
Engineers.

City Attorney Fletcher read the below titled resolution by title for Council's
consideration.
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A RESOLUTION APPROVING THE RECORD PLAT FOR HALF MOON LAKE ADDITION OF PORT
ROYAL, A COPY OF WIIICH IS ATTACHED HERETO AND MADE A PART OF THIS RESOLUTION;
AND PROVIDING FOR AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

Mr. Twerdahl moved adoption of Resolution 2981, seconded by Mr. Schroeder
and carried on roll call vote, 7-0.

AGENDA ITEM 21 . Request by Tom Abbott, Inc., for Council approval
of application to construct approximately 210 linear feet of vertical
concrete seawall at Lot 16, Block 3, Aqualane Shores, Unit 1 (745 -
16th Avenue South) and that the Department of Environmental Regulation
report be read into the record of this meeting. Owners: M.J. Hallisey
and F.T. Heinemann. ( D.E.R. File No. 11-13-1086-5E)

City Engineer McCord and City Manager Patterson explained that under the City's
existing ordinance the only requirement was that the Department of Environmental
Regulation's environmental impact statement be read into the record; whereupon
City Attorney Fletcher read the statement into the record (Attachment #5). Robert
McCauley, representing Abbott, Inc., spoke in support of this sea wall. Mr. Holland
moved approval of the application subject to approvalby the Corps of Engineers and
Department of Environmental Regulation, seconded by Mr. Twerdahl and carried on T^
roll call vote, 7-0.

AGENDA ITEM 22 . Sanitary Sewer Service Application by Royal Park
Villas, Inc. - C. Rigley, President, R.C. Bruns, P.E., Agent.

Mr. Clare Rigby, President of Royal Park Villas, spoke in favor of this
application. City Engineer McCord stated that the service requested in the applica-
tion was not in conformance with the master plan of the City and could not be appr---ed
as proposed. City Manager Patterson stated that it was his understanding that the
was another approach to requesting this service that would comply with the master _
plan to which Mr. McCord outlined the steps that could be taken to conform with the
master plan. Mr. Thornton moved denial of this application at this time as per
staff recommendation, seconded by Mr. Schroeder and carried on roll call vote, 7-0.

AGENDA ITEM 23 . A resolution authorizing City Attorney David W.
Rynders to participate in the deferred compensation plan through the
International City Management Association Retirement Corporation,
effective as of June 1, 1978; providing that he shall.be exempted
from participating in the retirement system of the City established
by Ordinance No. 1890; and providing an effective date. Requested
by . City Manager. -

City Attorney Fletcher read the above titled resolution by title for Council's
consideration. Mr. Thornton moved approval of Resolution 2982, seconded by Mr. McGrath
and carried on roll call vote, 7-0.

AGENDA ITEM 24. Action on industrial uniform service bid.

City Manager Patterson read the below titled resolution in its entirety for
consideration by Council.

A RESOLUTION REJECTING ALL BIDS RECEIVED FOR THE FURNISHING OF UNIFORMS
TO THE PUBLIC WORKS AND PARKS AND RF.CD.E_NTIQQR DEPARTMENTS, AND AUTHORIZING
EXTENSION OF THE AGREEMENT WITH THE EXISTING SUPPLIER FOR AN ADDITIONAL
PERIOD OF TWO YEARS IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS AND PROPOSAL
DATED JANUARY 22, 1976; AND PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE.
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Mr. Paul Hirschberger of Uniforms for Industry spoke in opposition of this
resolution inasmuch as his company was the low bidder for new uniforms. Mr. Sy Green,
General Manager of the American Uniform Company spoke in favor of the extension with
his company. Mr. Twerdahl moved approval of Resolution 2983, seconded by Mr. McGrath
and carried on roll call vote, 5-2, with Councilman Holland and Mayor Anderson voting no

Let the record show that Mr. Wood and Mayor Anderson were temporarily absent.

AGENDA ITEM 25 . . Bid award - furnishing of sod (annual bid).

City Attorney Fletcher read the below titled resolution by title for consideration

by Council.

A RESOLUTION AWARDING BIDS FOR THE FURNISHING OF THE CITY'S ANNUAL SOD
REQUIREMENTS; AND AUTHORIZING THE CITY MANAGER TO ISSUE PURCHASE ORDERS THEREFOR.

Discussion of this resolution determined that the information presented was

not complete; whereupon Mr . Thornton moved to removed this item from the Agenda

pending further information, seconded by Mr. Twer dahl and carried on roll call

vote, 5-0.

AGENDA ITEM 26 . Action on re-bid - 1-ton flat bed dump truck.

City Attorney Fletcher read the below titled resolution by title for Council's

consideration.

A RESOLUTION AWARDING BID FOR THE FURNISHING OF ONE 1-TON TRUCK FOR THE
WATER DISTRIBUTION DIVISION OF THE PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT; AND AUTHORIZING
THE CITY MANAGER TO EXECUTE PURCHASE ORDERS THEREFOR.

Let the record show that Mayor Anderson and Mr. Wood returned to Council Chambers.

After discussion of City Manager Patterson's memo of May 15, 1978 (Attachment #6),
Mr. Thornton moved approval of Resolution 2984 in accordance with the City Manager's

recommendation, seconded by Mr. Schroeder and carried on roll call vote, 5-2 with

Mr. Holland and Mr. Wood voting no.

Mayor Anderson requested the City Manager to try to set a price differential
in similar matters and to look into various interpretations of warranties.

AGENDA ITEM 27. A resolution amending the Position.Classification
and Salary Schedule for non-managerial employees of the City of Naples,
as adopted by Resolution No. 2702, in accordance with the attached
schedule; and providing an effective date. Requested by City Manager.

City Attorney Fletcher read the above titled resolution by title for Council's

consideration. Mr. Thornton moved approval of Resolution 2985, seconded

Mr. Schroeder . Mr. John Rouse, staff representative of the American Federation of
State, County and Municipal Employees commented on this matter. Motion carried on

roll call vote, 7-0.

Let the record show that Mr. Thornton left the meeting at 2:00 p.m.



AGENDA ITEM 28. A resolution amending the Position Classification

and Salary schedul
e for manageria

l and professional employe
es of the

City of Naples, as adopted by Resoluti
on No. 2722, in accordanc

e with

the attached schedule; and providing an effective date. Request
ed by

City Manager
. 	f

City Attorney Fletcher read the above titled resolution by title for considera-'^

tion by Council. After a brief discussion, Mr. 
McGrath moved for ado tion of

Resolution 2986, seconded by Mr. Holland and carried on roll call vote, 6-0

AGENDA ITEM 29 . A resolution amending Paragraph "J-01" of the

Personnel Rules and Regulations adopted by Resolution No. 2702, relating
to holidays for City employees, by adding a new Item (h) thereto pro-
viding for an additional holiday for City employees; and providing an

effective date. Requeste
d by City Manager.

Above titled resolution was amended and below titled resolution was read by

City Manager Patterson by title for Council's consideration.

A RESOLUTION AMENDING SECTION "J" OF THE PERSONNEL RULES AND REGULATIONS
ADOPTED BY RESOLUTION NO. 2702, RELATING TO HOLIDAYS FOR CITY EMPLOYEES,
PROVIDING FOR AN ADDITIONAL HOLIDAY WITH PAY FOR ELIGIBLE CITY EMPLOYEES;
ADDING A NEW PARAGRAPH "J-03" THERETO, PROVIDING FOR ADDITIONAL PAY OR
EQUIVALENT TIME OFF FOR HOLIDAYS FALLING ON REGULAR DAYS OFF; AND PROVIDING

AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

Mr. Twerdahl moved to approve Resolution 2987, seconded by Mr. Schroeder

and carried on roll call vote, 6-0.

AGENDA ITEM 30 .

establish a group
with the premium
effective date.

A resolution authorizing the City Manager to

life insurance plan for eligible City employees,
therefor to be paid by the City; and providing an

Requeste
d by City Manager.

City Attorney Fletcher read the above captioned resolution by title for Council's
consideration, noting that the amount to be filled in would be $10,000. After

discussion by Council, Mr. Holland moved approva
l of Resolution 2988 as amended to

include reference to optional insurance up to $5,000 available to eligible employees
at the employee s expense, seconded by Mr. McGrath and carried on roll call vote, 6-0.

*

Mayor Anderson asked that at this time Mr. Merlyn Almack be recognize
d to

address Council. Mr. Almack requeste
d that Council authoriz

e the Mayor to write

a letter to Senator Lawton Chiles indicating Naples City Council's support for

a Sheltered Workshop to be establish
ed in Collier County. Mr. Schroeder moved

appro
val of this reucuest, seconded by Mr. McGrath 

and carried on voice vote, 6-0.

CORRE SPONDE NCE & COM MUNICATIONS

T Discussion on the proposed distributio
n of the information on ordinances ensued

and consensus was that it should be available to the press in the office of the
i

City Clerk rather than mailing it late Friday afternoon prior to Council's meeting
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There being no further business to come before this Regular Meeting of the
Naples City Council, Mayor Anderson adjourned the meeting at 230 p.m.

^ r

R. B. Anderson, Mayor

2net L. Davis
City Clerk

Ellen P. Marshall'
Deputy City Clerk

These minutes of the Naples City Council approved on _ 7_ 7^

r

r
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AT'T'ACHMENT #1

, .
NAY n 1 373 1 1

Ck- LA/1 HILL
cllginceis
pL inners

ccOnolii.ists
Scientists

^^1ANA^^iCity of Naples
735 8th St.. South
Naples, rtorida

Attention: Mr. George Patterson, City Manager-

RE: East Golden Gate Raw Water Transmission Main, Parts I, II, & III

Gentlemen:

We have reviewed the bids as indicated on the attached bid tabulation form. It
is our recommendation that bids be awarded to the lowest responsible bidder,
Boyce Company, in the amount of $5, 969, 8Z4. 90, for the total bids submitted
for parts I, II, and III for the base bid.

We would request that a special Council meeting be called for the award of
the contract on this project, so as not to delay the completion of this project.

If you have any questions concerning this, please contact me.

ours ve ruly,

Ted IL Smallwood, P. E.

slt

attachment

4
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"East Golden Cato RAW Water Trnllsnita3ior Main, Parts I, II, and III"

CITY OF NAPLES AT.^ACI-IMENT #1 -page f3 , I
r tin'i, s, V1,01,IDA

Projct Mo. !Ii 30510.71 Dat,d March

DXD DATS3 2 MAY 1 9 70 - 2:00 P.H., EDT

TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
PART I PART I PART II PART II

Ii iDDERS BASE DID ALTERNATE RID BASE 11 1 0 ALTERN A TE D ID
ttar' y Pepper s Associates $ 1, 766, 770.07 $ 1, 868, 749. 77 $ 2, 067, 149.03 $ 2, 150, 238. 32 U

Louishourgk: Constr.,Ltd.^
yimont, 1.aVa 1 City, Can. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

tbaary Foundation Co.
Mla.af , f•'i, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Roas t' Contracting Co.,Inc.
Boy city, r 2, 429, 159. 00 No Bid 2, 670, 645 . 20 No Bid
Ir:man, Inc,
Pc ,ono Belch, Fr, Na Bid No Bid No Bid No Bi d
Wilson Coastal Enterprises
Lo^ii ta Sprintrs, FL No Bi d No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zar Coact:ucticn,Inc.
Ft. ,;yens, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
P.cgar J. Au & Sons
6:ans.' :eld, Ou No Bid No Bid No Bid • No Bid
Boyce Corpany 1,702, 954, 10 1, 765, 808. 50 . 1, 631, 526.98 1, 890, 594. 50
St. Petetshu srg , PL
P•su1 N. Howard Co.
Grcen_.tor:a, N C No Bid No Bid No B id No Bid
hzyznt Electric
t1ditland , [•L 1, 893,559.00 _ 1, 866, 626.00 2, 181, 357.00 2, 243, 116. 60

Southoat Onder7round
Conztr. No Bid 2, 349, 503.40 No Bid 2, 473, 567. 10

Cape Coral, FL

r. r
• AID f:.DT LATION

"East Golden Gate Fad Water Transmission Main, Parts I, II, and III"

• CITY OF NAPLES
NAPLES, FLORIDA

Project No. NA30510.71 1 Dated Marc

BID "DATE: 2 MAY 1978 - 2:00 P.M., EDT

TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
PART I PART I PART II PART II

BIDDERS BASE DID ALT F:II ATE BID BASE FED ALTEMATc BID
Southern CGnstruction & -

$Er,7inc^rin9 Co. $ No Bid No Bid $ No Bid No Bid
ifielech, FL _
Preston Carroll Constr.Co.
Clifton, TY 2,263,558.00 2, 352,643.40 2 49l 248.00 2 . 58t•244,00
Eoodruff S Sons
Eradenton, FL No Bid No Bid  No Bid_
Charles F. Smith S Son

_

Uhitehouse, FL r ;
E_N

No Bid No Bid
S & H Engircering &

Daveloprent Corp. No Bid No-Bid No Bid No Bid
tta 1es, FL
C.F.R. Ccastr. Co.,Inc.
Port Charlotte, i'L 2,271, 76.'50 No Bid 2,556,058.50 N B id



"Cost Golden Cato Itnw Water Trantmi-'Sion Main, Parts I, II, and III"

CITY or NAPLES ATTACIIM££3T #1^ page 3 I
td ISifi, FLORIDA

Pro r.ct NO. NA30510.71 ! — Datr(1 Marti

BID DATEi 2 MAY 197(1 - 2:0) P.M., EDT

TOTAL TOTAL TIN

TOTAL TOTAL PARTS I,r1 5 III PARTS I,I15III CO:TLi

PA1;T III PART III COMBINED COMBINED CALK

DIDDI:RS BASE BID PIT ERNATII BID BASS DID ALTEIrNATG 13ID n.

Harry Pcpper & Associates
2,451,849.17 g 7, 647, 765. 53 $ 6, 074 , 6z0. -56 $ 6, 111, 00;. 34

3 s tkso.iville, FL

Viroi
it, 

L 

v

l
Constr.

C

, , Ltd.

Vir.^nt, zVa i_tY , Can. N o Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Lksary foundation Co.

F;i is l , FL No B id No Bid No Bid No Bid _

ItCOS-c Contracting Co.,Inc.

P.a^r t Y , Lit 3j46, 662. 15 No Did No Bid No Bid

—,IntnSO, Inc.
Por.:r,a no Evach, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid —.
Nilson Coastal Entcrprisos

Bo nita Spri ngs, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid iD
y Oi Construction,Xnc. - `D

Ft. Myers, FL No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

Roger J. All & Sons
• 0

Mansfield, OIL No Rid No Bid No Bid No Bid ro —.

Boyce Co: 'pany
l^urq, FLst

. M2,442, 800.7 2, 601, 231. 17 5, 969, 824. 90 6, 236, 651.95
retPC.S .

Paul Ii. Howard Co. p

Greensboro, NC No Bid No Bid 6, 841, 828.20 6, 938, 439.00 

Bryant Electric

i
2, 997, 743.9 3, 206, 800.70 •7 ' 442, 784.50 7,382,426.50   

t land, FT.I4a
F< ----

SouthcasL Underground

Constr. No Bid 3,242,136. 90 No Bid 7,722,440.30
Cape Coral, FL

V

BID TABULATION

"East Golden Gate Raw Water Tranrnis'sion Main, Parts I, II, and III"

CITY OF NAPLES
NAPLES, FLORIDA

Project NO. NA30510.71 Dated .Tare,

BID DATE: 2 MAY 1979 - 2:00 P.M., EDT

TOTAL TOTALr TIME OF

TOTAL TOTAL PARTS I,I1511I PARTS 1,1151II CO:4PI,ETIO3i

PART III PART III COMBINED COMBINED CALENDAR

BIDDERS BASE BID ALTERNATE: BID BASE BID ALTERNATE BID DAYS

Southern Construction &
.

 Co. No Bid $ No Aid $ No Bid $ - No Bid

Hiaic.ih, FL
Preston Carroll Cor.str.Co.
Clifton, TN 3, 567, 303.85 3, 596, 724.70 No Bid No Bid t, —

l-oo ruff & Sons
Bradanton, FL

7 788 246.6 0	7,884,366.60 _r?2—R i { Iti Bidd n 
Ct,arles F. Smith & Son
11;itO)Ouse, Fl. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 

3 5 H En,ireering s 
Dovelo^:ent Corp. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Q

Iianles, FL - —•--
C.F.Tr. Constr. Co.,Xnc. -- 3, 379,489. 00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Port Charlotte, FI, ---

- 14 -
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ATTACHMENT #3
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735 EIGHTH STREET, SOUTH - NAPLES, F LOFUDA 33940

OFFICE OF THE CITY MANAGER MEMO

TO: HONORABLE MAYOR AND MEMBERS OF CITY COUNCIL

FROM: CITY MANAGER GEORGE M. PATTERSON

SUBJECT: ONE-TON TRUCK, FLAT-BED DUMP (RE-BID), BID NO. 78-16

DATE: MAY 15, 1978

The Purchasing Division of the Finance Department has
requested bids for a one-ton truck for the Water Distribution Division
of the Public Works Department. 

A Public Invitation to Bid was published in the Naples

Daily News on April loth and April 17, 1978. Twenty-one (21)
dealers were notified that bids were being accepted. Five (5)

b i ds were received on the item. The bids were opened and publicly

read on April 28, 1978.

We received a telephone call on May 10, 1978 that Sunshine

• Dodge could not meet our specifications and unles
obtain

they

 receivedk
a

	

	

received

Purchase Order by May 12, 1978, they could
specified from the factory. A letter tothat affect is forthcoming

from Sunshine Dodge. ----

The second low bid was submitted by Dick Courteau's G.M.C.
Truck Co. of Bradenton, Florida, who, due to an error on their last

• bid for this truck, this item required rebidding. Due to these
circumstances I would like to request that their. bid be rejected and
their firm's name deleted from the bid list due to their lack of

responsibility.

bid being eliminated, I wouldWith the first and second low g

recommend this vehicle be•purcha
sed from Ross Chevrolet, Inc. of

St. Petersburg, Florida, in the amount of $7,081.00. -

Attached are a
whom specifications were
Purchase order.

lao
Attachments

Bid. Tabulation and a list of dealers to
sent. Specification

s call for purchase by

Respectfully submitted,

Georg 1. Paterson,
City Manager

- 22 -
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CITY OF NAPLE
BID TABULATION

 DID N0. 78-16
ONE-TON SRUCK, FLAT BED DU. 42 (RE-BID)

BIDDER ONE-TON TRUCK LF•S5 DISCOUNT
FC55 U>fNe701.CP, It C.

NET RID Y£AR 6 MANIiFACTURflR ENG7!:E SIZE]I

2530 39Lh AlZe, Nor DF,LIVERy
St• r +i^, YL 3

.
713 7,081.00 --- 7,081.00 1978 350 CID.

Chrvtolet 165 H,P, 60-120
BILL B.QA+2•:;[ 42VIi0Lx.T

_
Days

fLC.
[-^in%cier at foalet _ 7,369.38 1978 750 crD

_ Myers, 67, 33901

___
7,369.38 Chevrolet 165 H.P, 65 Day

. RTL.fl7^; ppq-g
0035• U.S, 1

I rrri , Flodda8 6,873.94 6,873.94 1978 360 CID
Dadge 165 H.P. 70 Days

BU3 TAy
1DR oiEv c3FT,

1911 Fast 'nIR1'ai 8,322,00 1',182. 19741 350 CIDtames, F-(, 3794 2 7,139.457,1.39.45 Chevrolet 165 H.p, 60 Days
DICK C)'U1F0_•W'S G•M.C

.
- -

'7 W Co.
2509 9 th S. aksn 6,960.91 1978Br.YSr:trsn, Fr 33505 - 6,460.81 G. A7. C. 350 CID 60-90

160 A.P. Days


