
PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR NETWORK AND DATA PROTECTION/DATA STORAGE SOLUTIONS # 19-20-041

RFP OPENING:  FEBRUARY 26, 2020 @ 2:30 P.M.

Event Number # 19-20-041 Organization PSJA ISD Ebids

Event Title Request for Proposals (RFP's) for Network and Data Protection/Data Workgroup Purchasing

Storage Solutions Event Owner Emily Garza

Event Type RFP Email emily.garza@psjaisd.us

Issue Date 2/4/2020 02:24:13 PM (CT) Phone

Close Date 2/26/2020 02:30:00 PM (CT) Fax

Recommendation:    That the Board of Education award the Request for Proposals (RFP's) for Network and Data Protection/Data Storage Solutions

the lowest proposers listed below:

Awarded Suppliers

Name City State Classifications Lines Awarded Award Total

Netsync Network Solutions McAllen TX 4 $716,771.50

Solid Border, Inc. San Antonio TX 1 (Awarded 4/13/20) $113,489.50

Total: $830,261.00

Emily Garza, Director of Purchasing                                                                       Dr. Lauro Davalos, Assistant Superintendent for Technology

Daniel Saenz, Information Technology Director

Charge Budgeted Account Numbers: District Local Funds

One Hundred Eighty Four Eight (184) invitations were emailed to vendors

Thirty Four (34) Vendors viewed Bid Specifications

Three (3) Submitted Bid

One (1) Unsubmitted Bid

Four (4) No Bid
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR NETWORK AND DATA PROTECTION/DATA STORAGE SOLUTIONS # 19-20-041

RFP OPENING:  FEBRUARY 26, 2020 @ 2:30 P.M.

Line Qty UOM Description Manufacturer Manuf. Number Award 

Response

Award 

Quantity

Awarded Supplier Award Reason

1 1 EA Isilon Gen 6 H400 - 240 TB Raw File Storage Solution $223,186.20 1 Netsync Network Solutions LOW BID
2 1 EA Data Protection Solution (IDPA) 

DP4400 (48TB) Solution DP Appliance 4400

$176,438.80 1 Netsync Network Solutions LOW BID

3 1 EA DDVE 4TB/AVE 2SOX $19,506.00 1 Netsync Network Solutions LOW BID
4 Alt 1 1 EA VMware Enterprise Licensing Agreement - ELA VMware ELA-HOLDER-A-2 $297,640.50 1 Netsync Network Solutions LOW BID
5 1 EA Palo Alto Security Suite $113,489.50 1 Solid Border, Inc. LOW BID

$830,261.00
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR NETWORK AND DATA PROTECTION/DATA STORAGE SOLUTIONS # 19-20-041

RFP OPENING:  FEBRUARY 26, 2020 @ 2:30 P.M.

Total Price $723,620.40 Total Price $716,771.50 Total Price $113,489.50

Line # Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1 Isilon Gen 6 H400 - 240 TB Raw File 

Storage Solution
1 EA $463,320.00 $463,320.00 $223,186.20 $223,186.20 No Bid

1.1 HARDWARE Base Chassis - Normal Dell ICH-NORM 1 EA $463,320.00 $2,321.10

1.2 HARDWARE Switch 10GBE 24P 2PS 

Celestica
Dell 851-0258 2 EA $3,467.40

1.3 HARDWARE Cable Ethernet 10G Pass SFP+ 

3M
Dell 851-0263 8 EA $53.10

1.4 HARDWARE 2X10GBE (SFP+) L/M w/o 

Optics
Dell IFEIO-10GBE-B 4 EA $355.70

1.5 HARDWARE 

Transceivers/Optic/SFP+/SR/10GBE/2 

GEN6

Dell 851-0296 4 EA $65.10

1.6 HARDWARE 2X10GBE SFP+ Back end w/o 

Optics
Dell IBEIO-10GBE 4 EA $355.70

1.7 HARDWARE Pwcrd Kit for GEN6 Normal 

Chassis
Dell 800-0078 2 EA $34.80

1.8 HARDWARE H400-

2.2GHZ/4C/64G+15X4TB SAT/800GB
Dell IH400-4T-800G 4 EA $7,361.50

1.9 HARDWARE Prosupport 4HR/MC 

Hardware Support
Dell M-PSM-HW-I-002 1 EA $20,929.70

1.10 SOFTWARE Onefs Product Dell 458-001-863 1 EA $0.00

1.11 SOFTWARE Onefs Base License Tier 3=ID Dell 456-111-836 4 EA $6,902.90

1.12 SOFTWARE Onefs Capacity License Tier 3 

=CB
Dell 456-111-840 240 EA $166.80

1.13 SOFTWARE Enterprise Adv Bundle Cap T3 

per TB=CB
Dell 458-001-869 240 EA $33.80

1.14 SOFTWARE Enterprise Advanced Bundle 

Tier 3=ID
Dell 458-001-868 4 EA $2,111.70

1.15 SOFTWARE HDFS forONEFS 0.00 Dell 458-001-969 4 EA $0.00

1.16 SOFTWARE Prosupport 4HR/MC Software 

Support
Dell M-PSM-SW-I-002 4 EA $13,302.65

1.17 PRO DEPLOY PLUS (Installation  

Configuration) 30 Day Post Deploy Assist 

Isilon

Dell PS-PDP-P30ISILON 1 EA $199.50

1.18 PRO DEPLOY PLUS (Installation  

Configuration) 1 Training Credit Valid 1yr 

(PDP ISL)

Dell CE-PDPISLTC0001 1500 EA $0.90

1.19 PRO DEPLOY PLUS (Installation  

Configuration) PDP for Isilon Advanced 

Bundle

Dell PS-PDP-ISIADVDP 1 EA $11,003.30

1.20 PRO DEPLOY PLUS (Installation  

Configuration) PDP Addon, Isilon One 

Node

Dell PS-PDPAD-ISIAD1NIN 3 EA $1,122.70

1.21 PRO DEPLOY PLUS (Installation  

Configuration) Tech Refresh Up to 10 

Nodes Data Only

Dell PS-BAS-ISTECH 1 EA $6,620.30

1.22 Freight Charges for Equipment 1 EA $0.00 $0.00

2 Data Protection Solution (IDPA) DP4400 

(48TB) Solution DP Appliance 4400
1 EA $260,300.40 $260,300.40 $176,438.80 $176,438.80 No Bid

2.1 HARDWARE Anchor DP Appliance 4400 Dell DPAPPL_4400 1 EA $260,300.40 $0.00

2.2 HARDWARE DP4400 12TB Capacity 

Expansion Pack
Dell DP4400_12TB_PACK 2 EA $19,601.80

2.3 HARDWARE IDPA DP4400 24TB 

8X10GBASE-T RJ45
Dell DP4400_24TB_RJ458 1 EA $39,203.60

2.4 HARDWARE Cable CAT6 RJ 10 Meters Dell DPCBL-CAT6-10M 4 EA $44.60

2.5 HARDWARE Prosupport 4hr/MC Hardware 

Support
Dell M-PSM-HW-DD-E1 1 EA $62,725.80

2.6 SOFTWARE IDPA DP4400 ENV Config Dell 458-002-436 1 EA $0.00

2.7 SOFTWARE DP4400 Capacity Enabler DDVE 

12TB=CC
Dell 456-107-987 4 EA $0.00

2.8 SOFTWARE VRealize Enabler Entry=IA Dell 456-113-622 1 EA $0.00

2.9 SOFTWARE Analytics Enabler Entry=CB Dell 456-113-623 1 EA $0.00

Solid Border, Inc.Netsync Network SolutionsCDW Government LLC

AWARDED

(Line # 1, 2, 3 and 4)

AWARDED

(4/13/2020)

(Line # 5)
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR NETWORK AND DATA PROTECTION/DATA STORAGE SOLUTIONS # 19-20-041

RFP OPENING:  FEBRUARY 26, 2020 @ 2:30 P.M.

Total Price $723,620.40 Total Price $716,771.50 Total Price $113,489.50

Line # Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

Solid Border, Inc.Netsync Network SolutionsCDW Government LLC

AWARDED

(Line # 1, 2, 3 and 4)

AWARDED

(4/13/2020)

(Line # 5)

2.10 SOFTWARE IDPA BU APP Enabler Entry=IA Dell 456-113-621 1 EA $0.00

2.11 SOFTWARE IDPA BoostFS 1 TB Raw Enabler 

Entry=CB
Dell 456-113-781 48 EA $0.00

2.12 SOFTWARE IDPA BU Search Enabler 

Entry=CA
Dell 456-113-624 1 EA $0.00

2.13 SOFTWARE Federated Reporting Server 

Entry=IA
Dell 456-113-620 1 EA $0.00

2.14 SOFTWARE IDPA Target Protocol Enabler 

Entry=CA
Dell 456-113-661 1 EA $0.00

2.15 SOFTWARE DataProtection Central 

Entry=CA
Dell 458-002-414 1 EA $0.00

2.16 SOFTWARE DP4400 DD Cloud DR 

Essentials 5TB=CC
Dell 458-002-482 1 EA $0.00

2.17 SOFTWARE DP4400 Cloud Tier License Dell 458-002-437 1 EA $0.00

2.18 SOFTWARE Lic Cloud Tier DP4400 Base 

TB=CC
Dell 456-107-983 5 EA $0.00

2.19 SOFTWARE IDPA DP4400 OS SW Code 

2.4.X=IA
Dell IDPA_DP4400_2-4 1 EA $0.00

2.20 SOFTWARE DP4400 DD Cloud DR 

Essentials 1TB=CC
Dell 458-002-438 10 EA $288.40

2.21 SOFTWARE Prosupport 4hr/MC Software 

Support
Dell M-PSM-SW-DD-E1 5 EA $519.26

2.22 PRO DEPLOY PLUS (INSTALLATION AND 

CONFIGURATION) PD for Search Deploy
Dell PS-PD-SRCHDP 1 EA $6,811.30

2.23 PRO DEPLOY PLUS (INSTALLATION AND 

CONFIGURATION) PD for DPA Deploy
Dell PS-PD-DPADP 1 EA $5,214.10

2.24 PRO DEPLOY PLUS (INSTALLATION AND 

CONFIGURATION) PD for IDPA DP4X Series
Dell PS-PD-IDPAVEDP 1 EA $2,960.80

2.25 PRO DEPLOY PLUS (INSTALLATION AND 

CONFIGURATION) DDCDR Remote 

Implementation Service

Dell PS-BAS-DDCDRB 1 EA $6,428.20

2.26 PRO DEPLOY PLUS (INSTALLATION AND 

CONFIGURATION) PD Add'l Depl Time: 4hr 

Remote DPD Tech

Dell PS-PDADT-RDPDTECH 1 EA $1,413.70

2.27 DATA MIGRATION SERVICES PD Add'l Depl 

Time: 8hr Onsite DPD Tech
Dell PS-PDADT-ODPDTECH 2 EA $3,409.50

2.28 DATA MIGRATION SERVICES - SYSTEM 

EMC Granular Recovery Microsoft High=CA
Dell 458-002-484 48 EA $0.00

2.29 DATA MIGRATION SERVICES - SYSTEM 

Prosupport 4hr/MC Software Support
Dell M-PSM-SW-DD-H1 1 EA $0.00

2.30 DATA MIGRATION SERVICES - SYSTEM 

Recoverpoint for VM Starter Packs
Dell 458-001-440 1 EA $0.00

2.31 DATA MIGRATION SERVICES - SYSTEM 

RP4VM 5VM Starter Pack for DP4400=IB
Dell 456-113-589 1 EA $0.00

2.32 DATA MIGRATION SERVICES - SYSTEM 

Prosupport 4hr/MC Software Support
Dell M-PSM-SW-D3-001 1 EA $0.00

2.33 Freight Charges for Equipment 1 EA $0.00 $0.00

3 DDVE 4TB/AVE 2SOX 1 EA No Bid $19,506.00 $19,506.00 No Bid

3.1 SOFTWARE Commercial DPS DDVE Bundle Dell 458-002-398 1 EA No Bid $0.00

3.2 SOFTWARE EMC DPA Enabler-B Entry=CB Dell 456-113-571 1 EA No Bid $0.00

3.3 SOFTWARE DPA Single FED Reporting 

Server Entry=IA
Dell 456-113-572 1 EA No Bid $0.00

3.4 SOFTWARE DPS DP Search Enabler 

Entry=CA
Dell 456-113-570 1 EA No Bid $0.00

3.5 SOFTWARE DPS 2TB AVE Enabler Entry=CA Dell 456-113-568 2 EA No Bid $0.00

3.6 SOFTWARE Commercial Bundle RP4VM 

Enabler Entry=IA
Dell 456-113-666 2 EA No Bid $0.00
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR NETWORK AND DATA PROTECTION/DATA STORAGE SOLUTIONS # 19-20-041

RFP OPENING:  FEBRUARY 26, 2020 @ 2:30 P.M.

Total Price $723,620.40 Total Price $716,771.50 Total Price $113,489.50

Line # Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

Solid Border, Inc.Netsync Network SolutionsCDW Government LLC

AWARDED

(Line # 1, 2, 3 and 4)

AWARDED

(4/13/2020)

(Line # 5)

3.7 SOFTWARE DD VE Perpetual Cap CHNI 

Entry 1TB=CA
Dell 456-113-573 4 EA No Bid $0.00

3.8 SOFTWARE Commercial DPS DDVE Bundle 

Sockets=IA
Dell 456-113-545 2 EA No Bid $1,221.50

3.9 SOFTWARE Prosupport 4hr/MC Software 

Support
Dell M-PSM-SW-DD-E1 2 EA No Bid $669.00

3.10 SOFTWARE Prosupport 4hr/MC Software 

Support
Dell M-PSM-SW-DD-E1 2 EA No Bid $0.00

3.11 PRO DEPLOY PLUS (INSTALLATION  

CONFIGURATION) PD AddOn, Data 

Protectn Suite Soln Pkg.

Dell PS-PDAD-DPSSPDP 1 EA No Bid $1,357.20

3.12 PRO DEPLOY PLUS (INSTALLATION  

CONFIGURATION) PD AddOn, AVAMAR DD 

Boost Integ

Dell PS-PDAD-AVIG 1 EA No Bid $7,934.80

3.13 PRO DEPLOY PLUS (INSTALLATION  

CONFIGURATION) PD for Data Domain 

Virtual Ed

Dell PS-PD-DDVEDP 1 EA No Bid $2,007.80

3.14 PRO DEPLOY PLUS (INSTALLATION  

CONFIGURATION) PD for AVAMAR Virtual 

Edition Deploy

Dell PS-PD-AVEDP 1 EA No Bid $4,425.20

4 VM NSX Solution 1 EA No Bid $0.00 $297,640.50 No Bid

4 ALT1 VMware Enterprise Licensing Agreement 

Pharr San Juan Alamo ISD - ELA
VMware ELA-HOLDER-A-2 1 EA $297,640.50

4.1 VMware vSphere Enterprise Plus for 1 

processor
VMware VS6-EPL 24 EA No Bid $0.00

4.2 VMware vRealize Operations Standard (25 

VM Pack)
VMware VR7-OSTV25 3 EA No Bid $0.00

4.3 VMware vCenter Server Standard for 

vSphere (Per Instance)
VMware VCS6-STD 1 EA No Bid $0.00

4.4 VMware vRealize Operations Standard (Per 

CPU)
VMware VR7-OSTC 24 EA No Bid $0.00

4.5 VMware vSphere Remote Office Branch 

Office Advanced (25 VM pack)
VMware VS6-RBADV25 3 EA No Bid $0.00

4.6 VMware vRealize Operations Standard (25 

VM Pack)
VMware VR7-OSTV25 1 EA No Bid $0.00

4.7 VMware vSphere Remote Office Branch 

Office Advanced (25 VM pack)
VMware VS6-RBADV25 1 EA No Bid $0.00

4.8 vRealize Network Insight VMware VR-NI-ANXC-A 24 EA No Bid $0.00

4.9 NSX VMware NX-DC-ADV-A 24 EA No Bid $0.00

4.10 Academic Upgrade: VMware vRealize 

Operations 7 Standard (Per CPU) to 

VMware vRealize Suite 2018 Standard (Per 

PLU)

VMware VR18-OSTC-STD-UG-

APRO
24 EA No Bid $0.00

4.11 Implementation/Training VMware SVC-CR-10 500 EA No Bid $0.00

5 Palo Alto Security Suite 1 EA No Bid No Bid $113,489.50 $113,489.50

5.1 Threat prevention subscription for device 

in an HA pair renewal, PA-5250
Palo Alto PAN-PA-5250-TP-HA2-

R
1 EA No Bid $9,800.00

5.2 PANDB URL filtering subscription for 

device in an HA pair renewal, PA-5250
Palo Alto PAN-PA-5250-URL4-

HA2-R
1 EA No Bid $9,800.00

5.3 WildFire subscription for device in an HA 

pair renewal, PA-5250
Palo Alto PAN-PA-5250-WF-HA2-

R
1 EA No Bid $9,800.00

5.4 GlobalProtect subscription for device in an 

HA pair renewal, PA-5250
Palo Alto PAN-PA-5250-GP-HA2-

R
1 EA No Bid $9,800.00

5.5 4-Hour Premium support renewal, PA-

5250
Palo Alto PAN-SVC-4HR-5250-R 1 EA No Bid $22,560.00

5.6 Palo Alto Networks Perpetual Bundle 

(BND1) for VM-Series that includes VM-

300, Threat Prevention subscription, and 

Premium Support

Palo Alto PAN-VM-300-PERP-

BND1-PREM-1YR
12 EA No Bid $3,213.00

5.7 Panorama central management software, 

25 devices
Palo Alto PAN- PRA-25 1 EA No Bid $7,300.00

5.8 25 Premium support year 1, Panorama 25 

devices
Palo Alto PAN-SVC-PREM-PRA-

25
1 EA No Bid $1,786.00

5.9 Cortex XDR Endpoint Protection, includes 

30 days of data retention
Palo Alto PAN-XDR-PRVT 250 EA No Bid $16.35
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR NETWORK AND DATA PROTECTION/DATA STORAGE SOLUTIONS # 19-20-041

RFP OPENING:  FEBRUARY 26, 2020 @ 2:30 P.M.

Line Responding Supplier Supplier Notes

1 CDW Government LLC See attached Nutanix PDF for full description of solution we are bidding for Line Items 1.1-1.22. Free

2 CDW Government LLC See attached Nutanix PDF for full description of solution we are bidding for Line Items 1.1-1.22. Free
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR NETWORK AND DATA PROTECTION/DATA STORAGE SOLUTIONS # 19-20-041

RFP OPENING:  FEBRUARY 26, 2020 @ 2:30 P.M.

Line # Att # Attribute Name CDW Government LLC Netsync Network Solutions Solid Border, Inc.

Header 66 Business/Company Owner Name
Please provide the complete name of the business/company owner 

responding to the bid/proposal.

CDW Government LLC Netsync Network Solutions; 

Diane Gonzales, President

Derek del Barrio  > Owner     

Header 67 Date of Establishment 1989 September 2002 May of 2002

Header 68 Will the bid/proposal deviate from specifications? No No No

Header 69 If no please state "No deviation", if yes, please 

specify deviations:
(Please also complete and attach Form B - Deviations from 

SpecificationsCompliance Signature Form to this bid response.)

No Deviation No deviation No Deviation
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR NETWORK AND DATA PROTECTION/DATA STORAGE SOLUTIONS # 19-20-041

RFP OPENING:  FEBRUARY 26, 2020 @ 2:30 P.M.

Responding Supplier Signature Full Name Signature Email Supplier Notes

CDW Government LLC Matt Flood mattflo@cdw.com

Netsync Network Solutions Angela Melone proposals@netsync.com

Solid Border, Inc. David Williams david@solidborder.com
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR NETWORK AND DATA PROTECTION/DATA STORAGE SOLUTIONS # 19-20-041

RFP OPENING:  FEBRUARY 26, 2020 @ 2:30 P.M.

Participation Summary - As of 03/12/2020

Participant Name Response Date Response Status Contact City State Invitation Type Invitation Date Owner
CDW Government LLC 02/26/2020 Submitted Mike Smith Vernon Hills IL Automatic 02/04/2020 Michael Kransny
Netsync Network Solutions 02/26/2020 Submitted Xavier Trevino McAllen TX Automatic 02/04/2020 Diana Gonzales, President
Solid Border, Inc. 02/24/2020 Submitted David Williams San Antonio TX Derek Del Barrio
Lexine Inc Unsubmitted Frank Martinez McAllen TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Audio Visual Aids (Audio Visual Aids Co) 02/04/2020 No Bid Ron George San Antonio TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Hypertec USA Inc.  (Hypertec Direct) 02/04/2020 No Bid Mike Marracino TEMPE AZ Automatic 02/04/2020
PRECISION SAW & TOOL, INC 02/26/2020 No Bid EDDIE HOMAN CONVERSE TX
Youthlight, Inc. 02/13/2020 No Bid Sandra C. McCarthy Chapin SC
Acronis SCS Viewed Adam Morton Scottsdale AZ
Artcom Communications (Artcom Associates) Viewed San Antonio TX Automatic 02/04/2020
aves audio visual systems, inc. Viewed ANGIE GOMEZ SUGAR LAND TX Automatic 02/04/2020
BridgeNet Communications, LLC Viewed Donna TX Automatic 02/04/2020
CJIS GROUP Viewed Mariah Elliott Tallahassee FL Automatic 02/04/2020
Commvault Viewed Jeremy Shaw Tinton Falls NJ
dba Barcom Technology Solutions (Jet Web Communications LLC)Viewed John Huebener San Antonio TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Dell  Marketing, L.P. Viewed Aaron Rodriguez Round Rock TX
Dell EMC Viewed Round Rock TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Dell Technologies Viewed Michael Robert Round Rock TX
Five star lights Viewed Eduardo sanchez Mcallen TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Floral Park Consulting LLC Viewed Floral Park NY Automatic 02/04/2020
hdc video and communications dba (Maria del Castillo LLC)Viewed Maria del Castillo mcallen TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Howard Technology Solutions (Howard Industries, Inc.) Viewed Rebecca Dearman Birmingham AL Automatic 02/04/2020
Insight Public Sector (Sawyers) Viewed Tempe AZ Automatic 02/04/2020
JGA ROOFING SYSTEMS, LLC Viewed Waco TX
Logical Front Viewed Adrian Villalba SANDY UT Automatic 02/04/2020
Mercer Technologies Firm Viewed Garrett Mercer Gary IN
Mvation Worldwide Inc. Viewed Barry Weinstein Glen Cove NY
Nutanix Viewed Kristopher Ditmore San Jose TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Perseus Information Security Consulting, LLC Viewed Bill Nelson Tampa FL
Plexus Consulting, LLC Viewed Kai Wulff Brownsville TX
Safeguard Fire & Security Viewed Daniel Backhaus Mission TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Security International Inc Viewed Tanya Wychopen Edinburg TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Skyview Roofing LLC Viewed McAllen TX
Smartcom Telephone, LLC. Viewed Robert Sanchez McAllen TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Softchoice Corporation Viewed Juan Arango Chicago IL Automatic 02/04/2020
Solid IT Networks, Inc Viewed Staci Giddings Dallas TX Automatic 02/04/2020
SOUTH TEXAS COMMUNICATIONS, INC. Viewed JAMES L. EWING MCALLEN TX Automatic 02/04/2020
The PlanIT Room Viewed Cecilia Hernandez El Paso TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Universal Adaptive Consulting Services Viewed Valencia S. Hicks Henrico VA Automatic 02/04/2020
Urban TV's Viewed Gilberto Rocha Palmview TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Virtual Builders Exchange Viewed Jeannette Olguin SAN ANTONIO TX
VTX1 Companies (VTX Communications, LLC) Viewed Linda Garza Raymondville TX Automatic 02/04/2020
1.50 Cleaners llc Dba fat cat signs samuel avila mcallen TX Automatic 02/04/2020
9 TO 5 COMPUTER RICHARD RAAB Jacksonville Beach FL Automatic 02/04/2020
A V Pro, Inc. Heather Winkelman DeSoto TX Automatic 02/04/2020
ABC Custom Advertising (Marketing Concepts Unlimited) Martha J Miller McAllen TX Automatic 02/04/2020
ACCO Brands USA LLC (ACCO Brands Corporation) Customer Care Dallas TX Automatic 02/04/2020
ACE Data Recovery (ACE Data Group, LLC) Andrey Vasilyev Dallas WA Automatic 02/04/2020
ACP Direct (Affordable Computer Products, Inc.) Vanessa Morris Dallas TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Adorama Inc. NEW YORK NY Automatic 02/04/2020
Advanced Communications & Cabling Kent Taylor Georgetown TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Aeries Software Plano TX Automatic 02/04/2020
AIRGAS USA LLC CENTRAL DIV Javier Olmos McAllen TX Automatic 02/04/2020
AISYS Consulting, LLC Elizabeth Lopez McAllen TX Automatic 02/04/2020
AITA CONSULTING SERVICES,INC KEVIN KUMAR NORTH BRUNSWICKNJ Automatic 02/04/2020
All American Poly Piscataway NJ Automatic 02/04/2020
AllPlayers Network Inc. (Rank One Sport) Brian Mann Sanger TX Automatic 02/04/2020
ALPHA CUSTOM SHIRTS edinburg TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Altex Electronic's Ltd. San Antonio TX Automatic 02/04/2020
AM Utilities and Construction LLC Roberto Morales Mission TX Automatic 02/04/2020
AMSYS Innovative Solutions LLC Chuck Williams Houston TX Automatic 02/04/2020
AndyMark, Inc. Kokomo IN Automatic 02/04/2020
Applied Industrial Technologies Pharr TX Automatic 02/04/2020
AssetGenie, Inc. DBA AGiRepair and AGParts Education (AssetGenie, Inc.) Tina Covalesky Greensburg PA Automatic 02/04/2020
AT&T Corp Hector Orellana McAllen TX Automatic 02/04/2020
AUDIO RESOURCE GROUP, INC (AUDIO RESOURCE GROUP) Melonie Olson WEST FARGO ND Automatic 02/04/2020
AVM Educational Technology Consultant (NOE GRANADO SR) Noe Granado, Brownsville TX Automatic 02/04/2020
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR NETWORK AND DATA PROTECTION/DATA STORAGE SOLUTIONS # 19-20-041

RFP OPENING:  FEBRUARY 26, 2020 @ 2:30 P.M.

Participation Summary - As of 03/12/2020

Participant Name Response Date Response Status Contact City State Invitation Type Invitation Date Owner
Battery Systems Inc Suzanne Cruz Garden Grove CA Automatic 02/04/2020
Beneftifocus Charleston SC Automatic 02/04/2020
Best Buy For Business (Best Buy Stores, L.P.) Richfield MN Automatic 02/04/2020
Blue Sky Enterprises Alonzo Acosta La Blanca TX Automatic 02/04/2020
bulb, Inc. David Hughey Lafayette CO Automatic 02/04/2020
Butler Business Products Stacy Duke Houston TX Automatic 02/04/2020
C&H Distributors, LLC William Rose Chicago IL Automatic 02/04/2020
Calico Construction and Development LLC David Cantu Mission TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Charter Communications Operating, LLC St Louis MO Automatic 02/04/2020
CIELO OFFICE PRODUCTS DAVID BARRERA MCALLEN TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Circle Industries Inc. Joel HIlliard Houston TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Clary Business Machines (Sufian Munir Inc.) San Diego CA Automatic 02/04/2020
Coast To Coast Computer Products, Inc. Miranda Horowitz Simi Valley CA Automatic 02/04/2020
Cogent Communications, Inc. Baltimore MD Automatic 02/04/2020
Communications ETC (Valeric, LLC) McAllen TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Compostology LLC Kash Nathan Waco TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Connections Education Pearson Online & Blended Learning K-12 USA Columbia MD Automatic 02/04/2020
ConstructConnect Cincinnati OH Automatic 02/04/2020
Construction Bid Source (Plan Room) Felton CA Automatic 02/04/2020
Construction Journal LLC Pamela Exton Stuart FL Automatic 02/04/2020
Copy Graphics Inc. David Valdez McAllen TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Core Business Solutions/ UBEO Company (UBEO LCC) Baldomero Gonzalez Pharr TX Automatic 02/04/2020
CRW Consulting, LLC Jeffrey W. Harris Tulsa OK Automatic 02/04/2020
C-Tech Associates Inc. Sparta NJ Automatic 02/04/2020
Cytek Media Systems, Inc. Steve Patton Topeka KS Automatic 02/04/2020
Decisin Tree Inc. Brent Lawson El Paso TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Devin Distributing & Packaging Inc. Sandra Salinas Palmhurst TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Discount Two-Way Radio Corporation Stoyan Varbanov Compton CA Automatic 02/04/2020
DocuNav Solutions (VP Imaging, Inc.) Shannon Fellows Frisco TX Automatic 02/04/2020
DOGGETT FREIGHTLINER OF SOUTH TEXAS, PHARR MICHAEL GUZMAN PHARR TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Don Johnston Incorporated Baylee Royal Volo IL Automatic 02/04/2020
ECOEFFECT Alejandro Alanis McAllen TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Econ Group, LLC Gilbert Enriquez Edinburg TX Automatic 02/04/2020
ECS Learning Systems (Asteria Education, Inc.) Shawndell Byers Bulverde TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Ed Tech Soft, Inc. Vinita Bakhshi Duluth GA Automatic 02/04/2020
Education 2000 (Douglas E. Pennekamp) Marissa Pennekamp Houston TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Encore Data Products, Inc. (Burgess) Jeff Burgess Lafayette CO Automatic 02/04/2020
engage2learn (Engage! Learning, Inc.) Jaime Cooper Portland TX Automatic 02/04/2020
FireFly Computers Saint Paul MN Automatic 02/04/2020
Flaghouse Inc John Holt Hasbrouck Heights NJ Automatic 02/04/2020
Foremost Telecommunications Corporation Lawrence Halcomb Dallas TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Frontera Concetps, LLC John C Garza San Antonio TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Frontline Smart Security LLC dba Think Smart Homes Juan Curling Donna TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Full Compass (Full Compass Systems) Brian Kaphingst Madison WI Automatic 02/04/2020
Full Stop Equipment LLC Elias Macias La Joya TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Govmation Enterprise Solutions Dwaylyn Holland McKinney TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Greenwood Office Outfitters Robert Rosalez Fort Worth TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Grupo Telco LLC Medardo Perez Mission TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Hatch, Inc Sales Operations Winston-Salem NC Automatic 02/04/2020
Holzberg Communications, INc. Andy Holzberg Totowa NJ Automatic 02/04/2020
HP Financial Services (Hewlett Packard Financial Services Company, Inc.) Paul Hermann Berkeley Heights NJ Automatic 02/04/2020
Indeco Martin Pena Belton TX Automatic 02/04/2020
INNOVAERA INC DBASUPERNOVA McAllen TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Insight Darak Weaver McAllen, TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Intech Southwest Services san antonio TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Istation (Imagination Station, Inc.) Monika Flood Dallas TX Automatic 02/04/2020
IT RECYCLING GROUP Kay Ramon GEORGETOWN TX Automatic 02/04/2020
IXL Learning, Inc. Nektaria Klouvidakis San Mateo CA Automatic 02/04/2020
JANGA Technology LLC Andrea Anguiano Pharr TX Automatic 02/04/2020
JOHNSON CONTROLS FIRE PROTECTION Heather Foster ROUND ROCK TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Jostens, Inc. Carlos Trejo Chicago IL Automatic 02/04/2020
Learning Services International Inc Donna Villena Springfield OR Automatic 02/04/2020
Lesson Planet (Education Planet Inc.) Lori O'Connell Santa Barbara CA Automatic 02/04/2020
Library Video Company d/b/a SAFARI Montage West ConshohockenPA Automatic 02/04/2020
Lightspeed Technologies, Inc. Melissa Williams Tualatin OR Automatic 02/04/2020
Limitless Office Products Mita Guha RICHARDSON TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Little Giants Learning Center Alamo TX Automatic 02/04/2020
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PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.

REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS (RFP'S) FOR NETWORK AND DATA PROTECTION/DATA STORAGE SOLUTIONS # 19-20-041

RFP OPENING:  FEBRUARY 26, 2020 @ 2:30 P.M.

Participation Summary - As of 03/12/2020

Participant Name Response Date Response Status Contact City State Invitation Type Invitation Date Owner
M&A Technology (M&A Technology Inc.) Donna Shepard Carrolton TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Manning Navcomp Inc Michael Wells Austin TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Marie Bou K12 Inc Linda Lulic Plattsburg NY Automatic 02/04/2020
maxi aids angela giglio farmingdfale NY Automatic 02/04/2020
Medicaid Finance & Consulting Services (Houston Independent School District)Michael Gonzalez Houston TX Automatic 02/04/2020
MJR EDUCATIONAL SUPPLIES Houston TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Nightlock RGV Distributor LLC. Michael Perez McAllen TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Office Depot, Inc Nadia Garza La Feria TX Automatic 02/04/2020
OMA INDUSTRIES, LLC Lucia Valdez HARLINGEN TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Patina Fire & Safety MCALLEN TX Automatic 02/04/2020
PCMG, Inc. Elanie Bungay Los Angeles CA Automatic 02/04/2020
PCPC Direct Frank Parent Houston TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Pemica Inc Elvis Jimenez Miami FL Automatic 02/04/2020
Perez Technologies Mario Perez Mission TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Performance Scoring Michael Terneus Farmers Branch TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Phynyx Fire & Security ROY OLIVAREZ San Juan TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Precision Micrographics & Imaging , Inc. jerry collins Austin TX Automatic 02/04/2020
PREMIER & COMPANIES Henry Melendez NEW YORK NY Automatic 02/04/2020
Prime Systems HOUSTON TX Automatic 02/04/2020
ProComputing Corporation Michael McKinstry Grapevine TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Promo Solutions Frisco TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Protegis Fire & Safety LLC (Protegis Holdings, LLC) Naticia Porche LOUISVILLE KY Automatic 02/04/2020
Public Consulting Group Inc Maureen Farrell Boston MA Automatic 02/04/2020
PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS (PYRAMID PAPER COMPANY) PATRICIA OLIVAS TAMPA FL Automatic 02/04/2020
Radio Engineering Industries, Inc. (REI) Omaha NE Automatic 02/04/2020
Red River Technology LLC (Red River) Kimberly Reed Claremont NH Automatic 02/04/2020
Reyna Enterprises Inc (CRC (Computer Repair Center)) McAllen TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Romo Contractors, LLC Romo Contractors LLC Laredo TX Automatic 02/04/2020
royal media network inc. irene diaz WINDSOR MIL MD Automatic 02/04/2020
School Datebooks (SDI Innovations) Cole Cooper Lafayette IN Automatic 02/04/2020
School Outfitters Cincinnati OH Automatic 02/04/2020
School Specialty, Inc. Accounts Receivable Greenville WI Automatic 02/04/2020
SHI international Austin TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Silicon Mountain Memory (WayTech, LLC) Ann Monticello Fenton MO Automatic 02/04/2020
Skyward, Inc Darcy Grabski Stevens Point WI Automatic 02/04/2020
SmartSchool Sytems David Walling Kingwood TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Solix, Inc Parsippany NJ Automatic 02/04/2020
Southern Computer Warehouse, Inc. Julia Stewart Marietta GA Automatic 02/04/2020
SRC Solutions, Inc. Center Valley PA Automatic 02/04/2020
Strongline Security & Fire (Luis Alfonso Grimaldo DBA Strongline Security & Fire) San Juan TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Superior Alarms (Alan Yoder Enterprises, Incorporated) McAllen TX Automatic 02/04/2020
TCR- The Best Alarm INC Laredo TX Automatic 02/04/2020
TEACHER DIRECT (TDSA, LLC) JOSH BOX BIRMINGHAM AL Automatic 02/04/2020
Technology Integration Group San Antonio TX Automatic 02/04/2020
TekVisions, Inc. Elizabeth Blythe TEMECULA CA Automatic 02/04/2020
The Library Store, Inc. Shayla Hill TREMONT IL Automatic 02/04/2020
Total Seminars, LLC. Kathy Yale Houston TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Triggers Media Bobby Villarreal McAllen TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Trinity3 Technology Kendell Rickman Saint Paul MN Automatic 02/04/2020
Troxell Communications, Inc. Trenton Brackley Phoenix AZ Automatic 02/04/2020
Vanguard IT Solutions LLC Pedro Sandoval brownsville TX Automatic 02/04/2020
VCRNOW (Visual Candy Resources Inc.) Jeff Andersen Red Oak TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Vertex Marketing Dr. Sue Bayer Stafford TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Vets Securing America San Antonio TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Videotex Systems, Inc. Dika Causevic Dallas TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Virtucom, Inc. Tim Prince Peachtree Corners GA Automatic 02/04/2020
Visceral Illumination Code LLC (VISCERAL ILLUMINATION CODE LLC) Edinburg TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Vivacity Tech PBC Tanya Maloley Saint Paul MN Automatic 02/04/2020
WalkerCom, Inc. Ray Saldivar Pearland TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Walmart Inc Bentonvile AR Automatic 02/04/2020
Worldgate (Worldgate, LLC) Reston VA Automatic 02/04/2020
Xtreme Security & Alarm Galiguer Manjarrez Brownsville TX Automatic 02/04/2020
Zonar Systems Christian Jacobsen Seattle WA Automatic 02/04/2020
Zones,LLC Asad Ijaz Auburn WA Automatic 02/04/2020
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