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SE1CTION I
 

I-A NARRATIVE SUMMIARY 

Identification of tho final forty three public 

latrines was prov.d,;d by DPU and the drawifiqs 

have been revised accordingly. The ConsudLcnt 

has proposed that the Phsc III contractor bu 

assigned two of the new units to upgrade foC 

the one that wds razed by DPU shriJtLly after h, 

began work (sec. Mon tty Ptci 6r No, 38) as~ thie 

total cost for tho two would be leiss than that 

for the one torn down. Tender Doc.vupments for 

the balance of the public latrines upgrading 

are being prepared.
 

The distribution main contractorv are. noarinq 

completion of the.ir work. Tha replacement of 

the old transmission main along Jl. Kol. Su

tarto has been complited and test approve:i. 

During the test some of the old piping wi.thin 

the pipe gallery shifted and the Surkarta Water 

Enterprise is taking the opportunity to under

take repairs to Lhe reservoir while it is out 

of service. Other rcplacemait piping is being 

laid as indicated oxi Appendix V. The contrac

tors are still working the stream and drainage 

span work and one of the contractors has paid 

to the Railway Enterprise costs for his cross

ing. 

Notice to Proceed was issued by the Director
 

General Cipta Xarya on 04 February 1982 for the
 

procurement of Operations and Maintenance tool
 

and equipment list reported as approved in the
 



prcviouq report. Ti'h CW,-,tItont: ha5 issued the 

ir; .n,, is pL pari.ing a dr.,.-iFt forpurch ,sc oi ar~t 

in Ord -'.I" fOL Ciptaamentdmonh to thc ContractL 

let t,-rKarya to oht,in tlh nn wsry p[ioC)p orma 

of cuc,. it which wi1 l. by usn d four import tax ex

empt.ion. 

MeuLinLs wc. held 17 and 18 February 1982 in 

the officps of Ci,a Karyca for the evaluation 

of quoLaLions rt,,*tiv-. e Cor the watter well pm.'p

inj equipment obtaincd by the Consul.tant in the 

United St-,,s (see A-.yprndix Vi.) An a tclnmont 

.iic'his.owas reached in the latLer me.ting 	 t, 

va rious item!,the lowe'sL res.,',stvc bid for the 

on the Os . it. is anticipiked the Diructor 

to Proceed withGeneral will iqa.e his Motice 

that procurnw'-nt by mid March. 

Approval was also provi.da_'d to purcias frcm hlo-::l 

suppliers tho 1'oposod radio equiliprcnt Cin, Z'sop 

.air conpress,",- for thc Surakarta. Water .trp.Li. 

By months cnd, the raixo equipnent ",., beinj '. 

asThe leak survey was again stor ted exp':c:-7 d the 

first of the moct:h bt wa's hinde red during the 

month for vi r1u; ren.-;on.. P ri.marily due to the 

Kali Pusur which overFlowed its banks at Co' 

tulung on the ev'ning of 17 February 1932. This 

flood was not as high as those of December 1980 

1981 but was much more destructive.and February 

A report was madu and is included herein as Ap

pendix VII. 

The Sur.okarta Water "nterpri-;e is starting to 

install a section of the new distribution pipe 

along Jl. Jijar in order to nupp!ly the ho,.sinq 

area assigned for th, City ManAgement which 0s 

under construction in Kocamatan Laweyan. The 
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project will reibturs _, thQ illt allIation cos4; <q 
when the VY 18/J,981 PUl is m~de Rv41abo1 i1 

toTender Documentq are be tg revieweri for issue 


Lhe Jl70SPCCtiVC conltracturs for Phase ill diti

butioni ni,-Uns in the vniry near future. 

I-l PROBLEMS AND PRO~oSI D SOLUTIONS 

Excessive leak,-.iv aroundI Surakairta has been the
 

subjc-ct of various t is of co1uwiunication and Con.~
 

tintus to be a major problem. Prime consideratio,
 

Surakarta WaLor Enteiprise wLthout further delay. 

With the employmeiit of radio equipment, it is be.
 

lieved the moit severk. leaks c-in now be reported
 

to the Base Station operator by any other radio
 

equipped organizaLion provided the Suraka Lrt Wter
 

Enterprise uses it 24 hours par day as they are
 

supposed to.
 

Poor workmanship continues to be eviderht in the
 

Surakarta Water Ente-prise regarding the new ser

vice connections being made. Several tests were
 

delayed on the Phase I & II work because of the
 

servico connecLiuis madle by personnel of the Su

rakarta Water Enterprise leaked. Sometimes it was
 

found new service clamps were of the wrong pipe
 

size so rubber straps were used by the installet
 

in an effort to stop the leak, also concrete.
 

Sometime, for the lack of a proper tool, the man
 

tried to punch a hole through the distribution main
 

instead of drilling - that broke the pipe and
 

again rather than properly fixing the damage it
 

was covered up. Personnel of the Surtkarta Water
 

EnterprLse should be terminated for cause w.hen
 

found when it is knownwo does
such conditions are 


the work and that he has been through 0 & M training
 

(see Appendix VIII for photograph of such work).
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II-B approvocOSUISTONS/APPRVAS (b9 ] V 

4- Cotat pedi-f.4 
g I-5 

Consultant's Invoice No. 4 for January 1982 

USe D01u'r *oibv.rsibl0 expenses was submitt

ed to Cipta Kary: on U6 February 1982 and WAS 

approved by Cipta Karyci on 09 k'ebruary 1.982. 

Consiultanft's Rupiah Invoice No. 26 for January 

---9 2 s b i t d-t .. i a.a y - n,-11-Febr ua,~t ___j 

1982 wans approved on tLio same ditto. 

There submitals are in accordance 

Contract Appendix 1f, Page 11-15. 

with the 

11-B CONTRACT STAT~US. 

Appendix I shows the continuation of Consult

ant's effort in nan-months fromi the beginning 

of the Contrac. 

Appendix it shows the billings of approved ex

penditures to date. 

II-C PERSONNEL, 

The Surakarta Office personnel in February 1982 

were~as follows 

.44
 



- G$t or B4'a2En m]tr:n a Ler 


Jaeo, netoc Che ninee
 
arrivec' 26 Soptrh I- 1979
 

-Albert G. 1JjajU MSeils
 

arrivod 09 Muny 1980
 

- Mohammad Khalil, Matriols Coodinator
 

arrived 09 Octobr 1978
 

- M1oharn4d Syacif Ler'bnhg CouIstrtictin Supo~rviulor
 
arrvcd 01. MN.y 1979
 

- Gittot Bramono, Xn~pocitor 
arrivod 19 Noemo 1979
 

- Soewanto, Inspootot,
 
arrived 11 t~r~h 1980
 

- Abdul Ranyid, Innpector 
arrived 11 June 1981
 

- Susena, Draftsman 

arrived 20 October 1980 



-dni D~t s;. I-~VrH viCcMr!cj: ' 

-!J.-yxi 1' iy tllt i , W'r'ret'ary 

hirt,- .17 Nu.der1980 

- I~biy:' 1 Clrrk
 

hirce-- 01 Nc~'~c1978
 

- I'almld j i 1- 1 -Cj,- I i ve r 

Iii reo o' or: rxubt. . 1978 

- Sttt iLsuo, fl;.j.v/r 

hi':.Al 02 A!,ri 1 1979 

-. PL 1,1 tC, , Lir:i %.'I:I
 

hiceci 17 OcI.ob -- 199i0
 

of !-icc P:" 1'.i 

hired 10 Ncovebi-.r 193 

-Tukino, 

- 6



SET';''IOUN III.. 

ENGN'rR... AND ' 

III-A OFF-SHORT: PLWX,:A;0f:D :.t\V:i2L\[S US.$ %P.TD US. $ 

I[I-A-1 Direct CiptL:i Karya PrcAuaI&rt Cc. Lui 

II-A-I-I Amrvic,-:w Ci,:[ Tron 'i-: Co. 

D1ct[i] Trc€ Pir.fi & FittLiiv, 

Caltr'q : ctrt i'i Cf!C '-C:: 

0 1/021'% 

2,595,..11.60 .00 - 0-

IIl-A--I-2 Colcorini Rca 
Flcv,, ~ l[.g 7!: [l',l. 

Cant rac- ccrti.fic-d ccnplete 

07/04/",0 

3,462.00 100 -0

TIT-A-l-3 Rc,4!-r~i 

Wrh:itk<2LT 

C-M, ULci'iCtl 

',3, .Zipairs PaLrts-

6681712.83 90 66,871.28 

CmtracF . hifAicP C 

06/07/81 

III-A--I-4 Cl< Cr.q.or.Licxn 

CLincj, Auto Air Venhs & 
Valves. 

Ckitxract. ctrLified cc:4]ete 

1.5/05/81 

123,912.00 100 - O -

III-A-I-5 Ford Meter Box Cuapany 

Brass Valves Parts & gcces

sories. 

Contract certifi .:,d ccuplete 

12/02/81 

390,775.15 100 - o-

Sub Total III-A-I : 3,784,373.58 98.233 66,971.28 

- 7 -



IT -A-2 S -cial kjuI r*nt lProcuruitnt'/Conzu ltant Ccntract 

III-.A-2-1 Wostern Trh'im,.iLi.(,r,[ 2,496.14 100 - O 

... && H tors
o.= 	 .'Lcy 

III-A-2-2 Kenncdy/I:,.,:. 58,546.40 100 - O

Di;tributJLicn Nt74work Valves
 

Ccw,[pieLe
 

---2 r,tt l nL!.
III-l.::-, pii,' r -V~i r iotisL 

- C~r-Lcltc 	 11,303.54 100 - o 

III-A-2--4 	 Pubi ctli c & refcrence Data
 

Varicuti Sourc, 5 - Ccvplete 1,465.95 100 - 0 

III-A-2-5 	Pi.pi.r Pirts Foc ClooI
 

Varioii So'.uz 2s - Culcte 228.51 100 - 0 

IIT-A-2-6 	 0 & M ia,.ity Outfi.tt;n'j 

Variot!.-; Sn'tces -- P irtial 83,901.30 0.25 83,694.1.2 

Sub Total 	III-A.-2 : 157,941.74 47.01 83,694.12 

Total US 	 $ 3,942,315.32 96.181 150,565.40 

Bids were received and evaluated by the Consultant
 

for the water well pumping equipment. Two meetings
 

at the offices of Cipta Karya provided agreementon
 

the selection of equipment and the best responsive
 

bid (see Appendix VI ). Approval to proceed will
 

be forthcoming during the month of March.
 

III-B 	 CONSTRUCTION SUPERVISION
 

The Phase I contractor installed his pipe under the 

railroad tracks along with various stream crossings. 

- 8 
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WatcFnteprs ifinishdwith 'pa to t~i i) J 
brerservoir, tho rulcmn main will be pt into 

service. This same contcqo iotifbricatn tie 

.bzr4dge crossing over the Kaliktyur, When in place 
it will be conn oLtd to te ractoath new 
trnsislnmin thus compleing a elomntf 

<~JL. Tagoro north to, the Pnnnr'Nusukaln (s~o. Ap~ax 
V). The Phase I contrator. ha insalod 
ly morUQe pipe thanf was schebdilo. His,tut I con~ 

trc opletion- standsg -at7657b 
.~ 

- ~-"r-..~.-The Phase II contractor ha4 d~evoted1 most of thomi;th 

-

of February installing fire hydciwts, pipe alopq 
miscellaneous Jalans. and s.troauw crossings. His pi~pe~ 
installed totals presently approximately 2 S more 
7than was scheduled. His totnl contract complotton 
stands at 70.39 S. 

7The SuraIkarta Water Enterprise has been requestel ly 
the Mayor of Surakarta to do~ wha. ic necessary to 
provide water to the notw housing area being built to 

.7. ~.accomodate the City employees in the western part of 

ITx work by installing 0 200 mm,~ PVC pipe from the Sec
tion "ICI transmission main terminal up Jil Jajar, 
The Project will reimburse them when the FYt 1982/1983 
fud are avail~able. 1 

Activities that relate solely to the installation of 
pipe, valves and fittings have been done as innoted 
below t 

9
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PHASE KErfJJNH:\N INSTALLED TfETI-D 

I Jabreu 91.2 63.7
 
I laniha! etn 100 100
 

I KrapLonan 100 100
 
I G liemg in 99.1 9.8
 
I Jaga an 11o00 100
 
I£ Kampun Sewu 100
 

I Knut1An 100
 
I icpaihcJn a, 100
Wet 100 

I Replacement Vatriou;
 

Leo. 90.2 .5-


TOTAL P TI T 979+C0 799+2 

t c ian wj k h 100
 
IT Danr-Av1:!lm 100 100
 
It a Ste Z1 : 67.8
r 0hnge 100 


IT Tipes 85.6 71.9
 

II Pa n t pharstn 100 64.7
 

II Misc. Jan-Vorcu n
 

Loc. 88.6 14.6 
Ii fRolcacment - Various 

Loc. 10.8 

Troi~f, P-1. TT 97. 94C( 75.9 

Both contractors will encp~vor to coslete all romain

ing work during tdie month of March as is the policy of 
the Project. Some work which was to have boon -given 
to them an a change order. is now most prc'h,-tbly qotng to 

be held for the next phage of thle distribution network 
to be tendeod. The tender documeonts for Phase ITtt are, 

pros#*ontly being review ed and will be issuvc1 topp-c 

tive cctitractoesq as advisod by the Project. ProsenL ojrall 
completion status of the distribution piping construc

tion stands at 63.9 %. 

- 10 



Progroei-s ou the bath ltouses and public Ilrnes was 
1Ot asM cjre as iL ul d hdave beenbeCause of f1iln

ci-:ia sitt!'tAHrns of the contractors. it was necessary 

that they cempleLe 20 to 25 % OF their wock before 

subumiLLi'cj their first b.LlI. Most waited until 307 

had been dune before doing so ind it prooved to be 

too long when they f.c!:c ,i'i the .. trahLve d-, 

lay reqarding handling pavmtints. All three conLrac

tors aro Lu have r&:,ev.c1 thei r first pdyment by the 

end of PEb.:uary so work should pick up agai.n. The 

Surakarta DP[J reLui.nted thc litL oE the balanc,- oC 43 

pubic lataiic with new identifications; and thrawN

injo were- modiied -acZor d nxgly-- 'It wa found L'ha t 

two of the 43 locoLotis could be upgraded fo the 

v.dAuu. of the one proviously razed by DPU for a ntreet 

widetting pr ect. It is anticirp-ted approval will 

be 1.u,-eived to mke the chanje. The remiainder 41 

public latrines will. be offered for bids as soon as 

pso s1bl. Thc ,,nt-i.cipated budget will ex.e.ed the U.S. 

Dollar i00,000.00 by slightly over tea perceaLt. As 

funds were no competely spent for the water well 

pumping and 0 & M equipi.x'tit, it wil. be Lp esented 

for app.ovdL to reallocate funds from one "DRA" to 

alloi all of the available public latrines to be up
graded. 

The entire bath house/public latrine construction 

work is considered to be 42.2 % complete at this time. 

The bath houses overall are considered to be 61% 

as compared with 12.3 % completion of the planned 

103 public latrines. Completion status of the in

divIdual contri,;L phases is as follows 

- 11.

http:i00,000.00
http:r&:,ev.c1


PHASE" IT'EM 

I B11 3-4 75.6 .1/ I1 2 

I B1 3-.G 98.4 V.). il6 

I BH 3 9 51.5 13.0/3 

1 14 PubiLc I,:i.c~ne. 12.2 2.5'91 

TiASi 63.266TOTAL P T 

II BHi 3-1 53.3 10.377 

II BH 3-3 65.8 1.1.I'"S 

I TH 3-5 19.7 3.51.% 

II bH 3-7 62.7 1.1.018 

15 Pub].ic Latrines 34,. 9,?1 111 

TOTAL PHASE II 45. 807 

III B11 3-2 61.6 1 4'-. 

III B11 3-9 62.0 9.5-C 

III Bii 3-10 56.5 8.802 

ITT 31 Public Latrines 10.9 5.691 

TOTLj, pASE Iu 34.49'5 

Work on bath houe- o. 3-5 was h--tlted after Lhe aji

cent river f ocj the.:.r i but it: is though L .,; ,7 

may be able to start acyin with the additiotn of 

centimeters of fill to -he area and raise thu v/i]R 1. 1 

a like aiount . There i excss fill now from, the 

replacem:.ent trans.-ission main work in the nearby a:,ea 

of Jebres which has been c1t-orYAbv the Cons.iltant as a 

solution for both clean and fill. 

III-C GROUNDWATL;R EXPLORPATiuN ANDIJ WELL DEVELOPMLENT PROGVM 

Completed.
 

- 12 
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IID MANAGENM1*NT ASSIvuTMC, RGR 

Comploted. 

Itt-E 0 & M TRAINING A.ND ASSISTANCE PROGRAM 

The leak survey was started again fLrst of Febru

ary but only minimal effort was made to repair any 

of the deficiencies recorded. As with previous 

areas canvassed most if not all mkel-ere had not been 

read in many months. Several locations were found' 

in a vcry small area to be receiving water from 

previously. ut,cdLtribLution .pipes 'which .wero. not.,_ 
properly capped or plugged when the ser-vice was 
discontinued. Appendices IV and V indicate the 
areas covered by the leak survey and the work un
derway or completed with regard to the replacenent 
program. 

The Consultant received a Notice of Award to pro
ceed with the procurement of all 0 & M equipment 
and tools. Before months end all Purchase Orders 
were written and sent to the various suppliers. 
The items designated to be procured locally were
 

also handled in a manner so that USAID can reim-.
 
burse purchase of the shop air compressor and ra

dio equipment. The radio equipment was received
 

and in use before the end of February on funds
 

provided by the Surakarta Water Enterprise. The
 
Project has been asked to temporarily finance the
 

purchase of the shop air compressor.
 

Several days of productivity were lost as a direct 

result of the flood on the night of 17 February
 

at Cokrotulung. A good bit of damage resulted to
 
Surakarta Water Enterprise property. The emer

gency pipe which spanned the Kali Pusur was des

- 13 



tacIoLcl. Also lost w'|l, sovplinwocibi or-ej oC the 

-souLti crnbankitorit. The', fdiS aI.,L, recededi to Lhe 
et-,casotLnnt of th~e 0 4,0 i Lrimsmisstoniwiin strcivit 

CrcJ 'i I '.. Thal. pi1Aln is two urtf cow thi 

centul [ne of Lhe rniw .500 wiw pipeline wh LcL:h was 

installed undei. this project an: which lay; up

streamw o: thu older pipu.ine. NelI h r of the two 

pipelinus fiJled hovever a voi! did re-Iulit nrd 

riveiir wA ter Ui:'dn.C so th i L rL. I:lcC)ed ho.h 

work ist rStluird Th, ucctkar:ti Watecr i.t crprine 
wa given recc",,'me,ndatons immediaLly by th Con

sulcitnt and a report t-.offrming those rccLntanaa
-
....tions: i . includie, 'heic; --n -as--Appendizx VTT I,.........,,,,-..............
 

-ayor of Surakarta is to be cW)rmended tot: his ar

tLons and concern dotEinq the errjency. Apprecia

tion of the people of Surakarta was exterid,-,d to 

the Mi lit*try ond Boy S outs who worked Lo shore 
up the area around the pipelines and to the Citi

zen BDa',I Radio Club w.ho set up a rttdio at Cokro

tulunq 24 hours pur day monitoring the river and 

coordinating activlit; between thre and Surai

karta through use of the desiqnited emergency 

Chanrtel 37. 

During the tuat on the ropla c,-,ent 450 nim at 

Jobres the valve ins.de the pipe gallery of the 

reservoir was closed. Although thi.s was previous

ly tested to 7 atmospheres, duzing this test the 

tee adjacent to the valve moved 3 centimeters 

north. The space which was in the sleeve coup

ling at that locition was tt'en up completely so 

the pipe could not soparate but did cause a leak. 
The pipe will be disassembled at the affectod 

joint and repositionid a spacer will be installed 

within the sleeve coupling to prevent arexcurince. 

- 14 



To facilitate testing the asbestos cemOnt pipe the 

C orsutanl wrote a spectal test procecre, Pastcx

perithne has siown the pipc wiL absorh water to 

some e-tent and widll swell as does wood when wet. 

B~y allawhvj the Litpeline to absorb water wl. Lhut 

pressuro for at least four days, th,-,re resulted a 

good test,
 

The Coni~iultant has~ rjucstud tho Project- to prc.-O 

with the ncce.-sary modificaLions to the existingj 

0 & M facilities by building the warehouse shelv

ing, bins, shop tabkns and the cquipm:!nt foulndations. 

As of this writing nothing has been done. 

Ill-F METER REPAIh TRANNING PROGPLAM 

Completed.
 

I1-C NEW WATER DISTRIBUTION NE'rwoRK DESIGN 

Completed. 

III - COIFERENCES 

02 February 1982 : Coordination meeting with the 

two distribution main contractors and SWE wherein
 

it was pointed outSt was to rtke an exploratory ex

cavation near Pasar Legi to determine exact condi

tion of the existing mai, to verify need to replace
 

it. The Contractors were cautioned to not use more
 

than one gasket per flanged joint.
 

- 15 



03 Febrary .1982 : CoordinVatlon r thenitet[gqwith 

three contractiors involvaod with bath hOu.s and 
public la-ri.ws whero n -it was sated the latrine 
work should be copltransprior to starting ariother, 
I t Wa S alSo0SLyCsuggs~q c Fhacse I an d 1Pha se XET con
traCtorS submit th-eir invoices. 

09 February 1982 :Coordinct ton meet in-J with t h 
two distribution main curitrdtct.rs whe!:oin Phal; ' T 
contractor was inswtrUIC.tC L connectLionst,-) comrp lete 

to the 0 500 mm transmi.ss ion main fLroft priority as
 
the northern part of the City needs supply of the
 
,"ter from it. After that, the replac-x'ent ot the
 
4 450'Y 'm- "'- 9'Vg' K- . .
1K9.p-l ' -dit .dn6 .,' 

Phase I. advised there is a greaLer qLuaintity of 
stream ctrossings than scheduled - he was refered to 
Page 11-3 of the Contract. Documents. 

10 February 19?,2 : Cooidii ation meetinj with the 
three contractors involved with bath houses and 
public latrines wherein approval was givett to the 
use of a bronze groutnd key stop at the service con
nections provided by the -ont,-actor along with the 
submitted floor drain. It was stated the now float 
valves must be one inch size. The faucet as sc~iihdtt
ed by Phase II was not approved - it was suggested 

he use same as was installed at BU 3-6. The Phase 
II contractor was given approval to use an existing 

foundation found at PL III-Ci-1 while excavathig for
 
the septic tank as one of the walls of that septic
 

tank.
 

11 February 1982 : Site visitation by representa
tives of USAID including the Director - Office of 
Project Development - QturoaU For Asia Out of Jkashington 

and the Deputy Direct6r' of The World Bank, Jalkarta. 
A briefing of the Project and goals/accomplishments 
was provided followed by a tour of the Bath Houses 

- 16 
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undor co: u inand. PLIb1.c Hydcan Ls lre-a,,iy in 

Use hy the ~uie 

16 PC2h:..u-1r.' ~'rtiqwth Vl!Codr~~othI 

twot ii bu: ici main 'on trau-torz; h r1ri IA.e 

conrac-nr dv*.:-d ho h16 paid fur hi. - cro:;<;Inc c,' 

the ai.Lra and Lice otht2 c con Lu>Ic or w&j dvHe 

to CIO the Same. 

17 Foebrudr?. J902 Cu.2ii.Lionm: L ,~ith tbx 

three cotractors irivc;,1Ivedl wii Vth heiuses-. a 1., 

pub li.c .1 Lr inus whc r-'irn it was iictw1a tuil, c 0x

tcnz ior,. il bc reqLju ;t! d due to r) b am -a-iI 

been c-ncaunfur-tcl with DPU . All ce c:Lr. W:-, 

cautioned to corsna crvice ccO:ibiee-Ajon1. to tho 

dis tributiotn matinsi-,L Sl,JtA 

Meetir.vj in thte offic:L--; o[ Dire--ctorate, of Sjm i hurvc 

Enginet-rIng - ]',m; is tics, Jak tr Vt to rcrvi 1-2w bids 

rtec-u ived fc-c the! waE:t-,. we).L ou-pi.ng ecjuii nrvn L 
Of tho sIx malinf itemis c) Tede F r, 11. I0ets , t 

was agrcj;cee1 in thin- ivu- !tin' th:.t all iu, r t i !s cou 111 

accept those suji teil.:v o toer>,. 2, 3, 4 :ld 

6. Item 1 and 5 wer nbcite by a crpny wh i c

handled pu.iips of . ar L oc inJuc ntside- th-? 

USAI 1 n rv' Code ICoun Lric-s. TheC~iaI ~at 

waz r q LI. S Ld to0bC)L) .n Fo0re inr f o!r1 cl t ion f V0 the1'' 

supplier regjccrdli.ny th-e percentag.s- of tho t'r,,,j[uti 

vcalue0 which W;iuote to theD United Sti'te-.; in 

relation to the total- ~ce for te .tcm f nL-,.-I 

excoort frum thc Unite! States.- QuE stio-n of sparea 

parts was ailo rai5CC. thg Pr: tnChclwe 
to utsc Indon:)resia I a-ca nriLOr -"701 tho geneIird LCor set-;, 
USA "D 1nu Lnoved i. t. j n .dc tO: on .- I t..criz ;l 

ta-b led t(. thr e;.Lnc in cce i> for 18 'bar 

1932. 

- 1.7 
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16 F~bruvy 1989N 1 tbdhe CCI .01-Oc oom 

of 'tl Q.rucate of Scntr EnirJLWiotl in ji 

ka :t to complete reviwo os~J IS ubnittad for 
the Pum~ping oCtulpment. ayrood in 

....~~%Iwatur well
dr Q%, of pro)....... 

It was 
Kthis metn to proceet with the lowot resp nths ,v 

bid for eath Item regtrlsn of the circumtancas 
with tho understanding inforiv ation WOLAd stlt be 
obtained for: USAID on the .)LMPS S;O that they can 
proceed to obtain, necessary' watver-; i-F r ,quirf-d. 
It was fucther agred to purcli'r. one spairo Pumip 
unit for each woletwhich consist d of Pump, mtor 
-ind cable. For Li : yonerator setin th paree 
were ewtctblished red agreed to b o sresedthat 
ton percent of the value of the original bid. All 
agreerunts weru confirmed by the Consultan c. 

Appendix VI). 

22obrna 1t982 osting with SWv regarding th-. 

Flood dwage at Cokrotulunppi and the Consultant's 
reconarindations for corrective arition (sae Appundix 
VII for tho compl1ete report). 

23 Ferar 1982 Coordination eeting wih the 
two distribution main contractors wherein final 
items of work were discussed.' It was stressed that 

all work should be complete by tho end of Marc... 

III-J ACTIVITIES PLANNED FOR NEXT MONTH 

Continue with all contruction activity. Follow up 
on water well pumping equipment procurement. 
Prepare Tender Documents for the balance of public 
latrine restoration work. Propare Tender Documcats 
for Phase III distribution main work. Hold final 
inspections where Phase I and Phase 11 contractors 
call for them. Continue with leak survey and re
placement programs. Train SWE people in the proper 
use and care of the radio equipment as part of the 
O-J-T of the 0 & M training. 

. ... . . .... - t 
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SURAKAR' 

REPORT OF 

BURNS 8 McDONNELL/TI 

CONTRACT NO. COSTS FOR - CUMULATIVE COSTS THROUGH 

OI/WS-S/AI D/78 ,_ 

SIGNED 26OCT. 1978 

START I JAN. 1978 % OF TOTA 

END 30 SEP. 1982 FEBRUARY 1982 AMOUNT BUDGET 

REIMBURSABLE ' ESTIMATE 
EXPENDITURES 

US 

Sooaries and Related Costs 13,595.66 1,008,828.92 89.1 
Trcnsportotion - 73,631.72 88.3 
Equipment 12,455.36 77.8 

Miscellaneois 63,563.48 109.4 

Contingencies 53,543.45 84.6 

TOTAL DOLLARS 13,595.66 1,212,022.93 88.5 

INDO 

Salaries 3,461,000 176,951,384 79.0 

Tronsportotiop 1,055,100 72,261,603 86.0 

Housing - 64,000,000 101.6 

Vehiclo Costs 621,000 50,489,972 94.0 

Equipment Costs - 24,610,860 101.4 

Miscellaneous 159,770 83,865,480 91.3 
Contingencies - 33,144,580 99.7 

TOTAL RUPIAH 5,296,870 * 505,323,879 88.1 

* Through Invoice No.
 



A WATER PROJECT 

rNGINEERING COSTS 

,ANS-ASIA ENGINEERING ASSOC. 

I_ 
CUMULATIVE 

_I 
PAYMENTS THROUGH 

TOTAL BUDGET 

AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT %OF ESTIMATE FOR 

RECEIVED RECEIVED TOTAL 

IN THROUGH BUDGET CONT RACT 

FEBRUARY 1982 FEBRUARY 1982 ESTIMATE 

DOLLARS 

15,775.74 995,233.26 87.9 113 2,179 

73,631.72 88.3 16,000 
-12,455.36 77.8 

63,563.48 109.4 bb,063 

53,543.45 84.6 II 63,271 
I , 52, 3 b6 

15,775.74 1 ,1198,427.27 88 _ 

ESIAN RUPIAHJ 

163,329,217 72.9 8223,7595,20 

68,331,483 81.4 3 

64,000,000 

4__ _ __4 29t-47 2 _ -

101.6 62,975,000 
53 , 6 7 5 , O CC, 

24,610,860 
82,362,140 

101.4 
89.7 

11 24,2 53,0'0 
9 i,e i0, 000 

33,144,580 99.7 33,236,460 

83 007, 2__52 84.3 3 .... 

26 January 1982 
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LI. 
I 

PH 
II Jt. 

LOC. 
LEOOKSARI 0 80 

SI?., 
(OLD 8 ) 

LENGTH. 
675 LM 

DATE 
7/806 

12 11 JL SAWEAN (KARIMUNJAWAJ 00 COLD ,0 1 165..t 6/90 ..

4 
5 
6 

1II 
it 
II 
II 

JL. ENGGANO 
JL. TEG,5LHARDJO 
JL. CINOEREJO Pr. III 
JL. NU3UKAN 

0 S5 
0 80 
0100 
0150 

(OLD 
(OLD 
(OLD 
(OLD 

90 ) 
80 )-NOT 
80 ) 

125 )-NOT 

40.61 
CONN. 2!5YLM 

400 L:, 
CONIN. ) 60 LM 

81
s0/ 
8A.O . 
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0-- OLD 0I ROG. 1219-4141 
04001 OLL) 400) 280 C 

4r (OLD 400, ,2069 LM 
5 1' '252 LM' 

"% 

/ 

9/80' 
8/80 ;, 
10/80!, 
10/80 ".-.. 
8/80 
8/80 

7/81 
1/82 

2/82 

'\ 

24 
25 

IV 
IV 

JL. JOYOOYO 
JEBRES RESE 

JL. PASARLEGI 0 
OIR a 

75 
5 

( IR 
OLD B 

) 255. 
"0.' o 

,' ' "•,.s, .. 

X.. 

9p 
'... v ,' • , 

A, I 
.J'--, 

. ~scl . ,, '1, 
,a 

. .,; ... ... I ..... , 

4 - .I 

I ~If 
• p . 4,..... .

-_ --- _ , 

" "" . -

noll 



LENGTH ± 0ATE . 0/ . 

675 LM
1651.-4,. 

7/030
6 80 

-NOT CONN. 2,5'LM ZO 
., 

4C0 Lv 8MQ.. 
-NOT CONN. 60 LM 
SE SERV.) /150 LM 

o250 LM 

9/80 
9/80 ,' 
a/,so 

'" -" ,oo, 

USE SERV.,' 785 LM 
USE SERV. 5500 LM 
LINE K.) 4 400 LM

/ 600 LM/400 LM 
S 30 1,M 

10/80!1 
10/80',":!
8/80 
8/803/131
7,/81 

. 

/1."243 LM 
.,.820 LM 

1/82
2/82.) 

IN,ROG. . 

Sio 

"
 
'07 2 '0.... 

- 05* -/ 

. ,
* b.4,),-* 



V ----- APPENDIX 

II 

r! )# 14 

? 1 

3-t 

014 2 

em . ILII-98 DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM 

,1 V.. 
BURNS& Mc 

E 
ENGINEERIG CO' 

ASSOCIATES 

'URK.T HYRALI ANALYSIS 

- " 

? Il~.* I N 

,'i • "1441. .,." t I. 

,, FIGURE il 

":. ,SURAKARTA HYDRAULIC ANALYSIS 

'" I. 1985 DISTRIBUTION SYSTEMA 

" T-.', ' BURNS & McDONNELL ENGINEERING CO. 
'- ""o,. TrANS-ASIA ENGINEERING ASSOCIATES 

.- .. .. 



VI~*-~-APPENDIXh 

Atchtn- A rs. A-JOINT VENTURE Consutants -Plinnitts 

TRANS-ASIA En "Mlrinig 14ociates, In c 

REcENED 
plom$ Reply to! C/o.~ 

K our 4ef Z4J, 

0i 

f. o (P .i.. r *IaH n 

--- A k* 

$ ~&~t s~ d~Ulis.a~ 

)L. 

it rmc u.*2 mitnj 

- )~LA.~*0 1* ?at t4 "': VdC**~ * 

tOift 1. ~ 4$ s* -& 'y1j,~t. 4* * fix 4 S~f fl t *t4 0

r e, A~Ee~~i~r~t's~ cm~l r .Lii~ts h: yi~O ,

- c4 

* ~ C 1~;s~~N~i7(4.6.~ 

~~~ vi . ~ Vvrid ,:rr I ce,. ii 4dAU 

T~~~~±~~~~oi ~ 18 6i~0 0/ 2Ut;0 .4 



MON &McQDON--NELL Eng~aterin&Q. 

TRAS-AIAEnq~aeern4 Associ'e5, n.c, 

to$u1 H u Gosnt:Mir~~-

Hnzt
I tv ch 35 -X.JsohP -vmc 'la 

111C.r~n nutilDiii r10Di. oL:1:1$tc 

,u0.C 30 i 

rvvin yourcaryaorva t procood~Iin thisU' 4,63r.0)
 

Cutruly?4 ~ CIC.-X~uti) D~Pc3,10
 

If Mrc, )w' t) M 
0 loc.:~ Iiio crurr re .

Fr . ~r vJ .I 
tA~~ 

tb, tioplvC.1.1 ran O/z 
C"04 I4y r11unTIt OIdnio Wi 

PiloV
 



PROOSA.ALUATION
 

2 	 ~ 3 4 5 

~ 	 ~ P~p~ *uerator& 6tartdr/ 1'r~nu~ssio(upo and:, PiSpe,ftt.ngs Chlorina-
ft~switch, equip, connetu 

ficabl; 

$'Byron~ Jacson., 3

Pump-My~sion $55,171 
3t 

-777- 7--

TERW Pleusgar ~.24,974 	 -- $~''12,336 
Co1ul 	 P=P No bid -

4 1Haward, Tye No bi 

A.(Pro rome No.1) 0 18,994.66 	 Inl V/
B.(Pro-forma 	 No.2) $ 220064,63 - Inl /2 

TisRte $ 230290 4j83o 	 $ 


Chlorinator, Lne. 	 4,630, -'1$ 

.-'HyroIntr~uments 	 $60075ti 
Capital Controls $ 6,905 --


Wallace 6Tiernan - No bid -


Caa~Lno Mid AericaA (U , Plog Ship) f tf	 

7v1 

,f sam 	Brown Coo 
A. -KhZtr quip. 	 98#325ftf 	 f 

as Waukesha Equip. 	 234*089ftf 

.Kstolight Corp, 	 No bid 

SoCoat Industries 	 No bid f
 

ftil Custom Control M 	 1o 20 
*.General Electric Mt 	 No bid 

1, Westinghouse M No bid 
)fAllen Bradley No bi 

ote s, Corrected price
 

http:18,994.66
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'~.r.It0'V 	 5: 
mrInst~~ria IvInc 

1203 Ozark
 
NorthKancns City, Missouri
 
641186 

Burns & 	 McDonneln Co sg .jr p, t kn Feb. 24, 1982mmn~d 	 AMEBICH aohn INUSRILn 
4800 a3t 63rd Street
 
2anca City, sourJ
1i88 64141 	 ProposTl Nmo: '1031 

Attention 	 Alneo
Coodnow 	P.E.
 

-Projert:Rfleorence: Surakartt, Indons.t Waticw Project 	 78-877-2-001 
Item4 #4 	- Generator and Transfer Switch

CUMMENS MID.A.MJ1tCA, INC, INDUSTMIAL DIVi3iON proposes to deliver to yok' tri mtnclory

described herein, f.u,0 cof origin at prlce3 StOte inaedrinoa with the toef-liand cond'itions on the
 
back~ of this qujotatlon.
 

rated 155 K.W. and T20A 81 GC r1tod 200 K.W.
 

Pairtoi listed bebliw are afp1Itcabla to bothi units, 

I Aft 07110 Main bearing sot
 
We2r WTha20513006737 Corosithonflcoverreistseal re p: t T~v
1 Roar waf itfo 

1 3004316 Ancesory drive pultey sal
 
2 204586.. T.. Li
 
2 186780 Thorinostai; se.al
 
2 21536 	 rWMitcnp)ump bolts
 
2 17870q ont bolts
 
1 2005419 Alternator bolt
 

12 214950 Rod bering 
12 WF 2051 Corrosion realstor 
6 FS 1201 Fuel filter 
1. 30081.01 Cylinder head
 
1 3000886 pu
oater 	 eep
 
1. 30144156 Engine gasket set
 

Parts listed below are app2.ioabln to NT 855 GC (155 K.W.) unit only. 

6 3018329 rnjactor

3 3014602 Cylindar kits
 

Note: 	 3014602 cylinder kit contnins the following parL nMtb-rs
 
that are common to both units;
 

3 213740 Liners 
) 	 3 21.5091 Packing


3 183049 Packing

3 215090 Crevice seals
 

2 PIO-6632 Air cloanor clement 
2)f P10-t6541 Air cleanor elomtunt 

0104-0 0'1 Pr~ue 
lt 1611" 0 * ,.- SALES PARTS / SOnVWCE 

Phone: 14816-474-6080 	 qrQw oiqf Actvo.iriv~s for Constructions Electric Power Coneration 
0 srr.+n /' RENTALS$ 

OP.,a, Mil A* #~ 4 100Cwft- 14 AA' 	 A.-4 ~ ew ti, *I$ A0' 4 I .0 ' C4-o V4 Axwitd, t44 CONNAS 4q A,",4 

t*'4*4ftttj 	 " 1 i t 1'4 3 t4#41 

http:30081.01


Proposa~l No. 4031 
February 24, 1982 
Page 2. 

Parts listed below are applicable to the NTA 855 GC only (200 K.WJ. 

3 3017958 Piston & pin 
6 
2 

30188 3 
14829S 

In )ul.ctors
Cooler o'rincjs 

2 
2 

195952 
P .L-6453 

After cooler o'rings 
Air cleaner element 

2 lPIl-6446 Air cleanrer elem-ient 

Part,, 1iv~tod bulow are for tho A.C. generator. 

1 
1 
I 

3020009 
3020n20 
2020.... 

Pegulator 
Rectifiur assmbLy 
Surge suppressor 

Full pric C.T.F. Port of Semarang ...................... $7,430.00
 

Not. At ,ve parts list is for spare parts only. It does not
 
cont-ain enough parts to overhaul units.
 

Delivery: 120 - 180 days from date of approved ordeor
 

Terms: Per your Did Solicitation
 

Note: Above price does not include taxes if applicable.
 

Note: Above price is firm based on order within 60 days erom
 
da-te of this docuiienit. 

Respectfully submitted, 

Frank Parish:jc Manager - Generator Sales 

http:7,430.00
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