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3. Pressure Control Equioment: Continued

C. Testing Procedure:

Annular Preventer (Hydril).

At a minimum, the Annular Preventer will be pressuretested to 50% of the rated working pressure for a periodof ten (10) minutes or until provisions of the test aremet, whichever is longer.

At a minimum, the above pressure test will be performed:
1. When the annular preventer is initially installed;2. Whenever any seal subject to test pressure is broken;3. Following related repairs; and4. At thirty (30) day intervals.
In addition to the above, the annular preventer will befunctionally operated at least weekly.
Blow-Out Preventer.

At a minimum, the BOP, choke manifold, and relatedequipment will be pressure tested to the approved workingpressure of the BOP stack (if isolated from the surfacecasing by a test plug) or to 70% of the internal yieldstrength of the surface casing (if the BOP is not isolatedfrom the casing by a test plug). Pressure will bemaintained for a period of at least ten (10) minutes oruntil the requirements of the test are met, whichever islonger.

At a minimum, the above pressure test will be performed:
1. When the BOP is initially installed;2. Whenever any seal subject to test pressure is broken;3. Following related repairs; and4. At thirty (30) day intervals.
In addition to the above, the pipe and blind rams will beactivated each trip, but not more than once each day.
All BOP drills and tests will be recorded in the IADCdriller's
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3. Pressure Control Equipment:

C. Testing Procedure:

Blow-out Preventer. Continued

The Vernal District Office, Bureau of Land Management vill
be notified tventy-four (24) hours in advance (at a
minimum) of running pressure tests in order to have a BLM
representative on location during testing.

D. Choke Manifold Equipment.

All choke lines will be straight lines unless turns usetee blocks or are targeted with running tees, and will beanchored to prevent whip and vibration.

E. Accumulator:

The accumulator will have sufficient capacity to open thehydraulically-controlled choke line valve (if soequipped), close all rams plus the annular preventer, andretain a minimum of 200 psi above precharge on the closingmanifold without the use of the closing unit accumulatorcapacity and the fluid level will be maintained at themanufacturer's recommendations. The BOP system will havetwo (2) independent power sources to close the preventers.
Nitrogen bottles (3 minimum) will be one (1) of theseindependent power sources and will maintain a charge equalto the manufacturer's specifications. The accumulatorprecharge pressure test will be conducted prior to
coanecting the closing unit to the BOP stack and at leastonce every six (6) months thereafter. The accumulator
pressure will be corrected if the measured prechargepressure is found to be above or below the maximum or
minimum limits specified in Onshore Operating Order #2.

F. Miscellaneous information:

The Blow-Out Preventer and related pressure controlequipment will be installed, tested and maintained incompliance with the specifications in and requirements of
Onshore Operating order #2.

The choke maniÈold and BOP extension rods with hand wheelswill be located outside the rig
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F. Miscellaneous Information: Continued

The hydraulic BOP closing unit will be located at leasttwenty-five (25) feet from the well head but readilyaccessible to the driller. Exact locations and configura-tions of the hydraulic BOP closing unit will depend uponthe particular rig contracted te drill this hole.
A flare line will be installed after the choke manifold,extending 100 feet (minimum) from the center of the drillhole to a separate flare pit.

4. The Proposed Casing and Cementing Program:
A. Casing Program: (All New)

Hole Size Casing Size .Wt./Ft. Grade Joint Deoth Set
17-1/4" 13-3/8" Steel Conductor 0-200'12-1/4" 9-5/8" 36.0# J-55 ST&C 0-3000'8-3/4" 7 " 26.0# N-80 LT&C 0-8300'8-3/4" 7 * 26.0# S-95 LT&C 8300-11200'6-1/2" 5 * 18.0# S-95 LT&C 10900-14500'

Casing string(s) will be pressure tested to 0.22 psi/foot,or 1500 pai (not to exceed 70% of the internal yieldstrength of the casing), whichever is greater, aftercementing and prior to drilling out from under the casingshoe.

On all exploratory wells, and on that portion of any wellapproved for a SM BOPE system or greater, a pressureintegrity test of each casing shoe shall be performed.The formation at the shoe shall be tested to a minimum ofthe mud weight equivalent anticipated to control theformation pressure to the next casing depth or at a totaldepth of the well. This test shall be performed beforedrilling more than twenty (20) feet of new hole.
B. Cementing Program:

Surface Conductor : Approximately 150 sx. Redi-Mix,
circulated to surface.

Surface Casing : Lead with approximately 850 sx
"Lite" cement (65/35
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4. The Proposed Casing and Cementing Program:

B. Cementing Program: Continued

Surface Casing : Tail with approximately 275 sx
Class "Gn cement, circulated tosurface with 100% excess.

Intermediate Casing : Lead with approximately 1620 sx
Class "G" Nitrified foam, tail
with approximately 330 sx classnG" cement.

Production casing : Approximately 380 sx 50/50 Pozmixwith additives.
A greater amount of cement will be used if necessary toensure that all potentially productive hydrocarbon zonesare cemented off. Fill-up to be determined from logs.
All waiting on cement (WOC) times will be adequate toachieve a minimum of 500 psi compressive strength at thecasing shoe prior to drilling out.
The Vernal District Office, Bureau of Land Management willbe notified twenty-four (24) hours in advance (at aminimum) of running and cementing casing strings.

5. Mud Program: (Visual Monitoring)

Interval Tvoe Weight Viscosity Fluid Loss
0-3000' Native Mud 8.2- 8.8 35-50 No Control3000-8300' Fresh Water 8.8- 9.4 26-29 No Control8300-14500' Gel/Polymer 9.4-15.0 35-45 10-12 cc's

sufficient mud matefial to maintain mud properties, controllost circulation and contain a flowout will be available atthe well site during drilling operations.
6. Evaluation Program:

Logs : DIL-SP-GR * : 14,500' - 8,300'FDC-CNL-GR-CAL : 14.500' - 8,300'BHC-Sonie-GR : 14,500' - 8,300'

* Pull Gamma Ray to
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6. Evaluation Program: Continued

DST'S : None anticipated.

9"ISA : None anticipated.

The evaluation program may be altered at the discretion of thewellsite geologist, with prior approval from the AuthorizedOfficer, Bureau of Land Manageament.

Stimulation : No stimulation or frac treatment hasbeen formulated for this test at thistime. The drill site, as approved, willbe of sufficient size to accommodate allcompletio activities.
Whether the well is completed as a dry hole or as a producer,Well Completion and Recompletion Report and Log (Form 3160-4)will be submitted to the Vernal District Office, Bureau ofLand Management not later than thirty (30) days after thecompletion of the well or after completion of operations beingperformed, in accordance with 43 CFR 3164.
Two (2) copies of all logs, core descriptions, core analysos,well test data, geologic summaries, sample description, andall other surveys or data obtained and compiled during thedrilling, workover, and/or completion operations, will befiled with Form 3160-4. Sar-pies (cuttings, fluids, and/orgases) will be submitted whan requested by the AuthorizedOfficer, Vernal District Office, Bureau of Land Management,170 South 500 East, Vernal, Utah 84078, Phone: (801) 789-1362.

7. Abnormal Conditions:

No abnormal temperatures or pressures are anticipated. No H2Shas been encountered in or known to exist from previous wellsdrilled to similat depths in the general area. Maximumanticipated bottom hole pressure equals approximately 6743 poi(calculated at 0.465 psi/foot) and maximum anticipated surfacepressure equals approximately 3553 psi (bottom hole pressureminus the pressure of a partially evacuated hole calculated at0.22
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8. Anticicated Starting Dates and Notification of ooerations:
A. Drilling Activity

Anticipated Commencement Date : September 1, 1992Drilling Days : Approximately 60 daysCompletion Days : Approximately 30 days
B. Notification of Operations

The Vernal District Office, Bureau of Land Management willbe notified at least twenty-four (24) hours PRIOR to thecommencement of the following activities:

1. Spudding of the well. This oral report will befollowed up with a Sundry Notice (Form 3160-5).

2. Initiating pressure tests of the blow-out
preventer and related equipment.

3. Running casing and cementing of ALL casingstrings.

No location will be constructed or moved, no well will beplugged, and no drilling or workover equipment will beremoved from a well to be placed in suspended statuswithout prior approval of the Authorized Officer. Ifoperations are to be suspended, prior approval of theAuthorized Officer will be obtained and notification givenbefore resumption of operations.

In accordance with Onshore Operating order #1, this wellwill be reported on MMS Form 3160-6, "Monthly Report ofOperations", starting with the month in which operationscommence and continuing each ronth until the well isphysically pluggep and abandoned. 3ais report will befiled directly with the Royalty Managemenet Program,Minerals Management Service, P. O. Box 17110, Denver,Colorado 80217.

Immediate Report: Spills, blowouts, fires, leaks,accidents, or any other unusual occurrences shall bepromptly reported in accordance with the provisions ofNTL-3A or its curkent
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8. Antielppteg Startipq Dates and Notification of Operations:
B. Notification of Operations Continued

If a replacement rig is contemplated for completionoperations, a "Sundry Notice" (Form 3160-5) to that effectwill be filed for prior approval of the AuthorizedOfficer, and all conditions of this approved plan will beapplicable during all operations conducted with thereplacement rig.
Should the well be successfully completed for production,the Authorized Officer will be notified when the well isplaced in a producing status. Such notifica' -n will besent by telegram or other written communicati-a no laterthan five (5) business days following the date on whichthe well is placed on production.

Pursuant to NTL-2B, with the approval of the AuthorizedOfficer, produced water may be temporarily disposed ofinto the reserve pit for a period of up to ninety (90)days. During this period so authorized, an applicationfor approval of the permanent disposal method, along withthe required water analysis and other information, must besubmitted to the Authorized Officer.
Pursuant to NTL-4A, lessees and operators are authorizedto vent/flare gas during initial well evaluation tests,not exceeding a period of thirty (30) days or theproduction of fifty (50) MMCF of gas, whichever occursfirst. An application must be filed with the AuthorizedOfficer, and approval received, for any venting/flaring ofgas beyond the initial thirty (30) day or otherwiseauthorized test period.

A schematic facilities diagram as required by 43 CFR3162.7-2, 3162.7-3, and 3162.7-4 shall be submitted to theVernal District Office within thirty (30) days ofinstallation or first production, whichever occurs first.All site security regulations as specified in 43 CFR3162.7 shall be adhered to. All product lines enteringand leaving hydrocarbon storage tanks will be effectivelysealed in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.7-4.
A first production conference will be scheduled withinfifteen (15) days after receipt of the first production
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8. Antigipated Starting Dates and Notification of Operations:
B. Notification of Operations - Continued

No well abandonment operations will be commenced withoutthe prior approval of the Authorized Officer. In the caseof newly-drilled dry holes or failures, and in emergencysituations, oral approval will be obtained from theAuthorized Officer.

A "Notice of Intention to Abandon" (Form 3160.5) will befiled with the Authorized Officer within fifteen (15) daysfollowing the granting of oral approval to plug & abandon.
Upon completion of approved plugging, a regulation markerwill be erected in accordance with 43 CFR 3162.6. Thefollowing information will be permanently placed on themarker with a plate, cap, or beaded-on with a weldingtorch: "Fed" or "Ind", as applicable; Company Name, WellName and Number, Location by Quarter/Quarter, section,Township, Range, and Federal or Indian Lease Number.

A "Subsequent Report of Abandonment" (Form 3160-5) will besubmitted within thirty (30) days followiwng the actualplugging of the wellbore. This report will indicate whereplugs were placed and the currenet status of surfacerestoration operations. If surface restoration has notbeen completed at that time, a follow-up report on Form3160-5 will be filed when all surface restoration work hasbeen completed and the location is considered ready forfinal inspection. Final abandonment will not be approveduntil the surface reclamation work required by theapproved Application for Permit to Drill has beencompleted to the satisfaction of the Authorized Officer orhis representative, or the appropriate surface ManagementAgency.

Pursuant to Onshore Operating Order #1, lessees andoperators have the responsibility to see that theirexploration, development, production, and constructionoperations are conducted in such a manner which conformswith applicable Federal laws and regulations and withState and local laws and regulations to the extent thatsuch State and local laws are applicable to operations onFederal and Indian
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ANR PRODUCTION COMPANY

Tribal Lease #14-20-H62-1804, Ute 3-35A3
SW/NW, Section 35, T1S. R3W

Duchesne County, Utah

Multi-Point Surface Use and Operations Plan

1. EXisting Roads: Refer to Maps "A" & "B" (shown in ORANGE)
A. The proposed wellsite is staked and four 200-foot referencestakes are present.

B. To reach the location from the community of Bluebell, Utahproceed easterly approximately 0.9 miles on the Bluebell toHancock Cove Road, to the existing, upgraded oilfield road.Proceed in a southerly direction 0.5 miles to the beginningof the proposed access road. Follow road flags in aneasterly direction approximately 0.1 miles to the proposedlocation.

C. Access roads - refer to Maps "A" and "B".

D. Access roads within a one-mile radius - refer to Map "B".
E. The existing gravel roads will be maintained in the same orbetter condition as existed prior to the commencement ofoperations and said maintenance will continue until finalabandonment and reclamation of the Ute 3-35A3 well location.

2. Planned.Access Roads: Refer to Map "B" (Shown in GREEN)
Approximately 0.1 miles of new road construction will berequired for access to the proposed Ute 3-35A3 well location.
A. Width - maximum 30-foot overall right-of-way with an 18-footroad running surface, crowned and ditched.
B. Construction standard - the access road will be constructedin accordance with Bureau of Land Management RoadingGuidelines established for oil and gas exploration anddevelopment activities as referenced in the BLM/USFSpublication: Surfgee Operyt‡ng Standards for Oil and GasExoloration and Development (1989).

The access road will be constructed to meet the standards ofthe anticipated traffic flow and all-weather requirements.
Construction/upgrading will include ditching, draining,graveling, crowning, and capping the roadbed as necessary toprovide a well constructed and safe road.
Prior to construction/upgrading, the roadway shall becleared of any snow cover and allowed to dry completely.
Traveling off of the thirty (30) foot right-of-way will notbe
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2. Planned Access Roads: Continued

Road drainage crossings shall be of the typical dry creekdrainage crossing type. Crossings shall be designed so theywill not cause siltation or the accumulation of debris inthe drainage crossing nor shall the drainages be blocked bythe roadbed. Erosion of drainage ditches by runoff watershall be prevented by diverting water off at a frequentintervals by means of cutouts.

Upgrading shall not be allowed during muddy conditions.
Should mud holes develop, they shall be filled in anddetours around them avoided.

C. Maximum grade - 2%

D. Turnouts - turnouts will be constructed along the accessroute as necessary or required to allow for the safe passageof traffic. None anticipated at this time.
E. Drainage design - the access road will be crowned, ditched,and water turnouts installed as necessary to provide forproper drainage along the access road route.
F. Culverts, cuts and fills - no culverts will be required.There are no major cuts and/or fills on/along the proposedaccess road route.

G. Surface materials (source) - any construction materialswhich may oe required for surfacing of the access road willbe purchased from a local contractor having a permittedsource of materials in the area, if required by theAuthorized Officer, Bureau of Indian Affairs. Noneanticipated at this time. Native material from accesslocation and access road will be used.
H. Gates, cattleguards or fence cuts - as specified by BLM/BIA.ANR Production Company will be responsible for allmaintenance on those cattleguards directly associated withthe Ute 3-35A3 well location.
I. Road maintenance - during both the drilling and productionphase of operations, the road surface and shoulders will bekept in a safe and useable condition and will be maintainedin accordance with the original construction standards.
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2. Planned Access Roads: Continued

I. Road maintenance - Continued

drainage ditches and culverts will be kept clear and free-flowing, and will also be maintained in accordance with theoriginal construction standards.
The access road right-of-way will be kept free of trashduring operations.

J. The proposed access route has been centerline flagged.

3. Location of Existing Wells Within a One-Mile Radius:
Please refer to Map "C"

A. Water wells - none known.B. Abandoned wells - SW1/4, SW1/4, section 26, Tls, R3WC. Temporarily abandoned wells - none known.D. Disposal wells - none known.E. Drilling wells - none known.F. Producing wells - SE1/4, NW1/4, Section 26, T1S, R3WNE1/4, NE1/4, Section 35, T1S, R3WNW1/4, SE1/4, Section 35, T1S, R3WNE1/4, SW1/4, Section 34, T1S, R3WNW1/4, NE1/4, Section 34, T1S, R3WNE1/4, NE1/4, Section 3, T2S, R3WNE1/4, NW1/4, Section 2, T2S, R3WG. Shut-in wells - none known.H. Injection wells - none known.I. Monitoring wells - none known.
4. Location of Existing and/or Proposed Facilities:

A. If well is productive the following guidelines will befollowed:

1. A diagram showing the proposed production facilitieslayout will be submitted via Sundry Notice Form 3160-5prior to facilities installation.
2. All production facilities will be located on thedisturbed portion of the well pad and at a minimum oftwenty-five (25) feet from the toe of the backslope ortop of the fill slope.
3. The production facilities, consisting primarily of apumping unit at the wellhead, and a surface pipeline,will require an area approximately 3oo' x
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4. Location of Existing and/or Proposed Facilities:

4. Production facilities will be accommodated on theexisting well pad. Construction materials required forinstallation of the production facilities will beobtained from the site; any additional materialsrequired will be purchased from a local supplier havinga permitted (private) source of materials with thearea.

If storage facilities/tank batteries are constructed onthis lease, a dike will be constructed completelyaround those production facilities which contain fluids(i.e., production tanks, produced water tanks and/or
heater/treater). These dikes will be constructed ofcompacted subsoil, be impervious, hold 100% of thecapacity of the largest tank, and be independent of theback cut.

5. All permanent (on-site for six months or longer) above-the-ground structures constructed or installedincluding pumping units will laa painted a flat, non-
reflective, earthtone color to match one of thestandard environmental colors, as determined by theFive (5) State Rocky Mountain Interagency Committee.

All production facilities will be painted within six(6) months of installation. Facilities required tocomply with occupational Health and Safety Act Rulesand Regulations will be excluded from this paintingrequirement.

The required paint color is Desert Brown, Munsellstandard color number 10 YR 6/3.

6. If at any time the facilities located on public landsand authorized by the terms of the lease are no longerincluded in the lease (due to a contraction in the unitor other lease or unit boundary change), the Bureau ofLand Management will process a change in authorizationto the appropriate statute. The authorization will besubject to the appropriate rental or other financialobligation as determined by the Authorized officer.
7. A 4" surface production flowline will be installed fromthe Ute 3-35A3 well and tie into the existing batterylocated in Section 35, T1S-R3W (see attached Topo MapD). This flowline will be within tribal lease #14-20-H62-1804. A 30' width easement of approximately 2300'length is requested for this flowline (±300' of
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4. Location of Existing and/or Proposed Facilities:
7. Continued

flowline and ±2000' of new flowline along existingpipeline). There will be minimum surface disturbanceas the pipeline will be laid on the surface.
B. The need for a production pit on the well location is notanticipated at this time, however should be one necessarythe production (emergency) pit will be fenced with wovenwire mesh topped with one (1) strand of barbed wire held inplace with metal side posts and wooden corner "H" braces inorder to protect livestock and wildlife. Please refer toItem #9D (page #9) for additional information on the fencingspecifications.

C. During drilling and subsequent operations, all equipment andvehicles will be confined to the access road right-of-wayand any additional areas as specified in the approvedApplication for Permit to Drill.
D. Reclamation of disturbed areas no longer needed foroperations will be accomplished by grading, leveling andseeding as recommended by the Bureau of Indian Affairs.

5. Location and Type of water Suvoly:

A. Freshwater for drilling will be obtained from the Owen DaleAnderson water well located in the North 1/4 of Section 27,Township 1 South, Range 2 West, Duchesne County, Utah underthe existing water right #43-9974 held by Mr. Owen DaleAnderson. (See the attached application.)
B. Water will be transported over existing roads via tank truckfrom the point of diversion to the proposed Ute 3-35A3 welllocation. No new construction will be required on/along theproposed water haul route. Access roads which cross off-lease Tribal lands on/along the proposed water haul routewill be authorized under a separate right-of-way grant/special use permit to be obtained from the Uintah and OurayUte Indian Tribes and/or the Bureau of Indian Affairs priorto commencement of operations, if required.

C. No water well will be drilled on this location.

6. Source of Construction Materials:

A. Construction materials needed for surfacing of the well padwill be native from location and/or access
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6. Source of Çonytruction Materials: Continued

B. No construction materials will be taken from Federal and/orIndian lands without prior approval from the appropriate
Surface Management Agency.

C. If production is established, any additional constructionmaterials needed for surfacing the access road andinstallation of production facilities will be purchased froma local supplier having a permitted (private) source ofmaterials in the area.

D. No new access roads for construction materials will berequired.

7. Methods of Handling Waste Materials:

A. Cuttings - the cuttings will be deposited in thereserve/blooie pit.

B. Drilling fluids - Including salts and chemicals will becontained in the reserve/blooie pit. Upon termination ofdrilling and completion operations, the liquid contents ofthe reserve pit will be removed and disposed of at anapproved waste disposal facility within ninety (90) daysafter terminasion of drilling and completion activities.
In the event adverse weather conditions prevent removal ofthe fluids from the reserve pit within this time period, anextension may be granted by the Authorized Officer uponreceipt of a written request from Coastal Oil & GasCorporation. The reserve pit will be constructed so as notto leak, break, or allow discharge. The reserve pit will belined. A plastic nylon reinforced liner will be used. Itwill be a minimum of 12 MIL thickness w/sufficient bedding(either straw or dirt) to cover any rocks. The liner willoverlap the pit walls and be covered with dirt and/or rocksto hold it in place. No trash, scrap pipe, etc., that couldpuncture the liner will be disposed of in the pit. Morestringent protective requirements may be deemed necessary bythe Authorized
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7. Methods of Handling Waste Materials: Continued
C. Produced fluids - liquid hydrocarbons produced duringcompletion operations will be placed in test tanks on thelocation. Produced waste water will be confined to a linedpit (reserve pit) or storage tank for a period not to exceedninety (90) days after initial production. During theninety (90) day period, in accordance with NTL-2B, anapplication for apptsval of a permanent disposal method andlocation, along with the required water analysis, shall besubmitted for the Authorized Officer's approval. Failure tofile an application vithin the time frame allowed will beconsidered an incidence of noncompliance.

Any spills of oil, gas, salt water or other noxious fluidswill be immediately cleaned up and removed to an approveddisposal site.

D. Sewage - self-contained, chemical toilets will be providedby Rocket Sanitation for human waste disposal. Uponcompletion of operations, or as needed, the toilet holdingtanks will be pumped and the contents thereof disposed of inthe nearest, approved, sewage disposal facility.
E. Garbage (trash) and other waste material - garbage, trashand other waste materials will be collected in a portable,self-contained and fully-enclosed trash cage during drillingand completion operations. Upon complet'on of operations(or as needed) the accumulated trash will be disposed of atan authorized sanitary landfill. No trash will be burned onlocation or placed in the reserve pit.

F. Immediately after removal of the drilling rig, all debrisand other waste materials not contained in the crash cagewill be cleaned up and removed from the well location. Noadverse materials will be left on the location upon thetermination of drilling and completion operations. Any openpits will be fenced during the drilling operation and thefencing will be maintained until such time as the pits arebackfilled.

G. The reserve pit will be constructed on the existing locationand will not be located in natural drainages where a floodhazard exists or surface runoff will destroy or damage thepit walls. The pit will be constructed so as not to leak,break, or allow the discharge of liquids
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8. Ancillary Facilities:

None anticipated.

9. Wellsite Layout:

A. Figure #1 shows the drill site layout as staked. Crosssections have been drafted to visualize the planned cuts and
fills across the location. A minimum of twelve (12) inchesof topsoil will be stripped from the location (includingareas of cut, fill, and/or subsoil storage) and stockpiled
for future reclamation of the wellsite. Refer to Figure #1for the location of the topsoil and subsoil stockpiles.
(Stockpiled topsoil will be located on the east side of thelocation.) The reserve pit will be located on the northeastside of the location. The flare pit will be located

downwind of the prevailing wind direction on the east sideof location. Access to the location will be from the south.

B. Figure #1 is a diagram showing the rig layout. No permanent
living facilities are planned. There will be one (1) traileron location during drilling operations for the toolpusher.

C. A diagram showing the proposed production facility layoutwill be submitted to the Authorized Officer via SundryNotice (Form 3160-5) for approval of subsequent operations.Please refer to Item #4A (page #4) for additionalinformation in this regard.
D. Prior to the commencement of drilling operations, thereserve pit will be fenced "sheep tight" on three (3) sidesaccording to the following minimum standards:

1. 39-inch net wire shall be used with at least one (1)strand of barbed wire on top of the net wire (barbedwire is not necessary if pipe or some type ofreinforcement rod is attached to the top of the entirefence).

2. The net wire shall be no more than two (2) inches abovethe ground. The barbed wire shall be three (3) inchesabove the net wire. Total height of the fence shall beat least 42
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9. Wellsite Lavout:

D. Continued

3. Corner posta shall be cemetted and/or braced in such amanner to keep the fence tight at all times.
4. Standard steel, wood, or pipe posts shall be usedbetween the corner braces. Maximum distance betweenany two (2) posts shall be no greater than sixteen (16)feet.

5. All wire shall be stretched, by using a stretchingdevice, before it is attached to the corner posts.
The fourth side of the reserve pit will be fencedimmediately upon removal of the drilling rig and the fencingwill be maintained until the pit is backfilled.

E. Any hydrocarbons on the pit will be removed from the pit assoon as possible after drilling operations are completed.

10. Plans for Reclamation of the Surface:

A. Production

1. Immediately upon well completion, the well location andsurrounding area(s) will be cleared of all unusedtubing, equipment, debris, materials, trash and junknot required for production.

2. Immediately upon well completion, any hydrocarbons onthe pit shall be removed in accordance with 42 CFR3162.7-1.

3. The plastic or nylon reinforced pit liner shall be tornand perforated before backfilling of the reserve pit.
4. Before any dirt work to restore the location takesplace, the reserve pit will be completely dry and allcans, barrels, pipe, etc. will be removed. Other wasteand spoil materials will be disposed of immediatelyupon completion of drilling and workover
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10. Plans for Reclamation of the Surface:

A. Production - Continued

5. The reserve pit and that portion of the location andaccess road not needed for productionfacilities/operations will be reclaimed within ninety(90) days from the date of well completion, weatherpermitting.

To prevent surface water(s) from standing (ponding) onthe reclaimed reserve pit area, final reclamation ofthe reserve pit will consist of "mounding" the surface±3 feet above surrounding ground surface to allow thereclaimed pit area to drain effectively.
6. For production, the fill slopes will be reduced from a1.5:1 slope to a 3:1 slope and the cut slopes will bereduced from a 1.5:1 slope to a 3:1 slope by pushingthe fill material back up into the cut.
7. Upon completion o' backfilling, leveling andrecontouring, the stockpiled topsoil will be evenlyspread over the reclaimed area(s). Prior to reseeding,all disturbed surfaces (including the access road andlocation) will be scarified and left with a roughsurface. No depressions will be left that would trapwater and form ponds. All disturbed surfaces(including the access road and well pad areas) will bereseeded with a seed mixture to be recommended by theAuthorized Officer, Bureau of Indian Affairs.

Seed will be drilled on the contour to an approximatedepth of one-half (1/2) inch. All seeding will beconducted after September 15 and prior to ground frost.
B. Dry Hole/Abandoned Location

1. On lands administered by the Bureau of Indian Affairs,abandoned well sites, roads, or other disturbed areaswill be restored to near their original condition.This procedure will include:
(a) re-establishing, irrigation systems where



ANR Production Company
Ute 3-35A3
Surface Use & Operations Plan
Page 11

10. Plans for Reclamation of the Surface:

B. Dry Hole/Abandoned Location

1. On lands administered by the Bureau of Indian Affairs,abandoned well sites, roads, or other disturbed areaswill be restored to near their original condition.This procedure will include: Continued

(b) re-establishing, soil conditions in irrigatedfield in such a way as to ensure cultivation andharvesting of crops and,
(c) ensuring revegetation of the disturbed areas tothe specifications of the Uintah & Ouray IndianTribes or the Bureau of Indian Affairs at thetime of abandonment.

2. All disturbed surfaces will be recontoured to theapproximate natural contours with reclamation of thewell pad and access road to be performed as soon aspractical after final abandonment. Reseeding opera-tions will be performed in the fall following comple-tion of reclamation operations. Please refer to Item#10A7 (page #10) for additional information regardingthe reseeding operation,

11. Surface Ownership:

The wellsite and proposed access road are situated on surfacelands owned by the Uintah and Ouray Ute Indian Tribes andadministered in trust by:

Bureau of Indian Affairs
Uintah & Ouray Agency
P. O. Box 130
Fort Duchesne, Utah 84026
Phone: (801) 722-2406

This parcel of land is under the management of Ute TribalLivestock Enterprise, Ft. Duchesne, Utah
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12. Other Information:

A. ANR Production Company will be responsible for informing allpersons in the area who are associated with this projectthat they will be subject to prosecution for knowinglydisturbing historic or archaeological sites or forcollecting artifacts.

If historic or archaeological materials are uncovered,Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation will suspend alloperations that might further disturb such materialsand immediately contact the Authorized Officer, Bureauof Indian Affairs,

Within five (5) working days the Authorized Officerwill inform Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation as to:
- whether the materials appear eligible for theNational Register of Historic Places;

- the mitigation measures the operator willlikely have to undertake before the site canbe used (assuming in situ preservation is notnecessary); and
- a time frame for the Authorized Officer tocomplete an expedited review under 36 CFR800.11 to confirm, through the State HistoricPreservation Officer, that the findings of theAuthorized Officer are correct and thatmitigation is appropriate.

If ANR Production Company wishes, at any time, torelocate activities to avoid the expense of mitigationand/or the delays associated with this process, theAuthorized Officer will assume responsibility forwhatever recordation and stabilization of the exposedmaterials may be required. Otherwise, ANR ProductionCompany will be responsible for mitigation costs.
The Authorized Officer will provide technical andprocedural guidelines for the conduct of mitigation.Upon verification from the Authorized Officer that therequired mitigation has been completed, Coastal Oil &Gas Corporation vill then be allowed to resume
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12. Other Information: Continued

B. Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation will control noxious weedsalong rights-of-way for roads, pipelines, well sites, orother applicable facilities. A list of noxious weeds may beobtained from the Bureau of Land Management, or the UintahCounty Extension Office. On lands administered by theBureau of Land Management, it is required that a "PesticideUse Proposal" shall be submitted, and approval obtained,prior to the application of herbicides or other pesticidesor possible hazardous chemicals for the control of noxiousweeds.

On lands administered by the Bureau of Indian Affairs, it isrequired that a "Pesticide Use Proposal" be submitted andapproval obtained prior to the application of herbicides,pesticides or possible hazardous chemicals for the controlof noxious weeds.

13. Additional Sticulations for Operations on Lands Administered bythe Bureau of Indian Affairs:

A. Operator's employees, including subcontractors, will notgather firewood along roads constructed by operators. Ifwood cutting is required, a permit will be obtained from theForestry Department of the BIA pursuant to 25 CFR 169.13"Assessed Damages Incident to Right-of-Way Authorization.
All operators, subcontractors, vendors, and their employeesor agents may not disturb saleable timber (includingfirewood) without a duly granted permit from the BIAForester.

B. If the surface rights are owned by the Ute Indian Tribe andmineral rights are owned by another entity, an approvedright-of-way will be obtained from the Bureau of IndianAffairs before the operator begins any constructionactivities. If the surface is owned by another entity andthe mineral rights are owned by the Ute Indian Tribe,rights-of-way will be obtained from the other entity.
C. All roads constructed by oil and gas operators on the Uintah& Ouray Indian Reservation will have appropriate signs.Signs will be neat and of sound construction. They will
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13. Add‡t19041 Stipulgttong for Operations on Lands Administered bythe Bureau of Indian Affairs:

C. Continued

1. that the land is owned by the Uintah & Ouray Indiantribes,

2. the name of the operator,

3. that firearms are prohibited by all non-Tribal members,
4. that permits must be obtained from the Bureau of IndianAffairs before cutting firewood or other timberproducts, and

5. only authorized personnel are permitted to use saidroad.

D. All well site locations on the Uintah & Ouray IndianReservation will have an appropriate sign indicating thename of the Operator, the lease serial number, the well nameand number, the survey description of the well (eitherfootages or the quarter-quarter section, section, townshipand range).

E. ANR Production Company shall contact the Bureau of LandManagement and the Bureau of Indian Affairs between 24 and48 hours prior to commencement of construction activities.BLM: (801) 789-1362; BIA: (801) 722-2406.

F. The BIN and BIA offices shall be notified upon sitecompletion and prior to moving drilling tools onto thelocation.

14. Lessee's or ODerator's Representative and Certification:

Representative

ANR Production Company
Randy L. Bartley, operations Manager
P. O. Box 749
Denver, Colorado 80201-0749
Phone: (303)
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14. Lessee's or Operator's Representative and Certification:
Representative Continued

Eileen Dey, Regulatory Analyst*
P. O. Box 749
Denver, Colorado 80201-0749
Phone: (303) 573-4476

* Contact for any additional information which may be requiredfor approval of this Application for Permit to Drill.
Cggtif icat ion:

All lease and/or unit operations will be conducted in such amanner that full compliance is made with all applicable laws,regulations, Onshore oil & Gas Orders, the approved plan ofoperations, and any applicable Notice to Lessees.
ANR Production Company will be fully responsible for the actionsof their subcontractors. A complete copy of the approvedApplication for Permit to Drill will be furnished to the fieldrepresentative(s) to ensure compliance and shall be on locationduring all construction and drilling operations.
I hereby certify that I, or persons under my direct supervision,have inspected the proposed drill site and access route; that Iam familiar with the conditions which currently exist; that thestatements made in this plan are, to the best of my knowledge,true and correct; and that the work associated with theoperations proposed herein will be performed by ANR ProductionCompany, its contractors and subcontractors in conformity withthis plan and the terms and conditions under which it isapproved. This statement is subject to the provisions of 18U.S.C. 1001 for the filing of a false statement.

ate E een Danni ey - Regulatory
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ANR PRODUCTION COMPANY
Tribal Lease #14-20-H62-1804, UTE #3-35A3

SW/NW, Section 35, T1S, R3W
Duchesne County, Utah

Drilling Prognosis

1. Estigated Tops of Important Geologic Markers:

Tertiary Surface Wasatch 11247'
(Uinta/Duchesne) Total Depth 14500'Lower Green River 9940'

2. Estimated Deaths of Anticipated Water, Oil, Gas or MineralFormations:

Lower Green River 9940' Oil/Gas (Possible)
Wasatch 11247' Oil/Gas (Primary objective)
All usable water and prospectively valuable mineralsencountered during drilling will be recorded by depth andadequately protected. All oil and gas shows will be tested todetermine commercial potential.

3. Pressure Control Equipment: (Schematic Attached)

A. Type: 11" Double Gate Hydraulic with 11" Annular
Preventer (Hydril).

The Blow-Out Preventer will be equipped as follows:
1. One (1) blind ram (above).
2. One (1) pipe ram (below).
3. Drilling spool with two (2) side outlets (choke side3-inch minimum, kill side 2-inch minimum).4. 3-inch diameter choke .ine.

5. Two (2) choke line valves (3-inch minimum).6. Kill line (2-inch minimum).
7. Two (2) chokes with one (1) remotely controlled fromthe rig floor.
8. Two (2) kill line valves and a check valve (2-inch

minimum).
9. Upper and lower kelly cock valves with handlesavailable.

10. Safety valve(s) & subs to fit all drill stringconnections in use.
11. Inside BOP or float sub available.
12. Pressure gauge on choke manifold.
13. Fill-up line above the uppermost preventer.

B. Pressure Rating: 5,000
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ITED STATES GOVERNMENT

memorandumDATE:

Ad)G141992REPLY TO
ANNOF: •.

Superintendent, Uintah and ouray Agency
SUBJECT:

Concurrence Letter for ANR/Coastal 011 and Gas Corporation
Ute 3-35A3, SWNN, Section 36, T1S-R3W, U.S.M.

TO:
Bureau of Land Management, vernal District Office
Attention: Mr. David Little

We recommend approval of the Application for Permit to Drill on thesubject well.

Based on available information received on July, 07, 1992 , we havecleared the proposed location in the following areas of environmental
impact.

YES X NG Listed threatened or endangered species
YES NO Critical wildlife habitat
YES NO Archaeological or cultural resources
YES NO Air quality aspects 'to be used only if

Pro3ect is in or ad.iacent to a class I
area of attainment)

YEs No other (if necessary)

COMMENTS: See attached Bureau of Indian Affairs. Environmental
Anaylysis for additional stipulations.

Attachment

OPTIONAL FORM NO 10

REV I-80

GSA FPMR 41 CFN. \01-t l.6
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SURFACESTIPULATIONS

There will be a closed production and emergency system because a small stream is located
approximately600 feet East of the wellsite.

ANR will restore the well pad, access roads, and pipellne rights-of-way to near their original state. The
disturbed area will be reseeded, and the seed will be covered with a weed free organic mulch.

Noxious weeds will be controlled on all well sites and rights-of-way. If noxious weeds spread from the
well sites or rights-of-way, the company will also be responsible for their control.

New fences shall be constructed as shown on drawings #1 and #2 anached.

When the well is plugged and/or abandoned the gravel and road base hauled in to construct the well
pod and access roads will be incorporated into the soil.

Production water, oli, and other by-products will not be appIled to roads or well pads for the control of
dust c· weeds. Indiscriminate dumping of oil field by-products on tribal lands will not be allowed.

Soll compactionof the well pads and roads will be mitigated by ripping (minimum depth 24°).

All pipeline rights-of-way willbe cleared by a qualified cultural resource specialist so that cultural sites
will be avoided of



EPA'S LIST OF NONEXEMPT EXPLORATION AND PRODUCTION WASTES

While the following wastes are nonexempt, they are not necessarily
hazardous.

Unused fracturing fluids or acids

Gas plant cooling tower cleaning wastes

Painting wastes

Oil and gas service company wastes, such as empty drums, drum
rinsate, vacu2m truck rinsate, sandblast media, painting wastes,
spend solvents, spilled chemicals, and waste acids

Vacuum truck and drum rinsate from trucks and drums, transporting
or containing nonexempt waste

Refinery wastes

Liquid and solid wastes generated by crude oil and tank bottom
reclaimers

Used equipment lubrication oils

Waste compressor oil, filters, and blowdown
Used hydraulic fluids
Waste solvents
Waste in transportation pipeline-related pits
Caustic or acid cleaners
Boiler cleaning wastes

Boiler refractory bricks
Incinerator ash
Laboratory wastes

Sanitary wastes

Pesticiac wastes

Radioactive tracer wastes

Drums, insulation and miscellaneous



Section 102(b)(3) of the Federal oil and Cas Royalty Management Act
of 1982, as implemented by the applicable proviso os of the operating
regulations at Title 43 CFR 3162.4-1(c), requirer chat "not later
than the 5th business day after any well begins production on which
royalty is due anywhere on a lease site or allocated to a lease site,
or resumes production in the case of a well which has been off
production for more than 90 days, the operator shall notify the
authorized officer by letter or sundry notice, Form 3160-5, or orally
to be followed by a letter or sundry notice, of the date on which
such production has begun or resumed."

If you fail to comply with this requirement in the manner and time
allowed, you shall be liable for a civil penalty of up to 510,000 per
violation for each day such violation com inaes, not to exceed a
maximum of 20 days. See Section 109(c)(3) of the Federal oil and Gas
Royalty Management Act of 1982 and the implementing regulations at
Title 43 CFR 3162.4-1(b)(5)(ii).

APD approval is valid for a period of one (1) year from the signature
date. An extension period may be granted, if requested, prior to the
expiration of the original approval period.

In the event after-hours approvals are necessary, please contact one
of the following individuals:

Gerald E. Kenczka (801) 781-1190
Petroleum Engineer

Ed Forsman (801) 789-7077
Petroleum Engineer

BLM FAX Machine (801)



Gas produced from this well may not be vented or flared beyond an

initial authorized test period of 30 days or 50 MMCF following its
completion, whichever occurs first, without the prior written
approval of the Authorized Officer. Should gas be vented or flared
without approval beyond the authorized test period, the operator may

be directed to shut-in the well until the gas can be captured or
approval to continue venting or flaring as uneconomic is granted and

the operator shall be required to compensate the lessor for that
portion of the gas vented or flared without approval which is
determined to have been avoidably lost.

All site security regulations as specified in onshore oil & Gas Order

No. 3 shall be adhered to.

7. Other Information

All loading lin il be placed inside the berm surrounding the tank
battery.

All off-lease storage, off-lease measurement, or commingling on-lease

or off-lease will have prior written approval from the AD.

Gas meter runs for each well will be located within 530 feet rf the
wellhead. The gas flowline will be buried or anchowed down from the
wellhead to the meter and within 500 feet downstream of the meter run
or any production facilities. Meter runs will be housed and/or
fenced.

The oil and gas measurement facilities will be installed on the well
location. The oil and gas meters will be calibrated in place prior
to any deliveries. Tests for meter accuracy will be conducted
monthly for the first three months on new meter installations and at
least quarterly thereafter. The AO wil.1 be provided with a date and
time for the initial meter calibration and all future meter proving
schedules. A copy of the meter calibration reports will be submitted
to the Vernal District Office. All meter measurement facilities will
conform with Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 4 for liquid hydrocarbons
and Onshore Oil & Gas Order No. 5 for natural gas measureraent.

The use of materials under BLM jurisdiction will conform to 43 CFR
3610.2-3.

There will be no deviation from the proposed drilling and/or workover
program without prior approval from the AO. Safe drilling and
operating practices must be observed. All wells, whether drilling,
producing, suspended, or abandoned will be identified in accordance
with 43 CFR 3162.

"Sundry Notice and Report on Wells" (Form 3160-5) will be filed for
approval for all changes of plans and other operations in accordance
with 43 CFR



4. Mud Program and Circulating Medium

3azardous substances specifically listed by the EPA as a hazardouswaste or demonstrating a characteristic of a hazardous waste will notbe used in drilling, testing, or completion operations.

No chromate additives will be used in the mud system on Federal andIndian lands without prior BLM approval to ensure adequate protectionof fresh water aquifers.

Electronic/mechanical mud monitoring equipment shall be utilizedwhile drilling below the surface casing shoe to total depth and shallinclude a pit volume totalizer (PVT), stroke counter and flow sensor.

5. Coring, Loqqing and Testing Program

Daily drilling and completion progress reports shall be submitted tothis office on a weekly basis.

All Drill Stem tests (DST) shall be accomplished during daylighthours, unless specific approval to start during other hours isobtained from the AO. However, DSTs may be allowed to continue atnight if the test was initiated during daylight hours and the rate offlow is stabilized and if adequate lighting is available ti.e.,lighting which is adequate for visibility and vapor-proof for safeoperations). Packers can be released, but tripping should not b.>gir.before daylight unless prior approval is obtained from the AO.

A cement bond log (CBL) shall be utilized to determine the L22 ofcement (TOC) and bond quality for the intermediate casing andproduction liner.

6. Notlfication of Operations

The date on which production is commenced or resumed will beconstrued for oil wells as the date on which liquid hydrocarbons arefirst sold or shipped from a temporary storage facility, such as atest tank, and for which a run ticket is required to be generated or,the date on which liquid hydrocarbons are first produced into apermanent storage facility, whichever first occurs; and, for gaswells as the date on which associated liquid hydrocarbons are firstsold or shipped fr a temporary storage facility, such as a testtank, and for which
. run ticket is required to be generated or, thedate on which gas is first measured through permanent meteringfacilities, whichever first



CONDITiçN$ OF APPROVAL FOR THg
APPUÇATIQN FOR PERMIT TODRILL

Company/Operator ANR Production Company

Well Name & Number Q-QQA3

Lease Number 14-20-HQ2-1||lq4

Location SWNW Sec. 35 T. 1S. R·1W.

Surface Ownership Indign

NOTIFICATION REQUIREMENTS

Location Construction - at least forty-eight (48) hours prior to construction of location and
access roads.

Location Completion - prior to moving on the drilling rig.

Spud Notice - at least twenty-four (24) hours prior to spudding the well.

Casing String and - at least twenty-four (24) hours prior to running casing and cementing all
Cementing casing strings.

BOP and Related - at least twenty-four (24) hours prior to initiating pressure tests.
Equipment Test

First Production - withu. 'We (5) business days after new well begins or production
Notice resumes after well has been off production for more than ninety (Go

days.

For more specific details on notification requirements, please check the Conditions of Approval for
Notice to Orilland Surface Use
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a.....a.asac> UNITED STATES =••-••••¤ x=esr••Ausuar 21. nas
DEPARTMENTOF THE INTER10R & g,arBR DOMBENATION ANS BBBAAL 80.

BUREAUOF LAbe MANAGEMENT 14-20-862-1804

APPLICATIONFOR PERMitTO OR PLUGBACK &WEMAN.ALleWasogminMama

Ute Indian Tribes
se. wasereens 4 a .

om.L U 0 FLUGBACKO ' '"' """"'" "'"*

a wwweso won dW NIA

L sans er sesommes j .. Ute

ANR Production Comÿany fa ,
. A man so.

L as.....seessoasma y ,.
- 3-35A3

P.O. Box 749 Denver, CO 201-0749 303 573-4476 i . 758LB AND 9068.. 04 WII.DCAT

4. ameanne... wen iiiisu.s e - sa•> Altamont/Bluebell
aa nra•• 163 FNL and t. ' FVL SU n 5, Tl*, R3W IL ase-r.. a....oa nsa.

Same as above• jfg f. g/ ff, y S

tiæo 3œ5,
IS, R3W

it osarases m name ano esseesses seen sanasse seen en seer eerses• at. coents on maassa ti. .ms

Approximately 1.5 alles southeart of Bluebell. Utah Duchesne Utah
IL asevaare seed M IL ma er acase m mass it. ... er areas aassessa

secauses se seasser t.. rass van
seemmetsen s.aans use, ww. .tasse es esasses orig.eens naa um 660 640 80

ik esevaars pasas resseese seratoeso ik wassesse sorts tå seraat sa cassa teos.a
se masamer som sanname, ceaanssues ,es assumesua en oma sansa sa + 2500 14, 500' R tary

B. assoasseuslikse utsaber W. R. UR. sia) St. armeen. mars woes was.a. ersat•

6122' CR ¡ September 1, 1992
Psorosso chann. ano causartse Paooaan

essa se meas een er esesse esseet een weer eerrame sann aussysts or comaux

17-1/4" 13-3Î3" Conductor 0 - 200' 150 sx Circ to Surface *

i -lja" 9-3/8" J-55 36f 0 - 3000' 1125 sx Circ to Surface *

A-1/A" 7n N-80 260 0 - 8300' 1950 sx Cla "

3-3/4" 7" S-95 26# 8300 - 11200 3L
6-1/ 2" 5" S-95 180 10900 - 14500 ' 380 ax 50 or .

* Cement volunwa may change due to hol. aise.
Calcultate f rom Caliper log.

DMSGNOFEIGHT-POINT RESOURCEPROTECTION Pt.AN ATTACHED. \LGAS&MINING
I hereby certify that ANR Production Company is authorized by the proper Lease Interest
Owners to conduct lease operations associated with this Application for Permit to Drill
the Ute 3-35A3. Tribal Lease 14-20-H62-1804. Bond coverage pursuant to 43 CFR 3104 for
lease activities is beina provided by ANR Production Company, Nationwide Bond #CO-0001,w

.

vill be responsible for compliance with all the terms anc conditions of that portion of
the Leaie associated with this Application.
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Tit'e i USC Secuen 100(, makee at a enne for any persen knowingly and witthatty to smake to any department or eguacy of



. APPLICAT&N FOR PE CHANGE
OF WATERso

Ú reePoe s

STATEOF UTAH od*"

c A -

for lhe purpose olontainingpermissiontomakeapermanent changeof walelin the Slate ofUlah.application is
hereby madetothe State Engineer,based uponthe followingshowingotfacts, submitted in accordance with therequirementsof the 1.awsof Utah.

'WATERUSERCLAIMNO.K- 'APft.ICATION NO. a - /s/A ff
Changes are proposed in (check those applicable)
-point ofdiversion. -point ofreturn.

place ofUse. ...JÊ....natureofuse.
1. OWNER INFORMATION

Name: _ . Owen DAG.. ArtAttina. 'Interest: _-%

Address· PO Set 10ef \/erna# UT f4072

2. 'FRIORITY OF CHANGE: *Fil.lNCDATE:
As thischangeamendatory?(Yes/No):

3. atquT mvinrNCEO RV, Ë$4 i

Prine Apprnved Changa Appliralinna inr this rtghe 2 3• N.3- 2 i 9 4 - 4 3 - 7 3 & /40 99
••••••••••>••••••••••••••••••••• HERETOFORE•••••••••••••••••••••¤ **4•••**•

4. OUANTITY0r WATER: O•5 cis and/or ac-it.
5. SOURCE: U.C.k/ rm.U)
6. COUNTy, Due kr.xn a
7. Pnrur(sinrmVFRAION, Anul (Mel O Edal ANO (4 Ñrem N '/9 Corner

Descriptionof Diverting Workst
8. POINT(S)OFREDIVERSION

The waterwill be redivertedfrom at a pomt:

DescriptionofDiverting Works:
9. FOINT(5)OF RETURN

The amount of water consumed is -ctsor ac-it.
The amountofwater returnedis cisor ac-il.
The water will be returned to the natural stream/sourceat a point(sþ

'These items are to be completedby Division ofWater Rights.

Permanent



. 10. NA.TUREAND FERIODOf US
Šlockwatering: From n . to C<, 3 Ê
Domestic: From to
Municipal: From to
Mining: From to
Power: From - to
Ottier: Frorr. Idfi I to - et 2 i
trrigation: From --Agl I to

11. PURPOSEANDEXTENTOFUS£
Stockwatering (numberandkind 250 Øvestock Uni.ts
Domestic: Familiesand/or - Persons.
Muntripal (nama)•
Mining· Mining Distrir! In the Mine

Ores mined·
Pnwer· Plant namn. Type• ('apartlynther (rinscrihe)•

JÄÃ n/ËA ,irrigation: 5 5 • 3 acres.Sole supply ot acres
12. Pl.ACEOFUSE

I.egaldescription ofareasofuseethauhasweelgenenby 40 acre tract: n /l

13. STORAGE
Reservoir Name: --. . Storage Period: from & to -.I- -1/

-.Capacity: y • o ac-II. Inundated Area: acres
Height ofdam: feet
I.88aldescription of inundated areaby 40 tract: MU MS A 7, //5 F;W NXif wg

ee*Nen********n THETOLl.OWINGCHANCESAREPROPOSED••¤ aseen" ****-

14. QUANTITYOFWATER: cisand/or - ËÛ•Û ac-it
15. SOURCE: IAGW Rematning Water: .9 4 rn e
16. COUNTY: utdofilfit-
17 PntNT(s) OF nivERSION, .511 TYie

Descriptionof Diverting Works:
18. POINT(S)Oi REDIVER510N

The water will ha radiverted from al a poinh

DescriptionofDiverting Works:
t



- 19. PQINT(S)OF RETURN
. Ÿheamount of water consumed is cis or ac·lt

The amountof water returnedis cis or -
ac-(I

The water will be returned to the natural stream/source at a point(s):

20. NATUREANDPERIODOf USE
Stockwatering: From. ..au -

Domestic: From to -.....

Municipal: From-to ,

Mining: From to
Power: From to
Other: From Jan I to it 3
Irrigation: From. -10 - .

21. PURFOSEANDEXTENTOFUSE
(Inrkwalaring (numher and kindþ
Domestic: Familiesand/or- Persons
Muntripal (namaj•
Mining• Mining Distrirt in the Mina

rn9mined·
Powet: Plant name: Type: Capacity:

Ihar(dasertha)• ŠriÍÏtn aflÀ CosagÌtilenof oiÎ wtils
Irrigation:. acres.Solesupplyof

22. PLAC£OFUSE
Legaldescriptionof areasofuseby 40 acre tract:

OÑtr | SauÎœ4 49 lotahone wa. er Grut.ke na nerdeel
23. STORACE

Romervatr Nama• 4tarage Perin,t- from in
Capacityr ac•ft.Inundated Area: acres
Height ofdem: feet
Legaldescription of Inundated area by 40 tract:

24. EXPLANATORY
The 1011owingis set forth to define more clearlythe tulipurpose of this application.Include any supplementalwaterright,susedfor the samepurpose. (Use additionalpages ofsamesizeif necessary):

Change 'La .for ot\fle i Arsü'ing anA eyplardan.

Ápprav'iradri 4 acre 4 at Ina +-aken Gram
trr'iga.kon purgye.s. and u.sea Gor nüÛad purpn.ses

ht.rf.s to be rngabi w'll ekange Ga.. W.. 4e -Ge· serr<
because of 44e change an use. 4·7



Theundersignedhereby acknowledgesthat eventhough tielsheltheymayhave been assisted in the preparationof the above-numberedapplicationthrough the courtesy of the empicyees of the Division of Water Rights. allresponsibility for the accuracyof the inforination contained herein, at the time of filing. rests with theappitcant(s).

5 ature of plicant(s)

e



UTE #3-35A3 WELLBORE SCHEMATIC
SECTION 35 T1S R3W

DUCHESNE COUNTY, UTAH
DATE: 11-3)-95 (R. COX)

TOP OF F 26& CF-95 LTAC LINER @ 5.748'

2-3/W 4.7# J45 EUE (5.737') &1-11/16° 2.33& N•80 IJ 10 Rd (1.209')
TUBING SIDE STRING <@ 7.036° '

94/W 404 CF45 BTEC @ 6.0(.. &

2-7/P 0.5& N-80 EUE TUBING
10,496' & TAC @ 10.192'

TOP OF S' 18& 8-95 HS21 UNER @ 11.73&

T 264 CF45 UNER t.TAC @ 11,99& g

S' t.INER HAS A MOUNTAIN STATES
PERMANENT PACAER @ 12.000'

TOP PERFOSAff,N @ 12.008'

CURRENT PRODUCING INTERVALS
12.008' -

14.259°

T ifAL OF 507 PERFS

OTTOMPERFORATION@ 14,259'
PETD @ 14,302'

5'18& 845 HS21 LINER FROM 11.738° TO 14,34&/ i
TD @



Ute #3-35A3 Workover Procedure
9. TlHw/ RBP and RP on 2-7/8" &3-1/2" tubingstrings. Set RBP @ 13,240' and place 2 sx of bauxiteon top. Set RP @ 11.900' using 246' of 2-7/8" 6.5# P-110 tubing and 11,854' of 3-1/2" 9.3 # P-110tubing .

10. MIRUDowelland stimulateWasatch intervals (12,008'to13,219') totalof 300 holes /100 net perfintervals as shown below. Heat all fluids to 150 F except bleach. Maintain 1,500 psig surfacepressure on annulus.

MaximumFluid Volume Volume Specia Rate SurfaceDescription (Gals) (Bbi's) Additives Diverters (BPM) Pressure
Pad 4,200 100 Scale inhibitor 20-30 9.000 psig

Scale inhibitor
&Micellar 77 BS15% HCLAcid 3,000 71 Solvent 1.1 S.G. 20-30 9,000 psigGelled Water 1,000 24 20-30 9,000 poigBleach 1,000 24 20-30 9,000 psigGelled Water 1.000 24 20-30 9,000 psig

Scale inhibitor
&Micellar 77 BS15% HCLAcid 3.000 71 Solvent 1.1 S.G. 20-30 9,000 psig

0.5 ppg PSGelled Water 1,500 36 0.5 ppg BAF 20-30 9,000 psigBleach 1,000 24 20-30 9,000 psigGelled Water 1,000 24
20-30 9,000 psig

Scale Inhibitor
&Micellar 77 BS15% HCLAcid 3,000 71 so'vent 1.1 S.G. 20-30 9,000 psigFlush

(Stm Perf) 5,300 126 20-30 9,000 psigTotals 20,800 495

11. RU swab equipment and swab back acidjob. Monitor well flow back as required.
12. Release 5" packer and TOH w/ 3-1/2" &2-7/8" tubingstings.
13. TlHwl 2-7/8"tubingBHA.2-3/8"side string,rod pump and rods(consult Denver for rod design basedon results). Place wellon



1. MIRUcompletionrig. Circulatehot fluidsdown sidestringand POH wlrods and cumo. NDwellhead&NU BOPE. TOH w/ 2-3/8" & 1-11/18" 'abing side strings. Release tubingancnot @ 10,53T andPOH w/ 2-7/8" tubingstring.
2. TlHw/ 6" drag bit and casing scraper (7" 26# casing)to clean out 7" liner down to 5" liner top.
3. T1Hw/ a Baker "CJ" packer plucker millingtoolon tubingand millout 5" 18# Mountain Statespermanent packer @12,000°. Consider millingout packer wl washover shoe and washpipe aslast resort. POH w/ packer BHA.
4. TlHw/ 4-1/8" drag bit, casingscraper (5" 18# casing)and 2-3/8" &2-7/8" tubingto clean out 5" linerfrom 11,738' to PBTD@14,302°. TOHw/ BHA.
5. TlHw/ 5" retrievable packer, 1,586' of 2-7/8" 8.5# P-110 tubing and 11,664' of 3-1/2" 9.3 # P-110tubing . Set packer @+/- 13,240'.
6. MIRUDowelland stimulate Wasatch Int arvals (13,270' to 14,259') totalof 207 holes / 69 net perfintervals as shownbelow. Heat all fluids lo 150 F except bleach. Inject down the annulus whilepumping down tubing tc maintain a hydrostatic column.

MaximumFluid Volume Volume Special Rate SurfaceD scription (Gals) (Bbi's) Additives Diverters (BPM) PressurePad 4,200 100 Scale inhibitor 20-30 9,000 psig
Scale Inhibitor

&Micellar 77 BS15% HCLAcid 2,000 48 Solvent 1.1 S.G. 20-30 9,000 psigGelled Water 1,000 24 20-30 9,000 psigBleach 1,000 24
20-30 9,000 psigGelled Water 1,000 24 20-30 9,000 psig

Scale inhibitor
& Micellar 77 BS15% HCLAcid 2,000 48 Solvent 1.1 S.G. 20-30 9,000 psig

0.5 ppg RSGelled Water 1,500 36 0.5 ppg BAF 20-30 9,000 psigBleach 1,000 24 20-30 9,000 psigGelled Water 1,000 24 20-30 9,000 psig
Scale Inhibitor

&Micellar 77 BS15% HCLAcid 2,000 48 Solvent 1.1 S.G. 20-30 9,000 psigFlush
(Btm Perf) 5.400 129 20-30 9,000 psigTotals 22,100 529

7. RU swab equipment and swab back acid job. Monitor well flow back as required.
8. Release 5" packer and TOH w/ 3-1/2" &2-7/8" tubingstings.
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Staté of Utah
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES
DIVISIONOF OIL,GAS ANDMINING

355 Wesi North Tencie
Due C Hansen

3 Tned Center Sume350

Dianne lt Ph u SeR Labe Cep. Utah 64180-1203

July 27, 1992

ANR Production Company
P.O. Box 749
Denver, Colorado 80201-0749

Gentlemen:

Re: We:)-')§A')Well,1§Wfeet from the north line, (|160feet from the west line, SW 1/4
NW1/4. Section 35. Townonio 1 South. Range 3 West. Duchesne Countv.Utah

. Pursuant to Utah Code Ann. § 40-6-6, (1953, as amended) and the order issued
by the Board of Oil,Gas and Miningin Cause No. 139-42 dated April12, 1985, approval
to drillthe referenced wellis hereby granted.

In addition, the foDowingspecificactions are necessary to fullycomplywith this
approval:

1. Compliancewith the requirementsof Utah Admin. R. 649-1 et seq., Oiland
Gas ConservationGeneral Rules.

2. Notificationwithin24 hours after drillingoperations commence.

3. Submittal of EntityAction Form, Form 6, withinfive working days following
commencementofdrillingoperationsand whenever a change in operations
or interests necessitates an entitystatus change. '

4. Submittalof the Report of Water Encountered During Drilling,Form 7.

5. Prompt notification prior to commencingoperations, if necessary, to plug
and abandon the well. Notify Frank R. Matthews, Petroleum Engineer,
(Office) (801)538-5340, (Home) (801)476-8613, or R.J. Firth. Associate
Director, (Home) (801)571-6068.

6. Compliance with the requirements of Utah Admin. R. 649-3-20, Gas Flaring
or Venting, if the well is completed for



Page 2
ANR Production Company
Ute 3-35A3 Well
July 27, 1992

Trash and sanitary aeste should be properly contained and transported toapproved disposal locations, not retained in or .disposed of in pits on location ordownhole. Prior to the commen':ementofdrillingoperations,the operator should consultthe local/county sanitarianand/or the Department of EnvironmentalQuality,DivisionofDrinkingWater/Sanitation,regarding appropriate disposal of sanitarywaste,

This approval shall expireone year after date of issuance unless substantial andcontinuous operation is underway or a request for an extension is made prior to theapproval expirationdate. The APInumber assigned to this wellis 43-013-31365.

sincerely,

R. .

Associate Director, Oiland Gas

Idc
Enclosures
cc: Bureau of Land Management t

J.L Thompson



CONDITIONSOF APPROVALFOR THE
APPUCATIONFORPERMir TO DRtu.

Company/Operator ANRPiaductionCommeny

Wel Name &Number 3-35A3
.

Leese Number 14-20-HB2-1ao4

Location SWNW Sec. 35 T R. 3W.

Surface Ownership Indian

NOTIF1CATIONREQUIREMENTS
LocationConstruction - at least forty-eigtt (48) hours priorto constructionof location andaccess roads.

LocationCompletion · priorto movingonthedrMingrg
Spud Notice - at least tworty-four(24) hours priorto spudding the well.
CasingStringand - at least tworty-four(24) hours priorto runningcasingand cementingallCemerahg casingstrings.
BOP and Related - at least twerty-four(24) hours prior to initiatingpressure tests.EquipmertTesta

.

First Production - withinfive (5) business days after new wei begins or nrooctionNotice resumes afterwellhas been affproduction for more than ninety (90)days.

Fcr more specificdetais on notincationrequiremerta, please check the Conditionsof Approval forNotice to Dril and Surface Use



DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

SPUDDING INFORMATION

NAME OF COMPANY: Agg 43-013-31365

WELL NAME: UTE 3-35A3
,

Section 35 Township 18 Range JW County DUCHESNE

Drilling contractor PAR¥EB

Rig # 235

SPUDDED: Date 8(28(92

Time 8;00 AN

How DRY HOLE

Drilling vi i commence ROTARY WILL SPUD-9/4/92

Reported by JLB W/999M

Telephone #

Date 9/3/92 SIGNED



STATE OF UTAE
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING

DRILLING INSPECTION FORM

COMPANY: ANR PRODUCTION COMPANY COMPANY REP: SCOTT SEALY

WELL NAME: UTE 3-353A API NO:__1_3-013-31365

QTR/QTR: SECTION. 35 TWP: 1 S RANGE: 3 W

CONTRACTOR: PAREER DRILLING Ç9MPANY RIG NUMBER: 235

INSPECTOR: BERRIER TIME:__ g;)O AM DATE:___9/1 /92

OPERATIONS: MOVE IN RIG UP DRILLING RIG DEPTH:

SPUD DATE: DRY: 8/28/92 ROT¡.3Y: T.D.: DEPTH:

WELL SIGN:
__

SANITA1'10N: BOPE: BLOOIE LINE.

H2S POTENTIAL: ENVIRONMENTAL: FLARE PIT:

RESERVE PIT: FENCED: LINED: PLASTIC:

RUBBER: BENTONITE: OTHER: MUD WEIGHT
__ _

LBS/GAL

BOPE TEST RECORDED IN THE RIG DAILY TOUR BOOK:

BOPF TRAINING RECORDED IN THE RIG DAILY TOUR BOOK:

LEGEND: (Y)=YES (U)=UNKNOWN (NA)=MOT APPLICABLE

REMARKS:

NG NOT YET IN THY ATE -,TUST MOVING
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SUBMITIN TillÞLICATE
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N/A-- ·>.a - ca -

. se..... veers.,

t|te #3-35A3ANR Production Company
* Art *•• x•a.oren ... re...... *
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nu.......i...wayas.m'ai -r r-----
• s...... en

Tw.
on.

Cd-all-a ei aggiamo. Aappt

it 4 5 C 3esmas essa. messe se came aus ese asiamosummop ese esidde e esas e ese elampasimo es-se et me talem tinam Op a i ladAAshg WM 11-85 t-asimana

.....me.... as = u.. ...., ••me esmasuna
a

i

------- mi---- I
i - --•see assen..u.. .. a.....es



Forna31*5 UNITEDSTATES FOR.M APPROVEDIJune 19)o' DEPARTatENTOF THE INTERIOR
BUREAUOF LAND atANAGEhiENT s t..... o.s.......... sen.: No

14-20-H62-180A
SUNDRYNOTICESANDREPORTSON WELLS su go...,, you, s..,Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deeoen or reentry to a different reservoir.

Use "APPUCATIONFOR PERMIT-' for auch proposets lite Indian Tribes

7 If Uma or CA. Agreemees DesagasuesSUBMIT IN TRIÞLICATE
N/Ai Typt et Well

UL On Oo.. - ••-
: Na.....op....., Ute J3-35A3

ANR Production Cotipany Art wou se
) Asseen ana Id•plurt he 43-013-31365

P.O. Box 749 Denver, CO 30201-0749 (303) 573-4476 '
e 80 Farid and Paak or Exploratory Area

• --- us was•F...... see..r.. a.. x . os sur.., oner...... i Altataont/Bluebell
1632' FNL and 660' FWL (SW/NW) tu cou.» er warum.same
Section 35. TIS, R34 Duchesne County, Utah

:: CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXts) TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE, REPORT. OR OTHER DATA
TYPEOF SUSMISSION TYPE OF ACTIONUm

.-,s..... .. s.....
.------.. L.ao..... .. et...
.....- O s.. c....... .3 9......... ..... O r........a O s..-a..... r.. -,O c........, O w....s...<mO v... -- s.... O 4.... c... O c........ - 4...

GOlhallegott of Dr14 Operationg¯)
as,,,,wa,,
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COASTALCIL & GAS CORPORAT.A
CHRONOLOGICALHISTORY

UTE93-35A3
ALTAMONT/BLUEBELL
DUCHESNECOUNTY,UTAH
PARKER9235/UNIBAR
WI: 39.226 x ANR AFE: 64243ATO: 14,300' (WASATCH)50: 9/4/92CSG: 13-3/8' 9 185'; 9-5/8° 9 6000'DHC(NS): 1,414.0

9/1/92 161' GL MIRT. RU Bill Jr. Rathole Co. Orill to 161' w/ld" bucket. Ran 4jts of 13-3/8", 54.59, J-55 Csg. Set at 161' GL. Cat w/Howco. Pep 20 bblsgel wtr, 320 sx AG w/2% CaC12, Yaf/sx Flocele, 15.69/gal, 1.13 yield. Circ9 bbis cat to surf. Hole stood full. Job complete 9 11:34 a.m., 8/31/92.Spud conductor hole 8/28/92. CC: 364,080.
9/2/92 185' RURT. Expect to spud a.a. of 9/4/92. CC: $67,293.
9/3/92 185' RURT. Expect to spud 7:00 p.m., 9/3/92. CC: 567,805.9/4/92 564' Dr1g 379'/4.5 hrs. RURT. NU rot hd, PU SHA. Drlg. Spud at 12:30a.a., 9/4/92. PU rot hd rbr. Orig, svy: 1 deg & 460'. Air mist, air 2000CFM. CC: $84,778.
9/5/92 2500' Orlg 1936'/21-l/2 hrs. Drlg, svys: 1 deg 9 702'; I deg 9 953'; 1 deg9 1482'; 1/2 deg 9 1982'. Drlg w/wtr. MW8.4, VIS 27, PH 11.0, ALK

.15/.25,

CL 5500, CA 640. CC: %93,985.
9/6/92 3487' Drly 987'/22.5 hrs. Or19, svy: 1/4 deg 9 2977'. Drlg w/wtr. MU8.4,VIS 27, PH 9.0, ALK

.01/.02, CL 900, CA 48. CC: $114,157.9/7/92 4202' Orly 715'/22.5 hrs. Orig, svys: 1 deg 9 3472'; 1 deg & 4910'. Orlgw/wtr. MW8.4, VIS 27, PH 10, ALK
.1/.15. CL 900, CA 160. CC: $139,603.9/8/92 4820' Drlg 618'/23 hrs. Drlg w/wtr. Circ & svy: 1-1/4 deg & 4449'. RS,drlg w/wtr. MU8.4. VIS 26, PH 10, ALK

.1/.15, CL 900, CA160. CC: $156,699.9/9/92 5351' Drig w/wtr. 531'/17 hrs. Orlg, drop svy and POH w/bit. Svy: 1 deg0 4826'. SLN. no corr. LO 1 DC. TIN w/new bit and PU 4 DC's. MAR4766' to4826'. Drlg, TFNS. Start drlg w/wtr ac 5227', change over from aerated utr.
MM8.4, VIS 27. PH 11, ALK0.3/0.4, CL 1000, CA 400. CC: 5178,212.9/10/9ž 5940' Orlg 589'/23 brs. Drlg, cire and svy: 1 deg & 5306'; I deg & 5804'.Nud up to run csg at 5900°. MM9.1, VIS 37, ML24, PV4, YP 4, 45 SOL, PN 11,
ALK0.15/0.2. CL 1000, CA340, GELS0, 10' 1, CAKE2. CC: $187.550.9/11/92 6020' W0C. 80'/5 hrs. Dr1g, CIC for ST. ST 20 stds, no fill. CACfor csg.PON,LDJars. RULOmachine. LO6 - 5-1/2' DC's, SS & bit. RUUestates esgcrew. Ran 145 Jts 9-5/8" 400 55-95 buttress and CF-95 LTac. TL 6020.14',Otff fill shoe and float and 6 centraliters. Bridge at 5810'. Work 5810-6000' and RU Houco. Cat w/Howco. Pump 10 BU, 40 bbls Super flush, 10 W,1040 sx Hifill est all/40/sx Flocele, 30/sx Capseal. Yield 3.83, ut Ilf.Teil w/300 sx Prem AS + 15 CaCla and 1/49/sx Flocele, 1.18 yield, 15.6 wt.Orop plug and displace w/454 BW. Bump */1650 pst at 5:28 a.a.. Floats held.Good returns. 44 bbls cat circ, WOC. MW9.0, VIS 33, WL22, PV 5, YP 2, 05

OIL, DE LCM, 3.55 SOL, PN 10. ALK
.03/,08, CL 1500, CA 60, GELS 1, 10" 1. CAK£

2. CC: $327,029.
9/12/92 6020' Test DDP. MOC. Cut off 13-3/8' and 9-5/8°. Weld on head and test.NUBOP. Test 80PE to 5000 pst, hydril to 2500 psi, esg to 1500 psi, Installwear bushing. CC: $385,160.
9/13/92 6430' Orig 410'/8.5 hrt. PUbit, SS and TIN w/DC's. Check DC's, found Icrocked, LD same. POH for magnet. TIH w/magnet. PU 6 jts DP. Tag cat at5947'. Circ and work sagnet, RS. Chain out w/magnet. Rec nut lost in hole.

PU bit and TIH. PU 10 - 6-3/4' DC's and Jars. TlH w/bit. Drill cat andfloat. Test csg to 2000 psi. Orill est and shoe. Drill w/air sist. GreenRiver Formation. 605 SH, 405 SS. TR LS, 848 14 U. Drlg w/air mist, 2500 CFM
+ 11-12 GPW0 400 psi. CC:
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9/14/92 7545' Running wireline tvy. 1115'/18.5 hrs. Orig wiatr mist. Cire and trio
for string float. WL svy: 2-3/4 deg & 6504'; 3 deg 9 7002'. Ctre and trip
for string float. Dr19 wlair mist. RS. Green River, 100% SH. BGG 15 U, CG
0 U. STG 27 U. Show froe 1424-28', MPF 1-1.5-1, gas units 12-4400-2500, TR
oil. Orly wratr mist. MM8.4. VIS 27, PH 10.5, ALK

.2/.3, CL 1000, CA 400.
CC: 5413,230.

9/15/92 7829' Running survey - dr19. 284'/15 hrs. Dr19, TON, TFNB. TIH. W&R90'
to btm. 62' of fill. Orig, R5, svy: 3-1/2 deg 9 7500'. GR. 80% SH, 10% SS.
10% LS. SGG 18 U. CG 71 0. TG331 U. No shows. Drlg w/wtr. MW8.4, VIS 27,
PH 10, ALK

.3/.65, CL 1000, CA 320, 1800 CFM. CC: 5428.812.9/16/92 8220' Drle 391'/23 hrt. Drle, RS, svy: 2-3/4 leg 9 7785'; 3 deg e 8068'.
GR, 90% SH, 105 55. BGG12 U, CC 24 U. Orig w/wtr. MW8.4, VIS 27, PH 10.5,
ALK

.3/.6. CL 1000, CA 280. CC: $445.277.ORLGBREAKS _.WffF. SASUNITS7942-1972' 3.5-3.5-3.75 21-85-31 No incr ott, no fluor or cut8038-8043' 4.25-3-25-4.75 21-72-62 No iner oil, no fluor or cut8082-8085' 4-3.23-3.50 44-92-57 51 inct bik oil, 10% luor, un cut9/17/92 8679' Drly 459'/23 hrs. Orig, svy: 2-3/4 deg 9 8383'. Drlg, GR. 1005 SH,
SGG8 U. CG 30 U. MW8.4. VIS 27, PM 11, ALK 0.4/0,8, CL 1000. CA 220. CC:
1455.361.
ORLGBREAKS 151E. GASUNITS8302-8314' 4-¿-4.75 5-44-5 Slight oil incr. 20% fluor, uk cut8416-8424' 4.5-¿ 25-3.5 8-88-63 No incr in oil. 20% fluor, wk cut
8528-8529 2.25-1.5-20 10-37-10 Me iner in oil, 20% fluor, wk cut9/18/92 9105' Orig 426'l23 brs. Drle, Svy: 3-1/2 deg & 8915°. RS, drlg in GRFM,
905 SH, 105 LS, 808 55 0, CG 110 U. Drly w/wtr. MM8.4, VIS 27, PN 11, ALK
0.4/0.8. CL 800. CA 220. CC: $463,932.ORLSBREAKS ..BÊE,,.. GASUNITS8725-8728' 3.5-5-3 3-287-26 Sly tact in oli, los fluor, ut cut8781-8798' 3.25-2.5-4 35-116-20 Me incr in oil, 205 floor, ut cut
8902-8906' 3-1.75 3.5 49-114-70 No incr in oil, 205 fluor, no cut8974-8982' 2.75-3-5 13-97-71 Sly incr in oil, 105 fluor, uk est9/19/92 9572' Orly 467'/23 hrs. Orig, svy: 3 dog 0 9415'. 25, drlg. GR, DOS SH,
105 LS. BGG35 U, CS 60 U. DTS 360 U. Drle w/wtr. MU8.4, VIS 27, WLM/C,
PM11. ALK

.4/.8. CL 800, CA 240. CC: $471,309.DRLSBREAKS & GASUNITS8993-9002' 4.25-3.5-4.5 60-137-10 Ne iner in oil. 10ž fluor, uk est
9155-9169' 4-2.25-3 20-92-50 Me tuer in oil. 10ž fluor, uk cut9310-9314' 2.5-2.25-3 2.5-2.25-3 No iner in oil, 105 fluor, no cut
9340-9348' 3.5-2.75-3 55-172-10 No incr in oil, 5ž fluor, no cut9/20/92 9957' Orig 385'/15 hrs. Drlg, svy: 3 deg & 9002'. TON, che bit, TIN to
shoe. Cut drie line. RS, FTIN. Wash a ream 9770-9802', 10• of fill. Drlg,
GR, 105 SH. 305 LS. 866 90 0, CS 190 U, TG 470 U. Drlg w/wtr. MN8.4, V15
27. PM 10, ALK

,4/.65. CL 600, CA 220. CC: $483.397.DRLSBREAKS X GASUNITS9609-9612' 2.5-2-2 150-344-20 Me iner in oil. 105 fluor, no cut9646-9456' 2.5-1.5-2.5 45-171-70 Slt iner blk oil. 20s fluor, uk cut9/21/92 10,524' Orle 567'/23 hrs. Drle, svy: 3 deg 0 10,320'. RS and cht BOP.
Orlg, GR, 70% SH, 305 LS. 866 240 U. CG750 U. Mi 8.4. V15 27, wt N/C. PN 10.
ALK

,3/.45, CL 600, CA 240. CC: 1490.120.ORLGBREAKS $Êf_, CAS UNITS9927-9938' 2.5-1-3 45-325-50 Ne oil, 105 fluor, «k cut
10001-004° 2-3-2.5 30-120-15 Slt lacr ott, no fluor, wk cut10058-070' 2-2.5-2.5 15-225-70 Fair iner in blk oil, no fluor, ok cut
10190-198' 2.5-2-3 55-89-80 No incr in 011, 10%fluor, no Cut
10417-420' 2.5-2-2 120-648-150 Fair iner in blk oil, lŒ¾ fluor, we
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9/22/92 11.207' Orly 683'/23.5 hrs. Orle, RS. drly in GR, 100¾ SH. BGG850 U. CG1900 U. WW8.4, VIS 27, WL N/C, PH 10, ALK .3/.6, CL 500, CA 220. CC:1507.450.
ORLGEREAK5 MPF GASUNili10497-501' 1.5-1-1.5 150-1820-1500 10% fluor, wk cut, good oil show10611-614' 1-2.5-1 520-1137-950 20% fluor, wk cut, good oil show10659-666' 2.5-2-2.5 250-693-280 10% fluor, wk cut, no oil show10772-775' 2-.75-2 450-936-500 5% fluor, wk cut, no incr in oil10938-942' 2.5-2·'.5 500-1918-700 10% fluor, wk cut, no incr in oil10954-963' 2.5-1.5-2 700-1891-850 10% fluor, wk cut, good oil show11058-063' 2.5-1.5-1.75 800-1063-750 10% fluor, wk cut, no incr in oil11139-148 2-2.75-2 650-926-750 105 fluor, wk Cut, good inCr in oil

9/23/92 11,519' Drly 312'!23.5 hrs. Orlg, RS. Wasatch top 9 11,308', 705 SH, 30%SS. 80G 2300 U. CC 3690 U. FM 9.4, VIS 34, WL 16.8, PV 9, YP 4, TR OIL, 41SOL, PH 9. ALK
.15/.7. CL 600, CA 60, GELS 1, 10' 3, CAKE2. CC: 5515,503.DRLGBREAKS _BRE. GASUNITS11181-189' 1.25-2-2.5 700-1114-700 No fluor, wk cut, slt oil11316-319' 2.5-2.25-2.5 750-1009-950 No fluor, no cut, no oil11346-351' 3.5-2.75-2.25 800-6723-1500 No fluor. slt cut. abd oil11467 ••9' 7,5-6-7 1000-2042-1000 20% fluor. no cut, no oilll44s-450' 7.5-6.5-8 850-2432-990 20% fluor, no cut, no oil

9/24/92 11,638' TIH win .m bit. 119'/14 hrs. Drlg, TFNS, SLM, no corr. RS, TIH.Wasatch. 60% SH, 40% SS. BGG 1500 U, CG 2790 U. Svy: 2-1/2 deg 9 11,638'.Orig ork from 11.522-539', MPF 8-7-8.5. gas units 3500-5461-4500, nu fluor,uk cut, no incr in oil. Lost 150 bbls to seepage last 24 hrs. MU10.6, VIS36. WL 15.2. PV 7. YP 8, TR OIL. 95 SOL, PH 9.5, ALK
.1/.5, CL 3300, CA 52,GF't 1. 10° 6, CAKE2. CC: $529.759.

9/25/92 11.806' Orlg 168'/22 hrs. TIH, work 37' to bt . Orlg, RS. Wasatch, 605SH, 405 LS, BGG2450 U. CS 4050 U. Show 037 free 11,782-11,785', MPF 9-5-9.25. gas units 2800-4065-2650, no fluor, uk cut, no incr in oil. MW10.6,VIS 40. WL18. PV 9. YP 14, 25 Olt, 111 SOL, PH 10, ALK .2/.7. CL 3200, CA 32,GELS8. 10° 12. CAKE2. CC: $561,522.
9/26/92 11.814' TIH 68'/15 hrs. Orlg, lost 8000 pmp press. Check surface equipmentand pop flag. Trip for hole in DC, 10th DC cracked. LO 2 DC's. Wasatch, 905SH, 10%SD. SGG2300 U. CS 3530 0, no shows. MU10.7, VIS 36, WL12.8, PV 10,YP 8, 31 OIL, 115 SOL, PH 9.5, ALK

.15/.6. CL 3100, CA 24, GELS 2, 10' 10,CAKE2. CC: $577,650.
9/27/92 12.000' CLCfor ST 126'/19 hrs. TlH, WAR60' to bta, no fill. Drlg, CACfor logs. Wasatch. 705 SH. 305 SS. BGC 1500 U. CG 2548 U, TG 3766 U. Lost250 bbis mud to drlg breaks and fractures in last 24 hrs. MW11, VIS 40, WL10.4. PV 11. YP 11, 4% OIL. 121 SOL, PN 10, ALK .3/1.3, CL 3001, CA 20, GELSL, 10° 5, CAKE2. CC: 5550,058.

9/28/92 12.000' POH for 7' csg. CAC. ST 20 stds, no fill. CIC, POH. RUSchlumberger. Ran PLL/8HC Sos:*C, Cal/GR, logger's TO 12,001', max temp 179°,TIH. Cut OL, RS, T~H. Cire for 7° csg, TG 4919, POH. Lost 200 bb1s med overlast 24 hrs. Svy: 1-3/4 deg 9 12.000'. MU11, VIS 42, WL 10. PV 18, YP 12,45 OIL, 125 500. PM 9.5, ALK
.1/.7. CL 3200. CA 12, GELS2, 10" 12, CAK£2.CC: 5610,372.

9/29/92 12.000' LOS' OP. POH, LO6-3/4° DC's. RU Westates. Ran 141 jts 7' 26f TF-95 LTLC. TL 6229.85', shoe 2.40, FC 1.90. LC .9, hangar 15.65'. Tot6250.70'. Turbolators on lst 26 jts. TIH on 61 stds + 1 jt OP. Last 30 stdstight. CLC for cat. Hang liner and cat w/Howco, 20 BW, 30 bbis Superflush,30 6W, 850 sx Silicalite, 45 gel, 2% CaC1,. .35 Halad 413, 2f/sx Capseal,1/40/sx Flocale, 129 wt. 1.97 yield. Tail 750 sx H. .65 Halad 322, .35 HRS,.ti Super CBL, 16.4 wt, yield 1.06. Drop plug & 41591 w/337 SW, 119 aud.Bumpedplug. Lost returns. lost 10 bb1s of displacement. Floats held. Jobcomolete 12:02 a.m., 9/29/92. Pull 20 stds. LD 5" DP. RW 11. VIS 39, WL10,8, PV 14. YP 10, 4% Olt, 12% SQL. PM9.5. ALK
.1/1.2, CL3800, CA 44, GELS2. 10° 12, CAKE2. CC:
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9/30/92 12,000' TIH w/6-1/8' bit. LO 5° DP. Test BGP. PU 4-3/4° OC's and 3-1/2
OP. Or111 15' cat to too of liner at 5748'. TFNB. MU 11. VIS 39. WL 13.4.
PV 14. YP 12, 3% OIL, 121 SOL, PH 9, ALK

.15/1.1, CL 3600, CA 20, GELS3, 10'
12, CAKE2. CC: $831,254.

10/1/92 12.030' Orig 30'/4½ hrs. TIH and clean out liner hangar. PU 3-1/2' OP.
Drill cat from 11,863-11,905' (landing collar). Pressure test csg to 1500
psi/15 min/0K. Drill landing collar, float and shoe. Drlg, TFNB99. RS. W&R
15' to bts. arle. Wasatch FM, 40% SH, 60% SCST. BCG 200 U, CG 220 U. MW
10.9. VIS 43, WL11.2. PV 15, YP 10, 121 SOL, PH 12, ALK 0.6/2,1, CL 3600, CA
16, GELS7. 10' 10, CAKE2. CC: 5854,669.

10/2/92 12.155' Drlg 125'/22.5 hrs. Clean capseal out of mud pmp. Orig, RS. Drlg
in vasatch405 SS, 605 SH, BGG1000 U, CS 2145 U. MW10.6, VIS 35, WL16. PV
7, YP 8, 25 OIL, 115 SOL, PN 11, ALK

.6/1.4, CL 2500, CA 16, GELS 1, 10' 2,
CAKE2. CC: 5865,661.ORLGBREAKS ._BP..¶,... CASUNITS12070-078' 16-9-23 270-438-210 No fluor, no cut, no oil12092-102' 19-1-10.5 160-10.2-910 No fluor, no cut, no oil10/3/92 12.307' Orig 152'I23.5 hrs. Orle, RS. Wasatch, 100%5H, SGG 850 U. CG 1444

U. NW 10.5. VIS 35, WL9.6, PV 10. YP 6, 21 OIL, 111 50L, PH 11.0, ALK '
.4/1.2. CL 2500. CA 28, GELS1, 10' 4. CAKE2. CC: 1873,193.10/4/92 12.373' Orle 66'/14 hrs. Dr1g, TFNG. HER62' to bts. Drlg, RS. Wasatch,

. 90%SH. 10%SS, SCS680 U. CS 1330 U. TG 5101 U, no shows, Svy: 3-1/2 dog i
12.311. MW10.6. VIS 39, ML9.2, PV 12, YP 10, 2%OIL. 115 SQL, PH 10.5, ALK
.3/1.2. CL 2500. CA40, GELS2. 10° 10, CAKE2. CC: 5894.275.10/5/92 12.510' Orig 137'l23.5 hrs. Drlg, RS. Wasatch FM, 1005 SH, 806 850 U, CS
4476 U. MM11.2, VIS 38, WL9.2, PV 13, YP8, tz OIL. 11.51 SOL. PM0.3/0.5,
CL 2500. CA 40, GELS2. 10' 6. CAKE2. CC: 3902,620.DRLGBREAKS

_gf GASUNITS12396-401' 10.5-7.5-13 640-2580-1200 Mo fluor or cut and TR of ott
12452-460' 13.25-9-12.75 1120-1311-1020 No FL or cut, no increase in oil10/6/92 12.584' Drlg 74'/12.5 hrs. Drlg, svy, TFMB#11 at 12.541'. Cut DL. TIN.
WAR50' to bte. Dr19, RS. Nasatch, 1005 SN, BBS700 U, CC 2075 U, TG3607'.
Show 942 from 12,552-558'. MPF 11.5-10.75-9.25. gas units 110-958-700, no
fluor, cut or oil. Lost 175 bbls mud in last 24 hrs to seepage. MM11.4. VIS
37, WL8.8, PV 13, 19 8, 25 GIL, 125 SOL, PN 10.5, ALK

.35/1.6. CL 2500, CA
80. GELS2, 10' 9, CAKE2. CC: 5924.122.10/7/92 12.685' Orlg 101'/22 hrs. Dr1g, RR (and line hose). Drlo in Wasatch FM,
805 SH. 105 LS. 105 SDST. BSS 1180 U, CS 2831 U. MW11.4. VIS 36, WL8.4, PV
13, YP 8. 25 01L, 125 SOL, PN 10.5, ALK 0.3/1.6. CL 2500, CA 60, GELS2, 10'
4, CAKE2. CC: 1943,607.DRLGGREAKS .12E.. GASUNITS125ô8-574' 9.25-8.5-10.25 680-1202-1880 No FL, cut or oil12647-649' 13.25-13.5-14 1390-1459-1420 No FL, cut or oil10/8/92 12,787' Orig 102'/23.5 hrs. Drlg, RS. Wasatch, 905 SH, los SS, BGB1400

U, CG4143 U. Show 045 from 12.718-121', MPF 11-12.25-11.5, gas units 1400-5300-1350, no fluor, uk cut, fair incr in oil. Lost 75 bbis mud to seepage.
MU11.4. VIS 37. WL8. PV 12, YP 6, 25 OIL, 1ž¾ SOL, PM

.3/1.7, CL 2500, CA
50. GELS1, 10' 15, CAKE2. CC: 5954,822.10/9/92 12,900' Orig 113'/23.5 hrs. C-1g, RS. Wasatch FM, 1005 SH, SGS 2050 U, CG
5551 J. MW11.4, VIS 39. WLB, ?? 14. YP 7, 35 Ott, 13% SOL, PH 10.5, ALK
0.3/1.9, CL 2500, CA 60. GELS 1, 10" 7. CAKE2. CC: 5964,054.ORLGBREAKS X 4AS UNITS12,779-182' 16-15-14.75 14bo-2509-1550 Mo FL, cut or all show
12.796-802·

13.75-11.75-13.5 1850-3191-2000 No FL. cut or oil show
12,835-838' 11.25-13.75•10.75 1450-5263-2350 No FL, Cut or 011 show
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12|10/92 13.023' Orig 123'/23.5 hrs. Orig, RS, drlg in Wasatch, 1001 SH, 808 1020U, CG 2360 U. No mud lost, no shows. MU 11.6. VIS 39, WL8.4. PV 14, YP 8,35 OIL. 14% SOL, PH 10.5, ALK
.4/1.8, CL 2500, CA 60. GELS 2, 10' 7, CAKE2.CC: 5971.580.

10/11/92 13.100' Or1g 77'/11.5 hrs. Orig, POH for bit. Magnailux BHA, LD 8 DC's.TIH, wash 36' to btm, no fill. Orig, Wasatch, 1005 SH, SGG 1500 U, CG 2020U, TG 5400 U. MU11.6. VIS 36, WL8. PV 13, YP 7, 2% OIL, 14% SOL, PH 10.5,ALK
.35/1.5. CL 2500, CA 60, GELS 1. 10° 8, CAKE2. CC: 5997.974.10/12/92 13,183' Ctre to TFNB. 83'/10 hrs. Orig, circ up kick, SIDPP 500 psi, SICP600 pst. Raise MUfrom 11.6 ppg to 12.1 ppg. Mix pill and drop svy. Wellstarted flug up DP. Circ btas up. Circ and raise MMto 12.5 ppg. WasatchFM, 90% SH, 105 53, 886 400 U, CGl969 U. MM12.5, VIS 37, WL8.4, PV 16. YP8, 21 Olt. Its SOL, PH 10.5. ALK0.3/1.5, CL 2500, CA 60, GELT 2, 10• 9, CAKE2. CC: $1.010,100.

ORLGBREAKS $ÊE. SASUNITS13100-104' 7-6.5-6.5 730-996-890 No FL, cut or iner in oil13114-116' 6.5-6.75-6.25 870-1073-990 No FL, cut or incr in oil13122-126' 6.75-5.75-5.75 880-1002-900 No FL, cut or incr in oil13174-181' 4.5-4-12 1850-2232-1800 No FL, uk cut and slight incr in oil10/13/92 13.250' Orly 67'/10 hrs. Cire & raise MMfrom 12.5 ppg to 12.7 ppg. TFNS,RS. TIH w/bit and wash 60' to bta. Ream bridges in bta of hole. Drlg inUssatch FM, 80% SH, 205 50, BGG850 U, CS 978 U, TG 64ž9 U, lost 400 BN last24 hrs, no shows. Svy: 3 deg 0 13,141'. MM12.7, VIS 40, WL8.0, PV 16, YP
40. 3%OIL, 161 SOL. PN it.5, ALK0.35/1.4, CL 2500, CA 60. GELS2, 10' 11,CAKE2. CC: $1,024.826.

10/14/92 13,424' Drlg 174'/23.5 hrs. Drlg, RS. Vasacch FM, 90s SH, los 50, Bis 1010U. CS 1443 U. MW12.1, VIS 46, WL10.4, PV 15, Y9 13, 3.55 OIL. 185 SDL. PN
11, ALK0.35/1.4. CL 2500, CA 60, GELS2. 10' 13, CAKE2. CC: $1,052,197.ORLS BREAK3 ..BÊE._ $45 UNITS13274•278' 5-1-7.75 800-1156-850 No FL. cut or oil13360-364' 9.25-4-10.75 958-1258-958 Mo FL, cut or oil13374-378' 8.25•5.5-8.25 968-1101-1058 No FL, cut or all10/15/92 13,534' Drlg 110'll3.5 hrs. Drlg, RS. Wasaten FM, 105 SH, 305 50, 888 500

U, CG1741 U. MM13.4. VIS 45, WL8, PV 16, YP s, 31 OIL, 185 SOL, PN 11, ALK0.5/1.5. CL 2500, CA 100. GELS2, 10' 9. CAKE2. CC: $1,062,195.DRLSBREAKS _gÊE. GASUNITS13424-443' 15-10.5-13 1100-5203-5000 Mo FL, cut or oil13460-463' 14-3-10.5 3650-3860-3600 No FL, cut or oil13514-520' 14.25-4.75-15 690-900-600 Mo FL. cut or oil10/16/92 13,648' Drlg 114'/23½ hrs. Drlg, RS. Wasatch FM, 605 SN, 305 SD, 105 LS,
BSS 375 U, CS 972 U. Lost 100 BM/24 hrs. MM13.4, VIS 42, UL 8.0, PV 16, YP
7, 35 OIL, 195 SDL. PN 11.0, ALK0.8/2.1, CL2500, CA 120, GEL3 2, 10' 7, CAKE
2. CC: $1,077,628.

10/17/92 13,745' Drlg 97'/16 krs. Drlg, drop svy, TFMS. PUnew bit. TIN. Wash 40'
to bta, se fill. Drlg, Wasatch. BGS250 U, CS 346 U, TB 6396 U, 905 SN, 105
SS. No shows, ne medless. MM13.4, VIS 37, WL6.0, PV 16. YP 6, 25 OIL, 195SOL, PN 11.5, ALK

-8/2.1, CL 2500, CA 120. SL£3 2, 10* 7, CAKE2. CC:$1.098.306.
10/18/92 13,947' Orig 202'/23.5 hrt. Dr1g, RS, drig. Wasatch, 865 :50 U, CS 300 U,

705 SH, 305 LS. MM13.3, VIS 39, ML8.0. PV 15, YP 7, 25 ott, 195 500, PN
10.5, ALK

.7/1.9. CL 2500, CA 120, GELS 2. 10• 7, CAKI2. Cf : 51,105,988.DRLSBREAKS & GASUNITS13752-758' 7.5-5-7.5 290-405-290 Me fluer, cut or oil13789-802' 7-3-7 344-820-370 No fluor, cut or 01113820-823' 7.5-4.5-7.25 424-661-418 Me fluer, cut or oil13892-894' 7.73-4.75-4.5 370-575-378 Me fluor, cut or oil
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10/19/92 14,036' Orle 89'/16 hrs. Dr1g, RS. TOHw/bit. TIH w/new bit, washing 50'to tt.x (no fill). Drlg, Wasatch FM, 80% SH, 105 SD, 10% LS, SGG 310 U, CG 450U, TG 5111 0, no shows. MM 13.3. VIS 40, WL 8.4, PV 14, YP 5, 2%OIL, 19%SOL, PH 10.5. ALK 0.8/1.9. CL 2:00, CA 120, GELS 1, 10' 6. CAKE 2. CC:$1.130.380.

10/20/92 14.188' Orle 152'!23.5 hrs. Orlg, RS. Wasatch FM, 70% SH, 20% SD, 10% LS,BGG270 U. CG 366 U. No shows or losses. MW 13.3, VIS 40, WL8.0, PV 18, YP6, 2% OIL. 19% SQL. PN 11.5. ALK 1.4/2.2, CL 1900, CA 80. GELS 2, 10' 6, CAKE2. CC: 51,131,922.

10/21/92 14,334' Dr19 146'/23.5 hrs. Drlg, RS. Wasatch FM, 90% SH, 10%50, BGG1800, CG 2900 U. no mud lost last 24 hrs. MU13.3, VIS 42, WL7.6, PV 18, YP 9,45 OIL. 20%SOL. PH 7.5, ALK 1.2/1.9, CL 1700, CA60, GELS2, 10• 8, CAKE2.CC: $1,147.396.
DRLGBREAKS _MEE_ GASUNITS14260-268' 11-4-11 250-4110-293 No FL. cut or oil show14307-310' 12-9-11 190-256-180 No FL. cut or oil show

10/22/92 14,350' Running open hole logs. 16° 9 2.5 hrs. Drlg, circ. ST 25 stds (nodrag or fill). Circ, drop svy and TOH (SLM no correction) w/BHA. RUSchlumberger to run open hole logs. Logger's TO 14.353' to 12.000'. Nowrunning sonic log. Vasatch FM. 60% SH, 30% 50, 10% LS, BGG270 U, CG 1685 U,TG6115 U. Svy: 4 deg 9 14,350'. MM13.3, VIS 39. WL6,4, PV 15, YP 7, 4%OIL, 20% SOL. PM 11.5. ALK 0.6/1.2, CL 1600, CA 56, GELS1, 10' 6, CAKE1.CC: 51.158,092.

10/23/92 14.350 LO3-1/2" OP. Finish OH logs. TIH, wash 30' to bta, no fill. C&Cto run :iner. Þ0N to run 5· liner. PON to run 5' liner. LO 4-3/4" DC's.PU and rua 64 Jts 2590° 5' 189 S•95 Hydril 521 w/Baker liner and float equip,2610' total length. TIN ulliner on OP. CLC for cat. Cat 5' w/280 sx PremAG250 m/351 SSA-1, .85 CFR-3, .45 Halad 24, .45 Super CBL, .32 HR-5. Precedeest w/20 bbis 13.8 PPS med flush. Otsplace cat w/10 bols FW. 112.8 bbls 13.30mud. Rotated liner and had full returns throughout job. Bumpplug w/5000over. Cat in place 0 4.48 a.a., 10/23/92. POH 15 stds. Then commence LOof3-1/2' DP. MM13.3, VIS 39. ML6.4. PV 15, YP 7. 45 OIL, 205 SOL, PN 11.5.ALK
.6/1.2, CL 1600. CA56, GELSl. 10" 6, CAKE2. CC: $1.229,703.

10/24/92 14.350' Rte released. PON, LD 3-1/2' DP. NOBOP. NU and test 6' - 50000BOP and tbg head. Clean med tanks. RR 0 6:00 a.m., 10/24/92. CC:$1.299,777. FINAL DRILLING
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ALTAMONT/6LUEBELLFIELD
DUCHESNECOUNTY,UTAN
VI: 39.2265 AMR AFE: 64243
TO: 14.350' (WASATCH) 50: 9/4/92
CSG: 5' LINER 0 14.348'
PERFS: 12.292'-14.259'
CUC(MS): 1.757.0

10/25/92 WOCU. Dron from reoort until further activity.TC: 11.299.711

10/26/92 Plan to MIRU 10/21/92.
10/27/92 Continue RIH, cire drlg mud. Road rig to location. WOblade to getgravel spread a location ready to RU. MIRUrig a spot equip. Unload2-1/8' tbg. PU & tally in hole */6-1/8' drag bit, csg scraper, 152Jts 2-1/8' N-80 EUE9 4890'. Rev circ 370 bols. RIH 220 jts total.At 7080' etre clean. RIH 30 Jts. 250 total. At 8050' circ clean.RIH 30 Jts. 200 total. Rev ctrC clean. RIH 30 Jts. 310 total. At9915' rev circ.

OC: 58.091 TC: $1,207,868
10/28/92 Cont to drill cst to TOL. RIH w/l! JLs 2-7/8". 325 total. Tag 010.467'. RU dr19 equip. Drlg out sttrngers - get into good cat 0210.752'. Ort11 solid est from 10.752' to 11.331'. Crew change.Cont to drill cat from ll,33l'-II.530'. Made 1063' total (778° solidest).

DC: 56.549 TC: $1.314.417
10/29/92 Cont CO S'. Cont to drill est from 11.530' - getting to LT 0 11,738'with 365 Jts. Circ clean. PT to 3000 psi, held. POOHwith 365 Jts2-7/8', 7' scraper. drag bit. LD same. PU S' liner CO tool. RIHvlt2 Jts 2-3/8°. 10, 283 Jts 2-7/8', tag LT. RUdrlg equip. 00bushing a rete. PU 2 Jts w/swivel. No tag. RDdrlg equip. RIH(floattag) 4 stds. Rev circ heavy aud. Cont RIN & circ getting to12.110' by 1:00 a.a.

DC: $6,419 ."• $1.120.836
10/30/92 Logging. Cont RIN. Ctre out heavy med every 10 jts. Tag solid 013.600'. RU swivel. Fall thru 9 13,460'. RIH & tag 9 14,095'.Drill cat to 14.246'. Tag wiper plug. Drill on plug for 5 hrs &fall thru. Ortll 30' cak te 14,295'. Rev cire the clean. Pump 50bbls 35 filtered KC) denn 2-7/8" & spot in 5· liner w/67 bblsfiltered fan wtr. ADswivel a stripper. POOHw/2-7/8', 2-3/8° tby,string mill. RU OMPto run CBL-GR, perforate. RIH & correlate WL-PSTD0 14,315'.

DC: $6,144 TC: $1.321.960
10/31/92 Flug well to tank. Log free POTO14.308'-8,500'. RU with 3-1/8"guns w/120 deg phasing & perf.

Enal Osallt £sat thtlas mI 14.259'-13,B30' 25' 15 02 13.812'-13,340' 25' 75 03 13.307'-12.857' 25' 75 6504 12.885'-12.560' 25' 75 17005 12,539'-12.292• 18• 54 2400
Total 118' 354
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PAGEBSECTION 35. T15-43W
ALTANONTIBLUEEELLFIELD
DUCHESNECDUNTY,UT4N
Wl: 39 2261 ANR AFt. 64243

10/31/92 (continued)
Pressure 2600 pst before setting 5• perm pkr 9 12.000'. RO DWP.Blow down esg, RlH wiseat assemoly, SN, 372 Jts 2-7/8*. Rev circ100 bols. Soace out wil - 10', 1 - 4', 1 - 6', 1 - 2', 2-7/8' puoJts under 312nd Jt. Land tbg wihanger. NO BOP. Remove hanger,Install 000 Jt. Latch into par. Land tbg back w/14.0000 te.asion.MUUN. Test to 5000 pst. RU sitckline. PT to 3000 psi. RIN,knockout plug 6 12.000 ast went to 2650 psi. POOH& RO slickline.Open mell on 26 choke a press went to 0, 96 bols find back by 6:30a.m.
DC: $112.323 TC: $1.439,303

10/31/92 Rec 87 80. 151 BM/10 hrs, total of 238 bbis/10 hrs.
11/1/92 On production to battery. Well flug to tank. F1we 246 80. 254 BW,396 WCill8 hrs. (1P 3000, 25/64° cht.DC: 52.511 TC: $1.441.814
11/2/92 Mell on production, flue to battery. RD puso a lines. RD lightplants. Load equip. RO rig & move okt.DC: 110.144 IC: $1.451,958
11/2/92 Flug 521 BO. 124 BM, 477 MCF, FTP 3000, 25/64° chk. ROMOCU,
11/3/92 Flug 495 50, 123 BU, 619 NCF, FTP 3000. 25/64' cha.
11/4/92 Flug 519 80, llt BW, 323 MCF. FTP 2500, 25/64° chk.
11/5'92 Flug 432 80, 108 BU. 590 McF. FTP ž500, 25/64* chk.
11/6/92 Flug 431 00. 83 BU. 552 NCF, FTP 2500. 2$/64° chk.
11/7/92 Flug 420 50, 60 **. 552 McF, FTP 2500, 25/64* chk.
11/8/92 Flug 343 80. 38 BU, 532 MCF, FTP 500. 25/64* chk.
11/9/92 Flug 401 80, 18 BU, 511 MCF, FTP 1750, 25/64* chk.

Final
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ALTAMONT/BLUEBELLFIELD
DUCHESNECOUNTY, UTAN
WI: 39.226% ANR AFE: 64244/64410
TD: 14,350' (WASATCH) 50: 9/4/92
CSG: 5° LINER & 14,348'
PERFS: 12.292'-14.259'
CWC(MS): 357.1

2/3/93 Prep to kill well, PSOH witbg. N'RU.
DC: 51.386 TC °1.38ô

2/4/93 POOHw/tbg. ND 4. ..a spool & BOP. Sting out of perm pkr 9 12,000'.
POOH with 2-7/8 changing tbg collars on 90 jts to beveled collars.
DC: 53,666 TC: 55.052

2/5/93 RIH w/2-7/8* & pngg ERA. POOH, changing out collars '130 jts). RO
flaor, ND BOP & 4' spool. K2 tbg spool. NU dual string tbg spool.
NU BOP & 4' spool. PC 5-3/4" No-Go, 1 - 4 x 2-7/8 perf sub. solid
olug. 4-1/2° F3GA, 1 - 6 x 2-7/8" pup, SN. 7 jts 2-7/8" tbg, 7' MSOT
AC, 20 stds 2-7/8°. SDFN.
DC: 515.304 TC: $20.356

2/6/93 finish AlH */2-3/8° sidestring. RIH w/59 jts tbg, sidestring
receptacle. 218 jts 2-7/8". Set anchor 9 10.223 . PU sidestring
stinger. RIH w/1.66° tbg. 40 jts, XO to 2-3/8", 145 Jts 2-3/8" tbg.
50FW.
DC: $3.237 TC: $23.593

2/7/93 Cut wax w/slickline, prep to run pump & rods. RIH w/44 jts 2-3/8
,found tag in bowl 9 1026'. Land 2-3/8°. 40 BOP. Land 2-7/8' with

18.0000 teaston. Land 2-3/8" w/60000 comoression. MU WH. PU 2-1/2
x 2 x 34' rod pump. RIH w/8 -

1* rods w/guides. 91 - 3/4" stacked
out. Not oil w/30 bbis. RIH w/20 - 3/4' rods, stack out. POOM
*/111 - 3/4". 8 -

1°. rod pump. SDFN.
DC: 54.211 TC: $27.804

2/8/93 Finish RIH w/rods. Cut parafHn f-om 3000-3600' and RIH to 9800'.
Hot oil w/60 bb1s. Cut well again w/no tag. PU 2-1/2° x 2° x 34'
rod pumo. RI4 wis - l', 111 -

3/4°. PU 9 -
3/4°. stack out, hot oil

.T.d run rods to 4900'. SOFN.
30. 124.806 ft: 552.610

2/9/93 Well on pump. RIH */88 -
1/8°, 100 - l', stacked out. Flush w/60

bbls. RIH w/31 -
1°. Spaced out. SN ) 10,449'. Vill tbg w/30

bbls. Test to 500 psi, held. RD etg. Well on pumo & 4:30 p.m.,
2/9/93.
DC: 136.411 TC: 589.031

2/9/93 Pmod 31 80. 290 BW, 95 MCF, 4.8 SPM/it nrs.

2/10/93 Pmod 84 BO. 492 BW. 163 McF. 4.9 SPM

2/11/93 Pupd 160 90. 415 BW. 228 MCF. 4.1 SPM

2/12/93 Pmod 202 60. 357 BW, 228 WCF. 4 4 5PM

2/13/93 Pmod 214 80, 336 BW. 228 MCF, 4 9 SPM

2/14/93 Pmod 219 80. 317 BW, 256 McF
.

4 9 SPW

2/15/93 Pmod 234 80. 312 BW. 256 WCF. 4 9 5PM

2,16/93 Pmod 275 80. 241 BW, 280 Mct, 4 9 SPM

Prior prod. 93 80, 51 SW, :92 NCf. "P 'i 26; 4° cnt [1611
recort
OC 5254.419 R:
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UTE93-35A3 (CLEANOUT. PERF & ACIDilE) PAGE10BLUEBELLFIELD
DUCHESNECOUNTY, UT

Wl: 39.226562% >:.4 AFE: 64927
TD: 14,350' PBTD: 14.316'
5" LINER & II,738'-14,348'
FERFS: 12.008'-14.259' (WASATCH)
CWC(MS):109.5

1/14/94 Unseating pump.
Moved to location. RU to pull rods

: $1.640

1/15/94 POON w/side string.
Unse;*ed pump & flushed 254' w/70 BW. 910H wirods & pump. Work sidestring ã5 mins & unstung from shoe 7030°. POOH w/ló0 Jts 2Va" sidestrir.g. E0T 9 2130'.
TC: 54,450

1/16/94 Continue POOH w/254'.
POOHw/26 jts 244 & LD 40 jts 1.660 IJ 10rd & stinger. Too a btm jtsCOfK5CftWed bad. RÎS'd 7" AC 3 10,223'. POOH w/72 jts 254'.TC: 57,330

1/17/94 R1H wipkr plucker.
Continue POOH w/tbg & BHA. LD 41 jts (possible rod cut) above AC.RIH w/MSOT 5' pkr plucker i 282 ats 2Va" Brd. E0T @ 9105'.TC: $10,160

1/18/94 Continut• POOH w/pkr plucker.
PU 95 jts 2½ . tagged 5° pkr 9 12.000'. Milled out pk- in 3½ hrs.POOH wil2 Jts 254" above 5° LT. E07 7 11.665'.TC; $15.920

1/19/94 RIH w/CO tools.
Continue POOH w/pkr plucker i okr. Mill wore out. RIH w/4V." mill& CO tool, 88 jts 2Va". 278 jts 2Vs' to 11.632'.TC: 519.640

1/20/94 Prep to perf.
Bled gas off well. Continue RIH w/87 jts 2/a". CO 16' of fill from14,300°-14.316' PBTD. LD 93 Jts 2 a". POOH ,/27.

. 2Va". CO tool &mill. Had 1-jt 2¥." full of scale i 85 hot os led to clean tbg asPOOH. Cleaned around well. Changea to 3½• rams.TC: 526.410

1/21/94 PU 3½•.
RU Cutters WL. Perf Wasatch 9 12.008'-14.122° (153 holes), w/3Vs" csgguns. 3 SPF, 120* phasing.

Ran_* Deuth E111 "viel 111 EL
\ 14.122'-12.646' 20 60 0 6200'2 12,624°-12,127° 20 60 0 6200'3 12,125'-12,038' 11 33 0 530C'

RIH w/l.78° to F-nipple, 1-j: 2Fa . 5" MSOTArrowset-I 10K okr, ilofftool, XO. 4 jts 2Ve* Brd, 10. 5½" 00 No-Go. 138 jts 31." 9.34 N-80Brd tbg.
TC: $40.645

1/22/94 Continue swabbing.
Continue PU 246 Jts 3 5 " Bro, Set 5 MSOT Arrowset-l 11,837'*/35.000* compression. U Ocaeli. I st csq to 2000s. AcidizedWasatch cerfs 12.008°-14.259'

-,15.3$0 gals its MLI wta337 Îves. BAF,rock salt i 555 - 1.1 SS't. Ja cressure 9000s, avg pressure 8100«.Max rate 28 6PM. n 11.5 BPM, aug 19 SPM. ISIP 41001, 15 min \[F09. RDOcwell. U twao. FL 5500
.

Eit 5700', 2 swao runs, 14 5BLW wino oil or gas. un 6, 159 : bLTR.TC:
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DUCHESNECOUNTY,UT
WI: 39.226562% ANR AFE: 64927

1/23/94 Swabbing, prep to ris pkr.
SITP 600f (13 hrs). IFL 4600', FFL 5500'. Swab 18 runs in 10.5 hrs,rec 123 BLW& 39 80, 20 BPH final rate, 25% final oil cut, pH 5.TC: 590,550

1/24/94 LO 3½• & BRA.
SITP 7800 (13.5 hrs). Bled gas off. IFL 3800', I swab run - rec 780. Rls'd 5" pkr 9 11,837'. Worked 1.5 hrs getting pkr thru 5" LT.LD 335 jts 3½• to 1618'.
TC: 194,315

1/25/94 ND BOP, prep to set AC.
Continue LD 3½• Srd & pkr (I slip broke off & left in hole), RIHw/5½• No-Go, 4' perf'd sub, 254* solid plug, 1-jt 254", 4½" 00 PBGA,256" mechanical SN wil¼' dip tube, 4' sub, SN, 7 jts 254', 7" MSOTAC,99 Jts 254" & 218 Jts 254' to 10,505'.TC: 5102,400

1/26/94 Testing tbg.
Set 7° AC & 10,192.68', SN O 10,420.86', E0T 9 10,496.31'. Landedw/22,0000 tension. RIH w/Nat') Gilwell stinger, 40 jts 1.66" 2.330N-80 IJ 10rd a 187 jts 244" N-80 Brd. Stung into circ shoe 9 7001'.Landed w/40000 compression. NO BOP, NU WH. RU to fish standingvalve. Removed BPV.
TC: $105,530

1/27/94 Well on production.
Dropped standing valve, PT tbg to 500#. Pulled standing valve. RIHw/lit' Highland pump & 8 - 1". RIH w/¾ , Va" & 1" rods. Spaced out.Filled tbg, PT to 5000. RD rig. Well on production 9 6:30 p.m.TC: $121,550

1/27/94 Papd 3 80, 248 Sw, 190 MCF, 4.1 SPM, 12 hrs.
1/28/94 Pmpd 46 BO, 302 BW, 192 MCF, 4.1 SPM.
1/29/94 Pmpd Bl BO. 303 BW, 185 McF, 4.1 SPM.

1/30/94 Pmpd 67 BO, 285 BW, 188 MCF, 4.1 SPM.
1/31/94 Pmpd 32 80, 138 BW, 18 MCF, 14 hrs. Down 10 hrs - unit vibration.
2/1/94 Pmpd 81 BO. 231 BW, 154 MCF, 23 hrs.

2/2/94 Pmpd 90 BO. 201 BW, 154 McF.
2/3/94 Pepd 42 80, 391 BW, 161 MCF.
2/4/94 Pmpd 82 80, 302 BW, 142 MCf.
2/5/94 Pmpd 90 80, 263 BW, 129 HCF.

2/6/94 Pmpd 129 90, 204 BW, 142 MCF, 4.1 SPM.
Prior prod: 34 BO, 69 89, 121 MCF. Final
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DEPARTMEN'l OF THE INTERIOR .. n=.---.. ... ... -•BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT 14-20-H62-180s
i ©Ë.WELLCOMetETION OR RECOMPLETION REPORTAND LOG' Ute Indian Tribes

es.a a masa Á. ear oiker
..--

Tat a..axiusst nausa TYPE or court.rrto
N/ A

2- =s••••••••n•

Ute TribalCoastal 011 & Gas Corporation
• -se a•-3. as.eassa or vraanr

3-35A3P.O. Box 749 Denver, CO 30201-0749 (303) 573-4476 to. rama.. ..••••a. oe waraca
4..acario.or....a..ar,.res.......«,yr, ...... ...e...sa..was.artz, ......•

.. Altamont/BluebellAs sunse, 1632' FNL & 660 LiL (S'nSW)
it. .« r a--en. .....r•aws,

98 ARLAas too pree t...r... ....«.4 a.a., Sacie as above.
Section 35, T1S, R3Was tasas e.een Same as above.

14. reaanst me dag sostar - 11, corart on 11. avars
I 43-013-31365 17/27/92 I Duc ne Utah16. ours arranno is. mars v.a. assesses e 16. nars court. sk••••••er•• s is. asawas... ser. ama av. sa. ser.:• , is. stav. caansessaa8/23/92 I 10/21/92 11/2/92 6144' KB, 6122' CR20. Terak easta. as a Two 11. Pula saan 94.. as a Tve i .:. tw *•••Ytrt-a coaira.. :i. imysawasa seraar Toota caeLa &e i une usaT•

unacLas et14,350 14,302 i SFC-TD \4. ÑeocciÑTmTiaisates. or Tate roters.staes-Ter. seTTom. maass ame axe twag• 2&. was essarTiesak
auswes maan12,292-14,259' Wasacch

No
£4. ivre is.aërale aie owesa saae arn

ja)DueT/bt) / ÑEL \ ar. «••a was ceaanDLL/BHC-Son /Cal/Gi; DLL-SP-GR; CBL-CR
\ No28.

CARING RECORD INeeert eu erreege are em erethfastae sats wateN sarTa est taas i ateLa osas etmaattse asemas asses-T WWLLSE13-3/8" 54.5# 185' 18" 320 sx AG + Add None_ .

9-5/8" 400 6000' 12- 1/4" 1340 sx HiFill t. Prem AG None

se. unas ascono me. Yt•stwo ascoat,etse j tem teet eenom tues laatse cause?• ecesas test osas morre ser tues Paesas ear met7" I 5.748' I l.99A' I 16r" I 9-7/A" 17 nnn' ..12,000'I 11.738' 14,348' 280 i i in. reassaasse. ascona anser.....se ... ...*••• Perfe<i us, Acm. BROT. FRACTWRE. CEMENT SOUSERILENELw/3-l/8" un:
aarre annesas, sees au•rwe as mass er mesma case14,259-13 830' 25' 7513,812-13 340' 25' 7513,307-12 897' 25' 75

sa-•
raon -e rienas

-ease10/31/92 Flowing
Producingenn er waar meras teswee essaa assa re.... ... .n...n. ...-wer war......a saaea anese11/2/92 24 25/64" "" """" 521 477 124........... 9 l 5 . 55ftBW. TUtille geliga, fAsise pass CBS Pat.<tLATSB ate-est.. ma -act. waraa-esa,. etL saaTEWT4 9 4 Li300 N/A so-a•ca an. 521 477 124 43.1

Sold
M. Sozarth

Chronologi .al istory.

It0WED Regulatorv Analvst
Revised 12/ /92 EDD:

n

'(Se• M end Seessefor Addmenei Deseen Rev.... 94.)tide is U.LC. Sectaen 1001. makee is e enne fee say seeeenkasemagly eng wanfany te maan to .., esseremens .« ae•••T •¢ th•Usated States say false, tietations er tiendaleas saasemenes e, weer*•• •••¶
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r iDEP ARTMEP OFTHE INTER IOR = . ... .......... ... ...= ..
BUREAU OF LANDMANAGEMENT 14-20-H62-1804

WELL CQMPLETION OR RECOMPLET10NREPORTAND LOG' Ute Indian Tribesta. l aFL ui a LLL. ..... .... - -
, ,MBLL WKLB gy O (Ithpg ,24 IT 64•BEEMSMT MAMSa TYPE of coxPt.rrtour ! . );/AARW We*WK lbWat rt i a. •torg **
¡ $ 4 -

-••--WRil. e44RS g% %f¾ Panam O Ûth 9 ARM ut LBagg agggz. ...s or ersaaroe Ute TribalCoastal Oil & Gas Corporation a ..es s.
1. ........ or ernaasna 3- 35 A3P.O. Box 749 Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 5MS) N OF 10, PttLB ANO POOL. OS W1L Cat
4. sacarsom er •=ca anTw.ra te..r... eseger ......ee.....e. w.sa ... as.seree.Aggy y qwly Altamont/Bluebellas ..w... 1632 ' FNL & 660 FUL (SW/ NW)

11. mar . T . a.. M.. om eLoca amp evavat
tha AREAAt top prod. laterwel PT9efted bele, Same as akve.

As s•saa e.een Same as above. Section 35, TlS, R3W

14. Psamar no ears asataa 11. cormTT os IA. sTars
ramasa (>x<.he.s43-013-31365 \7/27/92 Cia un

, Utahti. ours arteens 14. mars T.e. asaeuse af. nova cours. akeese ••µ•e a an. sessam.. ser. ama. av. sa. swe.s• ' 15 a'*' ****•****8/28/92 10/21/92 j 11/2/92 6144' KB, 6122' GR
$$. TUTAL BWT-. -Be TW) 31. PM SAGE TA als a TWB J. tP Me iTIPt-8 COMPL.. . INTEStata moraat TOOLS CABLE TiloLB\ , new neat• \ uastras av14,350' 14,302

i SFC-TD \to. Peooresse satsevattes. or rasa ressrastsea-wer. eerrem. maus see ese Tves•
i 2i. was essecteemst

senwes asaan12,292-14,239' Wasatch
No

20. TTPs ELacTate use et'taa tese era
2Ý. was waLL ceaseDLL/BHC-Sonic/Cal/CR; DLL-SP-GR; CBL-GR

\ No$5. CARING RECORD :Segere eat stresse ett se treeftraanse essa wasset. Le-trT. , eertie est tues i mots asas ¡ reusstama agrees aaseest peLLas13-3/8" 54.30 $ 185' 18" 320 sx AG + Add No e9-5/8" 400 6000' 12-l/A" 1340 sx HiFill 6 Prem AC None

20- LAWER RECORD 30. Tt'SING AscORDessa | Top i met eerseas emet Iearse esta ssw• eemaan eme i essa serve ser emee Pacsaa eer t ma l7" A 5,748' 11.998' I 1600 7-7M" 1^ 000, 12,000'S I 11,/38' 14,348' s 280 )31. reareastaes estesa alstersel, esse end me.a6 ' erEE 13. ACID. BROT. FRACTURE. CEMENT 50Urman EftLv/3-l/8" un: eser. a.waswas anos an.e.• os .... e marassa case14,259-13 830' 25' 75 "13,812-13 340' 25' 7513,307-12 897' 25' 7512,885-12 560' 25' 7512,539-12.292'
holessa.•

raoercTtonesta risaw Pseestyses peeerrTeen netwee theeme.ges left, peampano-..ease end igpe et pesang es L syg a TR er10/ 31/92 Floving
Producingelva es test eerse testas caese ses weee a. Pee eaa,--est, maa-mer. earse-esa. •N *****11/2/92 24 25/64" "*"""• ' 521 ' 477 ' 124--a l I \now. Twame samm. raesse passeras ras.ertarse asa.-esa- see-mer. waras--mea.. ost saassyt-are (cosa.)300 N/A "" "'* 521 477 124

Sold

15. Last er attacasosate
Chronological history.

36. I hereer y 7 ettube to emessese med eerseet se determaase free aal awagable resorte

stowto Regulatory ,4nglvst ours 12/15/92

'Weeimensen... and Someenler Addme..i Dese en Reve... Side)
Title LA U-5.C. Sectson 1001. sekee it a crame fee any person haeetagly and wailfatty te state te eay depc.rument er agency of theVaated States any false, fictattees er treedaleet statemessa er eepresemanese se to say metter enthan aus
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D 1 i IL, GAS At tilNING DPERAg0R . c?ERATOR ACCI. NO.
ENTITYACTIONFORHff0RN 6 ADORESS O -

ACil0N CURRENT NEN API lAREER NELL NAME Ehl SIMO EffECTIVE(00E ENTiiY ND. EHilTV NO. QQ SE IP RG LOUNIY DAT[ DATE

î9îîî pg e-m-3 re- > s-assa só 35 i s 3 >œ« shs/o e/o
WELLI C0ttiENf5: ¡ / /

\ OILANDGAS

RF
WELL 2 CCitthis: F

LH

•

WELL3 C&ttNIS.
---....--

<f FILEUELL4 tŒttNIS:

I \ \ l I \MELL5 00MhtNIS:

ACIION CODés (see instructions en back of fore)
A - Establish new entity for new well (single well enly)8 - Add new well la esisting entity (grouper sait well)

,

"
iÏgn e( - Re-assign well free ese esistlag entity la another esisting entity //D - Re-assign well tros one esistis entity to a new entity

../E - Other gesplain in comments sect on) litle Date /nofE: Use CNesttir section te explain why each Action tode was selected. Phone no. I 1 7Ú
f



Form 31¾ UNITEDSTATES F •^r•ROVED, June im
DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR

,,,

im

BUREAUOF LAND MANAGEMENT taa.. r-en....... s..maN.
14-20 -H62 -1804SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTSON WELLS a u t..... so n rra, n...Do not use this form for proposals to ar:Il or to deecers or reent to a tr.Use "APPLICATION FOR PERMIT- for suc c'' Ute Tribal

. ) T If Unasor CA, Agrammem DesagnanomSUBMIT IN TRIPücATE

s-.°•-
DMúlÒNOF 't* 3-36^3

ANR Production Company my gagge * ^n '••) Addrena ame foispheat .%o

3 i 3ÚP. O. Box 749 Denver, CO 90201-0749 (303) 573-447 10 Fseid and Posi. or Ex¢esessey Ana4 Gassonos Well 4Foongs. Sec.. T . R.. M . or Surver Descreenoa• Al tamon t1632' FNL & 660 ' FWL (SW/Nw) n. ca..n or Param. 9...Section 35, T1S-R3W

Duchesne County, UT
I: CHECK APPROPAIATEBOXts) TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHEA DATA

TYPEOF SU6MISSION NPE OF ACTION
.s.... .a..... O , - O a.... .. -O .-,----- O s.. c........Os - ...-. O n...... .... Os a..... ......O c......... O w.., ...«Or ... - -2... O c... O c........ . .Ë other Commingle Product ion O apose water

a'aese Besert semmiseei musepia selheistsee et 4 0
x omose.... e, asseemem... assess medLes ter ail 859 statt all peniment det.usa, amt gewtpainsam tales. tuttamag •¤ama mit daht 09 tiat00g SR) pl 90000 work. gg egg g gymreammanygovesubsurtasesecanamaus mennesesne mis won.cas depes sur au maraan aan a...s perna.. en en ..«a•

ANR Production Company hereby requests permission to commingle oil and saltwater storage f ron.the above referenced w: 11 with the Ute fl-25A3, Ute 41-26A3, Ute #2-25A3, Ute 42-26A3 & Ute$2-35A3 wells. The Ute $3-35A3 has recently been completed and the Ute #1-25A3, Sl-26A3,42-25A3, 02-26A3 & $2-35A3 walls are producing into the 41-35A3 battery. A heater treater fgthe Ute #3-35A3 well has been instal'.ed at the 41-35A3 battery location (section 35, Tls-R3W)The production from the Ute $3-35A3 well be run through this treater. Oil, water & gas meteron the outlet side of the treater will measure the production of these products, then the oil& water production will be commingled with the oil & water production from the wells in thebattery into the existing tanks on this battery. Oil sales will be allocated based upon oilproduction volumes read at the heater treaters. Each treater in this battery has its own eilmeter. To prove these meters, a monthly well test is performed as follows: one well at a tiris produced into a test tank for a period of not less than 24 hours. The test tank is thengauged and compared to the actual meter reading. A meter factor is then derived from thisprocess. This request is being made in order to save money on initial battery installation,ongoing battery maintenance costs as well as limiting further surface disturbance,

14 I bereoy ceruly þit tps insegolag a Ami cessoci
, .,7

sas..s
,
/

.','. Regulatory Anal yst /l 9

Comimam ei appleuel. af asy:

rusa is usc s..... tool. me.... a crus s., anv pena....massy a.. metaan, m e.... m any me.............y .« ... u.a.s sm. a., raa.. run..s r fratuhaimm
or sees....m.... n .. any .umr weem a





'
Form 3166-5 UK.iED STATES 1 FORM mJ 990 ausgesans...No. 1004.4135t une i a DEPARTMENT OF THE INTERIOR ex,...- M.,,, 3i.19esBUREAUOF LAND MANAGEMENT 5. taa.. n-9--...s.n.a no

14-20-H62-1804SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTSON WELLS a a t.au.. Aa..., - ras, s...Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deeoen or reentry to a different reservoir.
Use "APPUCATION FOR PERM1T-' for suctt proDosals

7. If Una or CA. DesagannaSUBMIT IN TRIPUCATE •

l interosWen
N/A

:. Nasne or Operaser
Ute Tribal #3-35A3

ANR Production Comoany
: Aseren one Telepana, no 43-013-31365

P. O. Box 749 Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 i '** ** * - = E-19 ***7 ^=*
* L.arasana,n Wen sFonsage. sec..T. a.. M or surweeDescremen• Altamont/Bluebell

1632 ' FNL & 660 ' FWL (SW/NW) n. cou.rvor Pan.h. sa...
Section 35, T1S-R3W

i Duchesne County, Uta
::- CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXts) TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE. REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPEOF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION
O Nolac..n..... O -- O a......, m...O --- O s.. c........O ---,-- a.... O n......... O Non-Raunas FracamagO c........ O w..., sa.o<<O v.....-.- Neugt Ahmag Cumg Coverssoe m imerboaË oser Install Pumping Unit OD spen wam

& Sides tring "'" ""*" """''""""**"""''"
t annesse... er nece.nem... Rosen one Los a e13. DescreesPropease or CompiecesOpasanansICleertemaanas pennaam estana. and goneper•usam eines.**.me usamsess dale oi starnag anyproposed wort if med as duernomally d atgenenuesurtaaeincuammaaan mesamme aus umamunicasespes ser an usarassa and annes passana e osswork.a•

Please see the attached chronological history for the installation of a pumping unitand sidestring in the above referenced well.

DM ON 0:-
'L GAS&f.*A"

14 i conecs '

s...,a rus. Regulatory Analvyt 4/26/93
tlhis speed serFedesuler e assa

Appesund by Tida DessCememamet oppseus. si amp:

Tule it US C. Secusa 1004. masas a a crms der up passes knowegly est editaBy a mahme say esagemamer agmey ei meUn and Sans any talas. ficanaus or framedens saanor esposasamums aa e esp mamar wahm m imminassa

•5ee instmassion en neueree



aooi DEPART 'NT OF TllE INTERIOR soget MuNo 1004-0135

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Exp•r•• untw al. loca

5 Lease Des:gutscra and Senal No

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELt.S 14-20-1162-1804
Oc not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir. er laaen Alorts.or rue.sam.

Use *APPLICAT10N FOA PERMIT' - for such proposals
te Tribe

? 17 Und or Des na

SUBMIT IN TRI LICATE N/A
t Type of Wed ð Wen NarTw an3 No

-, r-, r,
<>•w., C) answ.. orner Ute Tribal 3-35A3

2 Name of Ope•mtor a API wed ro

ANR Production Company 43--013-31365
3 Address and feieonore Na 10 Ewd and PA Or Exp•ormlory Aron

P. O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4476 Altament/Bluebell
4 tocat.onof was Œoctage S•c

.
T .R. M .Or Survey Descronon) I i Cos-rny or Pansn Sore

1632°FNL & 660' FWL (SW/NW)

Section 35-TIS-R3W i Duchesne Co., UT
.2 CHECK APPROPAIATE BOy) TO INDICATE NATUREOF NOTICE. REPOAT. OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION YYPt ACTION

Maraca, of Wert Abandervrert Change of Pisos

.oorvoerson New Construccon

utse<>mnt Report Ptuggng Sach Non-Rootere f ractor y

Cea•ngAeca.« Ware Shut-Off

w Anandoneraet Nonce Amenng Casang Convers•m to inioson

orn., ÇO Perf & Acidize o.soo..w....
?t Rooon •••Ja of an,agie commty an

Coe•ço••ora es 4.cor•gswoon awan ano , •.

13 Dest De ' OUCaed o' " •Weted Opeethons (Classey stam et postenert date.g and 949 Deshnerg mies wmudog estimated ste of stanseg any proposed mona 8 WI * 'h' of
&omd gve subeam stamt•« m and enassured and tot veracasi Dins ist en sannsets anct annes port ment to tnsa mora l'

Please see the attached chronological historv to CO. perf. and acidize procedure perforrned on the subject well.

APR AN

L AS

.1 nvircun.ental ordinalpr o.a. 0 3lg
he M.smski

sunœ or se•e or State oene uses

ovso av
Conot•orts of ecornse f any

'eOresechtsOng g) I gny «gtter 46.6 gg ps; ye

'See Instruction on Revotoe



FoRM APPROVED.,asos
. DEPARTMEt )F THE INTERIOR ause..eu..u no.,oo4-oiasBUREAU OF UsND MANAGEMENT s.2 .. u..en as. 99.2

5. Laase Oes tuon and Serial No.SUNDAY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 14-20-H62-1804Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a different reservoir. 6. E in@an. Alonee or Tibe NameUse'APPUCATION FOA PEAMIT' - for such proposals

Ute Tribe
7 It Unit or CA, Agreement Designason

SUBMIT IN TRIPLICATE N/At. Type of Wei

6 We4 Neene ena No.ouw.a a..w.a oth.«
Ute Tribal #3-35A3FName of Opeessor

9 MPt Wee No,ANR Production Company
43-013-313653 Addsess and Te§ephone No.

10 Field and Pool. Or Emploratory AteeP. O. Box 749, Denver, CO 80201-0749
(303) 573-4455 Altamont/Bluebell4. Location of Well (Footage. Sec.. T., R., M.. Or Survey Desenstioni

11 County or Pensh State1632' FNL & 660' FWL (SW/NW)
Section 35-T1S-R3W

Duchesne Co., UTta CHECKAPPROPRIATEBOX(S)TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE,REPORT, OR OTHERDATATYPE OF SUBMISSION
TYPEOF ACTION

Notice of intent
Abandonment

Change of Plans

Subsequent Report
Plugging Back

Non-Roubne Fracturing
Cassag Aeonir

Water Shul-OWFinal Abandonment Notice -

Ng Ce
C

one, CO & Acidize o.cos.was.«
(NOTE Itepen seense of enunois œngishon on V pl iCo or ietsen Aegon and Leg form)

13. DetCnbe Ÿ©OD0sed of ComÞtetedOÞ0tahans(Cleedy state ei Destnent dotada. and gue pertinent dates. inclugng estmated date of startng any proposed work. W won is directionaNy

dellied. give subsurisce locabons and measured and tru vettteal depths tot ei We:Mets and zones DeehnerW to the work )·

Please see the attached workover procedure for work to be performed on the subject well.

4 i heteby corsty that the tore true and co

s.on.e
a rr' nu. Environmental & Safety Analyst o.. 12/19/95

(Thas space lor Federal or stseeomos use;

d by theAPPOLOVED BY
Tine

ConGbons¢agg-'m

Utah lon of
Oil, Gas and Miningse la U 5.C. Secoon 1001, males it a enme tar any person imommgly and munung te male to any depenment or a

dulent statements et
ressenamonees saany manar seus asMetodemon.

•8ee instruction on Reverse



uun•=•••> DEPART3tEh JF 111E INTERIOR eau..s e...u n.. soo4-osas

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT Empires: March 31, 1993MM2 5 1996 o•-••--s--

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WE 14-20-H62-1804
Do not use this form for proposals to drill or to deepen or reentry to a regoic - e a me... Asun...,1,.. n...

Use'APPUCATION FOR PERMIT' - for such pro GiL. eAS & f.

Ute Tribe
7. e unasor cA. Aos•••••t D••*en•••n

SUBMITIN TRIPUCATE N/A
1. Type of Wei S. Wei Name and No.

onwee aanwa on.., Ute Tribal #3 -35A3
a. Name of Operator 9. AAPi Wei No.

Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation 43-013-31365
3. Addiese and Telephone No, 10. Finid and Pool. Of EmpteratoryArea

P. O. Box749, Denver, CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4455 Altamont/Bluebell
4. LooeBon of WON(Footage.80s.. T.. R.. M.. Of Sussey Doesapton) 11. County or Partsh. $tate

1632'FNL & 66(YFWL (SW/NW)
Section 35-T1S-R3W Duchesne Co., UT .

is. CHECKAPPROPRIATEBOX(S)TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE.REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPEOF SUBMISSION TYPEOF ACTION

0 -•••••- bendme Change oks

n.oomples.. n.. can.trueson
subsequentRepost Phaggng Beck Non-Rousne Fracturtng

Cathbg Aspas Wetar Shut-OW

0---•-•·•••• ----.e--. Oo-----
o..., CO & Acidize os..... was.,

(NOTIL napart gestas et rmaWe een¢saan en w
Congismen er menengammennepen and t.og inte

13. Desembe Proposed et Completed Oposatene (Claeolystate se peatnese detais, and pue pesanent desse. Inehading eaumsted date of startng any proposed work. It wel is direcuene‡
drase, glue tubeurhee teostese and measused and tas vastaal dessas be es maskets and sonneperinert to taleworto)*

Please see the attached chronological history for work nerformed on the subject well.

14 i heleby coisfy tot to g to tius and eersect

as.... DR- N vm. Environmental & Safety Analyst o... 03/22/
Sheil Bremer

(This spees be Feessel or Stata eBoa uset

APPROVEDBY TMe Data
Conagens of appsowei. i eny:

Tine la us c.seasontoot, messe ne emmeer anyposeenenouangyand askap a sehe a anyeepenmentor esency ossie unissestansany tasse.acaciousor traudulent stalemen
les seentsens as to any mester nietin its As*¾

*Bee beeirection on Reverse



Page 9

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORAT10N
CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY

UTE M3-35A3 (RESTIMULATE)
ALTAMONT FIELD
DUCHESNECOUNTY.UT
WI: 39.226562%ANR AFE: 01024
TD: 14.350' Pbtd: 14302°

5" LINER @11.738'-14.348°

PERFS: 12.008°-14.348°

CWC(MS): 145.0

2/9/96 POOH. LD 2¾".
MIRU. HOT oiler down csg wil00 abis prod water on polish rod. Unseat rod pump @
10.421'. Flush tbg wi60 bbis. POOH wirods & pump. ND WH. PU on 2¾ sidestring &
unsting fromside stnng 4 701 f. Land back 2¾ . PU on 2½". NU spool & BOP. PU 2¾"
CC: 55267.

2/10-11/96 No activity.

2/12/96 RIH w/7" scraper.
POOH. LD 2¾" sidestring. Ris TAC @10.192' & POOH w/2½" tbg. CC: 58165.

2/13/94 Finish RIH w/S" scraper.
PU 6" drag bit. 7" csg Kraper. RIH m/2½" tbg. tag 5" LT@ l 1,738°. POOH w/365 jts 2½".
7" csg scraper, 6" drag bat. PU 4½" bit. 5" csg scraper,RIHw/86 jts 2¾" tbg. x-o, 2 jts 2½"
tbg. CC: 511.618.

2/14/96 PU 5" pkr. RIH wtacidize tbg.
RIH w/356 j•s2½" tby Fill 14.260 . PCOH w/35b its 2½". x-o, POOH LD 86 jts 2%".
5" csg scraper. CC: 515.338.

2/15/96 Finish PD RIH w/3½" tbg.
Open well, PU 5" HD pkr. RlH w/48 jts 2½"x3½" P-110 avkstrmg. EOT 9000 . CC:
$18.718.

2/16/96 Acidize.
Finish RIH w/pkr on 3½" workstring. Set $" HD pkr @ 13.240°. CC $22.070.

2/19/96 Swab.
Acidize perfs @ 13.270'-14.259' w/6000 gals 15% HCL.2000 gals bleach & diverter. MTP
9000#. ATP 1300#, MTR 28 BPM, ATR 19 BPM. ISIP 2150s. 5 min SIP 0*. Had good
diversion. 63 ' SLTR. Work 2 hrs to rls pkr 13.240'. POH. reset pkr 11.962 . Swab
perfs @ 12.008'-14.259° for 3 hrs, rec 78 BLW. no oil, FFL S'W. CC: $49.669

2/20/96 POOH. LD 2½" P-110 7 pkr.
100 psi on tbg. IFL @7200°, made 17 total swab runs/6 hrs. Ph 7 las: run. Rec 58 BO. 50
BW. FFL @8500 . RD swab. Ris pkr @11.962' & POH w/329 jts 3½ CC: 553.989.

2/21/96 Attempt to set pkr.
Open well. POOH.LD 48 jts 2½" P-105.5" HD pkr. RU Cutters. RlH w/5" CIBP & set
13.240'. RD Cutters. PU 5" HD pkr. RIH w/8 jts 2½" P-105 tbg. no-go. 373 jts 3½" tbg, tag
no-go on LT @ !1.738 . LD 3 jts. Unableto set 5" pkr 11.904 CC: 562.076.

2/22/96 RIH PU 3½" tbg.
Unableto get 5* pkr to set 2 11.904'. POOH. LD 3½" tbg 370 jts No-Go. 8 its 2½" P-10$
& 5" HD pkr. Pkr locked up wirubber & formation fill. PU nen 5 HD pkr. RIH on 3½" Ibg
•, 870°. CC: 568.488

2/23/96 Acidize.
Open well.contmue PU & RIH w/3½" tb; 288 jts. Tag 5" liner top g i 1.738°wiNwGo. LD
3 jts 3½". set 5" pkr I1.905°. Fill csg w/620 bbis & test to 1500* CC.



Page 10

COASTALOIL & GAS CORPORATTON
CHRONOLOGICAL HISTORY

UTE #3-35A3 (RESTIMUI.ATE)
ALTAMONT FIELD
DUCHESNECOUNTY. UT
Wl: 39.226562% ANR AFE: 01024

2/24/96 Swab.
Open well. RU Dowell& acidize Perfs 12.008°-13.219 w/9000 gais 15% HCL + 2000 gals
bleach + diverter. MTP 8900*. ATP 85005. MTR 27 BPM. ATR 15 BPM. ISIP 4189*. 10
min SIP 08. Had fair diversion. RO Dowell. RU swab. IFL 8500', made 11 swab runs &
rec 42 BW. PH 7.0 all runs. FFL @9200'. CC: $104352.

2/25/96 Free point.
700 psi on tbg. IFL (à 900Œ. made 12 swab runs. Rec 79 total bbis, 57 BW. 22 BO. PH 6.0
last run. FFL 8500. ori cut 40%. 13 BPH. RD swab. Unset 5'' pkr 11.905'. Let
equalize. POOH. LD 2 Jts 3½" & up 15 ft taggmg obstruction. PL 11.82T. CC:
5108.949.

2/26/96 RIH w/2½" tbg.
Hot Oiler down 3½" tbg wil00 bbis Open weit RIH wil jts 3½" tbg. work tbg. got pkr to
free up. POOH w/3½" tbg. LD 387jts No-Go.8 jts 2½" P-105. 5° pkr. PU 4½° shoe. CO
tools. RIH w/86 jts 2%". x-o. 2 jts 2½". CC: $115.250.

2/27/96 R!H to TD.
Open weit RIHw/327 jts 2½° tbg. tag @13.235'. Made 5°stroking tool. RU power swivel
Start drill on 5" C18P (à 13.24&. got cut over CIBP. R1Hall jt 2½ to 13.282*. RD swivel
POOH w/20 stds to i1,942 CC: 5120,601,

2/28/96 RIH w/prod tbg.
Open well. RIH w/70 jts 2½". Tag @14.262. work tb; several times making no hole.
POOHw/358 jts 2½", x-o. 86jts 2%". cleanout tools. 4½" shoe. I jt 2%' full of frac balls
& fill. RIH wiprod BHA on 50jts 2½° tbg. CC: $124.326.

2/29/96 Final. RDMO.
Open well. ContmueRIHwt2½''tbg. 323jts intal. ND BOP. Set 7° A/C 10.503 Land
tbg w/22.000s tenssoa RIH w/I½" pump & roda Seatpump @10.405' Fill tb; w/42 bbis,
test to 5000. held, slid usut space out, hung polish rod. Put unn to pumpmg @4 30 pm
Pmpd 17BO, 84 BW.!!5 MCF. 2 8 SPM. 15hours. CC. 5139.826

3/1/96 Pmpd 47 BO. 184 BW. 261 MCf. 4.1 SPM.

3/2/96 Pmpd 53 BO, 219 BW. 261 MCF. 4.1 SPM.

3/3/96 Pmpd 45 BO. 223 BW.233 MCF. 4.1 SPM. Will run dyno 3/4/96

3/4/96 Pmpd 45 80.222 BW. 233 MCF.4.1 SPM.
Ran dyno. FL @3219 (SN @ 10,405', 1½" pumpy Will increase SPM

315/96 Pmpd $3 BO. 233 BW. 231 MCF.4 i SPM.
Prior bod: 20 BO. I12 BW. 140 MCF.
Final
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OPERMOF. GIANGEMORKSHEET "°

lAttach all documentation received by the division regarding this change. 2U.itial each listed item when completed. Write N/A if item is not applicable. 3

Change of Operator (well sold) O Designation of Agent 51 Designation of Operator O Operator NameChange Only 611LM

he operator of the well(s) listed below has changed (EFFECTIVE DATE: 12-27-95 y
FO (new operator) COASTAL011. & GAS CORP FRON(former operator) ANR PRODUCTION CO DIC(address) 20 BOK749 (address) PO Box 749DHTER CO 80201-0749 DENVER CO 80201-0749

phone (303 )572-1121
phone £303 )572-1121account no. _N 0230(B) account no. NO675

Well(S) (attach additional page if needed):

Name:**SEE ATrArnxn** API:QÑ-6/ Entity: Sec_Tup Rng_ Lease Type:Name: API: Entity: Sec___Tup Rng___ Lease Type:Name: API: Entity:__ Sec___Twp Rng___ Lease Type:Name: API: Entity: Sec __Twp Rng___ Lease TypeName: API: Entity:___... Sec ..Twp Rna Lease Type.Name: API: Entity: Sec _Tup __Rng___ Lease Type.Name: API: Entity: Sec Twp___Rng___Lease Type:

PEMTORCHANGE000MENTATION

1. (Rule R615-8-10) Sundry or other leoa documentation has been received from to aoperator (Attach to this form).(t,)/g.g..g
2. (Rele R615-8-10) Sundry or ther legal documentation has been received from newopera or(Attach to this fora). {fy, T-84P

3. The Department of Omanerce has been contacted if the new operator above ts not curren I)operating any wells in Utah. Is companyregistered with the state? (yes/no) Ifyes, showcompanyfile number:
.

4. (For Indian and Federal Hells ONUf) The BLMhas been contacted regarding this cha ge(attach Telephone Documentation Form to this report). Make note of BLM status incommentssection of this form. Management review of Federal and Indian well opera prchanges should take place prior to completion of steps 5 through 9 below.
5. Changes have been tered in e dit a d Gas nforma System Nang/IBM) for each w 11isted above.(g-à- (f44(.A·A (1454 A /.Afs ($-20. A., t.A
6. Cardex file has been updated for each well listed aoove.
1. Nell file labels have been updated for each well listed above.

• 8. Changes have been included on the monthly "Operator, Address, and Account Changes" a efor distribution to State Lands and the Tax Commission- (p¿Aj?)e 9. A folder has been set up for the Operator Change file, and a copy of this page has bnplaced there for reference during routing andprocessing of the original documents.

- OVER







United States Department of the Interior

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT
Vemal District Office
170 South 500 East Phone: 1801) 781-400

wommato Vemal.Utah 84078-2799 Fax (801) 781-410

3162.3
UTOS438

May 22. 1996

Coastal Oil & Gas Corp.
Attn: Sheila Bremer
P. O. Box 749
Denver CO 80201-0749

Re: Well No. Ute 3-35A3
SWNW, Sec. 35, T1S, R3W
Lease 14-20-H62-1804
Duchesno County, Utah

Dear Ms. Bremer:

This correspondence is in regard to the SundryNotice submitted requesting a change in
operator for the referenced well. After a review by this office, the change in operator request
is approved. Effective immediately, Coastal Oil &Gas Corporation is responsible for all
operation*performed on the referenced well. All liability will now fall under your bond, a
$150.000 BIA Nationwide Bond, for all operations conducted on the referenced well on the
leased land.

If you have any otherquestions concerningthis matter, please contact Margie Herrmann or
FF Sutton o¾this officeat (801) 789-1362.

Howard B Cleaving'er II
Assistant District Manager for
Minerals Resources

cc: ANR Production Company





NITFD STATES GOVERNMENT

memorandum
March 26, 1996

.« v ro
ATTW OP:

Superintendent. Uintah and Ouray Agency
as te stry ,

Change of operator
wo'

Bureau of Land Management, Verr.al District Office
Attention: Sally Gardiner, Division of Minerale and Mining

We have received copies of Sundry Notices and Reports :. Wells
(Form 3160-5), requiring SIA Action, informing this office cf a

change of operator for the following wells:

OPERATOR - FAON: ANR PRODUCTION COKPANY

TO: COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION

(SEE ATTAPRWu LIST OF WELLS AND LOCATIONS)

This office recommands a approval for the Changes of operator forthe wells listed above.

All operations will be covered under a $150,000 Nationwide Bona·
filed with this office for Coastal.

If you have any questions, please contact this office at (801)722-2406, Ext. 51/52/54.

cc: Jerry Kanczka, BLN/Vernal
Energy & Minerals, Ute Tribe
Ute Distribution CorporatAon, Roosevelt. UT
Lisha Cordova, state of Utah
Theresa Thompson, SLM/State



e..alme UNT. > STATES Porameneveo
uun••••œ DEPARTMENTOFTHEINTERIOR eusesaus..Na toneetas

BUREAUOF LANDMANAGEMENT en... u.e si. sees
5 Lasse Dodgm en ed 5èrisiNa

SUNDRYNOTICESANDREPORTS ON WELLS 14-20-H62-t so4
Do not use ausform for proposals ¾ drillor to deepen orreertry toa dinerent reservoir. a iineen.museeer fra.se...

Use "A PUCAT10NFOR PERMIT'· for suchproposals
Ute Tribe

SUSMITIN TRIPUCA71I N/A

J Namesol dperater a ut w Me

Coasta1Oil & Gas Corporadon 43-013·31365
x uses. we Tele¢mne us R nsM ed Peel orEs¢mräwy has

P. O. Box 749, Denver. CO 80201-0749 (303) 573-4455 Altamont/Bluebella Lacemen arvuse FeeleW.Bea. T . R. R. Or a geengean) 1I cenerer Polen Base

1632' FNL& 660' FWL (SWINW)
Section 35-T IS-R3W Duch -sne Co.. UT

CHECKAPPROPRIATE BOX(S)TO INDICATENATUREOF NOTICE,REPORT. OR OTHER DATA
TYPEOF sueMISSION TYPE OF ACT10N

O •• •·- -·- e-•· ••--

no.......... N.. cansanas...L

commeasper Iwas.rsuos

om. Emergentyn one..•«m
assam messe em ans.ume.» en alas

Campasm e nemmenaan meses ame tag ammati bede o w Òem¢œMi Òpeplasma80taedy atmoal pelbani Øst-la and ghe asiamen altaa etchnistgesimtaled date ei slal tg maypopened mera it was e mamandyease. gue essessenesasessionsone maamsuce au en...wa enssissa as amassa em sense paresse seem wara r

Operator requests permission to use an emergency pit located at the Ute #1-35A3 battery

Accepted by the
Utah Division of 1937

04, Gas and g
FORRECORDONLY

ap... Ya Environmental A Safety Analyst o.. 04/08N7

i (8 0 R Ë•caanK4t. mates se esse tar wayponen ansmespyen weer to maae se any empenmeseor agency of we m Stitet my i 38 $2maus or ham.d-FM stehenwas or
amassemans as it WW m-SP alim it ylisihan

'See inetrucean en iteverse



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining
ROUTING

OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET 1. GLH , 4-KAS
,

2. CDW/ 5-LP /
3. JLT 6-FILE

Enter date after each listed itemis completed

Change of Operator (Well Sold) Designation of Agent

Operator Name Change (Only) X Merger

The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 3-09-2001

FROM: (Old Operator): TO: ( New Operator):
COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION EL PASO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY
Address: 9 GREENWAY PLAZA STE 2721 Address: 9 GREENWAY PLAZA STE 2721 RM 2975B

HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995 HOUSTON, TX 77046-0995
Phone: 1-(713)-418-4635 Phone: 1-(832)-676-4721
Account NO230 Account N1845

CA No. Unit:
WELL(S)

API ENTITY SEC TWN LEASE WELL WELL
NAME NO NO RNG TYPE TYPE STATUS
COLTHARP 1-27Z1 (CA 96-65) 43-013-30151 4700 27-01N-01W INDIAN OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-30Z1 (CA 84705C) 43-013-30813 9405 30-01N-01W INDIAN OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-31 (CA 73509) 43-013-30278 4755 31-01N-01W INDIAN OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-31A2 43-013-30401 1925 31-01S-02W INDIAN OW P
UTE 1-32Z2 43-013-30379 1915 32-01N-02W INDIAN OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-33Z2 (CA 9C-140) 43-013-30334 1851 33-01N-02W INDIAN OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-33Z2 (CA 9C-140) 43-013-31111 10451 33-01N-02W INDIAN OW P
UTE TRIBAL 2-34Z2 43-013-31167 10668 34-01N-02W INDIAN OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-35Z2 43-013-31133 10483 35-01N-02W INDIAN OW P
JAMES POWELL 4 43-013-30071 8302 19-01S-02W INDIAN OW P
MCELPRANG 1-31A1 (CA 96-50) 43-013-30190 5425 31-01S-01W INDIAN OW S
LESLIE UTE 1-11A3 43-013-30893 9401 11-01S-03W INDIAN OW P
LB UTE 1-13A3 43-013-30894 9402 13-01S-03W INDIAN OW P
LAUREN UTE 1-23A3 43-013-30895 9403 23-01S-03W INDIAN OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-25A3 43-013-30370 1920 25-01S-03W INDIAN OW P
UTE 2-25A3 43-013-31343 11361 25-01S-03W INDIAN OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-26A3 43-013-30348 1890 26-01S-03W INDIAN OW P
UTE 2-26A3 43-013-31340 11349 26-01S-03W INDIAN OW P
UTE 2-35A3 43-013-31292 11222 35-01S-03W INDIAN OW P
UTE 3-35A3 43-013-31365 11454 35-01S-03W INDIAN OW P
UTE UNIT 1-34A4 (CA 96-40) 43-013-30076 1585 34-01S-04W INDIAN OW P
OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION

1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 06/19/2001

2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 06/19/200 I
3. Thenew company hasbeenchecked through the Department of Commerce,Divisionof Corporations Database on: 06/21/20



4. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: YES Business Nurwer: 608186-0143

5. If NO, the operator was contacted contacted on: N/A

6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the (merger, name change,
or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: 08/16/2001

7. Federal and Indian Units: The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator
for wells listed on: 07/10/2001

8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"): The BLM or the BIA has approved the operator
change for all wells listed involved in a CA on: 08/16/2001

9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") The Division has approved UIC Form 5, Transfer of Authority to Inject,
for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: N/A

DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 08/28/2001

2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 08/28/2001

3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: N/A

4. Fee wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: N/A

STATE BOND VERIFICATION:
1. State well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

FEDERAL BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond No.: N/A

INDIAN BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Indian well(s) covered by Bond No.: 103601473

FEE WELLS - BOND VERIFICATION/LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
1. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any fee well(s) listed covered by Bond No: N/A

2. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A
The Division sent response by letter on: N/A

3. (R649-2-10) The FORMER operator of the Fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division
of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on:

FILMING:
1. All attachments to this form have been MICROFILMED on:

FILIN G:
1. ORIGINALS/COPIES of all attachments pertaining to each individual well have been filled in each well file on:

COMMENTS: Master list of all wells involved in operator change from Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation to El Paso
Production Oil and Gas Company shall be retained in the "Operator Change



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9

OEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5. LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUlv

a ir INnfaa ALI ATTEE OR TRIBF NAMF

SüNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON vvELLS
7. UNIT o< CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do tiol use liiis fo<m for proposals to drill new wells, significarttly deepen exisling wells below cu<<ent bottoin-liole deplii, reenter plugged wells. or to
drift horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposats.

1. TYPEOFWELL
OIL WELL GAS WELL OTHER

8. WELLNAMEandNUMBER:

Exhibit "A"
2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

A South 1700 East cny Vernal STATEUtahZIP84078 1435-789--4433
4. LOCATION OF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

UTAH

n. CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATIONO NOTICE OF INTENT
(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SlOETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date work will start: CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

CHANGE TUBING PLUG ANDABANDON VENT OR FLARE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACK WATER DISPOSAL
(Submit Original Form Only)

CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date of work completion:

COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELLSITE OTHER: Name Chanee
CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

As a result of the merger between The Coastal Corporation and a wholly owned

subsidary of El Paso Energy Corporation, the name of Coastal. Oil & Gas Corporation

has been changed to El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company effective March 9, 2001.

See Exhibit "A"

Bond # 400JUO708
Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation

NAME(PLEASEPRINT Ohn T r TITLE Vice PreSident

SIGNATURE DATE

El Paso duction Oil & Gas Coñþáffÿ
¯¯

NAME(PLEASEPRif ) JOhn T z er TITLE Vice PreSident

SIGNATURE DATE '

(This space for to use oni

RECEIVED
JUN 9 2001

(R) (sea instruciions on Reverse side)
DIVISION OF

OIL, GAS AND



State oflJelatoare

Office of the Secretary of State
PAGE 1

I, HARRIET SMITH WINDSOR, SECRETARY OF STATE OF THE STATE OF

DELAWARE, DO HEREBY CERTIFY THE ATTACHED IS A TRUE AND CORRECT

COPY OF THE CERTIFICATE OF EMENDMENT OF "COASTAL OIL & GAS

CORPORATION", CHANGING ITS NAME FROM "COASTAL OIL & GAS

CORPORATION" TO "EL PABO PRODUCTION OIL & GAS COMPANY", FILED IN

THIS OFFICE ON THE NINTH DAY OF MARCH, A.D. 2001, AT 11 O'CLOCK

A.M.

RECtiiVED

DIVISiON OF
JiL GAS AND MíN

. Harriet Smith Windsor, Secretary of State

0610204 8100 AUTHENTICATION: 1061007

010162788 DATE:



03/09/01 10:14 FAX 713 420 4099 CORP. LAW DEPT. @003/003

CERTIFICATE OF AMENDMENT

OF

CERTIFICATE OF INCORPORATION

COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATION (the "Company"), a corporationorganized and existing under and by virtue of the General Corporation Law of the State ofDelaware, DOES HEREBY CERTTFY:

FIRST: That the Board of Dioctors of the Company, by the unanimouswritten consent of its members, filed with the minutes of the Board, adopted a resolutionproposing and declaring advisable the following amendment to the Certificate ofIncorporation of the Company:

RESOLVED that it is deemed advisable that the Certificate ofIncorporation of this Company be amended, and that said Certificate ofIncorporation be so amended, by changing the Article thereof numbered"FIRST." so that,as amended, said Article shall be and read as follows:

"FTRST. The name of the corporation is El Paso Production Oil & Gas
Company."

SECOND: That in lieu of a meeting and vote of stockholders, thestockholders entitled to vote have given unanimous written consent to said amendment inaccordance with the provisions of Section 228 of the General Corporation Law of theState of Delaware.

THTRD: That the aforesaid amendment was duly adopted in accordance withthe applicable provisions of Sections 242 and 228 of the General CorporationLaw of theState of Delaware.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, said COASTAL OIL & GAS CORPORATIONhas caused this certificate to be signed on its behalf by a Vice Presidentand attested by anAssistant Secætary, this 9th dayof March 2001.

COASTALOIL & GAS CORPORATION

David L Siddall
Vice PresidentAttest:

STATE OF DELANARE
,, p . SECRETARY OF STATE

. , DIVISION OF CORPORATIONSet E. Roark, Assi t Secretmy At E IVEDmn :00 AN 03/09/2001
010118394 - 0610204

lUN19 2001
DIVISIONOF

IL GAS AND



d States De artment of the I ,or

BUREAU OF INDIAN AFFAIRS
Uintah and Ouray Agency

P. O. Box 130
988 South 7500 East

4 a •* Fort Duchesne, Utah 84026-0130
Phone: (435) 722-4300 Fax: (435) 722-2323

IN REPLY REFER TO:
Minerals and Mining
Phone: (435) 722-4310

August 16, 2001

Fax: (435) 722-2809

El Paso Production Company
Attn: Elizabeth R. Williams
Nine Greenway Plaza
Houston, TX 77046-0995

Dear Mrs. Williams:

We are in receipt of the corporate documentation for the name change from Coastal Oil & Gas

Corporation to El Paso Production Oil and Gas Company.

All documents appear to be în order, and the approval is hereby authorized to change all records,

including change of operator of certain oil and gas wells, Rights-of-Way, Communitization
Agreements, Oil and Gas Leases, Exploration and Development Agreements, etc. from Coastal

Oil & Gas Corporation to "El Paso Production Oil and Gas Company".

Approval of this name change is August 16, 2001, but effective on March 9, 2001. If you have

any questions, please do not hesitate to contact this office.

Respectfully,

Acting Superintendent

RECEIVED
AUG22 2001
DIVISIONOF

OiL, GAS AND



United States Department of the Interior
BUREAUOFLhAS eMANAGEME" RECEIVED

P.O. Box 45155
Salt Lake City, UT 84145-0155 JUL1 2 2001

DIVISION OF

In Reply Refer To:
OIL, GAS AND MINING

3106
UTSL-065841
(UT-924)

JUL 1 0 2000

NOTICE

El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company : Oil and Gas
Nine Greenway Plaza
Houston TX 77046-0095

Name Change Recognized

Acceptable evidence has been received in this office concerning the name change of Coastal Oil &
Gas Corporation into El Paso Production Oil & Gas Company with El Paso Production Oil & Gas
Company being the surviving entity.

For our purposes, the name change is recognized effective March 9, 2001.

The oil and gas lease files identified on the enclosed exhibit have been noted as to the name change.
The exhibit was compiled from a list of leases obtained from our computer program. We have not
abstracted the lease files to determine if the entities affected by this name change hold an interest in
the leases identified nor have we attempted to identify leases where the entitities are the operator on
the ground maintaining no vested recorded title or operating rights interests. We will be notifying
the Minerals Management Service and all applicable Bureau of Land Management offices of the
change by a copy of this notice. If additional documentation for changes of operator are required by
our Field Offices, you will be contacted by them.

If you identify additional leases in which the entities maintain an interest, please contact this office
and we will appropriately document those files with a copy of this



Due to the name change, the name of the principal/obligor on the bond is required to be changed
from Coastal Oil & Gas Corporation to El Paso Production Oil & Gas Companv. You may
accomplish this either by consent of surety rider on the original bond or a rider to the original bond.
The bonds are held in Wyoming and Colorado.

Opoloma L. Abeyta
Acting Chief, Branch of
Minerals Adjudication

Enclosure
1. Exhibit of Leases (1 pp)

cc: Moab Field Office
Vernal Field Office
MMS, Reference Data Branch, MS3130, PO Box 5860, Denver CO 80217

f¾tah WOGlŸÏAttn: Jim Thompson (Ste. 1210), Box 145801, SLC UT 84114
Teresa Thompson (UT-922)
Joe Incardine



RECEIVED: Mar. 07, 2012

                           FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 14-20-H62-1804 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 UTE 3-35A3 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP

9. API NUMBER:
 43013313650000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 BLUEBELL 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1632 FNL 0660 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SWNW Section: 35 Township: 01.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

3 /15 /2012

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

 

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038

TITLE
 Principle Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 3 /5 /2012

March 20, 2012

Sundry Number: 23635 API Well Number: 43013313650000Sundry Number: 23635 API Well Number: 43013313650000
FEDERAL APPROVAL OF THIS ACTION IS NECESSARY

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 14-20-H62-1804

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well UTE 3-35A3

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EL PASO E&P COMPANY, LP 43013313650000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana St. , Houston, TX, 77002 713 420-5038 Ext BLUEBELL

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

1632 FNL 0660 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SWNW Section: 35 Township: 01.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR
NOTICE OF INTENT

Approximate date work will start: CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME

3/15/2012
CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENTREPORT DEEPEN FRACTURETREAT NEWCONSTRUCTION
Date of Work Completion:

OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
SPUD REPORT

Date of Spud: REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION
Report Date:

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Accepted by the
Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

Date: March 20, 2012

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 420-5038 Principle Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 3/5/2012

RECEIVED: Mar. 07,



RECEIVED: Mar. 05, 2012

Ute 3-35A3 Procedure Summary 

• POOH w/rods, pump, and tubing 

• Circulate & Clean wellbore 

• Set CIBP @ 11,250’ and dump 10’ cement on plug 

• Perforate new intervals in the Lower Green River from (10,416’-11,228’) 

• Acidize new perforations with 30,000 gals of 15% HCL  

• RIH w/BHA, tubing, pump, and rods 

• Clean location and resume production 

Sundry Number: 23635 API Well Number: 43013313650000Sundry Number: 23635 API Well Number: 43013313650000

Ute 3-35A3 Procedure Summary
• POOH w/rods, pump, and tubing
• Circulate & Clean wellbore
• Set CIBP @ 11,250' and dump 10' cement on plug
• Perforate new intervals in the Lower Green River from (10,416'-11,228')
• Acidize new perforations with 30,000 gals of 15% HCL
• RIH w/BHA, tubing, pump, and rods
• Clean location and resume production

RECEIVED: Mar. 05,



Division of Oil, Gas and Mining ROUTING
OPERATOR CHANGE WORKSHEET (for state use only) CDW

X - Change of Operator (Well Sold) Operator Name Change/Merger
The operator of the well(s) listed below has changed, effective: 6/1/2012

FROM: (oldOperator): TO: ( New Operator):
N3065- El Paso E&P Company, L.P. N3850- EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
1001 Louisiana Street 1001 Louisiana Street
Houston, TX. 77002 Houston, TX. 77002

Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038 Phone: 1 (713) 997-5038

CA No. Unit: N/A

LL NAME SEC TWN RNG API NO ENTITY LEASE TYPE WELL WELL
NO TYPE STATUS

See Attached List

OPERATOR CHANGES DOCUMENTATION
Enter date after each listed item is completed
1. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the FORMER operator on: 6/25/2012
2. (R649-8-10) Sundry or legal documentation was received from the NEW operator on: 6/25/2012
3. The new company was checked on the Department of Commerce, Division of Corporations Database on: 6/27/2012
4a. Is the new operator registered in the State of Utah: Business Number: 2114377-0181
5a. (R649-9-2)Waste Management Plan has been received on: Yes
Sb. Inspections of LA PA state/fee well sites complete on: N/A
Sc. Reports current for Production/Disposition & Sundries on: 6/25/2012
6. Federal and Indian Lease Wells: The BLM and or the BIA has approved the merger, name change,

or operator change for all wells listed on Federal or Indian leases on: BLM N/A BIA Not Received
7. Federal and Indian Units:

The BLM or BIA has approved the successor of unit operator for wells listed on: N/A
8. Federal and Indian Communization Agreements ("CA"):

The BLM or BIA has approved the operator for all wells listed within a CA on: N/A
9. Underground Injection Control ("UIC") Division has approved UIC Form 5 Transfer of Authority to

Inject, for the enhanced/secondary recovery unit/project for the water disposal well(s) listed on: Second Oper Chg
DATA ENTRY:
1. Changes entered in the Oil and Gas Database on: 6/29/2012
2. Changes have been entered on the Monthly Operator Change Spread Sheet on: 6/29/2012
3. Bond information entered in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
4. Fee/State wells attached to bond in RBDMS on: 6/29/:2012
5. Injection Projects to new operator in RBDMS on: 6/29/2012
6. Receipt of Acceptance of Drilling Procedures for APD/New on: N/A
BOND VERIFICATION:
1. Federal well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601420
2. Indian well(s) covered by Bond Number: 103601473
3a. (R649-3-1) The NEW operator of any state/fee well(s) listed covered by Bond Number 400JUO705
3b. The FORMER operator has requested a release of liability from their bond on: N/A

LEASE INTEREST OWNER NOTIFICATION:
4. (R649-2-10) The NEW operator of the fee wells has been contacted and informed by a letter from the Division

of their responsibility to notify all interest owners of this change on: 6/29/2012
COMMENTS:
Disposal and Injections wells willbe moved when UIC 5 is received.

El Paso.xis



STATE OF UTAH FORM 9
DEPARTMENT OF NATURALRESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5 LEASEDESIGNATIONANDSERIALNUMBER:

Multiple Leases
6 IF INDIAN,ALLOTTEEOR TRIBENAMESUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:

Do notuse thisform for proposals to drillnewwells,significantlydeepen existingwells below currentbottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, orto
drillhorizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILLform for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAMEand NUMBER:
OILWELL GAS WELL OTHER See Attached

2. NAMEOF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:

El Paso E&P Company, L.P. Attn: Maria Gomez
3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 10. FIELD AND POOL, OR WILDCAT:

1001 Louisiana ciTY Houston STATE TX ZIP 77002 (713) 997-5038 See Attached
4. LOCATIONOF WELL

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: See Attached COUNTY:

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:
UTAH

« CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA
TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

O ACIDIZE DEEPEN REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION
NOTICE OF INTENT

(Submit in Duplicate) ALTER CASING FRACTURE TREAT SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL

Approximate date workwillstart CASING REPAIR NEW CONSTRUCTION TEMPORARILYABANDON

O CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS OPERATOR CHANGE TUBING REPAIR

O CHANGE TUBING PLUG AND ABANDON VENT OR FLARE

O SUBSEQUENT REPORT CHANGE WELL NAME PLUG BACl( WATER DISPOSAL
(SubmitOr10inalForm Only)

O CHANGE WELL STATUS PRODUCTION (STARTIRESUME) WATER SHUT-OFF
Date ofwork completion:

O COMMINGLEPRODUC1NG FORMATIONS O RECLAMATIONOF WELL SITE OTHER: Change of
O CONVERT WELL TYPE RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION Name/Operator

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS.Clearlyshow all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please be advised that El Paso E&P Company, L.P. (current Operator) has changed names to EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.
(new Operator) effective June 1, 2012 and that EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is considered the new operator of the attached
well locations.

EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. is responsible under the termsand conditionsof the lease(s) for the operations conducted
upon leased lands. Bond coverage is provided by the State of Utah Statewide Blanket Bond No. 400JUO705, Bureau of Land
Management Nationwide Bond No. 103601420, and Bureau of Indian Affairs Nationwide Bond No. 103601473.

Frank W. Fallerr Frank W. Falleri
Vice President Sr. Vice President
El Paso E&P Company, L.P. EP Energy E&P Company, L.P.

NAME(PLEAS NT) Maria S. Gomez TITLE Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE

E

DATE 6/22/2012

(ThisspaceforStateuseonly) RECEIVED
D JUN2 5 2012

. . . _ gee instrucuans on Reverse sd•) Olv.0F OIL,GAS&MINING"°°bivision of Oil,Gasand Mining-
Earlenekussell, Engineering Techniclaa



El Paso E1 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E1 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

Well Well
Well Name Sec TWP RNG API Number Entity Lease Type Type Status Conf
DVVR3-17C6 17 030S 060VV 4301350070 14204621118 OVV APD C
LAKEWOOD ESTATES 3-33C6 33 030S 060W 4301350127 1420H621328 OW APD C
YOUNG3-15A3 15 010S 030W 4301350122 FEE OW APD C
WHITING4-1A2 01 010S 020W 4301350424 Fee OW APD C
ELFUMSO4-34A4 34 010S 040VV 4301350720 Fee OVV APD C
YOUNG 2-281 02 020S 010W 4304751180 FEE OW APD C
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-1084 10 020S 040W 4301350712 18221 Fee OW DRL C
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-2684 26 020S 040W 4301350714 18432 Fee OW DRL C
LAKE FORK RANCH 4-24B4 24 020S 040W 4301350717 18315 Fee OW DRL C
Cook4-14B3 14 020S 030VV 4301351162 18449 Fee OVV DRL C
Peterson4-22C6 22 030S 060VV 4301351163 18518 Fee OVV DRL C
LakeForkRanch4-14B4 14 020S 040VV 4301351240 99999 Fee 04V DRL C
Ahelesco4-20C6 20 030S 060VV 4301351241 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
Peck3-13BS 13 020S 050VV 4301351364 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
Jensen2-9C4 09 030S 040VV 4301351375 99999 Fee OVV DRL C
El Paso 3-5C4 05 030S 040W 4301351376 18563 Fee OW DRL C
ULT6-31 31 030S 020E 4304740033 FEE O\¾ LA
OBERHANSLY 2-2A1 02 010S 010W 4304740164 FEE OW LA
DWR 3-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301351433 14-20-H62-4724 OW NEW C
LakeForkRanch5-23B4 23 0208 040VV 4301360739 Fee CNV NEVV
DuchesneLand4-10C5 10 030S 050VV 4301351262 Fee OVV NEVV C
Cabinland 4-9B3 09 020S 030W 4301351374 Fee OW NEW C
Layton 4-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301351389 Fee OW NEW C
Golinski4-24BS 24 020S 050VV 4301351404 Fee OiN NE\N C
AII>a1-21C4 21 030S 040VV 4301351460 Fee 04V NEVV C
Allison4-19C5 19 030S 050VV 4301351466 Fee ONV NEVV C
Seeley 4-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301351486 Fee OW NEW C
Allen4-25B5 25 020S 050VV 4301351487 Fee OVV NEVV C
Hewett 2-6C4 06 030S 040W 4301351489 Fee OW NEW C
Young2-7C4 07 030S 040VV 4301351500 Fee OVV NEVV C
Brighton 3-31A1E 31 010S 010E 4304752471 Fee OW NEW C
Hamaker3-25A1 25 010S 010VV 4304752491 Fee OVV NEVV C
Bolton3-29A1E 29 010S 010E 4304752871 Fee OVV NEVV C
HORROCKS5-20A1 20 010S 010W 4301334280 17378 FEE OW OPS C
DWR 3-19C6 19 030S 060W 4301334263 17440 14-20-462-1120 OW P
DWR 3-22C6 22 030S 060W 4301334106 17298 14-20-462-1131 OW P
DWR 3-28C6 28 030S 060W 4301334264 17360 14-20-462-1323 OW P
UTE 1-7A2 07 010S 020W 4301330025 5850 14-20-462-811 OW
UTE2-17C6 17 030S 060VV 4301331033 10115 14-20-H62-1118 OiN P
WLRTRIBAL2-19C6 19 030S 060W 4301331035 10250 14-20-H62-1120 OW P
CEDAR RIM 10-A-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301330615 6420 14-20-H62-1128 OW P
CEDAR RIM 12A B 030S 060W 4301331173 10672 14-20-H62-1323 OW P
UTE-FEE 2-33C6 33 030S 060W 4301331123 10365 14-20-H62-1328 OW P
TAYLOR3-34C6 34 030S 060VV 4301350200 17572 1420H621329 CNV P
BAKER UTE 2-34C6 34 030S 060W 4301332634 14590 14-20-H62-1329 OW P
UTE 3-35Z2 K 35 010N 020W 4301331133 10483 14-20-H62-1614 OW P
UTE 1-32Z2 32 010N 020W 4301330379 1915 14-20-H62-1702 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-33D 33 010N 020W 4301330334 1851 14-20-H62-1703 OW P
UTE 2-33Z2 33 010N 020W 4301331111 10451 14-20-H62-1703 OW P
UTETRIBAL2-34Z2 010N 020W 4301331167 10668 14-20-H62-1704 OW
LAKE FORK RANCH 3-13B4 13 020S 040W 4301334262 17439 14-20-H62-1743 OW P
Üii 1-28B4 28 020S 040VV 4301330242 1796 14-20-H62-1745 OVV P
UTE 1-34A4 34 010S 040W 4301330076 1585 14-20-H62-1774 OW P
UTE 1-36A4 36 010S 040VV 4301330069 1580 14-20-H62-1793 (MN P
UTE 1-1B4 01 020S 040W 4301330129 1700 14-20-H62-1798 OW P
UTE 1-31A2 31 010S 020VV 4301330401 1925 14-20-H62-1801 (MN P |



El Paso E2 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E2 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE1-25A3 25 010S 030VV4301330370 1920 'Wi-20-H62-1802 OVV P
UTE 2-25A3 25 010S 030W 4301331343 11361 14-20-H62-1802 OW P
UTE 1-26A3 26 OS 030W 4301330348 1890 14-20-H62-1803 OW P
UTE 2-26A3 26 010S 030W 4301331340 11349 14-20-H62-1803 OW P
UTETRIBAL4-35A3 35 010S 030VV4301350274 18009 1420H621804 OVV P C
UTE 2-35A3 35 010S 030W 4301331292 11222 14-20-H62-1804 ÖW P
UTE3-35A3 35 010S 030VV4301331365 11454 14-20-H62-1804 OIVV P
UTE 145B2 06 0208: 020VV4301330349 1895 14-20-H62-1807 O\N P
UTE 2-6B2 06 020S 020W 4301331140 11190 14-20-H62-1807 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 3-682 06 020S 020W 4301350273 18008 14-20-H62-1807 OW P C
POWELL 4-19A1 19 010S 010W 4301330071 8302 14-20-H62-1847 OW P
COLTHARP 1-27Z1 27 010N 010W 4301330151 4700 14-20-H62-1933 OW P
UTE 1-8A1E 08 010S 010E 4304730173 1846 14-20-H62-2147 OW P
UTETRIBE 1-31 31 010N 020VV 4301330278 4755 14-20-H62-2.421 OVV P
UTE 1-28B6X 28 020S 060W 4301330510 11165 14-20-H62-2492 OW P
RINKER 2-21B5 21 020S 050W 4301334166 17299 14-20-H62-2508 OW P
MURDOCK 2-34B5 34 020S 050W 4301331132 10456 14-20-H62-2511 OW P
LffE 1-3586 [35 0206; 060VV4301330507 2335 14-20-H62-2531 O\N P
UTE TRIBAL1-17A1E 17 010S 010E 4304730829 860 14-20-H62-2658 OW P
UTE 2-17A1E 17 010S 010E 4304737831 16709 14-20-H62-2658 OW P
UTE TRIBAL1-27A1E \27 010S 010E 4304730421 800 14-20-H62-2662 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-35A1E 35 010S 010E 4304730286 795 14-20-H62-2665 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-15A1E 15 010S 010E 4304730820 850 14-20-H62-2717 OW P
UTE TRIBAL P-3B1E 03 02 S 010E 4304730190 4536 14-20-H62-2873 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-22ATE 22 010S 010E 4304730429 810 14-20-H62-3103 OW P
BHUTE1-35C6 35 030S 060VV 4301330419 10705 14-20-H62-3436 09/ P
BHUTE2-35C6 35 030S 060VV 4301332790 15802 14-20-H62-3436 OV/ P
MCFARLANE 1-4D6 04 040S 060W 4301331074 10325 14-20-H62-3452 OW P
UTE TRIBAL 1-11D6 11 040S 060W 4301330482 6415 14-20-H62-3454 OW P
CARSON 2-36A1 36 010S 010W 4304731407 737 14-20-H62-3806 OW P
UTE 2-14C6 14 030S 060W 4301330775 9133 14-20-H62-3809 OW P
DWR 3-14C6 14 030S 060W 4301334003 17092 14-20-H62-3809 OW P
THE PERFECT "10" 1-10A1 10 010S 010W 4301330935 9461 14-20-H62-3855 OW
BADGER-SAM HU MONGUS1-15A1 15 010S 010W 4301330949 9462 14-20-H62-3860 OW P
MAXIMILLIAN-UTE14-1 14 010S 030W 4301330726 8437 14-20-H62-3868 OW P
FRED BASSETT 1-22A1 22 010S 010W 4301330781 9460 14-20-H62-3880 OW
UTETRIBAL1-30Z1 30 010N 010VV 4301330813 9405 14-20-H62-3910 OVV P
UTE LB 1-13A3 13 010S 030W 4301330894 9402 14-20-H62-3980 OW P
UTE2-22B6 22 020S 060VV 4301331444 11641 14-20-H62-4614 OVV P
UINTA QURAY 1-1A3 01 010S 030W 4301330132 5540 14-20-H62-4664 OW P
UTE 1-6D6 06 040S 060W 4301331696 12058 14-20-H62-4752 0W
UTE2-11D6 11 040S 060VV 4301350179 17667 1420H624801 OVV P
LÏÑï1-15D6 15 040S 060VV 4301330429 10958 14-20-H62-4824 OVV P
UTE2-15D6 15 040S 060W 4301334026 17193 14-20-H624824 OW
HILL3-24C6 24 030S 060VV 4301350293 18020 1420H624866 OVV P C
BARCLAYUTE 2-24C6R 24 030S 060W 4301333730 16385 14-20-H62-4866 OW P
BROTHERSON 1-2B4 |02 020S 040W 4301330062 1570 FEE OW P
BOREN 1-24A2 24 010S 020W 4301330084 5740 FEE _ 0W
FARNSWORTH 1-13BS 13 020S 050W 4301330092 1610 FEE OW P
BROADHEAD 1-21B6 21 020S 060W 4301330100 1595 FEE OW P
ASAYEJ 1-20A1 20 010S 010VV 4301330102 8304 FEE OVV P
HANSONTRUST 1-5B3 05 020S 030W 4301330109 1635 FEE OW P
ELLSO/ORTH1-8B4 08 020S 040VV 4301330112 1655 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH1-9B4 09 020S 040VV 4301330118 1660 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH1-17B4 17 020S 040VV 4301330126 1695 FEE OVV P
CHANDLER1-5B4 05 020S 040VV 4301330140 1685 FEE OVV P
HANSON1-32A3 32 010S 030VV 4301330141 1640 FEE OVV P
JESSEN 1-17A4 17 010S 040VV 4301330173 4725 FEE OVV P



El Paso E3 Company, LP. (N3065) to EP Energy E3 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective6/1/2012

JENKINS1-1B3 01 020S 030VV 4301330175 1790 FEE O¾V P
GOODRICH 1-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301330182 1765 FEE OW P
ELLSVVORTH1-19B4 19 020S 040VV 4301330183 1760 FEE ONV P
O(TYLE1-10B3 10 020S 030VV 4301330187 1810 FEE OVV P
JOS. SMITH1-17C5 17 iO30S 050W 4301330188 5510 FEE OW
RUDY 1-11B3 11 020S 030W \43013302041820 FEE OW
CROCu(1-BB4 06 020S 040VV 4301330213 1825 FEE OVV P
HUNT1-21B4 21 020S 040VV 4301330214 1840 FEE OVV P
LAVVRENCE1-30B4 30 020S 040VV 4301330220 1845 FEE ONV P
YOUNK31-29B4 29 020S 040VV 4301330246 1791 FEE 04V P
GRIFFITHS1-33B4 33 020S 040W 4301330288 4760 FEE OW
PCrrTER1-2B5 02 020S 050VV 4301330293 1826 FEE DVV P
BRCITHERSCR41-26B4 26 020S 040VV 4301330336 1856 FEE ONV P
SADIEMBLANK1-33Z1 33 010N 010VV 4301330355 765 FEE OVV P
PCFEFER 1-24B5 24 020S 050VV 4301330356 1730 FEE O\N P
VVHITEHELAD1-22A3 22 010S: 030VV 4301330357 1885 FEE OVV P
CHASELMILLER2-1A2 01 010S 0200/ 4301330360 5830 FEE OWI P
ELDER1-13B2 13 020S 020VV 4301330366 1905 FEE OVV P
BROTHERSON 2-10B4 10 020S 040W 4301330443 1615 FEE OW P
FARNSWORTH 2-7B4 07 020S 040W 4301330470 1935 FEE OW P
TEVV1-15A3 15 010S 030VV 4301330529 1945 FEE OVV P
UTEFEE2-20C5 20 030S 050VV 4301330550 4527 FEE ONV P
FN3USTCad1-34Z1 34 010N 010VV 4301330566 885 FEE OVV P
GALLOVVAY1-18B1 18 020S 010VV 4301330575 2365 FEE OVV P
SMfTH1-31B5 31 020S 050VV 4301330577 1955 FEE OVV P
LEBEAU 1-34A1 34 010S 010W 4301330590 1440 FEE OW P
LINMAR1-19B2 19 020S 020VV 4301330600 9350 FEE O\N P
AflSSE1-28Z1 28 010N 010VV 4301330609 905 FEE ONV P
POVVELL1-21B1 21 020S 010VV 4301330621 910 FEE OVV P
HANSEN 1-24B3 24 020S 030VV 4301330629 2390 FEE OVV P
OhAAN2-4B4 04 020S 040VV 4301330645 9125 FEE OVV P
DYE 1-25Z2 25 010N 020W 4301330659 9111 FEE OW
HMARTIN 1-21Z1 21 010N 010VV 4301330707 925 FEE OVV P
JENSEN 1-29Z1 29 010N 010W 4301330725 9110 FEE OW P
CHASEL2-17A1V 17 010S 010VV 4301330732 9112 FEE OVV P
BIRCHELL 1-27A1 27 010S 010W 4301330758 940 FEE OW P
CHRISTENSEN2-8B3 08 020S 030W 4301330780 9355 FEE OW
LAMICQ2-SB2 05 020S 020W 4301330784 2302 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON 2-14B4 14 020S 040W 4301330815 10450 FEE OW P
WRJRRAA'3-2A2 02 010S 020VVl4301330816 9620 FEE OVV P
HORROCKS2-20A1 V 20 010S 010W 4301330833 8301 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON2-2B4 02 020S 040W 4301330855 8420 FEE ÒV\Ï P
ELLSVVORTH2-8B4 08 020S 040VV 4301330898 2418 FEE OVV P
Òhi4N2-32A4 32 010S 040VV 4301330904110045 FEE OVV P
BELCHER2-33B4 33 020S 040VV4301330907 9865 FEE OVV P
BROTHERSON 2-35B5 35 020S 050W 4301330908 9404 FEE OW
HORROCKS 2-4A1 T 04 010S 010W 4301330954 9855 FEE OW P
JENSEN2-29A5 29 010S 050VV4301330974 10040 FEE OVV P
UTE2-34A4 34 010S 040VV 4301330978 10070 FEE OVV P
CHANDLER2-5B4 05 020S 040VV 4301331000 10075 FEE OVV
BABCOCK2-1284 12 020S 040VV 4301331005 10215 FEE OW/ P
BADGER MR BOOM BOOM 2-29A1 29 010S 010W 4301331013 9463 FEE OW
BLEAJAARD2-18B4 18 020S 040VV4301331025 1566 FEE OVV P
BROADHEAD 2-32B5 32 020S 050W 4301331036 10216 FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 2-1684 16 0208 040W 43013Š1046 10217 FEE OW
RUST3-4B3 04 020S 030VV4301331070 1576 FEE OVV P
HANSON TRUST 2-32Äi 3i 030W 4ŠÕT331072154T ËËË ÒŸÏ P
BROTHElfSOffž-fiŠÀ 02ÕŠÏ040W 4301331078 1541 FEE OW P



El Paso E4 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E4 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

HANSONTRUST2-5B3 05 020S 0309/ 4301331079 1636 FEE ONV P
BROTHERSON 2-15B4 15 020S 040W 4301331103 1771 FEE OW P
MONSEN2-27A3 27 010S 030W 4301331104 1746 FEE OW P
ELLSWORTH 2-19B4 19 020S 040W 4301331105 1761 FEE OW P
HUNT2-;21B4 21 020S 040VV 4301331114 1839 FEE OVV P
JENKINS2-1B3 _ 01 020S 030W 4301331117 1792 FEE OW P
PCTTTER2-24BS 24 020S 050VV4301331118 1731 FEE OVV P
POVVELL2-13A2 K 13 010S 020VV 4301331120 8306 FEE OVV P
JENKINS 2-12B3 12 020S 030W 4301331121 10459 FEE OW P
MURDCK3K2-26B5 26 020S 050VV 4301331124 1531 FEE O\N P
BIRCH 3-27B5 27 020S 050W 4301331126 1783 FEE OW P
ROBB 2-2985 29 020S 050W 4301331130 10454 FEE OW P
LAKEFORK2-13B4 13 020S 040VV 4301331134 10452 FEE OVV P
DUNCAN 3-1A2 K 01 010S 020W 4301331135 10484 FEE OW P
HAJ4SON2-983 09 0208; 030VV 4301331136 10455 FEE O\N P
ELLSVIORTH2-9B4 09 0208 040VV 4301331138 10460 FEE OVV P
UTE2-31A2 31 010S 020VV 4301331139 10458 FEE OVV P
POVVELL2-19A1 K 19 010S 010VV 4301331149 8303 FEE OVV P
CEDAR RIM 8-A 22 030S 060W 4301331171 10666 FEE OW P
POTTER 2-684 06 0208 040W 4301331249 11038 FEE OW P
MILES2-1B5 Oi 020S 050W 4301331257 11062 FEE ÒW
MILES2-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301331261 11102 FEE OW P
MONSEN 2-22A3 22 010S 030W 4301331265 11098 FEE OW P
M/RK3HT2-13B5 13 020S 050VV 4301331267 11115 FEE VV P
TODD2-21A3 21 010S 030W 4301331296 11268 FEE OW P
VVElit4RT2-29B4 3Ï 020S 040VV 4301331298 11332 FEE lOVV P
YOUNG2-15A3 15 010S 030W 4301331301 11344 FEE
CHRISTENSEN2-29A4 29 010S 040VV 4301331303 11235 FEE O\N I
BLEAZARD2-28B4 28 020S 040W 4301331304 11433 FEE OW P
REARY2-17A3 17 010S 030W 4301331318 11251 FEE OW P
LAZYK2-11B3 11 020S 030VV 4301331352 11362 FEE OVV P
LAZYK 2-14B3 14 020S 030W 4301331354 11452 FEE OW
MifFTHEVVS2-13B2 13 020S 020VV 4301331357 11374 FEE OVV P
LAKEFORK 3-15B4 15 020S 040W 4301331358 11378 FEE OW
STEVENSCHM3-29A3 29 010S 030VV 4301331376 11442 FEE CAN P
MEEKS3-883 08 020S 0300/ 4301331377 11489 FEE OVV P
ELLSVVORTH3-20B4 20 020S 040VV 4301331389 11488 FEE OVV P
DUNCAN5-13A2 13 010S 020VV 4301331516 11776 FEE CNV P
CAÑL3-17C5 17 030S 050VV 4301332112 12476 FEE OiN P
BROTHERSON2-24B4 24 020S 040?! 4301332695 14652 FEE O¾V P
BCH3RERO2-15B3 15 020S 030VV 4301332755 14750 FEE ONV P
BROTHERSON2-25B4 25 020S 040W 4301332791 15044 FEE OW P
CABINLAND2-1683 16 020S 030W 4301332914 15236 FEE OW P
KATHERINE 3-29B4 29 020S 040W 4301332923 15331 FEE OW P
SHRINERS2-10C5 10 030S 050W 4301333008 15908 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON2-26B4 26 020S 040W 4301333139 17047 FEE OW P
MORTENSEN 4-32A2 32 010S 020W 4301333211 15720 FEE OV\Ï
FERRARINI 3-2784 020S 040W 4301333265 15883 FEE OW P
RHOADES2-25B5 25 020S 050W 4301333467 16046 FEE OW P
CASE2-31B4 31 020S 040VV 4301333548 16225 FEE OVV P
ANDERSON-ROWLEY 2-24B3 2_4 020S 030W 4301333616 16284 FEE P
SPROUSE BOWDEN2-18B1 18 020S 010W 4301333808 16677 FEE OW P
BROTHERSON 3-11B4 11 020S 040W 4301333904 16891 FEE OW
KOFFORD2-36B5 36 020S 050VV 4301333988 17048 FEE O\N P
ALLEN 3-7B4 07 020S 040W 4301334027 17166 FEE OW
BOURNAKIS3-18B4 18 020S 040VV 4301334091 17264 FEE |3f! P
MILES3-12B5 12 020S 050VV 4301334110 17316 FEE OVV P
OWL and HAWK 2-31B5 31 020S 050W 4301334123 17388 FEE OW P



El Paso E5 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E5 Company, LP. (N3850) effective6/1/2012

OWL and°HAWK 4-17C5 17 030S 050W 4301334193 17387 FEE OW P
DVVR3-32B5 32 020S 050VV 4301334207 17371 FEE C¾V P
LAKEFORKRANCH 3-2284 22 0208 040W 4301334261 17409 FEE OW P
HANSON3-9B3 09 020S 030VI 4301350065 17570 FEE OVV P
DYE2-28A1 28 010S 010VV 4301350066 17531 FEE O\¾ P
MEEKS3-32A4 32 010S 040VV 4301350069 17605 FEE ONV P
HANSC‡J4-8B3 08 020S 030VV 4301350088 17571 FEE OVV rP C
LAKEFORK RANCH 3-14B4 14 020S 040W 4301350097 17484 FEE OW P
ALLEN 3-9B4 09 020S 040W 4TÕŒ55ÏžŠ17656 FEE W
HORROCKS4-20A1 20 010S 010W 4301350155 17916 FEE OW
HURLEY2-33A1 33 010S 010VV 4301350166 17573 FEE ONV P
HUTCHINS/CHIODO3-20C5 20 030S 050W 4301350190 17541 FEE OW
ALLEN3-8B4 08 020S 0409/ 4301350192 17622 FEE OVV P
OWILandHAVVK3-10C5 10 030S 050VV 4301350193 17532 FEE OMt P
ÒWÏ.and HAWK 3-19CS 19 030S 050W 4301350201 17508 FEE OW P
EL PASO 4-29B5 29 020S 050W 4301350208 17934 FEE OW C
DONIHUE3-20C6 20 030S 060VV 4301350270 17762 FEE OVV P
FUMMSON3-5B3 05 020S 030VV 4301350275 17725 FEE 04V P C
SPRATT 3-26B5 26 020S 050W 4301350302 17668 FEE OW P
REBEL3-35B5 35 020S 050VV 4301350388 17911 FEE O¾V P C
FREEMAN 4-1684 16 020S 040W 4301350438 17935 Fee OW P
VVILSON3-36B5 36 020S 050VV 4301350439 17936 Fee ONV P C
ELPASO3-21B4 21 020S 040VV 4301350474 18123 Fee 04V P C
IORIGat-12B3 12 020S 030VV 4301350487 17981 Fee O\N P C
CONOVER3-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301350526 18122 Fee OW P C
ROVVLEY3-16B4 16 020S 040VV 4301350569 18151 Fee OVV P C
POTTS 3-1483 14 020S 030W 4301350570 18366 Fee OW P C
FN3TTER4-27B5 27 020S 050VV 4301350571 99999 Fee CNV P C
EL PASO 4-21B4 21 020S 040W 4301350572 18152 Fee OW
LAKEFORK RANCH 3-26B4 26 020S 040W 4301350707 18270 Fee OW C
LAKEFORK RANCH 3-25B4 25 020S 040W 4301350711 18220 Fee OW P C
LAKEFK)RKFLANCH4-23B4 23 020S 040VV 4301350713 18271 Fee CNV P C
LAKEFORKRANCH4-15B4 15 020S 040VV 4301350715 18314 Fee OVV P C
LAKEFORK RANCH 3-24B4 24 020S 040W 4301350716 18269 Fee OW P C
GOLINSKI1-8C4 08 030S 040?! 4301350986 18301 Fee 04V P C
JFU3BERTSON 1-1B1 01 020S 01044 4304730174 5370 FEE C4V P
TIMOTiff1-8B1E 08 020S 010E 4304730215 1910 FEE OVV P
MAGDALENEPAPADOPULOS 1-34A1E 34 010S 010E 4304730241 785 FEE OW P
NELSON1-3tA1E 31 010S 010E 4304730671 830 FEE OVV P
ROSEMARY LLOYD1-24A1E 24 010S 010E 4304730707 840 FEE OW P
HD LANDY1-30A1E O 010S 010E 4304730790 845 FEE OW P
WALKER1-14A1E 14 010S 010E 4304730805 855 FEE OW P
BOLTON2-29A1E 29 010S 010E 4304731112 900 FEE OW P
PRESCCAT1-35Z1 kÏ 010N 010VV 4304731173 1425 FEE OVV P
BISEL GURR 11-1 11 010S 010W 4304731213 8438 FEE OW
UTETRIBAL2-22A1E 22 010S 010E 4304731265 915 FEE OVV P
L. BOLTON 1-12A1 12 010S 010W 4304731295 920 FEE OW P
FOWLES1-26A1 26 010S 010W 4304731296 930 FEE OVV
BRADLEY23-1 23 010S 010W 4304731297 8435 FEE OW P
BASTIAN 1-2A1 02 010S 010W 4304731373 Ì36 ËE ÃÏ
DR LONGž-15A1Ë i 010S 010E 4Š0ÀÌ314709ŠÕŒÏ ËË ÄÏ
DMCK3N1-23Z1 23 010N 010VV 4304731479 10310 FEE O\N P
O MOON 2-26Z1 26 010N 010W 4304731480 10135 FEE OW
LILAD2-25A1 25 010S 010VV 4304731797 10790 FEE OVV P
LANDY2-30A1E 30 010S 010E 4304731895 11127 FEE OVV P
VVINNP2-3B1E 03 0206: 010E 4304732321 11428 FEE OiN P
BISEL-GURR 2-11A1 11 010S 010W 4304735410 14428 FEE OW P
FLYlNGJFEE2-12A1 12 010S 010VV 4304739467 16686 FEE OVV P



El Paso E6 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E6 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

HARVEST FELLOWSHIP CHURCH2-14B1 020S 010W 4304739591 16546 FEE OW P
OBERHANSLY 3-11A1 _ 010S 010W 4304739679 17937 FEE OW
DUNCAN 2-34A1 34 010S 010W 4304739944 17043 FEE OW P
BISEL GURR 4-11A1 11 010S 010W 4304739961 16791 FEE OW
KILLIAN3-12A1 12 010S: 010VV 4304740226 17761 ML39760 O\N P
WAINOCO ST 1-1ÀB 020S 010W 4304730818 1420 ML-24306-A OW
UTAH ST UTE 1-35A1 35 010S 010W 4304730182 5520 ML-25432 OW
ST/VTE 1-19A4 19 0106; 040VV 4301330322 9118 ML-27912 OiN P
FEDERAL 2-28E19E 28 OSOS 190E 4304732849 12117 UTU-0143512 OW
FEDERAL 1-28E19E 28 050S 190E 4304730175 5680 UTU143512 O\¾ P
BLANCHARD 1-3A2 03 010S 020W 4301320316 5877 FEE OW PA
WH BLANCHARD 2-3A2 03 010S 020W 4301330008 5775 FEE OW PA
YACKU 1-7A1 07 010S 010VV 4301330018 5795 FEE OVV PA
JAAAESPOVVELL3 _ 13 010S 020VV 4301330024 8305 FEE VVD PA
BASTIAN1(3-7D) 07 010S 010VV 4301330026 5800 FEE OLV PA
LAMICQ-URRUTY 1-8A2 08 010S 020W 4301330036 5975 FEE OW_ PA
BLEAJJARD1-18B4 18 020S 040VV 4301330059 11262 FEE OVV PA
OLSEN 1-27A4 27 010S 040VV 4301330064 1565 FEE OVV F%4
EVANS 1-31A4 31 010S 040W 4301330067 5330 FEE OW
HAAABLIN1-26A2 26 010S 020VV 4301330083 2305 FEE OUV _F4
HARTMAN 1-31A3 31 010S 030W 4301330093 10700 FEE OW PA
FARNSWORTH1-7B4 07 020S 040W 4301330097 5725 FEE OW A
POVVELL1-33A3 33 010S 030VV 4301330105 4526 FEE OVV 44
LOTRIDGEGATES 1-3B3 03 020S 030W 4301330117 1625 FEE OW
REMINGTON 1-34A3 34 010S 030W 4301330139 1670 FEE OW
ANDERSON 1-28A2 28 010S 020W 4301330150 5895 FEE OW
RHOADESMOON 1-35B5 35 020S 050W 4301330155 5270 FEE OW PA
JC44N 1-3B2 03 020S 020VV 4301330160 5765 FEE O\N
SMITH 14C5 06 030S 050VV 4301330163 5385 FEE OVV F44
HORRCK3KSFEE 1-3A1 03 010S 010VV 4301330171 5505 FEE OVV !¾4
VVARREN1-32A4 32 010S 040VV 4301330174 9139 FEE CAV PA
JENSENFENZEL1-20C5 20 030S 050VV 4301330177 4730 FEE ONV PA
MNTilNRANCH1-13B4 13 020S 040VV 4301330180 4524 FEE OVV PA
BFKITHERSON 1-27B4 27 020S 040VV 4301330185 1775 FEE OVV PA
JENSEN 1-31AS 31 010S 050VV 4301330186 4735 FEE OVV 144
ROBERTSON 1-29A2 29 010S 020W 4301330189 4740 FEE OW Ä
VVINKLER1-28A3 28 010S 030VV 4301330191 5465 FEE ONV PA
CHENEY1-33A2 33 010S 020VV 4301330202 1750 FEE O¾V 144
J LAMICQSTATE 1-681 06 020S 010W 4301330210 5730 FEE OW PA
REESEESTATE1-10B2 10 020S 020VV 4301330215 5700 FEE OlVV I¾\
REEDER1-17B5 17 020S 050VV 4301330218 5460 FEE O\N PA
ROBERTSONUTE 1-2B2 02 020S 020W 4301330225 1710 FEE OW A
HATCH1-5B1 05 020S 010VV 4301330226 5470 FEE OVV PA
BROTHERSON1-22B4 22 020S 040VV 4301330227 5935 FEE OVV PA
ALLRED1-16A3 16 010S 030VV 4301330232 1780 FEE OVV 144
BIRCH1-35A5 35 010S 0509/ 4301330233 9116 FEE OVV 4
MARQUERITEUTE 1-882 08 020S 020W 4301330235 9122 FEE OW A
BU22I1-11B2 11 020S 020VV4301330248 6335 FEE 01N 44
SHISLER 1-3B 03 020S 010VV4301330249 5960 FEE OW A
TEW 1-1B5 01 020S 050W 4301330264 5580 FEE OW Ã
EVANSUTE 1-19B3 020S 030W 4301330265 1870 FEE OW PA
SHELL2-27A4 N 010S 1040W 4301330266 1776 FEE WD PA
DYE1-29A1 29 010S 010VV 4301330271 99990 FEE OVV 144
\/ODAUTE 1-‡C5 0.4 030S 050VV4301330283 4530 FEE 09V PA
BROTHERSON 1-28A4 010S 040W 4301330292 9114 FEE OW PA
MEAGHER 1-4B2 04 020S 020W 4301330313 8402 FEE OW PA
NORLING 1-9B1 020S 010W 4301330315 1811 FEE OW Ä
S. BROADHEAD 1-9C5 09 030S 050W 4301330316 5940 FEE OW PA



El Paso E7 Company, LP. (N3065) to EP Energy E7 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

TIh&DTHY1-09A3 09 010S 030VV 4301330321 10883 FEE 04V PA
BARRETT 1-34A5 34 010S 050W 4301330323 9115 FEE OW PA
MEAGHER TRIBAL 1-9B2 09 020S 020W 4301330325 9121 FEE OW PA
PHILLIPSUTE 1-3C5 03 030S 050W 4301330333 1816 FEE OW PA
ELLSWIORTH1-20B4 20 020S 040VV 4301330351 6375 FEE ONV PA
LAVVSC‡J1-28A1 28 010S 010VV 4301330358 5915 FEE OVV PA
An ES1-23A4 23 010S 040VV 4301330375 1901 FEE OVV PA
HORROCKS1-6A1 06 010S 010W 4301330390 5675 FEE OW PA
SHRINE HOSPITAL 1-10C5 10 0308 050W 4301330393 5565 FEE OW Pi
GOODRICH 1-1882 18 020S 020VV 4301330397 5485 FEE O\N PA
SVVDPOVVELL3 13 010S 020VV 4301330478 10708 FEE VVD PA
BODRERO1-15B3 15 020S 030W 4301330565 4534 FEE OW
AkOC‡4TRIBAL1-30C4 30 030S 040VV 4301330576 2360 FEE ONV PA
DUNCAN2-9B5 09 020S 050VV 4301330719 5440 FEE ONV PA
FISHER1-16A4 16 010S 040VV 4301330737 2410 FEE ONV PA
URRUTY2-34A2 34 010S 020VV 4301330753 9117 FEE ONV PA
GiOODRICH1-24A4 24 010S 040VV 4301330760 2415 FEE 04V PA
CARLSMITH2-25A4 25 0108 040VV 4301330776 9136 FEE 04V PA
ANDERSC‡J1-A30B1 30 020S 010VV 4301330783 9137 FEE OVV PA
CADILLAC3-6A1 06 010S 010W 4301330834 6316 FEE OW PA
MCELPRANG 2-31A1 31 010S 010W 4301330836 8439 FEE OW A
REESE ESTATE 2-10B2 10 020S 020W 4301330837 2417 FEE OW
CLARK2-9A3 09 010S 030W 4301330876 2416 FEE OW PA
JENKINS3-16A3 16 010S 030VV 4301330877 9790 FEE ONV PA
CHRISTENSEN2-26AS 26 010S 050VV 4301330905 10710 FEE ONV PA
FORD2-36A5 36 010S 050VV 4301330911 9630 FEE O¾V PA
MORTENSEN 2-32A2 32 010S 02OW 4301330929 9486 FEE OW PA
M/ILKERSON 1-20Z1 20 010N 010VV 4301330942 5452 FEE ONV PA
UTE TRIBAL 2-4A3 S 04 010S 030W 4301330950 10230 FEE OW
OBERHANSLY2-31Z1 31 010N 010VV 4301330970 9262 FEE Ï>Al I¾\
MORRIS2-TA3 07 010S 030VV 4301330977 9725 FEE ONV PA
POVVELL2-08A3 08 010S 030VV4301330979 10175 FEE OVV PA
FISHER24A3 06 010S 030VV 4301330984 10110 FEE OVV PA
JACOBSEN2-12A4 2 010S 040VV 4301330985 10480 FEE OVV PA
CHENEY2-33/G 33 010S 020VV 4301331042 10313 FEE OVV PA
HANSON TRUST 2-29A3 29 010S 030W 4301331043 5306 FEE OW PA
BURTON2-15B5 15 020S 050VV 4301331044 10205 FEE OVV PA
ËÃh4NS-UTE2-1783 17 020S 030VV 4301331056 10210 FEE LDVV PA
ELLSVVORTH2-20B4 20 020S 040VV 4301331090 5336 FEE 04V !%4
REMINGTON 2-34A3 34 010S 030W 4301331091 1902 FEE OW PA
VVINKLER2-28A3 28 010S 030VV 4301331109 4519 FEE O\¾ PA
TEVV2-10B5 10 020S 050VV 4301331125 1751 FEE ONV PA
LIND6WAY2-33A4 33 010S 040VV 4301331141 1756 FEE OVV PA
FIELDSTED2-28A4 28 010S 040VV 4301331293 10665 FEE OVV PA
POWELL 4-13A2 13 010S 020W 4301331336 11177 FEE GW PA
DUMP2-20A3 20 010S 030W 4301331505 11691 FEE OW PA
SMITH2X-23C7 23 0308 070VV 4301331634 12382 FEE D PA
MORTENSEN 3-32A2 32 010S 020W 4301331872 11928 FEE OW PA
TODDUSA ST 1-2B1 02 020S 010W 4304730167 99998 FEE OW PA
STATE1-7B1E 07 020S 010E 4304730180 5555 FEE OW
BACON1-10B1E 10 020S 010E 4304730881 5550 FEE ONV PA
PARIETTEDRAW 28-44 28 040S 010E 4304731408 4537 FEE OW PA
REYNOLDS2-7B1E 07 020S 010E 4304731840 4960 FEE OW PA
STATE2-35A2 35 010S 020W 4301330156 4715 ML-22874 OW PA
UTAH STATE LB 1-11B1 11 020S 010W 4304730171 5530 ML-23655 OW PA
STATE1-8A3 08 010S 030W 4301330286 5655 ML-24316 OW A
UTAHFEDERAL1-24B1 24 020S 010W 4304730220 590 ML-26079 OW PA
CEDAR RIM 15 34 030S 060W 4301330383 6395 14-20-462- 29 OW S



El Paso E8 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E8 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective 6/1/2012

UTE TRIBAL2-24C7 24 030S 070W 4301331028 10240 14-20-H62-1135 OW S
CEDARRIM12 28 030S 060W 4301330344 6370 14-20-H62-1323 OW IS
CEDARRIM16 33 030S 060W 4301330363 6390 14-20-H62-1328 OW S
SPRING HOLLOW 2-34Z3 34 010N 030W 4301330234 5255 14-20-H62-1480 OW S
E3/ANSUTE1-17B3 17 020S 030VV 4301330274 5335 14-20-H62-1733 OVV S
UTE JENKS 2-1-B4 G 01 020S 040W 4301331197 10844 14-20-H62-1782 OW S
LffE3-12B3 12 020S 030VV 4301331379 11490 14-20-H62-1810 OVV S
UTE TRIBAL9-4B1 04 020S 010W 4301330194 5715 14-20-H62-1969 OW S
UTE TRIBAL 2-21B6 21 020S 060W 4301331424 11615 14-20-H62-2489 OW S
UTE 1-33B6 33 020S 060W 4301330441 1230 14-20-H62-2493 OW S
UTE2-22B5 22 0206; 050VV 4301331122 10453 14-:20-H62-2509 O\N S
UTE1-1881E 18 020S 010E 4304730969 9135 14-20-H62-2864 O\¾ S
LAUREN UTE 1-23A3 23 010S 030W 4301330895 9403 14-20-H62-3981 OW S
UTE 2-28B6 28 020S 060W 4301331434 116i4 14-20-H62-4622 OW S
UTE 1-27B6X 27 020S 060W 4301330517 11166 14-20-H62-4631 OW S
UTE2-27B6 27 020S 060VV 4301331449 11660 14-20-H62-4:331 ONV S
CEDAR RIM10-15C6 15 030S 060W 4301330328 6365 14-20-H62-4724 OW 5
UTE 5-30A2 30 010S 020W 4301330169 5910 14-20-H62-4863 OW S
UTE TRIBAL G-1 (1-24C6) 24 030S 060W 4301330298 4533 14-20-H62-4866 OW S
UTE TRIBAL FEDERAL 1-30C5 30 030S 050W 4301330475 665 14-20-H62-4876 OW S
SMB1-10A2 10 010S 020VV 4301330012 5865 FEE OVV S
KENDALL1-12A2 12 010S 020VV 4301330013 5875 FEE ONV S
CEDARRIM2 20 030S 060VV .4301330019 6315 FEE ONV S
URRUTY 2-9A2 09 010S 020W 4301330046 5855 FEE OW S
BROTHERSON 1-14B4

J¯
ÕžÕŠ040W

4301330Ò5
1̄535 FEE OW

RUST1-4B3 04 020S 030VV 4301330063 1575 FEE OVV S
WK3NSEN1-21A3 21 010S 030VV4301330082 1590 FEE O\¾ S
BFKITHERSCRM1-10B4 10 020S 040VV 4301330110 1614 FEE ONV S
FÄRNSWORTH 1-12B5 12 020S 050W 4301330124 1645 FEE OW 5
ELLSVIORTH1-16B4 16 020S 040VV .4301330192 1735 FEE ONV S
MARSHALL1-;K)A3 20 010S 030VV 4301330193 9340 FEE OVV S
CHRISTMAN BLAND 1-31B4 31 020S 040W 4301330198 4745 FEE M S
FK)PER1-14B3 14 020S 030VV 4301330217 1850 FEE O\¾ S
EUROTHERSO‡l1-24B4 24 020S 040VV 4301330229 1865 FEE OVV S
BFMITHERSCRM1-33A4 33 010S 040VV 4301330272 1680 FEE ONV S
BROTHERSON 1-23B4 23 020S 040W 4301330483 8423 FEE OW S
SMITHALBERT2-8C5 08 030S 050VV 4301330543 5495 FEE OVV S
VODAJOSEPHINE2-19C5 19 030S 050VV 4301330553 5650 FEE ONV S
HANSEN1-16B3 16 020S 030VV 4301330617 9124 FEE OVV S
BFMITHERSCR41-25B4 25 020S 040VV 4301330668 9126 FEE 04V S
POWELL 2-33A3 33 010S 030W 4301330704 2400 FEE OW S
BROWN2-28B5 28 020S 050W 4301330718 9131 FEE OW
EULA-UTE1-16A1 16 010S 010VV 4301330782 8443 FEE O\N S
JESSEN 1-15A4 15 010S 040VV 4301330817 9345 FEE ONV S
REK3USTON 1-22Z1 22 010N 010VV 4301330884 936 FEE 04V S
FIELDSTED 2-27A4 27 010S 040W 4301330915 9632 FEE OW S
HANSKUTT 2-23B5 _ 23 020S 050W 4301330917 9600 FEE OW S
TIMOTHY 4-18A3 18 010S 030W 4301330940 9633 FEE OW S
BFKITHERSON2-3B4 03 020S 040VV 4301331008 10165 FEE ONV S
BROTHERSON 2-22B4 22 020S 1040W 4301331086 1782 FEE OW S
MILES2-35A4 35 010S 040W 4301331087 1966 FEE OW S
ELLSWORTH 2-17B4 17 020S 040W 4301331089 1696 FEE OW
RUST 2-36A4 36 010S 040W 4301331092 1577 FEE OW S
E\h4NS2-19B3 19 020S 030VV 4301331113 1777 FEE OiN iS
FARNSWORTH 2-12BS 12 020S 050W 4301331115 1646 FEE OW S
CHRISTENSEN 3-4B4 04 020S 040W 4301331142 10481 FEE OW Š
ROBERTSON 2-29A2 29 010S 020W ¡430133115010679 , FEE OW S
CEDAR RIM2A näiÏW 4301331172 10671 E OW S



El Paso E9 Company, L.P. (N3065) to EP Energy E9 Company, L.P. (N3850) effective6/1/2012

HARTMAN 2-31A3 31 010S 030W 4301331243 11026 FEE OW S
GOODRICH 2-2B3 02 020S 030W 4301331246 11037 FEE OW 'S
JESSEN2-:21A4 21 0106; 040VV 4301331256 11061 FEE C\N S
BROTHERSON3-23B4 23 020S 040W 4301331289 11141 FEE OW S
MYRIN FDANCH2-18B3 18 020S 030VV 4301331297 11475 FEE CAN S
BROTHERSON2-2B5 02 020S 050W 4301331302 11342 FEE OW S
DASTRUP2-30A3 30 010S 030VV 4301331320 11253 FEE 04V S
YOUNK32-30B4 30 020S 040VV 4301331366 11453 FEE ONV S
lOFK32-10B3 10 020S 030VV 4301331388 11482 FEE OVV S
WK3NSEN3-27A3 27 010S 030VV 4301331401 11686 FEE O\¾ S
HORROC‡092-5B1E 05 020S 010E 4304732409 11481 FEE CAN S
I-4RSEN1-25A1 25 010S 010VV 4304730552 815 FEE OVV TA
DRYGULCH1-36A1 36 010S 0100/ 4304730569 820 FEE ONV TA



RECEIVED: Nov. 02, 2012

 

STATE OF UTAH
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 

FORM 9
 

5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:
 14-20-H62-1804 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION
FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:
 

7.UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME:
  

1. TYPE OF WELL
  Oil Well 

8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
 UTE 3-35A3 

2. NAME OF OPERATOR:
 EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY, L.P.

9. API NUMBER:
 43013313650000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 
 1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038  Ext 

9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
 BLUEBELL 

4. LOCATION OF WELL
  FOOTAGES AT SURFACE:
     1632 FNL 0660 FWL 
  QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN:
     Qtr/Qtr: SWNW Section: 35 Township: 01.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U

COUNTY:
 DUCHESNE 

STATE:
 UTAH

11.

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

 

    NOTICE OF INTENT
Approximate date work will start:

    SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion:

8 /11 /2012

    SPUD REPORT
Date of Spud:

 

    DRILLING REPORT
Report Date:

 

     ACIDIZE       ALTER CASING       CASING REPAIR  

     CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS       CHANGE TUBING       CHANGE WELL NAME  

     CHANGE WELL STATUS       COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS       CONVERT WELL TYPE   

     DEEPEN       FRACTURE TREAT       NEW CONSTRUCTION  

     OPERATOR CHANGE       PLUG AND ABANDON       PLUG BACK  

     PRODUCTION START OR RESUME       RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE       RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION  

     REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION       SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL       TEMPORARY ABANDON  

     TUBING REPAIR       VENT OR FLARE        WATER DISPOSAL  

     WATER SHUTOFF       SI TA STATUS EXTENSION       APD EXTENSION  

     WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION       OTHER  OTHER: 

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

 Please attached procedure summary and detailed daily operations
summary.

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER 
 Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038

TITLE
 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE
 N/A

DATE
 11 /2 /2012

November 05, 2012

Sundry Number: 31515 API Well Number: 43013313650000Sundry Number: 31515 API Well Number: 43013313650000

FORM 9
STATE OF UTAH

DEPARTMENTOF NATURALRESOURCES
5.LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERIAL NUMBER:DIVISION OF OIL, GAS, AND MINING 14-20-H62-1804

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 6. IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME:

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, significantly deepen existing wells below
current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to drill horizontal laterals. Use APPLICATION 7.UNITor CA AGREEMENT NAME:

FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals.

1. TYPE OF WELL 8. WELL NAME and NUMBER:
Oil Well UTE 3-35A3

2. NAME OF OPERATOR: 9. API NUMBER:
EP ENERGY E&P COMPANY,L.P. 43013313650000

3. ADDRESS OF OPERATOR: PHONE NUMBER: 9. FIELD and POOL or WILDCAT:
1001 Louisiana , Houston, TX, 77002 713 997-5038 Ext BLUEBELL

4. LOCATION OF WELL COUNTY:
FOOTAGES AT SURFACE: DUCHESNE

1632 FNL 0660 FWL
QTRIQTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN: STATE:

QtrlQtr: SWNW Section: 35 Township: 01.0S Range: 03.0W Meridian: U UTAH

CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATENATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION

ACI DIZE ALTER CASING CASING REPAIR

NOTICE OF INTENT CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS CHANGE TUBING CHANGE WELL NAME
Approximate date work will start:

CHANGE WELL STATUS COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS CONVERT WELL TYPE

SUBSEQUENT REPORT
Date of Work Completion: DEEPEN FRACTURE TREAT NEW CONSTRUCTION

8/1 1/2 0 12
OPERATOR CHANGE PLUG AND ABANDON PLUG BACK

SPUD REPORT PRODUCTION START OR RESUME RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE RECOMPLETE DIFFERENT FORMATION
Date of Spud:

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL TEMPORARY ABANDON

TUBING REPAIR VENT OR FLARE WATER DISPOSAL

DRILLING REPORT
Report Date: WATER SHUTOFF SI TA STATUS EXTENSION APD EXTENSION

WILDCAT WELL DETERMINATION OTHER OTHER:

12. DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc.

Please attached procedure summary and detailed daily operations Accepted by the
summary. Utah Division of

Oil, Gas and Mining

FOR RECORD ONLY
November 05, 2012

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) PHONE NUMBER TITLE
Maria S. Gomez 713 997-5038 Principal Regulatory Analyst

SIGNATURE DATE
N/A 11/2/2012

RECEIVED: Nov. 02,



RECEIVED: Nov. 02, 2012

Ute 3-35A3 Procedure Summary 

Operations Completed 08/11/2012 

• POOH w/rods, pump, and tubing 

• Set CIBP @ 11,230’ and dumped 10’ cement on plug 

• Perforated from 11178’-10920’ and pumped 15000 gals 15% HCL acid 

• Perforated from 10824’ – 10408’ and pumped 40000 gals 15% HCL acid 

• RIH w/BHA, tubing, pump, and rods 

• Resumed production 

Sundry Number: 31515 API Well Number: 43013313650000Sundry Number: 31515 API Well Number: 43013313650000

Ute 3-35A3 Procedure Summary

operationscompleted08/11/2012

• POOH w/rods, pump, and tubing
• Set CIBP @ 11,230' and dumped 10' cement on plug
• Perforated from 11178'-10920' and pumped 15000 gals 15% HCLacid
• Perforated from 10824'-10408' and pumped 40000 gals 15% HCLacid
• RIH w/BHA, tubing, pump, and rods
• Resumed production

RECEIVED: Nov. 02,



RECEIVED: Nov. 02, 2012

CENTRAL DIVISION

1       General

1.1       Customer Information

CENTRAL DIVISIONCompany

Representative

Address

1.2       Well Information

UTE 3-35A3Well

UTE 3-35A3SiteALTAMONT FIELDProject

Event RECOMPLETE LANDKEY ENERGY/0005Rig Name/No.

Start Date 7/27/2012 End Date

8/28/1992Spud Date UWI 035-001-S 003-W 30

Active Datum GROUND LEVEL @6,122.0ft (above Mean Sea Level)

Afe 

No./Description

159509/44684 / UTE 3-35A3

2       Summary

2.1       Operation Summary

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD From

(ft)

Operation

7/27/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 P CT TGSM & JSA ( RIG UP )

 7:30  8:30 1.00 P MOL SLIDE UNIT, RIG UP

 8:30 10:30 2.00 P ATTEMPT TO WORK PUMP OFF SEAT W/ NO SUCCESS ( 

PARTED RODS )

10:30 12:30 2.00 P L/D P-ROD & SUBS, POOH W/ 137 1", 87 7/8". C/O TO TBG 

EQUIPMENT

12:30 14:30 2.00 P RELEASE TAC, NU TESTED BOPE, RU WORK FLOOR & TBG 

EQUIPMENT

14:30 18:30 4.00 P POOH W/ 122 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG.

7/28/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( POOH W/ TALL TBG )

 7:30 10:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P COOH W/ 50 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG, C/O TO ROD EQUIPMENT, 

UNSEAT PUMP

10:30 13:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P COOH W/ 52 7/8", 196 3/4", L/D & RETIRE 2" X 1-1/4" X 36' 

WALS RHBC. C/O TO TBG EQUIPMENT

13:30 19:00 5.50 PRDHEQ 39 P COOH W/ 175 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG (347 JTS 2-7/8") , 7" 

TAC, X/O TO 2-3/8", C/O TO 2-3/8" EQUIPMENT, L/D 22 JTS 

2-3/8" & BHA. SWIFN CSDFN CT.

7/29/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 STG01 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( WIRE LINE OPERATIONS )

 7:30 10:30 3.00 STG01 27 P MIRU PIONEER WIRELINE UNIT. RIH W/ 7" CIBP SET @ 11,230' 

DUMP BAIL 10' CMT

10:30 13:30 3.00 STG01 18 P RU PUMP & RETURN LINES FILL CASING W/ 644 BBLS 2% KCL, 

TO 1000 PSIG, GOOD TEST.

13:30 16:30 3.00 STG01 21 P MAKE 2 CONS 3-1/8" HSC GUNS  LOADED 3 JSPF, 120 DEG 

PHASING, W/ 22.7 GM CHARGES PERFORATE 11178 TO 10920, 

HOLD 500 PSIG ENDING PRESSURE VAC. RDMOL W/ PIONEER 

WIRELINE UNIT.

16:30 19:00 2.50 PRDHEQ 24 P SPOT PIPE RACKS AND CAT WALK, UNLOAD & PREP 350 JTS 

3-1/2" TBG, PUMU RIH W/ 7" WCS HD PACKER, 2-7/8" X 3-1/2" 

X/O, 60 JTS 3-1/2" 8RD EUE TBG. EOT @ 1875' SWIFWE 

CSDFWE

7/30/2012  6:00  6:00 24.00 NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE

7/31/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 27 P CT TGSM & JSA ( PU 3-1/2" TBG ) TSIP AND CSIP @ 90 PSIG 

BWD.

 1November 02, 2012 at 11:36 am OpenWells  

Sundry Number: 31515 API Well Number: 43013313650000Sundry Number: 31515 API Well Number: 43013313650000

CENTRAL DIVISION

1 General

1.1 Customer Information

Companv CENTRAL DIVISION

Representative
Address

1.2 Well Information

Well UTE 3-35A3

Project ALTAMONT FIELD Site UTE 3-35A3

Rig Name/No. KEY ENERGY/OOO5 Event RECOMPLETE LAND

Start Date 7/27/2012 End Date
Spud Date 8/28/1992 UWI 035-001-5 OO3-W30

Active Datum GROUND LEVEL @6,122.Oft (above Mean Sea Level)

Afe 159509/44684 / UTE 3-35A3

No.lDescription

2 Summary

2.1 Operation Summary

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
7/27/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 P CT TGSM & JSA ( RIG UP )

7:30 8:30 1.00 P MOL SLIDE UNIT, RIG UP
8:30 10:30 2.00 P ATTEMPT TO WORK PUMP OFF SEAT W/ NO SUCCESS (

PARTED RODS)
10:30 12:30 2.00 P L/D P-ROD & SUBS, POOH W/ 137 1", 87 7/8". C/O TO TBG

EQUIPMENT
12:30 14:30 2.00 P RELEASE TAC, NU TESTED BOPE, RU WORK FLOOR & TBG

EQUIPMENT
14:30 18:30 4.00 P POOH W/ 122 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG.

7/28/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CT TGSM & JSA ( POOH W/ TALL TBG )
7:30 10:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P COOH W/ 50 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG, C/O TO ROD EQUIPMENT,

UNSEAT PUMP
10:30 13:30 3.00 PRDHEQ 39 P COOH W/ 52 7/8", 196 3/4", L/D & RETIRE 2" X 1-1/4" X 36'

WALS RHBC. C/O TO TBG EQUIPMENT
13:30 19:00 5.50 PRDHEQ 39 P COOH W/ 175 JTS 2-7/8" 8RD EUE TBG (347 JTS 2-7/8") , 7"

TAC, X/O TO 2-3/8", C/O TO 2-3/8" EQUIPMENT, L/D 22 JTS
2-3/8" & BHA. SWIFN CSDFN CT.

7/29/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 STGO1 28 P CT TGSM & JSA (WIRE LINE OPERATIONS )
7:30 10:30 3.00 STGO1 27 P MIRU PIONEER WIRELINE UNIT. RIH W/ 7" CIBP SET @ 11,230'

DUMP BAIL 10' CMT
10:30 13:30 3.00 STGO1 18 P RU PUMP & RETURN LINES FILL CASING Wl644 BBLS 2% KCL,

TO 1000 PSIG, GOOD TEST.
13:30 16:30 3.00 STGO1 21 P MAKE 2 CONS 3-1/8" HSC GUNS LOADED 3 JSPF, 120 DEG

PHASING, Wl22.7 GM CHARGES PERFORATE 11178 TO 10920,
HOLD 500 PSIG ENDING PRESSURE VAC. RDMOL W/ PIONEER
WIRELINE UNIT.

16:30 19:00 2.50 PRDHEQ 24 P SPOT PIPE RACKS AND CAT WALK, UNLOAD & PREP 350 JTS
3-1/2" TBG, PUMU RIH W/ 7" WCS HD PACKER, 2-7/8" X 3-1/2"

X/O, 60 JTS 3-1/2" 8RD EUE TBG. EOT @ 1875' SWIFWE
CSDFWE

7/30/2012 6:00 6:00 24.00 NO ACTIVITY CSDFWE

7/31/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 27 P CT TGSM & JSA ( PU 3-1/2" TBG )TSIP AND CSIP @90 PSIG
BWD.

November 02, 2012 at 11:36 am 1 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Nov. 02,



RECEIVED: Nov. 02, 2012

CENTRAL DIVISION

2.1       Operation Summary (Continued)

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD From

(ft)

Operation

 7:30 16:30 9.00 PRDHEQ 24 P PUMU & RIH W/ 285 JTS 3-1/2" 8RD EUE TBG, SET PACKER @ 

10,871'.

16:30 18:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 18 P FILL CASING W/ 435 BBLS 2% KCL TEST TO 1000 PSIG GOOD 

TEST. SWIFN CSDFN CT.

8/1/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 STG01 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON RU PUMP LINES. 

FILLED OUT JSA.

 7:30  9:30 2.00 STG01 18 P FINISHED RU PLATNIUM FRAC EQUIPMENT, MIXED ACID IN FRAC 

TANK.

 9:30 12:00 2.50 STG01 35 P  PRESSURE TEST LINES @ 6700 PSI,BREAK DOWN STAGE 1 

PERFS 11178' TO 10920'. PUMPED 120 BBLS @ 8.2 BPM 0 PSI. 

INCREASED RATE TO 12.2 BPM PUMPED 20 BBLS BROKE @ 

3350. PUMPED 7500 GALS 15% HCL ACID DROPPED 100 BIO 

BALLS. PUMPED 7500 GALS ACID,  FLUSHED TBG W/ 116 

BBLS. AVG PRESS 3565, MAX PRESS 3901. MAX RATE 12.25, 

AVG RATE 10.4. ISIP 0. SI WELL RD ACIDIZERS.

12:00 17:30 5.50 STG01 39 P RELEASED PKR TOOH W/ 252-JTS 3 1/2 N-80 EUE TBG.EOT @ 

2941'. SECURED WELL SDFN.

8/2/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 STG01 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON LD TUBING AND 

PINCH POINTS. FILLED OUT JSA

 7:30  9:30 2.00 STG01 39 P CONTINUED LAYING DOWN 92-JTS 3 1/2 P-110 EUE TBG 

X-OVER PKR.

 9:30 11:00 1.50 STG02 26 P RU PIONEER WIRELINE RIH W/ PERF GUN AND CBP.SET 7" CBP 

@ 10850

11:00 14:00 3.00 STG02 06 P FILLED CSG W/ 598 BBLS FLUID LEVEL @10243' CHANGED 

OUT CSG VALVE. PRESSURE TEST CSG TO 1000 PSI  HELD.

14:00 17:30 3.50 STG02 21 P PERFORATE STAGE 2 IN 2 RUNS. FROM 10824' TO 

10408'.USING 3 1/8 GUNS, 3 SPF, 22.7GRAM CHARGES 120 

DEGREE PHASING. STARTING PRESSURE 1000 PSI FINAL 

PRESSURE 150 PSI. RD WIRE LINE.

17:30 19:30 2.00 STG02 39 P NU WASHINGTON HEAD. RIH 7" PKR, X-OVER AND 120-JTS 3 

1/2 P-110 EUE TBG EOT @ 3765'. SECURED WELL SDFN.

8/3/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 STG02 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON PU TBG FILLED OUT 

JSA.

 7:30 13:00 5.50 STG02 39 P 250 TSIP, 150 CSIP. BLED DOWN WELL. CONTINUE RIH W/ 208 

JTS 3 1/2 P-110 EUE TBG.SET PKR @ 10335', PRESS TEST CSG 

TO 1000 PSI HELD.

13:00 15:00 2.00 STG02 35 P RU PLATNIUM ACIDIZERS.

15:00 19:30 4.50 STG02 18 P WAIT ON ACID.  UNLOAD AND MIX ACID.

19:30 23:00 3.50 STG02 35 P  PRESSURE TEST LINES @ 7000 PSI, BREAK  DOWN STAGE 2 

PERFS 10824' TO 10408' PUMPED. PUMPED 20000 GALS 15% 

HCL ACID DROPPED 100 BIO BALLS. PUMPED 20000 GALS 

ACID,  FLUSHED TBG W/ 119 BBLS. AVG PRESS 4055, MAX 

PRESS 4575. MAX RATE 11.5, AVG RATE 6.6. ISIP 1875. 5 MIN 

1714 PSI, 1657 PSI, 1617 PSI.SI WELL RD ACIDIZERS. OPENED 

WELL ON 18/64 CHOKE W/ 1400.TRUNED WELL OVER TO FLOW 

TESTER

23:00  6:00 7.00 STG02 19 P 50 PSI ON 64/64 160 BBLS H20, 60 BBLS OIL.

8/4/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON LAYING DOWN 

TBG,

 7:30  9:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 19 P OPENED WELL WIDE OPEN ON 2" VALVE FLOWED BACK 20 

BBLS OIL.

 9:00 11:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 06 P RU PUMP LINES, RELEASED PKR. CIRC 100 BBLS DOWN TBG

11:30 17:00 5.50 PRDHEQ 39 P LD 238-JTS 3 1/2 P-110 EUE TBG. EOT @ 2948' SECURED WELL 

SDFN

8/5/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON WELL CONTROL 

FILLED OUT JSA.
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Sundry Number: 31515 API Well Number: 43013313650000Sundry Number: 31515 API Well Number: 43013313650000

CENTRAL DIVISION

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)

7:30 16:30 9.00 PRDHEQ 24 P PUMU & RIH W/ 285 JTS 3-1/2" 8RD EUE TBG, SET PACKER @
10,871'.

16:30 18:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 18 P FILL CASING W/ 435 BBLS 2% KCL TEST TO 1000 PSIG GOOD
TEST. SWIFN CSDFN CT.

8/1/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 STGO1 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON RU PUMP LINES.
FILLED OUT JSA.

7:30 9:30 2.00 STGO1 18 P FINISHED RU PLATNIUM FRAC EQUIPMENT, MIXED ACID IN FRAC
TANK.

9:30 12:00 2.50 STGO1 35 P PRESSURE TEST LINES @ 6700 PSI,BREAK DOWN STAGE 1
PERFS 11178' TO 10920'. PUMPED 120 BBLS @ 8.2 BPM 0 PSI.
INCREASED RATE TO 12.2 BPM PUMPED 20 BBLS BROKE @
3350. PUMPED 7500 GALS 15% HCL ACID DROPPED 100 BIO
BALLS. PUMPED 7500 GALS ACID, FLUSHED TBG W/ 116
BBLS. AVG PRESS 3565, MAX PRESS 3901. MAX RATE 12.25,
AVG RATE 10.4. ISIP 0. SI WELL RD ACIDIZERS.

12:00 17:30 5.50 STGO1 39 P RELEASED PKR TOOH W/252-JTS 3 1/2 N-80 EUE TBG.EOT @
2941'. SECURED WELL SDFN.

8/2/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 STGO1 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON LD TUBING AND
PINCH POINTS. FILLED OUT JSA

7:30 9:30 2.00 STGO1 39 P CONTINUED LAYING DOWN 92-JTS 3 1/2 P-110 EUE TBG
X-OVER PKR.

9:30 11:00 1.50 STGO2 26 P RU PIONEER WIRELINE RIH W/ PERF GUN AND CBP.SET 7" CBP

@ 10850
11:00 14:00 3.00 STGO2 06 P FILLED CSG WI598 BBLS FLUID LEVEL @10243'CHANGED

OUT CSG VALVE. PRESSURE TEST CSG TO 1000 PSI HELD.
14:00 17:30 3.50 STGO2 21 P PERFORATE STAGE 2 IN 2 RUNS. FROM 10824' TO

10408'.USING 3 1/8 GUNS, 3 SPF, 22.7GRAM CHARGES 120
DEGREE PHASING. STARTING PRESSURE 1000 PSI FINAL
PRESSURE 150 PSI. RD WIRE LINE.

17:30 19:30 2.00 STGO2 39 P NU WASHINGTON HEAD. RIH 7" PKR, X-OVER AND 120-JTS 3
1/2 P-110 EUE TBG EOT @ 3765'. SECURED WELL SDFN.

8/3/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 STGO2 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON PU TBG FILLED OUT
JSA.

7:30 13:00 5.50 STGO2 39 P 250 TSIP, 150 CSIP. BLED DOWN WELL. CONTINUE RIH W/ 208
JTS 3 1/2 P-110 EUE TBG.SET PKR @ 10335', PRESS TEST CSG
TO 1000 PSI HELD.

13:00 15:00 2.00 STGO2 35 P RU PLATNIUM ACIDIZERS.
15:00 19:30 4.50 STGO2 18 P WAIT ON ACID. UNLOAD AND MIX ACID.
19:30 23:00 3.50 STGO2 35 P PRESSURE TEST LINES @ 7000 PSI, BREAK DOWN STAGE 2

PERFS 10824' TO 10408' PUMPED. PUMPED 20000 GALS 15%
HCL ACID DROPPED 100 BIO BALLS. PUMPED 20000 GALS
ACID, FLUSHED TBG W/ 119 BBLS. AVG PRESS 4055, MAX
PRESS 4575. MAX RATE 11.5, AVG RATE 6.6. ISIP 1875. 5 MIN
1714 PSI, 1657 PSI, 1617 PSI.SI WELL RD ACIDIZERS. OPENED
WELL ON 18/64 CHOKE W/ 1400.TRUNED WELL OVER TO FLOW
TESTER

23:00 6:00 7.00 STGO2 19 P 50 PSI ON 64/64 160 BBLS H20, 60 BBLS OIL.

8/4/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON LAYING DOWN
TBG,

7:30 9:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 19 P OPENED WELL WIDE OPEN ON 2" VALVE FLOWED BACK 20
BBLS OIL.

9:00 11:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 06 P RU PUMP LINES, RELEASED PKR. CIRC 100 BBLS DOWN TBG
11:30 17:00 5.50 PRDHEQ 39 P LD 238-JTS 3 1/2 P-110 EUE TBG. EOT @ 2948' SECURED WELL

SDFN
8/5/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON WELL CONTROL

FILLED OUT JSA.

November 02, 2012 at 11:36 am 2 OpenWells
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RECEIVED: Nov. 02, 2012

CENTRAL DIVISION

2.1       Operation Summary (Continued)

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD From

(ft)

Operation

 7:30  8:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 19 P 500 TSIP 600 CSIP BLED DOWN WELL FLOWED BACK 30 BBLS 

OIL.

 8:00  9:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 06 P CIRC WELL W/ 200 BBLS 2 % KCL RETURNED 100 BBLS OIL. 

AND 80 BBLS WATER.

 9:30 11:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P LD 90-JTS 3 1/2 P-110 EUE TBG, X-OVER AND PKR.

11:00 12:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 18 P CHANGED OVER TO RUN 2 7/8 TBG.

12:30 18:00 5.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TALLIED AND RIH W/ 6 1/8 BIT, BIT SUB AND 204 JTS 2 7/8 N-80 

EUE TBG STOPPING AND FLUSHING TBG AS NEEDED W/ 80 

BBLS. EOT @ 6528. SECURED WELL SDFN.

8/6/2012 NO ACTIVITY

8/7/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING 

TUBING.FILLED OUT JSA.

 7:30  9:30 2.00 WBP 06 P 300 TSIP 500 CSIP BLED  DOWN WELL FLOWED BACK 30 BBLS 

OIL. CIRCULATE WELL. W/ 40 BBLS.

 9:30 17:00 7.50 WBP 39 P CONTINUE RIH W/ 135-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG TAGGED CBP 2' 

IN  ON JT #339,  STOPPING AND  FLUSHING TBG AS NEEDED W/ 

90 BBLS. HAD TO STOP EVERY 10 TO 20 JTS, HAD TO PUMP 

DOWN CSG W/ 70 BBLS @ 800 PSI TO GET TBG TO FLUSH.

17:00 20:30 3.50 WBP 10 P RU POWER SWIVEL. GOT REVERSE CICRULATION PUMPING 3 

BPM RETURNING 3 BPM. DRILLED ON CBP FOR @ 5MIN LOST 

CIRCULATION, INCREASED RATE TO 5 BPM. CONTINUED 

DRILLING ON CBP. PUMPED 150 BBLS FELL THRU NEVER GOT 

CIRCULATION. PUSHED CBP TO CEM TOP @ 11242'. TOOH W/ 

30 JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG. EOT 10322' SECURED WELL SDFN.

8/8/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING TUBING 

FILLED OUT JSA.

 7:30  9:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 06 P 200 CSIP, 100 TSIP, BLED DOWN WELL. PUMP 80 BBLSDOWN 

TBG GOT CIRCULATION, CONTINUED PUMPING 140 BBLS 

RETURNED 60 BBLS OIL AND 80 BBLS WATER.

 9:30 17:00 7.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RU SCANNERS TOOH SCANNING 343-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG, 

FOUND 17 BAD JTS. FLUSHING TBG AS NEEDED W/ 40 BBLS,

17:00 19:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ 5 3/4 NO/GO, 2-JTS 2 7/8 N-80, 5 1/2 PBGA, 2'- 2 7/8 

N-80 TBG SUB, SN, 6' 2 7/8 TBG SUB, 4-JTS 2 /8 N-80 EUE TBG, 

7"TAC, 69-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG, SECURED WELL SDFN.

8/9/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING TUBING. 

FILLED OUT JSA

 7:30  8:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P 250 TSIP 250 CSIP. BLED DOWN WELL CIRCULATE WELL W/ 100 

BBLS. CSG STILL FLOWING TBG ON VACUUM.

 8:30 12:00 3.50 PRDHEQ 39 P CONTINUED RIH W/ 250 JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG.

12:00 13:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 06 P CSG STILL BLOWING, CIRCULATE WELL W/ 225 BBLS,

13:30 15:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 16 P  SET TAC @ 10276', SN @ 10410', EOT @ 10512', RD RIG 

FLOOR ND BOPE NU WELL HEAD,

15:00 16:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P FLUSHED TBG W/ 60 BBLS REPLUMBED FLOW LINE

16:00 17:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P CHANGED OVER TO RUN RODS. CLEANED LOCATION SDFN.

8/10/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON RIH W/ RODS, 

FILLED OUT JSA,

 7:30  9:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 06 P 100 TSIP, 100 CSIP, FLOWED BACK 20 BBLS, TBG STILL 

FLOWING, CIRCULATE WELL W/ 120 BBLS, TBG DEAD CSG 

STILL FLOWING,

 9:00  9:30 0.50 PRDHEQ 39 P PU AND PRIMED 2 1/2" X 1 1/2" X36' PUMP, RIH W/ PUMP 10-1 

1/2" WEIGHT BARS. WENT TO RUN RODS OUT OF DERRICK 

FOOT PEDAL FOR TRANSFER WAS BROKE.

 9:30 14:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 54 P WAIT ON AND REPLACE PEDAL.

14:00 18:00 4.00 PRDHEQ 39 P CONTINUED RIH CHECKING ALL BREAKS W/ 202-3/4", 120-7/8", 

50-1" PU POLISH ROD SECURED WELL SDFN.
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Sundry Number: 31515 API Well Number: 43013313650000Sundry Number: 31515 API Well Number: 43013313650000

CENTRAL DIVISION

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
7:30 8:00 0.50 PRDHEQ 19 P 500 TSIP 600 CSIP BLED DOWN WELL FLOWED BACK 30 BBLS

OIL.
8:00 9:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 06 P CIRC WELL W/200 BBLS 2 % KCL RETURNED 100 BBLS OIL.

AND 80 BBLS WATER.
9:30 11:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 39 P LD 90-JTS 3 1/2 P-110 EUE TBG, X-OVER AND PKR.
11:00 12:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 18 P CHANGED OVER TO RUN 2 7/8 TBG.
12:30 18:00 5.50 PRDHEQ 39 P TALLIED AND RIH WI 6 1/8 BIT, BIT SUB AND 204 JTS 2 7/8 N-80

EUE TBG STOPPING AND FLUSHING TBG AS NEEDED WI 80
BBLS. EOT @ 6528. SECURED WELL SDFN.

8/6/2012 NO ACTIVITY

8/7/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 WBP 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING
TUBING.FILLED OUT JSA.

7:30 9:30 2.00 WBP 06 P 300 TSIP 500 CSIP BLED DOWN WELL FLOWED BACK 30 BBLS
OIL. CIRCULATE WELL. W/ 40 BBLS.

9:30 17:00 7.50 WBP 39 P CONTINUE RIH W/ 135-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG TAGGED CBP 2'
IN ON JT#339, STOPPING AND FLUSHING TBG AS NEEDED WI
90 BBLS. HAD TO STOP EVERY 10 TO 20 JTS, HAD TO PUMP
DOWN CSG W/ 70 BBLS @ 800 PSI TO GET TBG TO FLUSH.

17:00 20:30 3.50 WBP 10 P RU POWER SWIVEL. GOT REVERSE CICRULATION PUMPING 3
BPM RETURNING 3 BPM. DRILLED ON CBP FOR @ 5MIN LOST
CIRCULATION, INCREASED RATE TO 5 BPM. CONTINUED
DRILLING ON CBP. PUMPED 150 BBLS FELL THRU NEVER GOT
CIRCULATION. PUSHED CBP TO CEM TOP @ 11242'. TOOH W/
30 JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG. EOT 10322' SECURED WELL SDFN.

8/8/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING TUBING
FILLED OUT JSA.

7:30 9:30 2.00 PRDHEQ 06 P 200 CSIP, 100 TSIP, BLED DOWN WELL. PUMP 80 BBLSDOWN
TBG GOT CIRCULATION, CONTINUED PUMPING 140 BBLS
RETURNED 60 BBLS OIL AND 80 BBLS WATER.

9:30 17:00 7.50 PRDHEQ 39 P RU SCANNERS TOOH SCANNING 343-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG,
FOUND 17 BAD JTS. FLUSHING TBG AS NEEDED W/ 40 BBLS,

17:00 19:00 2.00 PRDHEQ 39 P RIH W/ 5 3/4 NO/GO, 2-JTS 2 7/8 N-80, 5 1/2 PBGA, 2'- 2 7/8
N-80 TBG SUB, SN, 6'2 7/8 TBG SUB, 4-JTS 2 l8 N-80 EUE TBG,
7"TAC, 69-JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG, SECURED WELL SDFN.

8/9/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING TUBING.
FILLED OUT JSA

7:30 8:30 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P 250 TSIP 250 CSIP. BLED DOWN WELL CIRCULATE WELL WI 100
BBLS. CSG STILL FLOWING TBG ON VACUUM.

8:30 12:00 3.50 PRDHEQ 39 P CONTINUED RIH W/ 250 JTS 2 7/8 N-80 EUE TBG.
12:00 13:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 06 P CSG STILL BLOWING, CIRCULATE WELL W/ 225 BBLS,
13:30 15:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 16 P SET TAC @ 10276', SN @ 10410', EOT @ 10512', RD RIG

FLOOR ND BOPE NU WELL HEAD,
15:00 16:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 06 P FLUSHED TBG W/ 60 BBLS REPLUMBED FLOW LINE
16:00 17:00 1.00 PRDHEQ 18 P CHANGED OVER TO RUN RODS. CLEANED LOCATION SDFN.

8/10/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON RIH W/ RODS,
FILLED OUT JSA,

7:30 9:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 06 P 100 TSIP, 100 CSIP, FLOWED BACK 20 BBLS, TBG STILL
FLOWING, CIRCULATE WELL W/ 120 BBLS, TBG DEAD CSG
STILL FLOWING,

9:00 9:30 0.50 PRDHEQ 39 P PU AND PRIMED 2 1/2"X 1 1/2"X36' PUMP, RIH W/ PUMP 10-1

1/2" WEIGHT BARS. WENT TO RUN RODS OUT OF DERRICK
FOOT PEDAL FOR TRANSFER WAS BROKE.

9:30 14:00 4.50 PRDHEQ 54 P WAIT ON AND REPLACE PEDAL.
14:00 18:00 4.00 PRDHEQ 39 P CONTINUED RIH CHECKING ALL BREAKS W/ 202-3/4", 120-7/8",

50-1" PU POLISH ROD SECURED WELL SDFN.

November 02, 2012 at 11:36 am 3 OpenWells
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CENTRAL DIVISION

2.1       Operation Summary (Continued)

Date      Time     

Start-End

Duratio

n

(hr)

Phase Activit

y 

Sub OP 

Code

MD From

(ft)

Operation

8/11/2012  6:00  7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P  CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING RODS 

FILLED OUT JSA

 7:30  9:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 06 P TBG AND CSG @ 500 PSI FLOWING CIRCULATE 60 BBLS DOWN 

TBG. TBG DEAD CSG STILL FLOWING A LITTLE.

 9:00 11:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P LD POLISH ROD RIH W/ RIH W/ 12 RODS LD 54-1", RIH W/ 72- 1" 

RODS( TOTAL 80-1"), SPACED OUT RODS W/ 1-8',1-6', 2-2'PU 

POLISH ROD SETED PUMP, TBG FULL PRESS AND STROKE 

TEST @ 1000 PSI HELD

11:30 14:00 2.50 RDMO 02 P RD RIG, RACKED OUT PUMP, SLID ROTA FLEXCLEANED 

LOACTION PUT ON PRODUTION.
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Sundry Number: 31515 API Well Number: 43013313650000Sundry Number: 31515 API Well Number: 43013313650000

CENTRAL DIVISION

2.1 Operation Summary (Continued)

Date Time Duratio Phase Activit Sub OP MD From Operation
Start-End n y Code (ft)

(hr)
8/11/2012 6:00 7:30 1.50 PRDHEQ 28 P CREW TRAVEL HELD SAFETY MEETING ON TRIPPING RODS

FILLED OUT JSA
7:30 9:00 1.50 PRDHEQ 06 P TBG AND CSG @ 500 PSI FLOWING CIRCULATE 60 BBLS DOWN

TBG. TBG DEAD CSG STILL FLOWING A LITTLE.
9:00 11:30 2.50 PRDHEQ 39 P LD POLISH ROD RIH W/ RIH Wl12 RODS LD 54-1", RIH Wl72-1"

RODS( TOTAL 80-1"), SPACED OUT RODS W/ 1-8',1-6', 2-2'PU

POLISH ROD SETED PUMP, TBG FULL PRESS AND STROKE
TEST @ 1000 PSI HELD

11:30 14:00 2.50 RDMO 02 P RD RIG, RACKED OUT PUMP, SLID ROTA FLEXCLEANED
LOACTION PUT ON PRODUTION.

November 02, 2012 at 11:36 am 4 OpenWells
RECEIVED: Nov. 02,



FORM9 STATE OF UTAH 
DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 

DIVISION OF OIL, GAS AND MINING 5 LEASE DESIGNATION AND SERI/IL NUMBER 

(see attached) 

SUNDRY NOTICES AND REPORTS ON WELLS 

Do not use this form for proposals to drill new wells, s1gnilicantly deepen existing wells below current bottom-hole depth, reenter plugged wells, or to 
drill horizontal laterals Use APPLICATION FOR PERMIT TO DRILL form for such proposals 

1 TYPE OF WELL 
OILWELL 0 GAS WELL □ OTHER _,,(s_e_e _ a_ tt_a _c _h _ed�)

'--
-----

2 NAME OFOPERATOR 

Javelin Energy Partners Management, LLC 
3 ADDRESS OF OPERATOR 

5221 N. O'Connor Blvd #110Q_, 1TY Irving 
4 LOCATION OF v-.1:LL 

FOOTAGES AT SURFACE 

QTR/QTR, SECTION, TOWNSHIP, RANGE, MERIDIAN 

STATE TX ZIP 75039 I
PHONE NUMBER 

(469) 575-3800

6 IF INDIAN, ALLOTTEE OR TRIBE NAME 

(see attached) 
7. UNIT or CA AGREEMENT NAME

(see attached) 
8 WELL NAME and NUMBER 

(see attached) 
9 API NUMBER 

(attached) 
10 FIELD AND POOL, OR WLDCAT. 

(see attached) 

couNTY (see attached) 

STATE· 
UTAH 

11 CHECK APPROPRIATE BOXES TO INDICATE NATURE OF NOTICE, REPORT, OR OTHER DATA 

TYPE OF SUBMISSION TYPE OF ACTION 

12] □ ACIDIZE □ DEEPEN □ NOTICE OF INTENT 
(Submit in Duplicate) □ ALTER CASING □ FRACTURE TREAT □ 

Appro�mate date work will start □ CASING REPAIR □ NEW CONSTRUCTION □ 

7/1/2022 □ CHANGE TO PREVIOUS PLANS □ OPERATOR CHANGE □ 

□ CHANGE TUBING □ PLUG AND AB,'NDQN □ 
□ SUBSEQUENT REPORT □ CHANGE WELL NAME □ PLUG BACK □ 

(Submit Original Form Only! 

□ CHANGE WELL STATUS □ PRODUCTION (START/RESUME) □ Date of work completion 

□ □ □ COMMINGLE PRODUCING FORMATIONS RECLAMATION OF WELL SITE 

□ CONVERT WELL TYPE □ RECOMPLETE - DIFFERENT FORMATION 

12 DESCRIBE PROPOSED OR COMPLETED OPERATIONS. Clearly show all pertinent details including dates, depths, volumes, etc. 

REPERFORATE CURRENT FORMATION 

SIDETRACK TO REPAIR WELL 

TEMPORARILY ABANDON 

TUBING REPAIR 

VENT OR FLARE 

WATER DISPOSAL 

WATER SHUT-OFF 

OTHER 

This Sundry is to serve as notification of the formal name change of operator from EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. to Javelin 
Energy Partners Management LLC effective March 30, 2022. 

Previous Name: EP Energy E&P Company, L.P. 
601 Travis Street, Suite 1400 
Houston, Texas 77002 

New Name: Javelin Energy Partners Management LLC 
5521 North O'Connor BLVD, Suite 1100 
Irving, Texas 75039 

NAME (PLEASE PRINT) Mandie Crozier 

"""''"" �- cL;;, 
(This space for State use only) 

TITLE 

DATE 

(5/2000) (See Instructions on Reverse Side) 

Sr. Regulatory Specialist 

7/1/2022 

rachelmedina
Approved
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