
 

OmniView PRO3 USB & PS/2 KVM Switch  

 

Manage up to 256 servers from one console with the industry's leading KVM for 
small-to-medium size businesses.

The OmniView PRO3 USB & PS/2 KVM 
Switch provides easy and dependable server 
control with extraordinary performance. The 
Switch enables network administrators to 
monitor and control up to four, eight, or 16 
USB- and PS/2-platform servers from a 
single console. The PRO Series KVM 
Switches are the industry's most popular for 
small-to-medium server rooms, branch 
locations, and test and development labs. 
Designed to grow along with your server 
network, the Switch can be daisy -chained 
together using dedicated daisy chain ports 
with other OmniView PRO Series KVM or 
SMB KVM Switches to support up to 256 
servers.
 

Benefits

l Micro-Cabling Technology reduces cable 
bulk by 55% when compared to conventional 
KVM cabling 

l USB & PS/2 compatibility gives expanded 
connectivity in a mixed server environment 

l Dedicated Daisy-Chain ports let you 
expand your KVM configuration without 
sacrificing CPU ports 

l Saves setup time and simplifies viewing 
and switching between multiple servers with 
OSD 

l Provides continuous server monitoring with 
programmable AutoScan and hot keys 

l Ensures consistent compatibility with flash -
upgradeable firmware 

l Available in 4-, 8- and 16-port models  

l Comes with a Belkin 3-Year Warranty and 
free technical support 

Check out other Belkin products in this range:  
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Part Number Description UPC

F1DA108Zea OmniView PRO3 USB & PS/2 KVM Switch 123456789 
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