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Ms. Ann Cole S Ak
Office of Commission Clerk =L ¥ 7
Florida Public Service Commission z o -
2540 Shumard Oak Blvd. n (q,;
o L

Tallahassee, FL 32399-0850

Re: Docket No. 110200-WU - In re: Application for increase in water rates in
Franklin County by Water Management Services, Inc.
Our File No. 46023.01

Dear Ms. Cole

Water Management Services, Inc. (“WMSI” or “Utility”} submits the following in
response to Staff’s Sixth Data Request dated May 16, 2012:

Items 1-6 relate to an invoice from Radey, Thomas, Yon & Clark, to WMSI, dated
March 7, 2012, produced in response to OPC POD No. 40. That particular invoice indicates
that the total balance due was approximately $146,400 for services billed during the last rate
case, Docket No. 100104-WU.

1. Does WMSI dispute this amount or any part of it? If so, what portion does it
dispute and on what basis?

Response: No.

2. Has WMSI paid any portion of the approximately $146,400 figure? If so,
please provide proof of any payments.

Response: Yes, see attached documentation.

3. If WMSI has not made any payments to Radey, Thomas, Yon and Clark for
legal services rendered in Docket No. 100104-WU, what, if any, arrangements have been

made for payment?

Response: WMSI has made payments to Radey, Thomas, Yon and Clark for legal
services rendered in Docket No. 100104-WU. Also, WMSI has entered into an agreement
with Radey, Thomas, Yon and Clark to pay the bill in full with installment payments.
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Ms. Ann Cole

Office of Commission Clerk
Florida Public Service Commission
May 30, 2012
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4, Has Radey, Thomas, Yon & Clark taken any legal action to collect this debt? If
yes, describe the action taken, and WMSI’s response.

Response: No.
5. As of the date of this request, does Radey, Thomas, Yon & Clark have a lien or

judgment against WMSI or Gene Brown for legal services rendered during Docket No.
100104-WU? If so, please provide a copy of the lien or judgment.

Response: No.

6. How much has WMSI paid Radey, Thomas, Yon & Clark for legal scrvices
rendered in Docket No. 100104-WU?

Response: $24,000
7. As of the date of this request, please state the payments WMSI has made to the

following Consultants for services rendered to WMSI during Docket No. 100104-WU, and
provide supporting documentation and proof of payments.

Consultants Commission Approved
Amount
M&R Consuitants, Inc. - Frank Seidman
$65,428
Post, Buckley, Schuh, & Jerigen, Inc. ~ Scibelli
$2,879
Barbara Withers
$2.700
Total

$71.007

Response: See Attached. Post, Buckley and Barbara Withers have been paid in full
for their services in the prior case. Frank Seidman has been paid $45,274, some of which
was applied to preparation of annual reports. The balance of Frank Seidman’s bill is
being paid with periodic monthly payments.

SunpsTROM, FRiEDMAN & FuMERO, LLP
766 North Sun Drive, Suite 4030, Lake Mary, Florida 32746




Ms. Ann Cole

Office of Commission Clerk
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8. As of the date of this request, do any of the Consultants named in Question 7
have a lien or judgment against WMSI or Gene Brown for unpaid services related to fees for
Docket No. 100104-WU? If so, please provide a copy of the lien or judgment.

Response: No.

By Order No. PSC-11-0010-SC-WU, issued January 3, 2011, on pages 50 and 64, the
Commmission required WMSI to provide proof by April 4, 2011 (90 days from the date of the
Order), that the adjustments for all the applicable NARUC USOA primary accounts were
made. In its response to Staff's First Data Request, Item 17, issued December 12, 2011,
WMSI stated that it believed that all the adjustments made would be shown in the MFRs,
filed by the Utlity on November 7, 2011. After reviewing the Utlity’'s MFRs, staff has
concluded that the MFRs did not provide proof that the adjustments have been made. As of
the date of this request, no proof of Commission-ordered adjustments has been received by
staff. Please provide proof that the adjustments for all the applicable NARUC USOA primary
accounts have been made. In this response, please include all journal entries made to adjust
the Udlity’s general ledger for the Commission-ordered adjustments.

Response: WMSI is uncertain as to what additional adjustments need to be made, and
would like an opportunity to consult with a PSC staff member for clarification on this point,
WMSI is ready to meet at any time, and w.li make all of the required adjustments within 3
days after the meeting. If the PSC staff has a list of the additional adjustments that need to
be made, please send it to WMSI and the adjustiments will be made without the necessity of a
meeting.

Note: The artached invoices and cancelled checks should be a sufficient response to
itern one of Staff’s Fifth Data Request. If not, please let me know what else you
need.

It you or Staff have any questions, please fecl free to contact me.

Very truly yours,
I
Mé‘ d/‘//
=" MARTIN S. FRIEDMAN
For the Firm
MSF/der
Enclosures

SunpsTROM, FRIEDMAN & FUMERO, LLP
766 North Sun Drive, Suite 4030, Lake Mary, Florida 32746




WMSI RESPONSE TO STAFF
SIXTH DATA REQUEST

QUESTION NO. 2




Radey !

Date CheckNo. | Amount
1/12/20101 1525 $4,000
3/15/2010{ 5354 $2,000
4/12/2010] 5918 $2,000
5/13/20101 6028 ©  $2,000

6/7/20101 6103 | $2,000
7/30/2010/ 6270 | $2,000
8/24/2010] 6367 | $2,000
9/29/2010] 6467 $2,000
10/27/2010] 6568 $2,000 |
11/30/2010; 6660 $2,000
4/16/2012! 6797 $1,000
5/18/2012. 6879 $1,000

| |
Total: $24,000
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WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES, INC. _ AN
25€ JOHN KNOX ROAD #4 ) C ey 0tk o
TALLAMASSEE, FLORIDA 32303 81-275:829

DATE

‘May 18, 2012




RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
FROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS ATLAW
POST OFPFICEBQOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE FI, 32302
(850) 425-6654
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101245

Bill Number 1513%

Invoice Date February 4, 2010
Actrvity Billed throngh  01/31/2010

Gene D. Brown
‘Water Management Services, Inc. _
250 John: Knox Road )
Tallahassee, FL 32303

Petinon for Rate Increzse
38 01 ™D PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT
' FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

01/04/2010 LCS  Research of Florida Public Service 0.50 hrs. 130.00
Commission orders regarding emergency rate
rshef subject to refund, in preparation for
meeting with Mr. Brown -

01/05/2010  LCS  Meeting with Mr. Brown to discuss possible 1.70 hrs. 442 00
representation

01/05/2010 1D Initial consultation with Mr. Brown and Ms. 170 hrs. 516.00
Chase

01/08/2010 TD Review notes from January 5, 2008 mesting 0.30 hrs. 90.00
with Mr. Brown and Ms. Chase

01/12/201¢  TAE  Initial case management meeting with Mr. 0.80 hrs. 208.00
Brown and Ms. Chase

01/12/2010  LCS  Research regarding recent water cases and the 1.30 hrs. 338 05
chient's previous rate increase filings

01/13/2010  TAE  Strategy conference for clieat; telephone call 1.00 hrs. 260.00
with Ms. Chase regarding preparation of the ‘
apnual report filing

01/13/2010  TAE  Review 2007 and 2008 annual reports 1.20 hrs. 240.00

1.50 hrs. 390.00

01/13/2010  LCS  Confer for client regarding strategy moving
Torward with representation; review applicable
statutes and rules and Flonda Public Service
Commission docketed materials; research
regarding nesded minimum filing requirements
Review and analysis of statutes and rules 3.50 hrs.
regarding rate cases; conference for client

81G.00 -

b

01/14/2010 T

WHITE - CUSTOMER TRITOW - REMITT AN




Client/Matier :
Bill Number

01/14/2010

01/15/2010

01/15/2010
01/15/2010

RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(850} 425-6654
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101245

738 01
15138

regarding annual reports and MFR's

D Begin initial review of Class A Water Unlity
Fmanczal Rate and Engineering Minimum
Filing Requirements

TAE  Continue review of miles; review and analyze
minivmm filing requrements schedules

D Meeting with Mr. JR. Kelly

D Continue review of Class A Water Utility
Financial, Rate and Engineening Minimum

Page

1.00 hrs.

0.9C hrs.
2.00 hrs.

300.00

312.00

270.00
600.00

Filing Requirements

01/20/2010

01/20/2010
01/20/2010

01/20/2010

01/26/2010

01/27/2010

01/27/2010

01/28/2010

TTAE Strategy conference for clien t regarding -

delegation of duties in preparation for rate
filing

D Telephone call with Mz. Seidman to discuss

technical support for the case and past orders

Telephone call with Ms. Chase to discuss

Minimum Filing Requirements

TD Review docket file in Docket Nos.
940109-WU and 000694-WU and Order Nos.
PSC-00-2227-PAA-WU,
PSC-04-0791-AS-WU and
PSC-1156-PAA-WU; review Waier
Management Service's 2007 and 2008 Arnnual
Reports

1D Review preliminary estimate of earnings
deficiency

LCS  Email communications with Ms. Chase to
request documents to provide background for
filing of test year letter; review email
communicatons from Mr. Seidman; confer for
chent regarding scheduling of meeting in late
February 2010

D Telephone call with Mr. Brown to discuss
structure and information needs for a iest year
letter; email correspondence with Mr. Seidman
to discuss

D Email correspondence to discuss preliminary
scheduling

J

. Ci_SO h.rs‘.

.50 hrs.

020 hrs.

WHITE - CTIRTOMAER  VRIT AW - RRVATT ANCE

130.60

210.00
60.00

1,080.00

60.00

52.00

156.00

60.00



RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALY AHASSEE, FL 32302
(850) 425-6654
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101245

Clhient/Matter - 738 01
Bill Number 15138
01/29/2010 LCS Review commumnications from Mr. Seidman 020 hrs.
regarding preliminary interim rate increase
G1/2%/2010 D Review memo and attachments from Mr. 140 hrs.
rown daied January 29, 2010 regarding : rate
case, capital ymprovements and other issues

Total fees for this matter

Page 3

52.00

420.00

$7.274.00

BILLING SUMMARY :

7 TOTALFEES

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL
LESS PREPAID CASH APPLIED TO THIS INVOICE*

TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE

WHITE - CUSTOMER YHELLOW - REMTTTANCE

$7,274.00
$4.000.00 CR

$3,274.00

g
A



Gene D. Brown
Water Management Services, Inc.

250 John Knox Road

ﬂ

Petition for Rate Increass

738 01

Tallahassee, FL. 32303

D

RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(850) 425-6654
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101245

Bil Number 15259
Invoice Date March 5, 2010
Activity Billed through 02/28/2010

PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT

T T Ty

" FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERE

02/01/2010
02/12/2010
02/16/2010

02/16/2010

02/17/201C

02/18/2010

02/22/2010

LCS

LCS

LCS

- Review facts and policieés concerning

Begin review and analysis of Mr. Brown's
correspondence of 1/29/10 and attachments,
saummanzing curment circumstances and
proposed capital improvements

appropriate test year and pro forma
adjustments; review anticipated changes in

-oost of debt

Begin review of filings and Flonda Public
Service Commission orders from the last rate
case in 1994 and the subsequent request for
mcrease in 2000, 1n preparation for drafting
test year letter and petition; begin drafting test
year letter

Conduct research and report findings on
projected electnicity costs

Continue review of filings and Florida Public
Service Commission orders from the last rate
case in 1994 and the subsequent request for
increase in 2000, in preparation for drafiing
test year letter and petition

Review preliminary estimates of intenm and
permanent revenue requirernenis and pro
forma expenses; determine and provide
estimate of rate case expense

Review multiple correspondence between Mr.

WHITE - CGSTOMER YELLOW - REMTTTANCE

0.70 brs.

' 0.60 hrs.

N
Lh
<
5

040 hrs.

0.90 hIrs.

120 brs.

0.50 hrs.

182.00

180.00

650.00

120.00

234.00

360.00

130.00



RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10567
TALL ABASSEE, FL 32302

(850) 425-6654

Federal Tax ID # 75-3101243

Client/Matter : 738 (1
Bill Number 15259

Seidman and Mr. Brown related to minimum
filing requirements, refinancing and capital

1IMprovements

02/25/2010  LCS  Prepare for {1.0) and parhicipate in conference
call/meeting with Mr. Brown, Ms. Chase, M1,
Seidman, Mr. Gauck and Mr. Deason to
discuss draft minimum filing requirerents and
1ssues related to upcoming rate case filing (2.3)

02/25/2010 TD Preparaticn and participation in conference

call to assess preliminary status of case, review
anticipated-fimancial resultsdiscuss potential —

s d STl

correspondence with Mr. Seidman

Total fees for this matter
BILLING SUMMARY
| TOTAL FEES

WAL CIEARGIES FOR RS BT

PLUS NET BALANCE FORWARD

TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE

BALANCE FORWARD SUMMARY

<
&

L

Page 2

1,050.00

1ssues and plan for next steps; follow-up email

‘Bill Date Bill Number Billed Amount  Amount Due
02/04/2010 15138 $7.274.00 $3.274.00

WHEITE - CUSTOMER. YELLOW - REMITTANCE

$3,764.00

$3.764.00

$3,764.00
$3,274.00

$7,038.00

S




RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS ATLAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
{850) £425-6654
Federal Tax ID £ 75-3101243

Bill Number 15448

Iovoice Date  Aprl 6, 2010
Activity Billed through 03/31/2010

Gene D. Brown

Water Management Services, Inc.
250 John Knox Road

Tallahassee, FL. 32303

Petition for Rate Increase

738 01 D PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT

FOR PROFESSIONAT SERVICES RENDERED 777 7~

03/02/20 1 0 LCS Research Florida Administrative Code and 2.90 hrs. 754 00

past Florida Public Service Commission
dockets regarding whether interim rates and
revisions to service availabifity charges can be
included in a petition for general rate increase;
receive, review and respond to email from Mr.
Seidman related to service availability charges;
continue drafting test year letter, including
more detalled explanation in changes in
operations and history and impact of shallow
wells; revise tentative timeline; confer for
client regarding draft test year letter and
tmeline

03/63/2010  LCS  Confer for client regarding revisions to draf
test year letter; revise test vear letter
accordingly

03/03/2010  TD Review information requirements for service
availability charges; review draft test year
letter; telephone call with Ms. Chase

03/04/2010 SFC  Review test year Jetter and discuss potential
TEVISIONS

03/04/2010  LCS  Continue to revise draft test year letter; confer
for client regarding changes; email
communications with Mr. Brown and M.
Seidman regarding test year letter and tentative
timeline

0.90 hrs. 270.00

0.20 hrs 80.00

1.10 hrs. 286.00

WHITE - CUSTCMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE




Client/Matter :
Bill Number

03/04/2010

03/05/2010

03/08/2010

738
15448

TD

LCS

LCS

RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION -
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW
POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL. 32302
(850) 425-6654
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101245

01

Page

Telephone call with Ms. Chase; review revised 0.60 hrs.

test year letter and planning timeline

Receive and review communications related o 0.80 hrs.
draft test year letter; revise letter accordingly;
follow up commumications with Mr. Brown
and Mr. Seidman regarding revisions
0.50 hrs.

Review email cornmunications from Mr.
Seidman and Mr. Brown regarding revised test
year letter; finalize test year letter and arrange
delivery and filing of same

‘—_OBLOQ'/QOJQJ%S“_ggﬂm_{mwégfhﬁﬁefﬁﬁpﬁ_ﬁm@WIﬁd—_0*8'9—.&1:5 -

03/10/2010

03/12/2010

03/12/2C10

03/15/2010

03/18/2010

LGS

LCS

LCS

n direct testimony and witnesses to address
each topic and review testimony filed in
client's last rate case

Prepare list of topics to be covered in direct
testimony by Mr, Brown, Mr. Serdman, Mr.
Gauker and possibly others, including review
of testimony filed in last rate case and relevant
Florida Administrative Code as needed; confer
for client regarding same; research regarding
whether Public Service Commission can
change a previous used and nsefuil
determination

Finalize list of suggested topics and withesses
for direct testimony, to be discussed at 3/18/10
meeting; email information and summary of
research regarcing used and useful
determinafions to client

2.50 hrs.

<2
%]
ek}
B
%]

Review preliminary list of 1ssues and areas to 0.50 hrs.

cover 1n direct testimony
Review Water Management Services Annual
Report for changes impacting pending rate
case; telephone call with Ms. Chase

repare for conference call/meeting, including
preparation of agenda and proposed timeline
for direct testimony, petition and mimmum
Tiling requitements; email agenda and timeline
1o clients; participate in meeting/call with Mr.

WHITE - CUSTOMER. YELLOW - REMITTANCE

1.10 hrs.

2.80 hrs.

[

180.00

208.00

130.00

550 .00

78.00

150.00

330.00

728 .00



Client/Matter -
Bill Number

03/18/2010

05/19/2010

738
15448

LCS

RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK

PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS ATLAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(850) 425-6654
Federal Tax ID # 75-31012453

01

Brown, Ms. Chase, Mr. Setdman, Mr. Gauker
and Mr. Deason regarding status of actions,
umelines and 1ssues to be covered by direct
testirnony

Prepare for and attend meeting with Mx.
Browrn, Ms. Chase, Mr. Seidman, Mr. Gauker
and Ms. Scoles

Revise deadline dates and testirnony topics,
based on the 3/18/10 conference call/meeting;
email communications with Mr. Brown, Ms.

Chase Mr. Gauker and Mr_Seidman totecap

03/23/2010

03/26/2010

03/26/2010

LCS

LCS

DISBURSEMENTS

call/meeting and send updated dates and topics
to address in direct testimony

Research to provide Mr. Brown with samples
of direct testtmony from officials of regulated
utilities in other proceedings, 1o review in
preparation for drafting of his direct testimony
Review correspondence from Mr. Brown
related to minimum filing requirements and
send email comrnunications regarding
conference call scheduled for 04/15/10 to
discuss draft testimony

Review revenue trends and impact on rates

Total fees for this mafter

03/31/2010 TIntercall phone conference
03/31/2010 Photocopies
03/31/2010 Messenger Charges

Total disbursements for this matter

Page 3
2.50 hrs 750.00
0.50 hrs. 130,00
0.20 hrs 52.00
020 hrs. 52.00
0.50 hrs. 150.00
$5,264.00
ERY
12.00
10.00
3101.88

WHITE - CUSTOMER. YELLOW - REMITTANCE




RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW
POST OFFICE BOX 10967

TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(850) 423-6654
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101245

Client/Matter © 738 (1

Bill Number 15448
BILLING SUMMARY
TOTAL FEES
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL
PLUS NET BALANCE FORWARD

TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE

Page 4

$5.264.00
$101.88

$5,365.88
$5,038.00

$10,403.58

BALANCE FORWARD SUMMARY

Bill Date Bill Number Billed Amount Amount Due
02/04/2010 15138 $7.274 .00 $1,274 .06
03/05/2010 152359 $3,764.00 $3,764.00

WHITE - CUSTOMER. YEIILOW - REMITTANCE




RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS ATLAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAFASSEE, FL 32302
(850) 425-6654
Federal Tax ID £ 75-3101245

Bill Number 15584

Invoice Date May 7, 2010
Actvity Billed through  04/20/2010

Gene D. Brown
Water Management Services, Inc.

250 John Knox Road
#4
Tallahassee, F1. 32303

Petition for Rate Increase
738 01 ™D PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIFT

~  FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

04/05/201¢  LCS  Review relevant rules and statutes and begin
‘ drafting application for an increase in water
rates to be filed with the Florida Public Service
Commission
04/06/2010  LCS  Receive.and review test year approval letter
from the Florida Public Service Commission;
email correspondence to Mr, Brown, Ms.
Chase, Mr. Setdman and Mr. (Gauck to send
letter and highlight fling deadline of 5/25/1C; .
follow up email communications with Mr.
Seidman; phone communications with Florida
Public Service Commission staff regarding
directions specified in letter
Update timeline and due dates based on date
for filing of application and minimum filing
requirements, as specified in the Chairman's
approval letter; email communications with
Mr. Brown regarding direct testimony;
continue drafting application
04/08/2010  LCS  Conunue drafting application, consulting
relevant statutes and rules and other client
fitings as needed; email communications with
Mr. Brown, Ms. Chase, Mr. Seidman, Mr.
Deason and Mz. Gauker to send draft
application and revised timeline

04/05/2010 LCS Email communications with Mr. Seidman

040 hrs. 104.00

0.70 hrs. 182.0C
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1,482.00
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0.20 hrs. 52.00

WIITE - CUSTOMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE




Clhient/Matier :

Bill Number

04/09/2010
04/12/2010

04/13/2010

LCS

LCS

RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS ATLAW
POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(850) 425-6634
Federel Tax ID 4 75-3101245

01 Page

regarding timeline; revise imeline accordingty
and distribute

Review initial draft of application

Recerve and review email communications
with Mr. Seidman related to suggestions for
application and from Mr. Brown regarding
same

Mulaple email communications related to
expenses and draft testimony, including
providing examples of direct testimony to Mr.

0.50 hrs.
.30 hrs.

120 hrs

2

150.00
78.00

312.00

G‘aukaLas,aiemnlaie,rﬁmma__d malke

04/13/2010

04/14/2010

04/14/2010

04/14/2010

04/15/2010

04/15/2010

SEC

LCS

SFC

LCS

suggestions to ditect mstmony of Mr.
Seidman and Mr. Brown

Review Mr. Brown's initial draft of his direct
testimony and references to Minimum Filing
Requirement schedules; identify corrections
and suggest edits; prepare estimates of rate
case expense

Review draft testimony; make suggestions for
revisions and additions

Make agreed uno.n revisions to direct
testimony of Mr. Brown and Mr. Seidman;
confer for client regarding same; review Mr.
Seidman's suggestions for Mr. Brown's
testimony; confer for client regarding
call/meeting scheduled for 4/15/10

Review Mr. Seidman's initial draft of his direct 1.
testimony and references to MFR schedules;
identify corrections and suggest edits

Review Mr. Gauker's testimony and suggest
revisions and additions; conference with client
and witnesses to review testimony, application
and discuss further research and information
needed for case

Incorporate suggested changes into direct
testimony and application and circulate same;
draft agenda for conference call/meeting;
email communications relating 1o same;

1.40 hrs.

0.80 hrs.

)
o
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=
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<3
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2.50 hrs.

h
[
[wn]
=
e

WHITE - CUSTOMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE

42(.00

320.00

23400

W
[
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<

1,000.00

1,430.00




Chent/Matter :

Biil Number

04/15/2010

738
15584

RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK

PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(830) 425-6654
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101245

01

review draft testimony of Mr. Gauker; prepare
for and participate in call/meeting to discuss
draft application and direct testimony; receive
and review follow up email communications
Tom Ms. Chase and Mr. Brown

Review Mr. Gauker's initial draft of his direct
testimony; identify corrections and suggest .
edits; prepare for and attend meeting and
conference call with Mr. Brown, Ms. Chase,
Mr. Seidman, Mr. Gauker, Ms. Scoles and Ms.

Clark

Page

0.40 hrs.

040 hrs -

120.00

o400 T T

UA/16/20T0— LGS

04/16/2010

04/16/2010

04/19/2010

04/21/2010

i

04/23/2010

04/26/2010

LCS

LCS

Compose and send recap of call/meeting from
/15/10 and subsequent tasks and deadlines;
schedule call/meeting on 5/6/10; follow up
phone communications with Ms. Chase
Receive and review additional suggested
changes to direct testimony and application
from Mr. Seidman; follow up contact with
Commissiorn staff on relevant issues
Review notes and action items from 4/15/10
mesting/conference call; review schedules and
calculations supporting service availability
charges
Review additional suggestions regarding direct
testimony by Mr. Seidman; follow-up contact
with Commision staff
Begin review of draft Minimum Filing
Requirements, Volumes I IT and T
Research of Commission orders and ruies
related to acceptable reconnection fees and the
participaticn at agenda for interim rates; email
communications with Mr. Brown, Ms. Chase,
Mr. Seidrnan and Mr. Gauker summarizing
recent activities, outcome of research and
upcoming tasks to be-accomplished
Phone communications with Commission staif
regarding audits and adjustments from
Commission order establishing rate base;

WHITE - CUSTOMER

040 hrs

0.70 hrs.

YELLOW - REMITTANCE

10400

210.00

130.00

L2
Yo
S
[
<

234 .00

78.00



RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW
POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(850) 425-6654
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101245

Client/Matter : 738 01 Page 4
Biil Number 15584
email commumcations to Mr. Brown and Ms.
Chase regarding same
04/26/2010  TD Coptinue review of draft Minimum Filing 2.20 hrs. 660.00
Requirements, Volumes I, If and IT1
04/28/2010  TD Conclude review of draft Minimum Filing 1.10 hrs. 33600
Regquirements Volumes L T and IT
04/29/2010 LCS  Revise application based on 04/15/10 360 hrs. 936.00
conference call and subsequent input; prepare
notice for service availability charges; email
comrnunicattons with Mr. Brown, Ms. Chase,
Mr. Seidman and Mr. Gauker regarding e ——
7 revised applicaticn and upcoming deadlines
Total fees for this matter $9,542.060
DISBURSEMENTS
04/30/2010 Phone conference call on 3/18/10 5495
04/30/2010 Photocopies 450
04/30/2010 Facsimile Charges 2.00
Total disbursements for this matter 36145
BILLING SUMMARY
TOTAL FEES $9,542 .00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS 56145
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL $9,603 .45
PLUS NET BALANCE FORWARD $8,403.88
$18,007.33

TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE

BALANCE FORWARD SUMMARY
Bl Date Bill Number Billed Amount Amount Dus

WHITE - CUSTOMER. YELLOW - REMITTANCE




RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS ATLAW
POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TATLLAHASSEE, F1. 32302
(850) 425-6654
Federal Tax ID # 73-310]245

Clhent/Matter : 738 01 Page 3
Bill Number 15584

02/04/2010 15138 $7.274.00 $1,274.00

03/05/2010 15259 $3,764.00 $1,764.00

04/06/2010 15448 $5,365.88 $£5.365 .88

WHITE - CUSTOMER

YELLOW - REMITTANCE




RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(850) 425-6654
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101245

Bill Number 15822

Invoice Date June 7, 2010
Activity Billed through  05/31/2010

Gene D. Brown

‘Water Management Services, Inc.
250 John Knox Road

#4

Tallahassee, FL 32303

Petiion for Rate Increass

738 01 D PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT

~FORPROFESSIONAL SERVICESRENDERED

05/03/2010  LCS  Receive, review and respond to email 0.80 hrs. 208.00

communications with Mr. Seidman regarding
rate base; research to obtain the Florida Public
Service Commission's 2004 audit and
distribute same; begin preparations for
upconing conference call/meeting on revised
drafts; prepare public records request to obtain
copies of Staff's work papers from 2004 audit

05/04/2010 LCS  Email communications with Mr. Seidman and

Mr. Gauker regarding rate base and draft

testimony, to be discussed on the 5/6/10

conference call; confer for chent regarding

same

05/64/2010 1D Review final audit report in Docket No.
000654-WU; review revised draft Applicaticn
for Interitn and Permanent Increase in Rates
and Charges and Increased Service
Availability Charges

05/05/2010 LCS  Review email communications regarding draft
testimony; receive and review audit work
papers provided by Florida Public Service
Commission; prepare for conference call on
5/6/10; circulate andit work papers

05/05/2010 1D Review revised draft tesimony of Frank

' Seidman and prepare proposed edits; review

notes from previous review of draft Minimum

104.00

[
=Y
[ ]
=)
2

54000

—i
o e}
O
g
wm

060 hrs. 136.00

2.10 hrs. 630.00

WHITE - CUSTOMER. TYELLOW - REMITTANCE.




Chient/Matter -
Biil Number

05/06/2010

05/06/2010

05/06/2010

738
15822

RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS ATLAW
POST OFFICE BOX 10867
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(8501 425-6654
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101245

Page

Filing Requirements; telephone call with Mr.
Seidman to discuss same; telephone call with
Mr. Brown

Review petition and testimony

Prepare and circuiate agenda for call/mesting;
prepare anc participate in call/meeting to
discuss revised petition, testimony, work
papers and other related issues

Review audit work papers in Docket No.
000694-WU, prepare for and participate on

[ I e
N

Ng=
NaJREN
5
o0

420 hrs.

200.00
754.00

1,260.00

conference call wath- My Browa-Ms—C Ms—Chase,—————

(5/10/2010

05/11/2010

05/14/2010

05/17/2010

LCS

LCS

LCS

1C8

" M. Seidman and Ms. Scoles

Set up conference call/meeting for 5/15/10 and 020 hrs.

circulate information and related timelines to
Mr. Brown, Ms. Chase, Mr. Seidman and Mr.
Gauker

Recetve and review email communications
from Mr. Sexdman related to expenses

Revise petition based on input received and
discussion at 5/6/10 meeting/conference call;
emall communications to send revised petiton
and exhibit and 1o cuiline additional tasks
needed to be accomplished for upcoming
meeting/conference call, phone and email
communications with Mr. Seidman related to
information needed 2nd timeline for
compieting MFRs; phone and email
communications with Mr. Brown regarding
cost information needed; email
communications with Mr. Seidman and Mr.
Brown regarding petition exhibits

Email communicaticns with Mr. Brown and
Ms. Chase regarding petition exhibiis; review
and edit Mr. Brown's and Mr. Seidman's direct
testimony; note exhibits needed; prepare for
5/19/10 conference call/meeting, inchading
preparing agenda; email communicafions with
Mr. Brown, Ms. Chase, Mr. Seidman and Mr.

020 hrs.

1.50 hrs.

1.60 hrs.

WHITE - CUSTOMER, TELLOW - REMITTANCE

52.00

52.00

390.00



Client/Matter -
Bill Number

05/18/2010

05/19/2010

05/19/2010

05/20/2010

05/21/2010

05/24/2010

05/25/2010

/
/

.7

6/2010

)]
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738
15822
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RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS ATLAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(850) 425-6654
Federal Tax ID £ 753101245

01

Gaulker to circulate materials and agenda for
call/meeting

Receive and review emails from Mr Brown,
Ms. Chase and Mr. Seidman regarding
upcoming conference call/meeting and filing
Prepare for and participate in conference/call
meeting regarding upcoming filing; begin final
revisions on documents and arrange copyving of
same

Preparation and participation on conference
call with-Mr. Browe-Ms—Chase Mr—Seidman——

LCS

LCS

LCS

=
)
174)

LCS

and Ms. Scoles

Begin to finalize documenis and exhibits for
filing or 5/25/10; multiple email and/or phone
communications with Mr. Seidman, Mr.
Brown, Ms. Chase and Mr. Gauker regarding
same; meet with Mr. Brown regarding same

Continue to finalize documents and exhibits
for filing on 5/25/10; review and note ail
noticing requorernents and assoclated
timelines; email commumnications with Ms.
Chase regarding requirements and timelines
Finalize cover letter to Florida Public Service
Commission clerk and attachments; finalize
distibution of copies of petition and
supporting documents

Finalize filing at Florida Public Service
Commission; email communications with Mrt.
Brown, Ms. Chase, and Mr. Seidman regarding
same; email communications with Ms. Chase
regarding documents to make availzble at the
service area location

Review final Application for Interim and
Permanent Increase in Rates and Charges and
Increased Service Avatlability Charges,
Tesumony and Minimum Filing Requirements
Emairl commumications with Flomda Public
Service Commaission staff to follow up on the

WHITE - COSTOMER YEILOW - REMITTANCE

Page

020 hrs.

2.60 hrs.

160 hrs.

470 hrs.

72‘.20 hrs.

0.70 hrs.

G 80 brs.

1.4C hrs

(VM)

52.00

676.00

480.00

1,222.00

182.00

208.00

420.00



RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW
POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSER, FL 32302
(850) 425-6654
Federal Tax ID £ 75-3101245

Client/Matter : 738 01 Page 4
Bil Number 15822
notice of service availability charges i
$8.626.00

Total fees for this matter

DISBURSEMENTS
05/17/2010  Florida Public Service Commission public records request fee for audit

records
05/26/2010 Miscellaneous expenses related to binding documents te file in rate case
(95 documents bound), incurred 5/21/10-5/25/10

05/31/2010 _Conference call charges for calls-en-5/06/10-and-5/F9A0-with Mr-—Brown,

—— s Chase, MiT. Séidman, Vir. Deason and Ms. Scoles
05/31/2010 Photocopies
05/31/2010 Messenger Charges

Total disbursements for this matier
BILLING SUMMARY

TOTAL FEES
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL
PLUS NET BALANCE FORWARD

TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE

BAL ANCE FORWARD SUMMARY

Bill Date Bill Number Billed Amount - Amount Due
04/06/2010 15448 $5,365.88 $4. 403 88
05/07/2010 15584 " $9,603.45 $9.603 45

WEITE - CUSTOMER ~ YELLOW - REMITTANCE

=
L
o=
bp
b

1
i

2,323.25
20.06

$2,731.06

$8,626.00
$2.731.06

$11,357.06T
$14,007.33

$25,364.39



RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(850) 425-6654
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101245

Bill Number 15948

Invoice Date July 7, 2010
Activity Billed through 06/30/2010

Gene D. Brown

Water Management Services, Inc.
250 John Knox Road

#4

Tallahassee, FL 32303

i

Petition for Rate Increase
738 01 ™

PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT

—FORPROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED —

06/02/2010  LCS  Email communications with Fiorida Public
Service Commission staff to follow up on
approval of notice of propesed changes to
service availability charges

06/03/2010 LCS  Multiple phone and email communications 2.00 hrs.
with Florida Public Service Commission staff
and Ms. Chase regarding waiver of 60 day
deadline for interim rates and the proposed
notice for the service availability charges;
revise imeline with new dates, including
statutory deadlines; prepare letter to Public
Service Comumussion waiving 60 day deadline
for interim rates and electromically file same
with Commuission clerk; email communications
with Mz, Brown, Ms. Chase and Mr. Seidman
to provide update and circulate revised
timeline

06/63/2010  TD Review revised update of case timeline and 030 hrs.
staff's request for waiver of the 60 days for

, mtenm rates; conference on same

06/16/2010 LCS Review email communications from Mr. 0.20 hrs.
Brown related to audit requests from Florida
Public Service Commission staff

06/16/2010 1D Review Audit Document/Record Requests 0.90 hrs.
submitted by Public Service Commission staff
on June 14, 2010 and associated email

WHITE - CUSTOMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE

52.00

- 520,00

20.00

270.00



Client/Matter :
Bill Number

06/17/2010

06/17/2010

738
15548

1LCS

Ty
1)

RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
"PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
{850) 425-6654
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101245

01

correspondence with Mr Brown

Review multiple email communications from 050 hrs.
Mr. Brown regarding requests from Flonida

Public Service Commission staff and posing

questions related to procedure and process;

review relevant Florida Statutes; phone

communications with Commissior legal staff

regarding requests and process; email

communtcations to respond to Mr. Brown and

Mr. Seidman

Review status of filing due dates, overall case 0.70 hrs.

Page 2

130.00

scheduling and responses to audit requests;

06/18/2010

06/21/2010

06/22/2010

06/23/2010

LCS

LCS

LCS

LCS

telephone call with Mr. Kelly

Phone and email communications with Mr. 030 hrs.
Brown related to responses to Flonida Public

Service Commission staff's audit requests and

mtervention by the Office of Public Counsel;

confer for client regarding same

Phone communications with Florida Public 3 50 hrs.
Service Commission staff regarding the

previously-supplied map; email

communications with Mr. Brown regarding

same and regarding communications with

staff; multiple phone and email

communications with Flerida Public Service

Commission legal staff regarding map, rate

case Synopsis and upcoming noticing

requirements; begin drafting rate case

synopsis, consulting relevant rules as needed

Finish drafting rate case synopsis; email and/or 1.70 hrs.
phone communications with Mr. Seidman, Ms.

Chase, Mr. Brown and Mr. Deason regarding

same; finalize rate case synopsis and email to

Florida Public Service Commuission staff for

review and approval

Draft filing requesting confidential treatment 1.90 hrs
of documents provided to Florida Public

Service Comumission staff in response to audit

WHITE - CUSTOMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE

78.00

910.00

442 .00

454 00



Client/Matter :
Bili Number

738
15948

RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLABASSEE, FL 32302
(850) 425-6654
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101245

01

request; email communications with Mr.
Brown to request irnformation regarding same;
phone and email communications with
Commussion staff regarding revisions to rate
case synopsis and key dates; revise and edit
synopsis, adding key dates and making
necessary comections; emat! revised synopsis
to Commuission staff; email communications
with Mr. Brown, Ms. Chase and Mr. Seidman
regarding schedule; prepare and circulate
updated timeline based on the schedule

Page 3

io@gg/fzg;p_LQS_Ehme,and,emajLQommuniQaﬁonLMtbﬁlpﬁ_da 1.80 hrs.

06/24/2010

06/25/2010

06/25/2010

06/28/2010

D

L.CS

™

LCS

Public Service Commission staff regarding

rate case synopsis; finalize synopsis; draft

cover letter to send synopsis to Franklin

County Commissioners; phone and email

commumnications with Ms. Chase regarding

distrbution of synopsis; begin to draft initial

customer notice _

Review Rate Case Synopsis and schedule for 040 hrs.
case

Receive and review letter from the Flonda 3.90 hrs.
Public Service Commission establishing filing

date as 5/25/10; continue drafting customer

notice and email communications with client

regarding draft; conferences for client

regarding minimum filing requirements filed

with the clerk’s office; phone and/or email

communications with Mr. Brown, Ms. Chase

and Mr. Seidman regarding same,; phone

communications with the Florida Public

Service Commuission legal staff regarding same

Review and comopare MFR's with Petition, 220 hrs.
Testimony and the draft Customer Notice to

identify points for updating; review draft

Customer Notice

Prepare and finalize cover letter to Flonda 120 hrs.
Public Service Commission Clerk to

accompany updated pages of Volume I of the

WHITE - CUSTOMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE

120.00

1,014.00

660.00

(93]
—t
=2
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(wn]

46800 |



Client/Matter :
Biil Number

06/28/2010
06/29/2010

738
15948

RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(850) 425-6654
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101245

01

minimum filing requirements and arrange
delivery of same; email communications with
Mr. Brown and Ms. Chase regarding filing to
request confidentiality; draft affidavit for Mr.
Brown regarding compliance with noticing
requirements; confer with Mr. Brown
regarding revisions to customer notice; email
customer notice to Commisston legal staff for
approval

Telephone calls and emails with Ms. Merchant 0.40 hrs.

fulaple phone and emai} communications 1.5G hrs.

Page 4

12C.00
380.00

with thﬁ_O_ﬁﬁcegiRublichounsﬁlj—Staﬁ—Offme—xi

06/29/201C

06/30/2010

06/30/2010

06/30/2010

MMG

LCS

D

Florida Public Service Commission and the

utility related to the Office of Public Counsel's

concern with the schedule; receive discovery

requests from the Office of Public Counsel;

email communications regarding discovery

requests to utility

Review email from Mr. McGlothlin; review (.50 hrs.
proposed case schedule and concerns

expressed by Mr. Mc(Glothlin; discuss with

Ms. Scoles

Review documents received from Mr. Seidman 120 hrs.
with an assessment of their format and

responstveness to discovery received from the

Office of Public Counsel '

Email commumcations from Mr. Seidman 1.30 hrs.
related to interrogatories and request for

documents from the Office of Public Counsel;

review 1nitial interrogatory and production

responses from Mr. Seidman; multiple email

and phone communications with Florida

Public Service Commission staff and the

Office of Public Counsel regarding schedule,

meeting on 7/2/10 and audit responses; email

and phone communications with client to

discuss same; prepare for meeting on 7/1/10

with client and 7/2/10 with Commission staff

Prepare for mesting with Mr. Brown, Ms. 1.50 hrs.

WHITE - CUSTOMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE

150.00

180.00

338.00

45G.00



Chent/Matter . 738 01
Bill Number 15948

RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK

PROFESSIONATL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS ATLAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(850) 425-6654
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101245

Chase, Mr. Seidman and Ms. Scoles; initial
review of pending discovery requests from the
Office of Public Counsel

DISBURSEMENTS

05/06/2010 Intercall Conference call on 5/6/10
05/19/2010 Intercall conference call on 5/19/10

06/30/201¢  Photocopies

Total fees for this matier

Page 5

$7,450.00

5749
37.57
2500

—06/30/2010- viessenger Charges———

06/30/2016 Postage

BILLING SUMMARY

TOTAL FEES

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS

Total disbursements for this matter

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL
PLUS NET BALANCE FORWARD

TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE

BALANCE FORWARD SUMMARY

Bill Date Bill Number
04/06/2010 15448
05/07/2010 15584
06/07/2010 15822

Billed Amount Amount Due
$5,365.88 $4,403 88
35,603 .45 $9,603.45
$11.357.06 $11,357.08

WHITE - CUSTOMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE

oo = . ,,,7,1_6.:90___.______ .-

3.73

$7.450.00
$133.79

$32,948.18

)



RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(850) 425-6654
Federal Tax ID £ 75-3101245

Bill Number 16157

Invoice Date August 3, 2010
Activity Billed through 07/31/2010

Gene D. Brown

Water Management Services, Inc.
250 John Knox Road

#4

Tallahassee, FL 32303

Petition for Rate Increase

738 01 D - PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT

fn iy W

FORPROFESSIONAT SERVICES RENDERED L T T T
598 .00

07/01/2010  LCS  Prepare for and participate in meeting with Mr. 2.30 hrs.
Brown, Ms. Chase, Mr. Seidman and Mr.

Deason to discuss the proposed schedule

changes;-customer notiee,-discovery-and
- confidential information; follow email

commumnications with Mr. Seidman regarding
discovery responses; prepare for 7/2/10
meeting with Office of Public Counsel and
Public Service Commission staff, email
commmunications regarding customer noticing
requirements and proposed schedules from the
Office of Public Counsel

07/01/201¢  TD Attend meeting with Mr. Brown, Ms. Chase 230 hrs. 690.00
Mr. Seidman and Ms. Scoles concerning case
scheduling, customer notice, pending
discovery, and confidential information;
prepare for 7/2/10 meeting with the Office of
Public Counsel and Commission Staff

07/02/2010 LCS  Begn drafting responses to the Office of 2.70 hrs. 702.00
Public Counsel's interrogatories; prepare for
and participate in meeting with staff of the
Fionda Public Service Commission and the
Office of Public Counsel related to the
schedule in the case; confer for client
regarding meeting; phone communications
with Mr. Brown and Mr. Seidman regarding

WEITE - CUSTOMER. YELLOW - REMI’I'I‘ANCE

- i q 5 SEp— - A R LS -y e

S ~




Client/Matter :
Bill Number

07/02/2010

07/06/2010

738
16157

D

LCS

RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(850) 425-6654
Federal Tax ID # 73-3101245

01 Page 2

meetng
Research case schedules for File and Suspend
Rate Cases; attend meeting with Commission
staff and Office of Public Counsel; make
telephone calls to check personnel availability;
prepare and forward report on today's meeting
Review reguest to inspect utility facilities from
the Office of Public Counsel; email
communications with Mr, Brown and Ms.
Chase regarding same; confer for client
regarding same; phone communications with

2.70 hrs. 810.00

410 hrs. 1,066.00

the Office-of Publre-Counselregarding sante; o —

revise and finalize draft request for
confidential classification; email
communications with Mr. Brown and Ms.
Chase regarding same; continue reviewing and

R e

07/06/2010

07/07/2010

D

LCS

coordinating Tesponses 10 the Uifice of Fublic
Counsel's interrogatories; phone
communications with Mr. Brown regarding
same

Review Office of Public Counsel's Request to
Permit Entrty Upon Land and Property for
Inspection of System, discuss with Ms. Scoles
and Ms. Chase; review Request for
Confidential Classification and redacted
documents

Multiple ematl communications with Mr.
Brown and Ms. Chase regarding request for
confidentiality and discovery responses; email
communications with the Office of Public
Counsel regarding the inspection date; review
the Office of Public Counsel's request for
production of documents and begin prepanng
responses thereto; revise the request for
confidentiality per Mr. Brown's additional
information; finalize request and attachments
and arrange fling and service of same; draft
client's response to the Office of Public
Counsel's request to permit entry upon land

0.80 hrs. 240.00

430 hrs. 1,118.00

‘WHITE - CUSTOMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE

T

e e T R




Client/Matter : 738
Biil Number 16157

07/08/2010 LCS

RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(850) 425-6634
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101245

01 Page

and notice regarding same; file notice with the
Florida Public Service Commission; serve
response and notice to the Office of Public
Counsel and Commission staff

Email and phone communications with Ms. 0.70 hrs.
Chase regarding discovery responses to the
Office of Public Counsel; confer for client
regarding same; email communications with
Office of Public Counsel staff regarding
mspection date; email communications with
Florida Public Service Commission staff

fﬂf]”l""fi;ﬂﬂ Fadn o V=9 l’\f\"‘\ 11 1

[WB]

182.00

P RN P
lysmu..L.LLa LT« i Juran, L) § Ll A W 4 L

7/08/2010  TD

Review response to Office of Public Counsel's 1.00 hrs.
Regquest to Permit Entry and make plans to

attend the mspection; review pending

mterrogatories from the Office of Public

300.00

07/09/2010  LCS

07/12/2010  LCS

07/13/2010  LCS

st e e s A HE L AP ST

Counset

Phone and email communications with Ms. 0.40 hrs.
Chase regarding discovery responses,

scheduling and customer notice requirements;

phone communications with Fiorida Public

Service Commission staff regarding same

Review all documents received from client 2.90 hrs.
responstve to the Office of Public Counsel's

first request for production of documents;

multiple emall communications with client

regarding discovery responses, customer

notice and schedule; revise responses to

production requests accordingly; prepare

privilege log for privileged documents; phone

and email communications with Florida Public

Service Commussion staff regarding schedule;

revise initial customer notice, rate case

synopsis and timeline to include new dates;

emall initial customer notice and revised rate

case synopsis to Commission staff for approval

prior to distribution; draft cover letter to

Franklin County Commissioners

Multipie email communications with Florida 1.40 hrs.

WHITE - CUSTOMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE

104.00

754.00

364.00
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Chent/Matter ;
Bill Number

07/13/2010

RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(850} 425-6654
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101245

758 01 Page
16157

Public Service Commission staff regarding
customer notice and updated rate case
synopsts; multiple email communications with
the Office of Public Counsel regarding the
mspection date; finalize customer notice,
updated rate case synopsis and cover letter to
Franklin County Commissioners; multiple
ematl communications with Ms. Chase
regarding same; receive and review order
establishing procedure

Review Order Estabiishing Procedure

60.00

o o

I
0O

TR @
1S b
W O
B

b

.

Conferfor clientregarding-date-forthe- Office

07/14/2010

i
P!
7]

of Public Counsel's inspection of system and
discovery responses; multiple phone
communications with Ms. Chase regarding
discovery responses and documents; phone

& O

| U
| &

07/14/2010

07/15/2010

07/15/2010

conmmunrcations with Flonde Publc-Service
Commission staff regarding assignment ,
change and inspection date; phone and email
commuerications with the Office of Public
Counsel regarding inspection date; confer for
client regarding documents to be produced
TD Review documents to be produced in response 3.00 hrs.
to Citizens' First Request to Produce
Documents, Nos. 1, 2, 4-12, 17-20, 24, 26, 27,
30, 32, 34, 35, 37, 39-40, 44, 45 and 48
I.CS  Begin list of issues to discuss with client 6.60 hrs.
related to discovery responses; email
communications to schedule a conference
call/meeting regarding interim rates; outline
additional steps needed to finalize discovery
responses; multiple email and phone
communications related to discovery
responses; review and revise responses to the
Office of Public Counsel's interrogatories and
requests for production of documents
D Review draft responses to Citizens' First.Set of 3.60 hrs.
Interrogatories Nos. 1-64 and documents to be
produced 1n response to Citizens First Request

WHITE - CU. STOMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE

900.00

1,716.00

1,080.00

— - S TRt e -




Client/Matter :
Bi1ll Number

07/16/2010

07/17/2010

07/19/2010

738
16157

LCS

PLK

RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(850)) 4256634
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101245

01 Page

to Produce Documents, Nos. 28, 31, 36 and 47

Continue to review, edit and refine responses 5.70 hrs. i,
to the Office of Public Counsel's

interrogatories and requests for production;

phone communications with Mr. Brown, Ms.

Chase and Mr. Seidman regarding same

Muitiple phone and email communications 0.90 hrs.
with Mr. Brown regarding exhibits to

interrogatories; confer for client regarding

same

Prepare Notice of Service; telephone 0.90 hrs.

5

482.00

23400

conferencesand-ematls-with MsChase

07/26/2010

regarding discovery responses; office

PLX

conference with Mr. Brown and Ms. Chase;
conference regarding same; revise responses

Conference with Ms. Chase regarding

o]
(W]
o=}
=
w

07/21/2010

07/26/2010

07/27/2010

LCS

LCS

additions to documents to be produced;

telephone conference with Mr. Jaeger

regarding cancellation of site visit

Coordinate change in Office of Public 0530 hrs.
Counsel's site visit from 7/22/10 to 7/30/10

Review Florida Public Service Commission's 1.20 hrs.
recommendation regarding interim rates;

review email communications from Mr.

Seidman and Ms. Chase regarding same; draft,

finalize, serve and file amended response to

the Office of Public Counsel's request for

inspection and notice of same; confer for client

regarding production of documents and staff
recommendation

Continue to review the recommendation of the 1.80 hrs.
Flonda Public Service Commission staff and

concerns regarding same; conference for client

regarding same; legal research related to '

interim rates; phone communications with

Commission staff; prepare for 7/29/10

meeting/conference call, including preparation

of draft agenda for issues to be covered

WHITE - CUSTOMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE
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Client/Matter :

Bill Number

07/27/2010

07/28/2010

RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION,
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(830) 425-6654
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101245

738 01 Page
16157

D Review and analyze staff recommendations on 1.20 hrs.
interim rates; review emails from Mr. Brown
and Mr. Sexdman concerning same

LCS  Multiple phone communications with Florida 1.40 hrs.

onTAiT

Public Commission legal staff regarding
inspection, discovery responses and agenda
conference; ematl communications with client
regarding items for discussion at 7/29/10
meeting; confer for client regarding bates
labeling; email commumcations with the
Office of Public Counsel regarding mspecmon
prepare for 07/29/10 meeting

360.00

36400

07/25/2010

07/25/2010

SFC Rewew of and conference regarding interim 2700 hrs.
rates recommendation and preparation for
Agenda Conference

1CS  Prepare for and participate in meeting/cali with

L)
L)
j
g
(7]

80000

GO
L
_()0
o]
<

07/29/2010

07/29/2010

07/306/2010

M. Brown, Ms. Chase, Mt Seidman, Mr.
Deason and Ms. Clark; follow up
communications with the Office of Public
Counsel and Florida Public Service
Commission staff, confer regarding 7/30/10
ingpection

D Participation in meeting with Mr. Brown, Ms. 2.00 hrs.
Chase, Mr. Seidman Ms. Clark and Ms.
Scoles regarding interim rates recommendation
and Agenda Conference

D Preparation and participation at the Office of 5.00 hrs.
Public Counsel's inspection of Water
Management Services' plant and facilities on
St. George Island and wells in Franlkdin
County; meet with Mr. Brown and Water
Management Services’ staff following the
Inspection

LCS Email communications with the Office of
Public Counsel and Mr. Brown regarding
proposed deposition dates; email -
communications with Mr. Seidman regarding
rate of return figures; prepare and arrange

L)
—
O
B
n

WHITE - CUSTOMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE

600.00

500.00

—
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806.00
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RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(850) 425-6654
Federsl Tax ID # 75-3101245

Client/Matter - 738 01

Bill Number

16157

filing of correspondence to Fiorida Public
Service Commission clerk to provide
publication of service availability charges
notice; draft comments for agenda conference

if allowed to participate; prepare, review,
finalize and serve first request for production
of documents and fitst set of interrogatories to
the Office of Public Counsel; prepare notice of
service and file same with Commission;
review the Office of Public Counsel's second

request for production of documents and

Page 7

distribute same

Total fees for this matter

DISBURSEMENTS

$19.336.00

07/31/2010 Photocopies
07/31/2010 Messenger Charges

Total disbursements for this matter

BILLING SUMMARY

TGTAL FEES
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL
PLUS NET BALANCE FORWARD

TOTAL BAIANCE NOW DUE

BALANCE FORWARD SUMMARY

Biil Date

04/06/2010

Bill Number Billed Amount Amount Due
15448 $5,365.88 32 403 88

‘WHITE - CUSTOMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE

- A

e Rt

293.00
50.00

$343.00

$19,336.00

$343.00
$19,675.00
$30,948.18




Client/Matter :

Bill Number

05/07/2010
06/07/2010
07/07/2010

738 01
16157

15584
15822
15548

RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW
POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(850} 425-6654
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101245

$9.603.45 $9,603.45
$11,357.06 $11,357.06
$7,583.79 $7,583 79

Page

WHITE - CUSTOMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE




RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEF, FL 32302
(850) 425-6654
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101245

Bill Number 16266

Invoice Date September 17, 2010
Activity Billed through 08/31/2010

(Gene D. Brown
‘Water Management Services, Inc.
250 John Knox Road

+A
e o ]

Tallahassee, FL 32303

Petition for Rate Increase
738 01 D PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT

~ FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED -~ ——

08/01/2010 LCS  Email communications with the Office of 020 hrs. 52.00
Public Counsel providing clanification on
discovery request and regarding dates for Mr.

Brown's deposttron; entail COMIATMCatons
with Mr. Brown regarding deposition dates

08/02/2010 MMG Finalizing WMST's [st document production to 0.60 hrs. 90.00
Office of Public Counsel and Public Servic
Commission =

08/02/2010  LCS  Email communications with Mr. Brown and 2.60 hrs. 676.00

Ms: Chase related to an Office of Public
Counsel discovery request; confer for client
regarding 7/30/10 mspection; revise comments
and prepare for 8/3/10 agenda conference;
email communications with Mr. Brown and
Ms. Chase regarding depositions to be
addressed at deposition; phone
communications with Florida Public Service
Commission staff regarding interim rates item
on 8/3/10 agenda; email communications with
client regarding same
08/02/201¢  TD Brief Ms. Scoles on the Office of Public 1.00 hrs. 300.00

|- Counsel's inspection of Water Management
Service's plant and facilities; review comments
on staff's recommendation on interim rates;
review Office of Public Counsel's Second
Request to Produce Documents

WHITE - CUSTOMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE




Client/Matter :
Bill Number

08/03/2010

738
16266

LCS

RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK

PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS ATLAW
POST OFFICE BOX 10967

TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(850) 423-6634
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101243

01

Page

Phone communications with Flonida Public 1.60 hrs -

Service Commission staff regarding agenda
conference; email communications with Mr.
Brown and Ms. Chase regarding same; prepare
for and attend the agenda conference regarding
interim rates; receive and review notice of
deposition of Mr. Brown; multiple email
communications with Mr. Brown regarding
deposition; email communications with the
Office of Public Counse] staff regarding
confidential documents

2

416.00

68/64/2010——ECS—Confer forchent regardurg 873710 agenda 090 hrs.

23400

conference; review email communications
from the Office of Public Counsel regarding
confidential documents; prepare cover letter
for compact disc of documents provided to the

08/05/2010

1LCS

Office of Public Counsel with a copy to
Flonda Public Service Commission staft;
multiple phone communications with Office of
Public Counsel staff regarding confidential
wnformation; multiple phone and email
commmunications with Mr. Brown regarding
same

Prepare for and meet with Office of Public 2.40 hrs.

Counsel staff to review confidential document;

begin drafting responses to the Office of

- Public Counsel's second request for production

of documents; phone and email
communications with Mr. Seidman regarding
interregatory responses and Mr. Brown's
deposition; phone communications with Ms.
Chase regarding additional documents
requested by the Office of Public Counsel;
begin to prepare for deposition of Mr. Brown
on 8/10/10; email communications with Mr.
Brown and Ms. Chase regarding deposition
preparatior; phone and multiple email
communicanions with Flonda Public Service
Commuission staff regarding deposition of Mr.

WHEITE - CUSTOMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE

624.00
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RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW
POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(850} 425-6654
Federal Tax D # 75-3101245

(W8]

Client/Matter : 738 01 Page
Bill Number 16266

Brown and production documents

08/06/201¢  MMG Assessment and numbering of documents Q.50 hrs. 75.00
responsive to discovery requests
08/06/201¢ LCS  Multiple phone communications with Florida 240 hrs. 624.00

Public Service Commission staff regarding
documents produced; meet with Ms. Chase
and receive additional documents; confer for
client regarding bates labeling of documents;
recerve and review request for production from
Commission staff; begin responses to staff's
first request for production; email

communications wath Mr. Brown regarding I e
same; review responses to the Office of Public

Counsel's second request for production and

email communications with Ms. Chase

regarding docurents needed; prepare

supplemental response to the Office of Public
Counsel's first request for production related to
request number 23; prepare notice regarding
same; organize documents responsive to same;
finalize and arrange service of supplemental
response to the Office of Public Counsel and
staff

08/09/2010  LCS  Email communications with the Florida Public 1.60 hrs. 416.00
Service Commission staff regarding
supplementa] discovery response; review
comments from Mr. Seidman; email
commumnications with Commission staff
regarding Mr. Brown's deposition; receive,
review and organization. for production
documents related to the Office of Public
Counsel's second request for production;
confer for client regarding Mr. Brown's
deposition; prepare for Mr. Brown's
deposition; phone communications with Office
of Public Counsel staff regarding deposition

08/09/2010 - TD Review Staff's First Request for Production of 1.00 hrs. 300.00
Documents; review interrogatory responses to
assist Mr. Brown 1n deposition preparation

WHITE - CUSTOMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE

P T S O P




RADEY THOMAS YON & CLLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW
POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(850) 425-6654
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101245

Chent/Matter ; 738 01
Bill Number 16266

Page

08/10/2010  LCS  Prepare for and defend deposition of Mr. 10.30 hrs.

Brown by the Office of Public Counsel and the
Florida Public Service commission staff;
recerve and review notice regarding 1ssue
identificatton meeting

08/10/2010  TD Pre-deposition meeting with Mr. Brown, Ms. 7.50 hrs.

Chase and Ms. Scoles; attendance at the
deposition of Mz. Brown by the Office of
Public Counse] and Commission Staff

08/11/2010  MMG Assessment of production sets and creation. of 2.10 hrs.

production log with reference to documents

4

2.678.00

2,250.00

——Identrfication aod responsive parggraphs

08/ 1 1/20i0 LES Email communications with the Office of 1.90 hys.

Public Counsel regarding settlement
agreement; email communications with Mr.
Brown and Ms. Chase regarding late-filed

exhibits; research regarding Fionda Pubhic
Service Commission practice regarding capital
improvements; email communications with
chient regarding research; confer for client
regarding same; schedule meeting to discuss
intervenor testimony and issue identification

08/11/2010 TD Review Commuission orders referenced by 130 hrs.

Comrmssion Staff during the August 10, 2010

deposition of Mr. Brown. Research other
relevant orders and provide comments on same

08/12/2010  LCS  Confer for client regarding issue identification; 2.80 hrs.

preliminary review of staff audit report;
conference call with Mr. Brown and Ms. .
Chase related to audit report, outstanding
discovery responses and late-filed exhibits to
Mr. Brown's depesition; finalize notice and
responses to the Office of Public Counse!'s
second request for production; file notice with
Florida Public Service Commission and
arrange service of responses; receive and
review Commission order authorizing interim
rates and distmbute to clients

WHITE - CUSTOMER. ~ YELLOW - REMITTANCE

390.00

728.00
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Client/Matter :
Bill Number

08/12/201¢C

08/13/201C
08/16/2010

738
16266

TD

D
LCS

RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK

PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS ATLAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(830) 425-6654 '
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101245

C1

Conference call with Mr. Brown, Ms. Chase
and Ms. Scoles to discuss outstanding
discovery requests, late-filed deposition
exhibits and schecule for issue identification;

review Order suspending Rates and Approving

Tntenm Revenue Increase, Order No.
PSC-10-0513-PCO-WU, review Commission
Staff's Financial Audit Report and attached
schedules; review responses to the Office of
Public Counsel's Second Request for
Production of Documents

Page

290 hrs.

h

870.00

08/13/2010——LCS— Continue review-of orderop-interim-rates:

draft customer notice regarding interim rates
Review draft customer notice for interim rates

Multiple email and phone communications
with Mr, Brown and Ms. Chase regarding

08/18/2010

08/18/2010

LCS

MMG

LCS

documents to be provided to the Office of
Public Counsel and Florida Public Service
Commissior staff; multiple email
communications with Commission staff
regarding escrow agreement; receive staff's
discovery requests; recetve and respond to
inquiry from the Office of Public Counsel
regarding late-filed exhibits

Phone and email communications with Ms.
Chase regarding interim rates and documents
to produce; phone and email communications
with staff of the Florida Public Service
Commission regarding timing of notice and
implementation of interim rates and steff's
second request for production of documents;
email communications with the Office of
Public Counsel regarding documentation -
Assessment and numbering of documents
responsive to discovery requests

Email communications with the Office of
Public Counsel and the Florida Public Service
Commission staff regarding late-filed exhibits;
confer for client regarding same; multiple

o

<

<

=

020 hrs.

0.90 hrs.

WHITE - CUSTOMER. YELLOW - REMITTANCE
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Client/Matter :
Bill Number

08/18/2010

08/19/2010

738
16266

D

MMG

08/19/2010

LCS

RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK

PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(850) 425-6654
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101245

01

phone communications regarding same;
recerve and review discovery responses from
the Office of Public Counsel; recetve and
review late-filed exiibits; arrange for Bates
numberning of same; emall communications
with court reporter, Office of Public Counsel
and Cormmmuission staff to relay late-filed
exhibits

Review late-filed exhibits to Mr. Brown's
deposition

Assessment and numbering of documents

0.4G hrs.

020 hrs.

120.00

30.00

responsive-to-discovery requests

Fmail and phone communications with Ms.
Chase and Mr. Brown regarding documents to
be produced; email communications related to
items to be discussed at 8/25/10 meeting;

130 hrs.

338.00

08/19/2010

08/20/2010
08/23/2010

™D

LCS

revise responses 10 Florida Public Service
Commission staff's first request for production
of documents and review responsive
documents; ematl communications to send
responses to staff's first request to produce and
to file notice with Commission regarding
same; recerve and review staff’s second set of
interrogatosnies; email communications with
Commuission staff and the Office of Public
Counsel regarding the notice and tariff sheets
related to interim rates -
Rewview Staff's First Set of Interrogatories and
Staff's Second Reguest for Production of
Documents; Review documents produced in
response to Staff's First Request for Production
of Documents

Review Staff's Second Set of Interrogatories
Receive and review Florida Public Service
Commission staff's draft list of issues; multiple
email communications with Commission staff
regarding site visit of utility; email
communications with the Office of Public
Counsel regarding obtaining a copy of

[}
o0
<O
B
%]

0.20 hrs.
1.60 hrs.

WHITE - CUSTOMER ~ YELLOW - REMITTANCE

60.00
416.00




Client/Matter :

Bill Number

08/23/2010

738
16266

RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK

PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(850) 425-6654
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101245

01

testimony; review Commission staff's multiple
discovery requests; prepare agenda and
organize documents in preparation for 8/25/10
meeting with client and confer with client
regarding same; receive and review the Office
of Public Counsel's third request for
production and second set of interrogatories;
email cominunications regarding rescheduling
of 1ssue identification meeting; receive and
begin review of intervenor testimony

Review Tentative Issues List distributed by

Pagce

300.00

an-ﬁ‘-‘; TF-"(N PTXYF \TnT‘r S T nn-n Set @I

[=aHEo 0

Interrogatonies and Third Reguestfor

Production of Documents; review Office of
Public Counsel's Second Set of Interrogatories
d Third Request for Production of

08/24/2010

08/24/2010

08/25/2010

08/25/2010

LCS

LCS

Documents
Email communications with Florida Public
Service Commuission staff regarding notice and
security for interim rates; email
communications with Commission and Ofﬁce
of Public Counsel staff regarding site visit and
rescheduling of 1ssue identification meeting;
begin review testimony of Mr. Woodcock and
Ms. Ramas

Review the prefiled direct testimony and
attached exhibits of the Office of Public
Counsel witness Andrew Woodcock

Email and phone communications with client
related to rescheduling meeting to discuss
intervenor's testimony and issue identification;
confer for chient regarding same; emaii
communications regarding Florida Public
Service Commuission staff's site visit; receive
and review fourth interrogatories and request
for production from Commission staff
Review Staff's Fourth Reguest for Production
of Documents and Staff's Forth Set of
Interrogatories

0.90 hrs.

0.90 hrs.

C.80 hrs.

030 hrs.

WHITE - CUSTOMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE

T

234.00
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RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS ATLAW

POST OFFICE BCX 10967
TALLAMASSEE, FL 32302
(850) 425-6634
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101243

Client/Matter . 738 01 Page 8
Bill Number 16266

08/26/2010  LCS  Email communications with Mr. Seidman 1.60 hrs. 416.00
regarding 8/30/10 meeting; email
communications with the Office of Public
Counsel regarding possible deposition dates;
review draft discovery response; conticue
reviewing testimony of Mr. Woodcock and
Ms. Ramas; receive and review draft escrow
agresment; email commumcations with Florida
Public Service Commission staff regarding
same

08/27/2010 LCS  Travel to/from St. George Isiand; participate in 7.00 hrs. 1,820.00

site.visit of plant and facilities on-St-George

T Island and Eastpoint

08/27/2010 TD Review the prefiled direct testimony and 2.50 hrs. 750.00
attached exhibits of Office of Public Counsel
witness, DDonna Ramas; review Mr. Seidman’s

testimony in Dotket No. S40TOS- WU review
Order No. PSC-%4-1383-FOF-WU in Docket
No. 940109-WU

08/30/2010 LCS  Email communications with Florida Public 3.90 hrs. 1,014 .00
Service Commission staff regarding interim
tariff sheets; prepare for and participate in
meeting with Mr. Brown, Ms. Chase, Mr.
Seidman and Mr. Deason regarding to issue
identification and intervenor's testtmony

08/30/2010  TD Meeting with Mr. Brown, Ms, Chase, Mr.
Serdman and Ms. Scoles to discuss testimony
filed by the Office of Public Counsel, Staff's
Audit Report, interim rates, pending
interrogatories and production of documents,
Staff's site visit, issue 1dentification, and
possible rebuttal testmony

08/31/2010 LCS  Email and phone commum cations with Florida 2.30 hrs. 598.00
Puablic Service Commission staff regarding
mitial customer notice; email communicaiions
regarding pension plan expert; review
discovery responses related to vehicle travel
records; review Order No.

PSC-94-1383-FOE-WU related to vehicle

(UM
L
(@]
f

1,050.00

WHITE - CUSTOMER ~~ YELLOW - REMITTANCE
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RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALI AHASSEE, FL 32302
(850) 425-6654
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101245

Chent/Matter : 738 01 Page 9

Bill Number

16266

travel records; correspondence with the
Commuission staff and the Office of Public
Counsel regarding the utility's changes to the
1ssue list; email communications from Public
Counsel staff regarding same; ematl
communications to Mr. Brown, Ms. Chase and
Mr. Seidman related to issues to be covered in
rebuttal testimony; revise notice of interim
rates and email to Commission staff with
update on secunty; receive and review order
revising schedule and email communications
to clients regarding same; review Public

Counsel'sadditional 1ssues and review.orders .
referenced therein; confer for client regarding
1ssue identification meeting

08/31/2010 TD Review Order No. PSC-04-0791-AS-W1J and 0.70 hrs. 210.00
Order No, PSC-05-1156-PAA-WTJ

Total fees for this matter $20,748.00

DISBURSEMENTS
08/05/2010 Terry Deason, Ground Transportation - St. George Island for Site 79.00

' Inspection on 7/30/10
08/05/2010 Terry Deason; Meals - St. George Istand for Site Inspection on 7/30/10 14,53
08/30/2010  Accurate Stenotype Reporters, Inc.- Copy of Deposition transcript and 526.70
exhibits

08/31/2010 Photocopies 143 00
08/31/2010 Messenger Charges 3000
08/31/2010 Postage 13.64
Total disbursements for this matter $806.87

e e ATUAR ARl G 2 e o T TR A B AR A T
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Client/Matter : 738 01
Bill Number 16266
BILLING SUMMARY
TDTAL FEES
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS

RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW

POST OFFICE BOX. 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(850) 423-6654
Federal Tax 1D # 75-3101245

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL
PLUS NET BALANCE FORWARD

TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE

Page 10

$20,748.00
$806.87

$21,554.87 —
$48,627.18

$70,182.05

T T BALANCE FORWARD SUMMARY™ —

Bill Date Bill Number Billed Amount  Amount Due
04/06/201 15448 $5,365.88 3403 88
05/07/2010 15534 $9,603 45 $9,603.45
06/07/2010 15822 $11,357.06 $11,357.06
07/07/2010 15948 $7,583.79 $7,583.79
08/05/2010 161357 $19,679.00 $19,679.00

WHITE - CUSTOMER

YELLOW - REMITTANCE




RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW
POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(850) 425-6654
Federal TaxID # 75-3101245

Bill Number 16334
Invoice Date October 4, 2010
Activity Billed through 09/30/2010

Gene D. Brown

Water Management Services, Inc.
250 John Knox Road, #4
Tallzhassee, FL. 32303

Petrtion for Rate Increase
738 01 TD - PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT
FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

09/01/2010  LCS  Prepare for and attend issue identification 2.60 hrs. 676.00
meeting at the Florida Public Service

~Commuission inelnding conference call, emall T DR
communications with Mr. Seidman regarding
possible depositions; confer for client
regarding same
0%/¢1/2010  TD Attendance and participation at issue 1.50 hrs. 450.00
identification conference at the Public Service
Commission
09/01/2010 TD Pre-issue identification conference call with 0.50 hrs. 150,00
Mr. Brown, Ms. Chase Mr. Seidman and Ms.
Scoles
09/02/2010  LCS =~ Email communications with possible pension 0.90 hrs. 234,00
expert; email communications regarding
scheduling of conference call to discuss
Florida Public Service Commission staff
testimony and other 1ssues; begin review of
transcript of Mr. Brown's deposition, draft
customer notice of service hearings and
request approval from Commission staff
09/03/2010  LCS  Review multiple email communications from 2.10 hrs. 54600
Florida Public Service Commission staff :
regarding the notice of customer service
beanngs and possible depositions; prepare
responses to staff and the Office of Public
Counsel's multiple sets of interrogatones and

WHITE - CUSTOMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE
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requests for production; email communications
with Ms. Chase regarding same; email
communications with Commission staif
regarding availability of staff testimony;
recerve and review staff's fifth set of discovery
requests to the utility and first requests to the
Office of Public Coungel; receive and review
the corrected testimony of Witness Woodcock
09/07/2010  LCS  Review testimony filed by Ms. Chejette, Ms. 530 hrs. 1,378.00
Dobiac and Mr. McKeown; draft
mterrogatories and request for production of
documents for the Office of Public Counse;
finalize and serve same; file notice of service
with the Florida Public Service Commission,;

e e - begin-to-draft questions-for cress-examimnation——
of witnesses; review correspondence related to
rebuttal testimony; email communications with
Ms, Chase regarding discovery responses;
begin to review draft rebuttal testimony of Mr.
Seidman; review and organize documents to be
produced in response to Staff's request for
production; review and organize documents to
be provided as exhibits to interrogatory
responses to Staff; finalize responses to
interrogatories and request for production;
arrange service of same; finalize and file
notice of service of responses with
Commission clerk

09/07/2010 TD Review prefiled direct testimony and exhibits 340 hrs. 1,020.00
of staff witnesses Chelette, Dobiac, and
McKeown: review initial draft of rebuttal
testimony of Mr. Seidman and prepare edits;
review staff's fifth set of interrogatones to
Water Management Services and staff's first
set of interrogatories to the Office of Public
Counsel
09/68/2010  LCS  Prepare for and attend meeting/conference call 7.10 hrs, 1,846.00
with Mr. Brown, Ms. Chase, Mr. Seidman and
Mr. Deason regarding staff's testimony,

WHITE - CUSTOMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE
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01

rebuttal testimony, inferim rates, discovery
responses and other issues related to the case;
prepare responses to staff's second set of
interrogatories; prepare notice for same; confer
for client regarding electronic versions of
documents produced on 9/7/10; obtain same
and prepare cover letter for same; email
communications with the Office of Public
Counsel and staff regarding wording of issue;
prepare correspondence to staff regarding
escrow agreement, tariff sheets for interim
rates and notice regarding same; draft template
of rebuttal testimony for Mr. Schiabelli; email
communications with Mr. Sayler regarding

Page

09/08/2010

09/09/2010

09/09/2010

- d1sCOVery responses; serve jntetrogatory——  —————

D

LCS

D

responses and file notice; begin drafting
templating of rebuttal testimony for Ms.
Withers

Meeting with Mr. Brown, Ms. Chase, Mr.
Seidman and Ms. Scoles to discuss escrow
agreement, notice requirements, effective date
of intenim rates, discovery responses and
pending discovery, issue wording, staff
testimony, rebuttal positions and witnesses,
and potential areas for settlement.

Finish drafting template of rebuttal testimony
for Ms. Withers; email communications with
Ms. Withers regarding same; finalize
responses to staff's discovery requests for
service and filing today; draft notice of
service; review email communications from
Office of Public Counsel and correspond with
Ms. Chase regarding same; confer for client -
regarding topics to cover on cross-examination
of Office of Public Counsel witnesses; file
notice of service of discovery responses

o
00
&
=
3
[£a]

_LJJ
—s
[
=)
w

Prepare analyses and draft subject areas and 3.90 hrs.

poesitions fo pursue in cross examination of
Office of Public Counsel witness Ramas;

WHITE - CUGSTOMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE

1,170.00
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confer for client regarding same, review
responses to Staff's Third Set of Interrogatories
and Third Reguest for Production of
& Documents

09/13/2010  LCS  Draft responses to the Office of Public 2.70 hrs. 702.00
Counsel's discovery requests; email
communmnications with client regarding
responses; phone and emai! communications
with Florida Public Service Commuission staff
regarding issues; email communications with
the Office of Public Counsel regarding same;
meet with Office of Public Counsel staff in
their offices; multiple phone and email
communications with client related to

disecovery responses;-email-to Commissiop—-~

staff regarding implementation of interim

rates; finalize and serve response to the Office

of Public Counsel's third request for

production of documents; serve and file notice

of service; phone communications with Office

of Public Counsel regarding discovery

responses

09/13/2010  TD Preparation for and participation in meeeting 1.60 hrs. 480.00
with Mr. McGlothiin and Ms. Merchant of the
Office of Public Counsel

09/14/2010 LCS  Multiple email and phone communications

with client related to discovery responses,

rebuttal testimony, notices and audit response;,

email and phone communications with Florida

Public Service Commission staff regarding

interim rates, notices and audit response;

finalize responses 1o interrogatories from the

Office of Public Counsel; serve responses to

the Office of Public Counsel's interrogatories;

file notice of service with Commission

regarding interrogatory responses; finalize

documents responsive to the Office of Public

Counsel's requests for production and arrange

service of same; finalize responses to staff's

L8]
LD
o)
3
4
(7]
@]
th
)
L
<
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mterrogatories and requests for production;
finalize documents responsive to same; serve
responses; fle notice of service with
Commission regarding same; finalize notice
for interim rates and for customer service and
technical hearings and communications with
client regarding same; arrange meeting/call to
discuss rebuttal testimony and other related
issues; email communications with client
related to rebuttal testimony of expert f
witnesses; review testimony of engineering
experi

Review draft rebuttal testimony of Ms. 4.70 hrs. 1,222.00
Withers and Mz. Seidman; prepare for 9/16/10

09/15/2010

09/16/2010

- meeting regarding-same;emait and-phone- -+ - o

D

LCS

communications with Ms. Withers, Mr.
Seidman, Mr. Brown and Ms. Chase regarding
same; phone communications with Florida
Pubiic Service Commigsion staff regarding
same; multiple email communications with the
Office of Public Counsel and the Commission
staff regarding issues; begin drafting
prehearing statement; review and revise
rebuttal testimony of multiple witnesses; email
communications with witnesses regarding
same

Review draft rebuttal testimony of Mr. Scibelli 2.10 hrs. 630.00
and revised draft rebuttal testimony of Mr.
Seidman; make proposed edits; review updated
List of issues and draft posmons -
Prepare for and participate in conference call 6.90 hrs. 1,794 .40
with Mr. Deason and Mr. Seidman to review
and discuss rebuttal testimony and
1ssues/positions; review, edit, revise and
finalize testimony and exhibits for Mr. Scibelli
and Mr. Seidman; rrultiple email and phone
communications with Ms. Withers regarding
testimony; continue drafting prehearing
statement

WHITE - CUSTOMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE
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Preparation and participation on conference 2.30 hrs.
call with Mr. Seidman and Ms. Scoles to

discuss draft rebuttal testimony for witnesses

Scibelli, Seidman and Withers and to discuss

1ssues and positions for wnclusion in Prehearing

Statement

Continue to review, edit and finalize rebuttal 8.60 hrs.
testimony and exhibits; multiple

communications with Mr. Seidman, Mr.

Brown and Ms. Chase regarding same; email
communications with Flonda Public

Commuission staff regarding audit work papers

and others matters related to the case; work on

prehearing statement :

690.00

2,236.00

- 09/17/2010

(9/19/2010
05/20/2010

TD

LCS
LCS

- Review-preliminary positions-on Staff Andit——- 2

th
P
g

Findings; discuss with Mr. Brown, Ms. Scoles
and Mr. Seidman; review draft of Mr. Brown's
rebuttal testimony and attached exhibits; make
edits and discuss same on conference call with
Mr. Brown, Ms. Chase and Ms. Scoles;
finalize edits; assist with finalization of all
rebuttal testimony for filing

Continue drafiing pre-hearing statement 0.70 hrs.
Continue drafting prehearing statement; 6.90 hrs.
arrange delivery of final version of testimony
to Mr. Seidman, Mr. Scibelli and Ms. Withers;
prepare for and participate in conference
call/meeting regarding testimony, discovery,
audit response, depositions and other related
matters; draft cross-notice of deposition of Ms.
Dobiac; phone and email communications with
Florida Public Service Commission staff and
the Office of Public Counsel related to -
cancellation of deposition of Ms. Dobiac;
finalize prehearing statement and arrange
filing and service of same; draft and finalize
supplemental documentation related to reguest
for confidential classification; arrange service
and filing of same; phone and email

WHITE - CUSTOMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE

182.00
1,794.00
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communications with client related to
discovery responses and deposition
D Review Order Nos. PSC-04-0791-AS-WU and 1.00 hrs.
PSC-05-1156-PAA-WU in Docket No. '
000694-WU concerning setflement with Office
of Public Counsel and fire flow upgrades;
review prehearing statement
LCS  Email and phone communications with Mr.

- Brown and Mr. Seidman regarding possible
objection; email communications with
Commission staff and the Office of Public
Counsel regarding deposition of Ms. Dobiac
and order of witnesses; begin drafting
responses o staff's fifth set of interrogatones;

S
U8}
<O
3

300.00

598.00

09/21/2010

09/22/2010

09/22/2010

09/23/2010

multiple email commmunicationswith the——  — ———
Office of Public Counsel to respond to
previous questions; confer for chient regarding
mterrogatory responses and prehearing
statements; phone and email communications
with Commission staff regarding same; file
cross-notice of deposition of Ms. Dobiac

D Review prehearing statements filed by Staff 1.40 hrs.
and the Office of Public Counsel;comments
and confer for client regarding same; discuss
potential objection to Interrogatory No. 86 in
Staff's Fifth Set of Intervogatories; review
Account 414 Sale of Assets

LCS  Email communications with Florida Public 0.30 hrs.
Service Commussion staff regarding discovery
responses; email communications with client
regarding revisions to staff audit report

D Review revised testimony of staff witness 0 8C hrs.
Debra Dobiac; review Ms. Dobiac's audit work
papers

LCS  Phone and email communications with Florida 1 80 hrs.
Public Service Commission staff regarding
possible stipulations and discovery responses;
draft a response to an Interrogatory; review,

WHITE - CUSTOMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE

420.00

78.00

240.00
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edit and finalize interrogatory responses and

exhibits; prepare notice of service of

mterrogatory responses; serve interrogatory

responses on staff and the Office of Public

Counsel; email communications with staff and

the Office of Public counsel regarding

responses

Review responses to Staff's Fifth Set of 1.00 hrs.
Interrogatories

Prepare for and participate in deposition of Ms. 2.80 hrs. .

Dobiac, Florida Public Service Commission
staff at Commaission offices; meet with Ms.

‘Withers and Mr. Brown regarding additional
information requested; meet with Mr_Brown

300.00

728.00

09/24/2010

09/27/2010

--40 discuss-possible-stipuiations-and-otherissges ——

D

LCS

to be discussed at pre-hearing conference;

phone and email communications with Mr.

Brown related to discovery responses and

additional documentation requested; email

communications with witnesses regarding .

hearing and sutomary of testimony

Review draft Prehearing Order and possible 0.50 hrs.
stipulations

Email and phone communications with the 5.30 hrs.
Office of Public Counsel and the Florida

Public Service Commission staff related to

issues related to the pre-hearing conference

and upcoming hearing; phone and email

communications with Mr, Brown and Mr.

Seidman regarding possible stipulations;

prepare for and attend the prehearing

~ conference at the Commission; meet with the

staff of teh Office of Public Counsel regarding
fire flow documents; meet with Mr. Brown,
Ms. Chase and Mr. Deason regarding
outstanding issues related to hearing; follow up
email and phone communications with
Commission staff and the Office of Public
Counsel; review staff's comprehensive exhibit

WHITE - CUSTOMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE

150.G60

1,378.00
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list; draft responses to new Issue 50; review
motion to strike and begin research for use in
response 1o same
D Preparation and partictpation at Prehearing 2.90 hrs. 870.00
Conference; meeting with Mr. McGlothlin and
Ms. Merchant following the Prehearing
Conference meeting with Mr. Brown, Ms.
Chase and Ms. Scoles to discuss
Post-Prehearing Conference matters
LCS  Begm review of the Office of Public Counsel's 7.60 hrs. 1,976 .00
discovery responses; email communications
with Mr. Brown, Ms. Chase and Mr. Seidman
regarding possible stipulated exhibits; research

and draft response to motion to strike; receive

09/28/2010

09/29/2010

and teview documents from client: email - —

communications with Mr. Seidman related to

cross-examination; email communications

with Fiorida Public Service Commission. staff

and the Office of Public Counsel related to

possibie stipulations and letter from the

Northwest Floridda Water Management

District; draft response to staff's fifth request

for production of documents; finalize and

electronically serve same; draft notice of -

service and file same

TD Review Public Counsel's responses to Staff's
First Set of Interrogatories for possibie
stipulation; review Public Counsel's Motion to
Strike Testimony; review Staff's
Comprehensive Exhibit List and revised
positions on Issues 50a and 50b ‘

LCS Confer for client regarding revisions to 6.80 hrs. 1,768.00

response to the Office of Public Counsel

motion to strike; revise accordingty; multiple

phone and email communications with Mr.

Brown, Mr. Saidman and/or Ms. Chase

regarding positions on Issue 50 and the draft

response; phone communications with. the

Florida Public Service Commuission staff

39000

=t
(V)
L]
=
i
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(850) 425-6654
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101245

regarding pre-hearing matters; begin research
related to the Commission' s authority as to
affiliated companies; finalize, file and serve
response to the Office of Public Counsel
motion to strike; finalize and send to staff
utility's positions on new issues; draft opening
statement; provided updated positions to Issues
11 and 12 )

‘Review draft Response to Public Counsel's

Motion to Sirike Rebuttal Testimony; research
findings i Order No. PSC-00-227-PAA-WU;
prepare edits to Response and discuss with Mr.
Brown and Ms. Chase; review final position
statements; read and analyze Public Counsel's

4. 60 hrs.

Page 10

1,470.00

09/30/201¢  LCS

_.responses and accompanying documents

provided in response to WMSI's Second Set of
Interrogatories and Second Request for
Production of Documents; prepare notes and
findings on same for use during cross
examination of Public Counsel witness Mr.
Andrew Woodcock

Review excerpts from Mr. Woodcock's reports
produced by the Office of Public Counsel for
possible cross examination; email and phone
communications with the Office of Public
Counsel and the Florida Public Service

. Commission regarding stipulated witnesses

09/30/2010 TD

DISBURSEMENTS

and exhibits; receive and review pre-hearing
statement

Identify areas of cross examination of Public
Counsel witnesses; prepare points to be made
and strategy for their pursuit, confer for client
regarding same; prepare possible cross
examination guestions for Mr. Brown to be
used during hearing preparation session

Total fees for this matter

1.60 hrs.

3.40 hrs.

WHITE - CUSTOMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE

416.00

1,020.00

332,964 .60
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09/30/2010  Photocopies 3,366.25
09/30/2010  Messenger Charges 70.00
3571

09/30/201C  Postage

Total disbursements for this matter §3,471 .96

BILLING SUMMARY
TOTAL FEES $32,964.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $3,471.96
CREDIT FOR AMOUNTS PREVIOUSLY $2,960.00 CR

BILLED IN ERROR (SEE ATTACHED)
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL

$33,475 .96 —

PLUS NET BALANCE FEORWARD. - - - - 56818205

TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE $101,658.01

BALANCE FORWARD SUMMARY

Bill Date Bill Number Billed Amount Amount Due
05/07/2010 15584 $9,603.45 $8,007.33
06/07/2616 15822 $11,357.05 $11,357.06
07/07/2010 15948 $7,583.79 $7,583 79
08/05/2010 16157 $19,679.00 $15,679.00
09/17/2010 16266 $21.554.87 $21,554.87

WHITE - CUSTOMER

YELLOW - REMITTANCE



CREDIT FOR AMOUNTS PREVIOUSLY BILLED IN ERROR:

Description Total
Fees billed for Attorney Toni A. Egan (TAE) in Jenuary 2010: $2.060.00
Fees billed for Paralegal Michelle Gerrell (MMG) in June 2010: 180.00
Fees billed for Paralegal Michelle Gerrell (MMG) in August 2010: 540.00
Fees billed for Paralegal Pam Keitlor (PLK) in July 2010 180.00
$2,960.00

TOTAL CREDIT




RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS ATLAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
{830) 425-6654
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101245

Bill Namber 16937

Invoice Date January 7, 2011
Activity Billed through 12/31/2010

(Gene D. Brown

Water Management Services, Inc.
250 John Knox Road

#a

Tallahassee, FL 32303

Petition for Rate Increase

73 01 TD PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

noL

210/01/2010 - SFC..... Review .tesﬁmbnmd 'cip_aie,in_vvﬁmess_;,,, 600 hrs. 240000 ___

preparation and practice testirnony
presentation and cross examination;
conference on additional preparation for
Florida Public Service Commiission hearing

10/01/2010  LCS  Hearing and witness preparation; phone and &.10 hrs. 2,106.00
email communications with the Office of
Public Counsel and the Florida Public Service
Comrnission staff regarding documents, rate
case expense and other pre-hearing matters;
review documents to brng to hearing; begin
preparing exhibits for hearing

10/01/2010 1D Hearing and witness preparation 5.00 hrs. 1,500.00

10/02/2010  LCS  Prepare for hearing, including selecting 4.30 hrs. 1,118.00
exhibits and drafting cross-examination
questions; email communications with utility
witnesses regarding exhibits and summaries of
testimony

10/04/2010 LCS  Finish cross-examination for Mr. Woodcock
and Ms. Ramas; meet with Mr. Seidman
regarding hearing and exhibit; email
comrnunications with the staff of the Florida
Public Service Commission and the Office of
Public Counsel regarding stipulations; phone
communications with Ms. Chase regarding
map of fire flow improvements; review the

-3
L3
[
=5
2

1,898.00

WHITE - CUSTOMER "ELLOW - REMITTANCE
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01 Page

sumrnary of Ms. Wither's rebuttal testimony;
email commmumnications with Ms, Withers -
regarding same; prepare file supplemental
responses to the utility's discovery responses to
the Office of Public Counsel related to fire
flow improvements; meet with Commission
and Office of Public Counsel staff regarding
same; phone commumnications with Mr. Scibelli
and Ms. Withers regarding therr testimony;
finalize new exhibit for Mr. Seidman's
testimony

Review deposition transcript of Ms. Dobiac; 2.00 hrs.

review-Order Denying OPC's MotrontoStrike

10/05/2010

10/05/2010

10/05/2010
10/06/2010
10/06/2010
104772010

10/07/2010

10/08/2010

SFC

LCS

Portions of WMSI's Rebuttal Testimony,

review and revise cross examination questions

for Mr. Woodcock and Ms. Ramas; review

draft of testimony summaries for Mr. Scibells,

Mr. Withers and Mr. Brown

Attend rate case hearing; note issues to address 4.00 hrs.
in redirect or cross examination; note 1ssues to

be clarified; note items identified in customer

testimony; make notes on items to be

addressed in briefing or subsequent filings

Travel to St. George Island; prepare for and 13.10 hrs.
participate In two customer hearings and

technical hearing; review and revise

cross-examination questions of Mr. Woodcock

- and Ms. Ramas

D
LCS
D
LCS

D

LCS

Attend at technical hearing 8.00 hrs.
Prepare for and participate in technical hearing 10.00 hrs.
Attend technical hearing 8.00 hrs.
Reorganize documents and notes from hearing; 1.80 hrs.
begin drafting pre-hearing brief; phone and

email communications with utility offices

related to information requested

Post hearing organization of notes, testimony 1.00 hrs.
and exhibits _
Contirue drafting mitial outline of prehearing 0.30 hrs.

WHITE - CUSTOMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE

1,600.00

3,406.00

2,400.00°
2,600.00
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brief, email communications with Mr.

Seidman regarding same

Email communications with Mr. Seidman 0.20 hrs. 52.00
regarding pre-hearing brief

Research related to issues in post-hearing 5.50 hrs. 1,430.00
draft; review and organize exhibits from . '
hearing; continue drafiing post-hearing draft

Email communications with Ms. Chass 410 hrs. 1,066.00
regarding late-filed exhibits; review transcript

of customer service hearings and technical

hearing; continue to draft post-hearing brief;

confer for client regarding same

T 10/19/2030

10/19/2010
10/20/201G

10/20/2010

10/21/2010
16/21/2010

10/22/2010

10/22/2010

LCS.

TD

LCS

D

ICS

LCS

(ontinue researching and drafting pest-hearing.. 1010 hrs— ....2,626.00_ ..

bnef

Review memo and attached exhibits frorm Mr. 0.80 hrs. 240.00
Brown concerning areas of cross examination

to be addressed 1n brief

Continue drafting post-hearing brief; prepare 7.90 hrs. 2,054.00
and file late-filed exhibits with the Flonida

Public Service Commission and serve. .

Review transcript of technical hearing; identify 3.90 hrs. 1,170.00
franscript citations for brief by issue number

contained in Prehearing Order; review selected

exhibits for citation in brief, review late-fiied

hearing exhibits; research and review

Commission orders for possible citation in

brief

Review and revise portions of post-hearing 2.80 hrs. 728.00
bnef; confer for chient regarding same;

research regarding non-utility transactions

Meeting with Ms. Scoles to discuss first rough 2.10 hrs. 630.00
draft brief; conduct futher review of transcripts

and exhibits; prepare outline of arguments

Confinue drafting, researciung and revising the 6.70 hrs. 1,742.00
post-hearing brief; confer for client regarding

same; email communications with Mr. Brown

and Mr. Seidman to send draft for review

Prepare outline of additional citations and 1.60 hrs. 480.00

WHITE - CUSTOMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE
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arguments for inclusion in brief; review first
complete draft of brief; make edits and draft
additional language for Ms. Scoles’ review
LCS  Emall communications with Mr. Seidman and 0.20 hrs. 52.00
Mr. Brown related to draft post-hearing brief
and meeting/call to discuss same
LCS Review comments regarding draft post-hearing 0.40 hrs. 104.00
brief from Mr. Sexdman; confer for client
regarding same; email communications with
Mr. Seidman regarding same
D Review edits to draft of brief and 0.50 hrs. 150.00
' accompanying spreadsheet from Mr. Seidman;

10/26/2010

10/26/2010

10/27/2010

10/27/2010

10/28/2010.

~ discuss with Ms. Scoles; review additional , e

response from Mr. Seidman

LCS Review comments from Mr. Brown; revise 2.10 hrs. 546.00
draft post-hearing brief in accordance with Mr.
Seidman and Mzx. Brown's suggestions; email
communications with chents regarding same

™D Review edits to draft of bnef from Mr. Brown 0.40 hrs. 120.00
and Ms. Chase

LCS  Prepare for and participate in conference 2.80 hrs. 728.00
call/meeting with Mr. Seidman, Mr. Brown,
Ms. Chase and Mr. Deason regarding changes
to draft pest-hearing brief; update timeline
with revised dates for staff recommendation,
agenda conference and final order; email .
communicaons regarding tuneline

D Conference call with Mr. Brown, Ms. Chase, 2.70 hrs. 810.00
Mr. Seidman, and Ms. Scoles to review first
full draft of brief and suggested edits; review
transcripts and exhibits for further suggested
edits; review citations in bnef

LCS  Review suggested changes; email
commumnications with Ms. Chase and Mr.
Brown regarding certain suggested changes;
revise post-heaning brief; email
communications with Mr. Brown, Ms. Chase,
Mz. Seidman and Mr. Deason to relay revised
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WHITE - CUSTOMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE




Client/Matter :

Bill Number

10/29/2010

10/25/2010

11/02/2010

12/03/2010

RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK

PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS ATLAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLATIASSEE, FL 32302
(850) 425-6654

Federal Tax ID # 75-3101245

738 01
16937

brief and request review of same

Recerve and review suggested changes from

Mr. Brown, Mr. Seidman and Mr. Deasor;

revise, proofread, edit and finalize

post-hearing brief; arrange service and filing of

same

D Make final review of bnief and give edits to
‘Ms. Scoles

1D Review brief filed by the Office of Public

Counsel

Receive, distribute to client and begin to

review Public Service Commission staff's

LCS

LCS

4.10 hrs.

o
\D
[
B
)

1.10 hrs.

0.30 hrs.

Page 3

1,066.00

12/06/2010

12/06/2010

12/06/2010

12/13/2010

12/14/2010

S s e gnmendation”

Review of staff recommendation and meet
with chent
Email communications with Public Service
Commission clerk regarding missing pages in
staff recormmendation; review agenda for
12/14/10 conference; confer for client
regarding staff recommendation; arrange
conference call/meeting with client to discuss
staff recommendation; continue review of staff
recomimendation; prepare for and participate in
conference call/meeting regarding same
TD Review staff recommendation and
attachments; discuss with Ms. Scoles; meeting
with Mr. Brown, Ms. Chase, Mr. Seidman, Ms.
Clark and Ms. Scoles to discuss staff
recommendation
Phone comumunications with Mr. Brown
regarding Agenda Conference
- Attend the Florida Public Service Commission
Agenda Conference related to the
Commussion's decision in Docket No.
100104-WU

SEC

LCS

LCS

LCS

Total fees for this matier

WHITE - CUSTOMER

1.50 hrs.

2.30 hrs.

3.20 hrs.

0.10 hrs.

4.50 hrs.

YELLOW - REMITTANCE

960.00

26.00

1,17G.00

$44,052.00



RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW

PQST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(850) 425-6654
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101243

Chient/Matter : 738 01 Page 6
Bill Number 16937

DISBURSEMENTS
09/22/2010 Testimony binding supplies 120.86
16/07/2010  Accurate Stenotype Reporters, Inc. - Deposition transcript of Debra 109.25
Dobiac
10/15/2010  Lisa Scoles; Ground Transportation - Travel to St. George on 10/5 - 92.00

10/6/10 for Hearing
10/15/2010 Terry Deason; Ground Transportation - 10/5 - 10/6/10 travel to St. George 158.00

for Hearing
10/15/2010  Lisa Scoles; Lodging - Travel to St. George on 10/5 - 10/6/10 for Hearmg 86.11
10/15/2010 Lisa Scoles; Meals - Travel] to St. George on 10/5 - 10/6/10 for Hearing 5.67
— 1052010 Terry Deason; Meals - 10/5--10/6/16 travel to St-George for Hearimg——— 3538 ~— ~
12/31/2010 Photocopies 864.75
12/31/2010 Messenger Charges 70.00
Total disbursements for this matter $1,542.02
BILLING SUMMARY

TOTAL FEES $44,052.00

TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS : $1,542.02

T OIT A ™ Ty TTT T = "

TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL $4D,39402

PLUS NET BALANCE FORWARD $57,658.01

TOTAL BALANCE NOW DUE S_I 4?;,_?:_5_.’;(-}_3

BALANCE FORWARD SUMMARY

Bill Date Biil Number Billed Amoumnt Amount Due
03/07/2010 15584 $9,603.43 $4.007.33
06/G7/2010 15822 , $11,357.06 $11,357.06
07/07/2010 15948 $7,583.79 $7.583.7%
0B/05/2010 16157 $19,675.00 $19,679.00

WHITE - CUSTOMER YELLOW - R_EM.ITTAN CE




. Chent/Matter :

Bill Number

09/17/2010
10/04/2010

738 01
16937

16266
16334

RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(8B50) 425-6654
Federal Tex ID # 75-3101243

Page

$21,554.87 $21,554.87
5.96 $33,475.96

WHITE - CUSTOMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE




RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK

PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(850) 425-6654
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101245

Bill Number 17086

Invoice Date February 7, 2011
Activity Billed through 01/31/2011

(Gene . Brown
Water Management Services, Inc.
250 John Knox Road

#4
Tallahassee, FL 32303

Petition for Rate Increase
738 01 D

'FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED

PAYMENT DUE UPON RECEIPT

01/04/2011 LCS  Review the Public Service Commission's final
order in Docket No. 100104-WU

01/05/2011 1D Begin review of final order in Docket No.
1.00104-WTJI

1.00 hrs.

1.00 hrs.

260.00

300.00

01/06/2011 D Conclude review of final order in Docket No.
100104-WU
01/10/2011 SFC  Review of final order in case (1.4) and
participate in conference on same (1.6)
Meeting with Mr. Brown, Ms. Chase, Mr.
Deason and Ms. Clark to discuss strategy
moving forward; research regarding whether
exhaustion is required before appeal; provide
template for customer notice to Ms. Chase;
phone communications with Florida Public
Service Commission staff regarding handling
of show case and any further proceedings by
Mr. Brown
01/10/2011 D Meeting with Mr. Brown, Ms. Chase, Ms.
Clark and Ms. Scoles to discuss Order No.
PSC-11-0010-SC-WU and potential actions in
response
01/14/2011 LCS  Multiple phone communications with Mr.
Brown; phone communications with Fiorida
Public Service Commission staff regarding
process to be removed from parties' list;
prepare notice of withdrawal; finalize, file and

=
]
w2

01/10/2011

1.20 hrs.

3.00 hrs.

1.80 hrs.

1.69 hrs.

0.30 hrs.

WHITE - CUSTOMER YELLOW - REMITTANCE

360.00
1,200.00

468.00

480.00

78.00




RADEY THOMAS YON & CLARK
PROFESSIONAL ASSOCIATION
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS AT LAW

POST OFFICE BOX 10967
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
(850) 425-6654
Federal Tax ID # 75-3101245

Clent/Matter : 738 01 Page 2
Bill Number 17086
arrange service of same
Total fees for this matter $3,146.00
DISBURSEMENTS
01/31/2011 Photocopies 1.75
Total disbursements for this matter $1.75
BILLING SUMMARY
' | TOTAL FEES $3,146.00
TOTAL DISBURSEMENTS $1.75
TOTAL CHARGES FOR THIS BILL $3,147.75
PEUS NET BALANCE FORWARD $T43.752.03

TOTAIL BALANCE NOW DUE

BALANCE FORWARD SUMMARY

Bill Date

05/07/2010
06/07/2010
07/07/2010
08/05/2010
09/17/2010
10/04/2010
01/07/2011

Bill Number Billed Amount Amount Due
15584 $9,603.45 $4,007.33
15822 $11.,357.06 $11,357.06
15948 $7,583.79 $7,583.79
16157 $19,679.00 $15,679.00
16266 $21,554.87 $21,554.87.
16334 $33,475.96 $33,475.96
16937 $45,594.02 $45,594.02

WHITE - CUSTOMER

YELLOW - REMITTANCE

AR TS TR AT g T L e S A e T

$146,399.78




WMSI RESPONSE TO STAFF
SIXTH DATA REQUEST

QUESTION NO. 7




MRCT - Frank Seidman
| T
Date ' Check No. | Amount
a !
3/27/2009] 5452 $1,450
6/30/20090 5695 | $2,000
8/13/2009 1129 | $2,000
1/21/2010; 1558 $1,000
3/19/20100 5380 $1,000
4/7/2010] 5906 $3,000
5/13/2010[ 6029 $2,000
7/7720100 6102 ! $2,000
7/30/2010] 6271 | $2,000
—_—
8/25/2010: 6369 $2,000
9/29/2010' 6468 $2.,000
10/29/20101 6570 $2,000
11/17/20100 6628 $2,824
1/21/2011] 6819 | $2,000
3/4/2011. 5500 | $2,000 |
5/5/2011] 5763 | $4,000
6/30/2011) 5921 | $4,000
8/11/2011) 6066 $4,000
11/3/2011. 6340 $2,000
—4/5/2012] 6772 $2,000 | "

|

|

I

Total:

| $45,274




PAY

TO.THE
‘CSROER
Dk

EMfem 0N

WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES, INC.

250 JOMN KNOX ROAD =4
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32303

WO mousand and-00M 00 Dollars

MGMJ & REG CCNSULTANIS INC
36 YACHT CLUE DRIVE" :

'NORTH PALM BEACH, FL ;;;4@5

EEER* Tk P
S_.Pmmmlrﬂm
Mmytwbank.r.mn :

81-275-825 Check NumEer:

DATE

Apc S, 2612

R
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Promenen o Busie .

WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES, INC. DN
e - CherNurT;Her 75921'

RaY

TO THE
CREER

250 JOHKN KNOX ROAD #4
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32303 81-275-322

DATE

Jum30, 2011

Four Thousand and 304100 Delars
MEMT & REG CONSWLTANTS, ING.
18444 L OST LAKE WAY '
JUPITER, FL- 33458

~4000.6¢

CAMOUNT, . -

._‘p‘l_ilr:l”:! on bﬂﬂh N

Meme:




WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES
250 JOHN.ENOX ROAD =1 -
FALLARASSEE

FLORIDA 32303

, INC.

Aesawmiy{ OGbank.com .

81-275.820




WA] ER MANAGEMENT SERVI! CES }NC BNL
ST 250 JOHN &VOX ROAD £4 = . eovewsrag Dl G
4 323@3 : . 81. F7E-829

- - » 8 .
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WATER UANAGEMENT SERVIESS, NG, 1097 o At 2 Gt

- H

250 JOMN XNOX ROAD 22 Nest oo }
TALLAHASSEE A 35303 e Number f
DATT ARKOUNXT ’

2l3e, 270 2000.00

Towo Thouszmet and DOAAG Ocitacs. I

o X 1

MSHT & REG CONSULTANTS, INCL @

182444 LOST LAKE WAY

AIPTER, FL 33483 /(7/ |
- L -]
Mamar 7 4/ [
|

#6271 8/10/2010 $2,000.00




.




e




A

e S e




1

&= P













36 Yacht Club Drive, #403
- North Palm Beach, FL 33408
Phone or Fax (561) 207-6083
¢-mail: frankdenjup(@att.net

Management & Regulatory Consuitants, inc.

WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES, INC.
MR. GENE BROWN

250 JOHN KNOX ROAD, #4.
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302

CONSULTING - RE: WATER RATE CASE

PREVIOUS BALANCE

Week of:
NO SERVICES

PAYMENTS AND CREDITS FOR EXPENSES
4/12/12 PAYMENT

HOURS
0.00

05/07/12
20031.91

$44442.73

0.60

- 2000.00

BALANCE DUE (CREDIT)

$42442.73




18444 Lost Lake Way
Jupiter; FL' 33458
Phaone or Fax (561) 743-9510
e-maii: frankdenjup@att. net

Management & Reguiatory Consuitants, Inc.

WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES, INC.
R. CGENE BROWNM

50 JOHN KNOX ROAD, #
ALTAHASSEE, FL 32302

H b=

SUMMARY OF OUTSTANDING BALANCES - ALL ACCOUNTS

MTSC. CCNSULTING (ANNUAL REFORT)
WATER UTILITY :

10/13/11

4
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18444 | ost Lake Way
Jupiter, FL 33458
Phone or Fax (561) 743-8510
e-mail: frankdenjup@atinet

Management & Reguiatory Consultants, Inc.

WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES, INC.
ME. GENE BROWN
25C JOHN EKNOX ROAD, #4.

i¢c/031/10

TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
20031.91
CONSULTING - RE: WATER RATE CASE
PREVIOUS BALANCE $46066.59
Wesi orf: HOURS
09/01/10 FS CONSULTING - CONFERENCE CALL
W/CLIENTS, PSC, OPC RE
ISSUES. 1.50 225.00
A RS CONS UL T ING —DRAT T REBUTTAS— o ——= ——
ASSIST W/DISCOVERY RESPONSES,
STATEMENT OF ISSUES, CONF. CALL. - 24.00 3600.00
09/13/10 FS CONSULTING - ASSIST W/DISCOVERY
RESPONSES, AUDIT RESPONSES,
PREHEARING STATEMENT, STIPULATIONS,
CONF. CALL, REBUTTAL. 28.00 4200.00
08/20/10 FS CONSULTING - ASSIST W/DISCOVERY
‘ RESPONSES, PREHEARING STATEMENT. 7.00 1050.00
09/27/10 FS CONSULTING - PREPARE FOR HEARING.  10.50 1575.00
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 71.00 $10650.00 3
EXPENSES
PAYMENTS AND CREDITS FOR EXPENSHS
10/01/1C PAYMENT, as of -~ 0.00

BATANCE DUE (CREDIT)

$56716.59



18444 [ost Lake Way
Jupiter, FL 33458
Phene or Fax (561) 743-9510
e-mail: rankdenjup@ait.net

Managemen% & Raguiatery Consultants, Inc.

WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES, INC.

MR. GENE BROWN
250 JOHN KNOX ROAD, #4.
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302

CONSULTING - RE: WATER RATE CASE

PREVIOUS BALANCE

Wesk of: JOUERS
08/02/1C FS CONSULTING - ASSIST W/DICOVERY

RESPONSES; REVIEW & COMMENT ON

PSC STAFF AUDIT. . 3.50 525.00
S8AQ0/ 30 po moNcrEmTNe o peoEapan poees

ORDERS RE DISCOVERY. 3.00 450 .00
08/16/10 FS CONSULTING - ASSIST & COMMENT ON

STAFF DISCOVERY & ISSUES. 7.00 1050.00
08/23/10 FS CONSULTING - REVIEW INTERVENOR

TESTIMONY; ASSIST W/DISCOVERY: -

PREPARE REBUTTAL . 22.00 3300.00
08/30/10 FS CONSULTING - CONFERENCE CALL RE i

ISSUES, DISCQVERY, TESTIMONY. 2.50 375.00 .

38.00 $ 5700.00 %?(

FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED

EXPENSES

. PAYMENTS AND CREDITS FOR EXFPENSES
08/30/10 PAVMENT

]
)
v)
g
(o
1
(B ]

BALANCE DU

~-$2000.00

$46066.58

27
7



18444 | ost Lake Way
Jupiter, FL 33458

Phone or F

ax (561) 743-9510

e-mall: frankdenjup@att.net

Mzanagement & Regulaiary Consultanis, Inc.

WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES, INC.
MR. GENE BROWN
250 JOEN KNOX ROAD, #4.
TALIAHRSSEE, FL 32302 08/09/10
20031.91
CONSULTING ~ RE: WATER RATE CASE
PREVIOUS BALANCE $42721.91
Heek of: HOURS
07/01/1C FS CONSULTING - CONFERENCE CALL
RE OPC DILISCOVERY, STRATEGY,
TIMELINE. 1.50 225.00
L G O S CONSHI NG A s o om o D o nenoros o = =
TO OPC DISCOVERY. 2.25 337.50
07/12/10. ¥S CONSULTING - ASSIST W/RESEONSES
TO OPC DISCOVERY. 2.00 300.00
07/15/10 FS CONSULTING - REVIEW STAFF REC
ON INTERIM RATES & COMMENT. 1.50 225.00
07/26/10 FS CONSULTING — CONFERENCE CALL &
“INPUT RE INTERIM REC. 3.50 525.00
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 10.75 $ 1612.50—“F§
T U
EXPENSES Vjiu’ﬁ
06/30/10 FEDEX SHIP QPC POD 42 32.18 (g%
PAYMENTS AND CREDITS FOR EXPENSES
08/09/10 PAYMENT -52000.00C
BAI.ANCE DUE (CREDIT) $42366.585



18444 [ ost Lgke Way
Jupiter, FL 33458
FPhene or Fax (£681) 743-8510
e-mall: frankdenjup@att net

Management & Reguiatory Consultants, inc.

MR. GENE BROWN

250 JOEN EKNOX ROAD, #4.

TALIAHASSEE, FL 32302 07/07/1G
20037, 91

CONSULTING — RE: WATER RATE CASE

Weelk orf: HOURS
06/14/10 ¥F5 CONSULTING - ASSIST WITY

RESPCNSE TC¢ AUDIT REQUESTS. 4.50 675.400
06/21/10 FS CONSULTING - RECONCILE FIfgD -

- MEE w/t'J_NAL_MﬁR; BREVIEW SYNOPSIST U 73 T2 50
C6/28/10 FS CONSULTING - ASSIST WITH

FINAL VOL. IITX; FINAIL VOL. I; FINAL

SAC; FINAL TESTIMONY; COMMENTS ON

RESPONSE TO OPC DISCOVERY. GO 1500.00

FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 15.25 § 2287.5

EXPENSES
PAYMENTS AND CREDITS FOR EXPENSES
061110 EAYMENT : -32000.00




CONSULT

ING - RE:

18444 | osi Lake Way
Jupiter, FL 33458
Phene or Fax (581) 743-3510
e-rnail: frankdenjivp@att.net

Management & Regulatory Consal

VATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES, INC.
"TR, GENE BROWN
250 JOHN KNCX ROAD, #4.

TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302

i'

jﬂ

tants, Inc.

G6/07/10
20031.91

BALANCE DUE {CREDIT)

Week of: HOURS
05/03/10 ¥S CONSULTING - UEDATE MER PROFORMA;

DISCUSS RB SUPEORT REVIEW SAC;

CONFERENCE CATLT,. %00 1350.00 -
05/10/10 FS CONSULTING — MFR; O&M ISSUES;

VOLUME IIZI (ADDITIONAL ENG. INFGQ). 12.00 1800.00
05/17/10 FS CONSULTING - CONFERENCE CALL:

' FINAL VOL. III; FINAT VQL. I; FINAL
SAC; FINAL TESTIMONY; COMMENTS ON
PETITION; INPUT FOR TBRIFFS. 21.00 3150.00
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 42 .00 5 6300.007\\
EXPENSES
C4/20/10 FEDEX SHIP DRAFT 3 VOLUMES 90.72
03/18/1C FEDEX SHIP FINAL VOL. TIT 51.66 I
05/19/10 FEDEX SHEIP FINAL VOL. T AND SAC 51.66 j
05/18/10 FEDEX OFFICE - CQPIES — VOL. IIT 28.18
05/19/10 FEDEX OFFICE - COQPIES - VOL. I, SAC 23.;7;,//
s 245,997 = ]

PAYMENTS AND CREDITS FOR EXPENSES % (05498
05/17/10 PAYMENT, Part of $2,000.00 payment -$ B57.357
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wWeek of:

=

18444 | ost Lake Way
. Jupiter, FL 33453
Phone or Fax (861} 743-8510
e-mail rankgenjup@sit.nst

Management & Regulatory Consuitanis, Inc.

MANAGEMENT
GENE RBROWN

MR,
250 JOHN KNOX ROAD, #4
TATLLAHRASSEE, FL 32302

G - RE:

= M)
P

-t

(S )
<
O~

ECURS
7.00

Wt

= O

04/01/1C FS CONSULTING - DRAFT TESTIMCNY
04/05/10 FS CONSULTING ~ PREEARE . S S P —

RECCHNCILIATION OF MER & G/L. 5700 in0.00
04/12/1C FS CONSULTING - PREPARE FOR &

PARTICIPATE IN CONF. CALL W/CLIENT;

COMMENT ON DRAFT PETITION & TEST-

IMONY: CONTINUE PEEPARATION CF MER;

REDRAFT TESTIMONY. - 27.00 40350.00
04/19/10 FS CONSULTING - ADDITIONAT COMMENTS

ON TESTIMONY; SEND QUT DRAFT MER. 3.50 525.08

42.5 S 6375.00

CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED

- 0.00
836745 .89



84«-— Lost Lake Way
Jupiter, F1 33458
Phoreo Fax (361) 743-8510

e-mail: Trankdenjup@sitnet

Mlanagement & Reguist

ory Consuitants, inc.

WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES, INC.
MR. GENZ BRCWN
250 JOEN KNGCX ROAD, #4.
'FR_L;}\EP\SS?*, FL 32302 04/20/10
20031.91
CONSULTING ~ RE: WATER RATE CASE
PREVIOUS BALANCE $27773.63
Week of: EQUER
03/04/1C FS CONSULTING - REVIEW & COMMENT
RE TEST YEAR LETTER 00.75 112.350
7 T T ST CONSTUTTING = DEvE LT 2009 1Y —— = —
MFR’ 5. 5.00 750.0Q0
03/15/10 FS CONSULTING - DEVELOP 2008 TY
MFR’s; CCONFERENCE CATL. §.00 300.00
£3/22/10 F3S CONSULTING - DEVELOP 2068 TY
MR’ g, 5.00 758.00
FCR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 2512.50 § 2512.50 —~_.
EXPENSES
FAYMENTS AND CREDITS FOR EXEENSES
04/20/10 PAYMENT, as of - G.00
BATANCE DUE (CREDIT) $30286.13




18444 | ost Lake Way
Jupiter, FL 33458
Fhene or Fax (561) 743-
e-mail: frankdenjup@stt net

G54

a1

(¥

Management & Reguiatory Consultants, Inc.

WATER MANAGEMENYT SERVICES, INC.
MR . CGENE BROWHN
250 JOHN KNOX ROAD, #4.
TRATIAHASSER, FL 32302 03/05/10
20031.¢1
CONSULTING - RE: WATER RATE CASE
PREVIQUS BALANCE 85873.83
Wieek of: BOURS
02/02/1¢ FS CONSULTING - DEVELOP 2009 TY
MER’ 5. 46 .00 £3C0.00
e S e e =i = . =
MER’ 3. 38.00 5700.00
02/15/10 ES CONSULTING ~ DEVELOP 2009 TY
MFR’ 3. 40.00 &200.00
02/22/10 FS CONSULTING - DEVELOP 2008 TY
MFER’s; Tsl. Conf. W/COUNSEL &
CLIENT. 22.00 3300.00
FOR CURRENT SERVICES RENDERED 145.0 S21900.40
EXPENSES
PAYMENTS AND CREDITS FOR EXPENSES
03/05/10 PAYMENT, as of - G.C0
BATLANCE DUE (CREDIT) S27773.63
Please ncte that the “Previocus Balznce” is a corrzacted amount. Iin
the previcus (2/08/18) invoice, there was a transposition and the
amount was incorrect




Week of:

01/18/10Q

18444 [ ost Laks Way
Jupiter, FL 33458

Phore or Fax (561) 743-¢510

e-mail: frankdenjup@ati.net

Management & Regulatory Censultaris, Inc.

WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES, INC.
MR . GENE BROWN
250 JOEN ENOX RCAD, #4.
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32302
G - RE: WASTEWATER UTILITY &
WATER RATE CASE
DPREVIQUS BRLLANCE

FS CONSULTING -~ COMMENCE 2008 7Y -

02/08/10
20031.91

HOURS

. ¥ 2 PLb e

gl o

PAYMENTS
02/88/10

CURRENT SERVICES RENDEIRED

AND CREDITS FOR EXPENSES

FAYMENT, a3 of

BATANCE DUE (CREDIT)
NOTE: BILLING RATE, EFERECTIVE 1/01/10C: 159

o

.00

0.00

S Son &

5‘5?5{5

.00/




Barbara Withers

| E'Rate E‘x&‘
Date Check No. | Amount
J/z7/20095 5450 $285
9/4/2009| 1183]  $550
12/29/2009° 1007|  $3,675
3/19/2010 53811 $285
6/10/2010 6127,  $1,500
6/17/2010 6146)  $550
6/30/2010] 6187 $1,500
’—8/1 8/2010 6341;  $1,500
9/23/2010 6455  $550
9/30/2010 6479,  $1,500
12/29/2010 6748]  $3,000
12/29/2010: 67491  $3,000
7/6/2011 3258)  $1,500 |
10/4/2011- 6222 $575
5/24/2012] 6888 5285 |
5/24/12012] CCl  $3,500
5/24/2012, CC| $1,000
|
i Total: [ $24,755
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WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES, INC. = e
250 JOKN KNOX ROAD =4 Yoy O com
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 22303 81-275-828 Check Number: 6888
DATE AMDU}_VT

May 24, 2012 285.00

B Twe Hundred Eighty-Five and 00/100 Dellars
LEONARD & WITHERS, CPAs

: EJD Becuily fealures. Delplls on back.

TO THE v

CRDER 417 LVE OAKPLANTATION ROAD

O TALLAHASSEE, FL 32312 . ]
Mema: -

;
A
E)
: ]
3
=




WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES, INC.
250 JOHN KNOX ROAD 4
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32303

One Thnusand Frue Hundred and 00/ 1 QO Dollars |

BARBARA' S. W[THERSi CPA

mylw
81-275-829

5966

mﬁm

Check Nuriber: 3258

DATE

Jul 8, 2011

AMOUNF

500.00

Aumoﬁgz-s_lspga’gﬂag o

- Ej '::'S'E’FUIHW fedilurqs. .Detalls on back. .
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WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES, INC. : N gz o
250 JOHN KNOX ROAD #4 S e—— : :
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32303 81-275-829 CheecNumber  g220 3
] DATE
“Oct 4, 2011
PAY

0O THE
ORDER

O

,
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Lecnzrd & Withers CPAs, PL
411 Live Qak Plantation Road
Tallahassee, FL 32312

Voice: (850) 893-4080
Fax (850} B8953-6375

Account Of St. George Island Utility Company
230 John Knox Road, # 4
Tallahassee, FL 32303

Statement

Statement Date:
May 17, 2022

Customer Account ID:
5t. George Island

Ameount Enclosed

$ —
L Date Due Date Reference Paid Amount Batance Job
3/8/1z a/7/12 B2012-140 285.00 285.00
|
|
|
]
|
: ! !
Total | 285.00
| i
. : , :
_: 0-30 31-60 61-90 Over 50 days
0.00 f 285.00 0.00 0.00 |

e e T N T

Plesase attend to this payment as soon as possible.

L Uy O St SO Y PURON




Barbara Sheehan Withers,

CPA

Statement

411 lLive Cak Plantation Road
Tallahassee, FIL, 32312
Statement Date;
Jan 10, 2011
Voice: (850) 823-408C Customer Account ID:
Fax: {850) BB83-6375 Water
Account Of Water Management Services
" 250 John Knox Road, Suite # 4
Tallahassee, FL 32303
Amount Enclosed
$
Date Due Date | Reference Paid Job Amount Balance
6/30/10 7/30/10 B2010-437 |Part 3,000.00 3,000700
8/17/10C 8/1e/10 R2010-478 1,500. 00 4,500.00
8/31/10 2/30/10 B2010-488 1,300.00 6,000.00
e J11/30/10. 12/30/10  [B2010=603 .. | | _ o e 4.,500. 00 10,500.00] .
12/239/10 1/28/11 E2010-611 1,500.0d 12,0600.00
LESS CHECEKS (#6748 and #6749) AS OF 12/31/201(0
TOTALING $6,0004 00"
;
j
/
!{
.!‘
L
Totai 12,000.00
0-30 31-60 61-90G Over 50 days
&,000.00 G.00 0.00 6,000.C0

o S e o T ek

e e S

T




Barbara Sheehan Withers, CZA

411 Live Oak Plantation Road Statement
Tallahassee, FL 32312
Statement Date:
Feb 2, 2011
Voice: (830} B93-4080 Customer Account ID:
Account Of Water Management Services
250 John Knox Road, Suite # 4
Tallahassee, FL 32303
Amount Enclosed
$
Date Due Date " Reference Paid Job Amount Balance
8/17/10 8/1e/10C B2010-478 1,500.00 1,5006.00
8/31/1C 9/30/10 B2010-488 1,500.0Q 3,000.00
11/30/10 12/30/10 B2010-603 4,500.00Q 7,500.00
12/29/1¢0 1/28/11 B2010-611 1,500.00Q 9,000.00
Total 9,000.00
j
0-30 33i-60 61-50 Over %0 days
1,500.00 4,500.00 0.00 3,000.00

L o L R B S et 21 B



" Barbarz Sheehan Withers,

CEA

411 Live Oak Plantation Road

Statement

Tallahassee, FL 32312
Statement Date:
Mar 4, 2011
Voice: B93-4080 Customer Account iD:
Fax 883-6375 Water
Account Of Water Ma.nagement Services
250 John Knox Road, Suite # 4
Tallahassee, FL 32303
Amount Enclosed
3
Date Due Date Reference Paid Job Amount Balance
11/3G/10 12/30/10 E201.0-603 4,500.00 4,500.00
12/29/10 1/28/11 B2010-611 1,500.00 6,000.00
Total 6,000.C0
0-30 31-60 61-90 Over 80 days
0.00 1,500.00 4,500.00 0.00

T e A AN e ! 4 M M e e W i

A B S e
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Barbara Sheehan Withers,
411 Live Ozk Plantation Road

CPA

Statement

Tallahassee, FL 32312
Statement Date:
Zpr 28, 2011
Voice: (850} B93-4080 Customer Account |D:
Fax: (850} 883-6375 Water
Account Of Water Management Services
250 John Knox Road, Suite # 4
Tallahassee, FL 32303
Amount Enclosed
5
Date Due Date |Reference Paid Job Amount Balance
11/30/10 12/30/10 B2010-603 4,500.00 4,50C0.00
12/29/10 1/28/11 B2010-611 1,500.00 6,000.00
‘! Total 6,000.0C |
\ ,
i i i
[ 0-30 ;! 31-60 61-5C Over 90 days !
\ | :
i 7 I
| 0.00 ; 0.00 1,500.00 4,500.00 |




Barbara Sheehan Withers, CPA
411 Live Cak Plantation Road
Tallahassee, FL 32312

Statement

Statement Date;

Jun 2, 2011

Voice:  (850) 833-4080 Customer Account ID:
Fax: (850) B53-6375 Water
Account Of: Water Management Services
250 John Knox Road, Suite # 4
Tallahassee, FL 32303
Amount Enclosed
$
Date Due Date Reference Paid Job Amount Balance
11736710 12730710 BZ2010- 603 4,500.00 1,5060.00
12/25/10 1/28/11 BE2010-611 1,500. 00 6,000.00
&
it
Total 6,000.00
0-30 31~60 61-50 over 90 days
0.00 0.00 0.00 6,000.00

T e AL T a8 2 B Sy it S T AL kit
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Barbara Sheehan Withers, CPA .
411 Live Cak Plantation Road Statemellt
Tallahassee, FL 32312
Statement Date:
Jul 7, 2011
Voice:  (830) 893-4080C Customer Account ID;
Fax: (850) 883-6375 Water
Account Of— Water Ma.nagement Services
250 John Knox Road, Suite # 4
Tallahas_see, FL. 32303
Amount Enclosed
$
Date Due Date Reference Paid Job Amount Balance
11/30/10 12/30/10 [B2010-603 4,500.00 4,500.00
12/29/10 1/28/11 R2010-611 1,500.00 6,000.00
Total 6,000.00
G-30 31-60 61-90 Over 90 days
Q.00 0.00 0.60 6,000.00

R A A ] o s i
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swtation Road Statement
322

Statement Date:

Aug 16, 2011

Voica: (830) 2323-4080 Customer Account ID:
Fax: (85Q) £%3-6375 Water

Account (Of Water Management Services
220 John Xnox Road, Suite # 4
Tzllahassee, FL 32303

Amount Enclosed
s

te Due Date Reference Paid Job Amount Balance

Da
11735710 12/30/10 B2010-603 Part 3,000.00 3,000.00
12/25/10 :L,“ES/ll B2010-611 1,500.00 4,500.00
5
i
|
k
i
Total 4,500.00
3=30 31-60 _ £1-90 ’ Over 30 days
3.00 .00 0.00 ‘ 4,500.00

Tp— o o rome v 3 et Gk St - " e e




Barbara Sheehan Withers,

CPA

411 Live Oak Plantation Road Statement
Tallahassee, FL 32312

Staiement Date:
Oct 1, 2011
Voice: (850) 893-4080 Customer Account ID:

Fax (850) 893-6375 Water

Account Of: Water Management Services
250 John Xnox Road, Suite # 4
Tallahassee, FL 32303
Amount Enciosed
g
Date Due Date Reference Paid Job Amount Balance
11/30/10 12/30/10 B2010-603 Part 3,000.00 3,000.00
12/28/10 1/28/11 B2010-611 1,500.00 4,500.00
89/13/11 10/13/11 B2011-498 575.00 5,075.00
Total 5,075.00 |
1
0-30 | 31-60 61-90 Over 90 days
575.00 ; 0.00 0.00 4,500.00
{
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Barbara Sheehan Withers, CPa
411 Live Oak Plantation Road

Statement

Tallahassee, FL 32317
Statement Date:
Nov 1, 2011
Voice: (850} 893-4080 Customer Account ID:
Fax: (850) 893-6375 Water
Account Of; Water Management Services
250 John Knox Road, Suite # 4
Tallahassee, FL. 323032
Amount Enclosed
$
Date Due Date Reference Paid Job Amount Balance
11730710 12/30710 B2010-603 Part 3,000.00 3,G00.00
12/29/10 1/28/11 B2010-611 1,500.040 4,500,900
Total 4,500.00
| !
f 0~30 31-60 1 61-90 Over 90 days
J
0.00 0.00 | 0.00 4,500, 00




Barbara Sheehan Withers,
411 Live Oak Plantation Road

CBA

o A T

Statement

Tallahassee, FL 32312
Statement Date:
: Nowv 29, 2011
2
Voice:  (850) 883-4080 Customer Account ID:
Fax [850) 893-6375 4 Water
Account Of: Water Managemeri:?t Services
250 John Knox Road, Suite # 4
Tallahassee, FL 32303
é\mount Enclosed
Date Due Date Reference Paid Job Amount Balance
11/30/10 12/30/10 1B2010-603 Part 3,000.00 3,000.0(
12/23/10 1/28/11 :.B2010-611 1,500.00 4,500.0(
s]_':
A Total 4,500.00
0-30 31-60 61-30 over 90 days
0.00 — g.00 0.00 4,500,00
i
g
5
L
1




Barbara Shechan Withers, CPA
4131 Live Cak Plantation Road
Tallahassees, FL 323172

Statement

Statement Date:
Dec 29, 2011

Voice: (850) 893-4080 Customer Account ID:
Fax: (850) B893-6375 Water
Account Of Water Management Services
250 John Knox Road, Sulte # 4
Tallzhassee, FL 32303
Armount Enclosed
&

Date Due Date Reference Paid Job Amount Balance
11730710 12/30/10 E20L0-603 Part 3,000.00 3, 000.00
12/28/10 1/28/11 B20L0-611 1,500.00 4,500. 00

Total 4,500.00
! |

0-30 31-60 | 61-90 Over 80 days

; | : ! }

T - i - i - . T T e s s — |

‘i 0.00 0.00 ; .00 ! 4,500.00




Barbara Sheehan Withers CPA
411 Live Oak Plantation Rd
Tallahassee, FL 32312-2364

(850)893-4080

June 17, 2010

WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES INC.
250 JOHN KNOX ROAD #4
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32303

Invoice: B2010-427

TEL: (850)668-0440

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN THE PREPARATION OF YOUR 2009 INCOME TAX RETURN.

FEDERAL
Form 1120 Page 1
NOL Summary Statement
NOL Deduction Statement (4)
NOL Worksheet (4)
Form4562
Detail Statements (2)
Two Year Comparison
Federal Depreciation Schedule

AMT Depreciation Schedule

s i A g Rt 3 it O S el it e ittt = T 4 = i

Futare Fed Depreciation Sch
Power of Attorney

FLORIDA STATE
Form F-1120 Page 1

AMOUNT DUE

$550.00




Barbara Shechan Withers CPA
411 Live Qak Plantation Rd
Tallahassee, FL 32312-2364

(850)893-4080

September 13, 2010 Invoice: B2010-427
WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES INC. TEL: (850)668-0440
250 JOHN KNOX ROAD #4

TALLAHASSEE, FL 32303

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN THE PREPARATION OF YQUR 2009 INCOME TAX RETURN.

FEDERAL
Form 1120 Page 1
NOL Summary Statement
NOL Deduction Statement (4)
NOIL Worksheet (4)

e Sehedule D e

Form 4562

Auto Expense Worksheet (3)
Form 4797

Cap Loss Carryover Summary

Detail Statements (2)

Two Year Comparison
Federal Depreciation Schedule
AMT Depreciation Schedule
Future Fed Depreciation Sch
Power of Attorney

FLORIDA STATE
Form F-1120 Page 1

AMOUNT DUE $550.00

Vi




Barbara Sheehan Withers CPA
411 Live Qak Plantation Rd
Tallahassee, FL 32312-2364

(850)893-4080

March 12, 2010

ST GEORGE ISLAND UTILITY CO. LTD.
250 JOHN KNOX RD. #4
Tallahassee, FL. 32303

Invoice: B2010-186

TEL: (850)668-0440

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN THE PREPARATION OF YOUR 2009 INCOME TAX RETURN.

FEDERAL
Form 1065
Schedule B-1
Two Year Comparison
Detail Statements

Partner Summary
Per Schedule K-1 (8)

- Form 1065 SE Worksheet e

£285.00

_ AMOUNT DUE




BARBARA SHEEHAN WITHERS

CERTIFIED PUBLIC ACCOUNTANT

* Member
Telephone: (850) 893-4080 411 LivE OAK PLANTATION ROAD American Institute of CPA's

Facsimile: (850) §93-6375 Florida Institute of CPA's

TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32312

Emaii: witherscpa@agl.com American Women’s Society of CPA’s

December 29, 2010

Water Management Services inc.
250 john Knox Road, #4
Tallahassee FL 32303

INVOICE #82010-611

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with accounting and
bookkeeping policies, procedures, account classifications, computations and )

7 othef matters, for the month of December, 2010

1 Month Retainer, as per accounting and bookkeeping
services agreement $1,500.00




RECAP OF HOURS AS OF SEPTEMBER 16, 2010 FOR
BARBARA SHEEHAN WITHERS CPA FIRM

BARBARA WITHERS 48 HRS @ $150 $7.200
SCOTT HUTTER 28HRS @ $75 2,100
SUSAN BROOKS SHEARER 495 HRS @ $50 2,475
TOTAL 311,775
(PAID TO DATE %4,500)

Update as of 11-30-10:

Additional hours worked:

Barbara Withers 23 hrs @$150 3,450

Scott Hutter 25 hr @75 18.75

Susan Brooks Shearer 26.5 hrs @50 1325
Total 4794

Billed to Date 11 months at $1,500 516,500

Paid to Date as of 11-30-10 6,000

Balance Due 10,500




Hours Worked by Barbara S. Withers CPA
for Water Management Services inc.

Date
4116/2010
412212010
412372010
6/17/2010
6/24/2010

7612010
7/8/2010
71212010
711512010

7M98/2010
7/20/2010

712312010

—————BABR2IE——1-00-review-financiakdata-w/ - SHE-SB———————

8/17/2010
8/18/2010

8/23/2010

8/25/2010
8/28/2010
8/30/2010
8/31/2010
Subiotal

8/13/2010

8/15/2010
9/16/2010

Subtotal

9/16/2G10
9/24/2010
9/30/2010
10/6/2010
10/19/2010
10/22/2010
Subtotal

Hours Description/Project

2.00 Meet with Gene Brown at his office,
review financial data

1.50 Meet with Gene Brown at my office,
review cash needs/ffinancial info.

1.00 Telephone conversations, Sandy Chase
Bobby Mitchell & Gene Brown, fax items
Prepare Federal & Florida Income tax
returns for 2009 - 5 hrs. billed separately $550

5.00 Work on fixed assets, depreciation schedules

1.50 Review financial information

2.00 Review documenis and schedules

2.00 Review accounting matters

2 50 Review June 30, 2010 financial statements
and prepare list of items o be analyzed

3.00 Work on fixed assets, depreciation schedules

1.50 Prepare June 30 2010 Fixed Asset Matrix
and depreciation schedules

2.00 Review PSC material

1.00 Organize files, review financials
1.00 Organize fites, review financials
27.00

1.00 Depreciafion schedules with staff
set up new procedure/excel spreadsheets
2.00 Review PSC material, read iestimony
0.50 Telephone converstion Gene Brown Re:PSC
3.00 Review depreciation schedules
2.00 Work on and review depreciation schedules
35.50

0.50 Meet with Gene Brown, Sandy Chase

re: accounting matters(with S. Brooks)

July & August financial statements for review
4.00 Finalize & prepare 2009 tax return/research
4.00 Review PSC testimany and prepare testimony
4.00 Work on testimony, research records

27 X /8o

48.00 As of September 16, 2010

3.00 Additional review of testimony, deposition etc

2.00 Attend PSC accounting staff testirmony/depo.

2.00 Conference call w/ GDB, Frank Seidman re: PSC

8.00 Attend P5C Hearing at St. George [sland & testify

4 .00 Prepare |ate filed exhibits/ coordinate with GDB/FS

4.00 Meet w/GDB, Citizens Bank of Perry VP, SC, re: refinance

23.00

P52



— - — =y wrsaaray M UURD

cC cc cC cC cCc cc cC cc ce cC

Flack Womar's Consult Withers Grahamn FEFPA Kid's Word Moody  Kiliearn Nightlife
Day/Week  Date Start Stop_ # Hours CC CPA Project Bsw Office  State
Monday 16-Aug 2:00PM 545PM 375 WMS] BSW  Review of Audit Proc /Gen Ledger 375
Wednesday 13-Aug 4:00 PM S30PM 150 wMS! BSW  Gene Brown Depreciation Sch 1.50
Friday 20-Aug  9:00 AM 530PM B850 WMSI BSW  Depreciation Schaduie 8.50
Monday 23-Aug B8:45 AM T1.00AM 225 WMSI BSW  Depreciation Schedule 22%
Monday 23-Aug 12:45PM B4SPM B0 WMSI BSW  Depreciation Schedule 6.00
Wednesday 25-Aug 9:00 AM 330PM 650 WMSI BSW  Depreciation Schedule 6.50
Friday 27-Aug  9:00 AM 2:00PM 500 WMS! BSW  Depreciation Schedute 5.00
Friday 27-Aug  2:30 AM S5 AM 275 wWMSI BSW  Depreciation Schedule 275
Monday 30-Aug  9:00 AM 11:45AM 275 WMSI BSW  Depreciation Schedule 275
Monday 30-Aug 1S PM GO0 PM 475 WMSI BSW  Depreciation Schedule 4.75
Monday 13-8ep 10:15 AM 11:15 AM 1.00 WMS! BSW  WMSI: Review FIS June 1.00
Monday 13-3ep 11115 AM 11:45AM  0.50 WMSI BSW  WMSI: Meeting w/Client 0.50
Monday 13-8ep 11:45 AM 1:45PM 200 WMSL BSW  WMSL Review F/S July & Aug 2.00
Monday 13-Sep  3:00 PM 430PM  1.50 WMSI BSW  WMSI: Review Supporting 1.50
000 Schedules w/Client
Monday 13-Sep 430PM 5:15PM 0.75 WMSI BSW  VWMSL Prepare Wk Files/Copies 075
Monday Z7-Sep 11115 AM 200PM 275 WMSI BSW  Meeting w/Client; Review Work 275

Papers re: Vouch Cash infOul
Accounts; Gene Brown 2008-2010

Wednesday 25-Sep 9:45 AM 10115 AM 050 WMSI BSW  Review Work tc Be Performed at 0.50
_ : Client's Ofc re: Cash/In Cash/Out
1015 AM Z30PM 425 WMSI BSW  WMSL Meeting w/Client; Vouch 4.25
315 PM 4:30 PM #1.25 WMSI BSW Cash In/Out Accounts: Gene 1.25
! Brown 2008;
4:30 PM 6:00 PM 1.50 WMSt BSW  Create Work Files for Documents 1.50

Rec'd from Client: Cash/In; Cash
Prepare Excel Spreadsheet
Reconciliation; Memo to BSW

Friday 22—06’1 415 PM 5:45 PM 1.50 WMSI Bsw  Water Management Svcs: Updatec 1.50
Q.00 Depreciation Schedule for Fixed As
R ————— s fo———o w0 et mo = ———w ————0 O_ﬁe_i ——— — fq:hruﬁaﬁ/‘]-e—-—f— - T T e
Monday 22-Nov  9:15 AM 11:30 AM 225 WMSH BSW  Preparation of 3-Ring Binder for De 2.25
.00 Schedute; Review of Depreciation Scheduie
12:00 PM 5:30 PM 550 WMSI BSW  Meeting w/Client re; Updated Genel 5.50
0.00 for Fixed Asset Accounts/Deprecial
Monday 29-Nov "2:30 AM 430 PM 7.00 VWMSI BSW  Review of Annual Report; 7.00
: 0.00 Preparation of Matrix
76.00 76.00 0.00 0.00
OK Capital, nc. 0.00
Blue Pefican Seafood 0.00
Mahan Preschool 0.00
Lifestyle Designs 0.00
Barbara 8. Withers, CPA 0.00
Tax 0.00
Goiden Book Preschoot 0.00
WMSI 76.00
Other 0.00 CPA Hour Breakdown
Clarence Moses 000 _—
Barbara Office Siate. !
cC 76.00 . 76.00 0.00 0.00




¢ crwea rruviaeu Ry DUCOL FTUTIET

cC cCc cc cC cC cc cc cc cc cc
Flack Woman's Consult Withers Graham FEFPA Kid's Worid Moody Killearn Nightiife
DayMieek  Date Start Stop # Hours CC CPA Project BSW Office  State
Friday 5-Feb 11:40AM 11:50AM  0.17 WMSI BSW  Reguiations Books 017
Thursday t7-dun  305PM 335 PM 0.50 WmMsi BSW  Trip to WiMSI/Federal Extension 0.50
Thursday 24-Jun 1130 AM 1230 PM 100 WMSI BSW  Trip to WMSHDepr. Schedules 1.00
Friday 25-Jun 12:220PM  115PM 092 WMSI BSW  Trip to WMSI/Matrix Q.82
Friday 25-Jun  330PM  S50PM 157 WMSI BSW  Trip to WMSI/Matrix 1.67
Tuesday 20-Jul 11:30 AM 11:45AM 025 wWMSI BSW  Helping BSW 0.25
Thursday 22-Jul 12235PM  1.05PM  0.50 WMS BSW  Depreciation Reports 0.50
Thursday 22-Jul 2:30PM  515PM 275 WMS| BSW  Depreciation Reports 275
Thursday 2%-Jul 540PM 550PM 017 WMS| BSW  Fixed Assets 0.17
Thursday S-Aug  3:30PM  3B0PM 033 WMSH BSW  Fixed Asseis 0.33
Friday 6-Aug 11:10AM 11.20AM  0.17 WMSI BSW  Audit/Depreciation 0.17
Friday 6-Aug 5:05PM S530PM  0.42 WMSI BSW  Fixed Assets 0.42
Wednesday 11-Aug 12:00PM 1225PM 042 WMS! BSW  Fixed Assets 0.42
Wednesday 11-Aug 5:.05PM 520 PM 0.25 WMs| BSW  Depreciation Schedules 0.25
Monday 16-Aug 11:45AM 1200PM 025 WMS BSW  Audit 0.25
Tuesday 17-Aug 1210PM 1220PM 017 WMS| BSW  Heiping BSW 017
Friday 20-Aug 1245PM T1T:05PM  0.33 WMSI BBW  Helping Susan/Depreciation 032
Tuesday 24-ALg 1120 AM 11:535AM  0.58 WMSI BSW  Reading Over PSC Testimony .58
Wednesday 25—Ai.ig ‘B:30AM  S:00AM 050 WMSI BSW  Helping BSW/Depr. Schedule 0.50
Wednesday 25-Aug 10:40 AM 1055 AM 025 WMSI BSW  Helping Susan/Depreciation 0.25
Friday 27-Aug S35 AM 11256 AM  1.83 WMSI BS8W  Depreciation Schedules 1.83
Friday 27-Aug 1225PM 1:.05PM 067 WMSI BSW  Depreciation Schedules 0.67
Friday 27-Aug “2220PM  320PM 1.00 WMS) BSW  Depreciation Schedules 1.00
Friday 27-Aug 3335PM S545PM 217 WMSI BSW  Depreciation. Schedules 217
Monday 30-Aug 900AM 1200PM 300 WMSI - BSW  Depreciation Schedutes 3.0C
Monday 30-Aug 1210 PM 12:30 PM 0.33 WMSI BSW  Depreciation Scheduies 0.33
Monday aG-Aug 2:35PM 605PM  3.50 WMSI BSW  Depreciation Schedules 3.50
Tuesday 31-Aug  EB40AM 1200PM 333 WMSI.  BSW  Depreciation Schedules 333
Tuesday 3t-Aug 1220PM 12:40PM  0.33 WMSI BSW  Depreciation Schedules - 0.33
_WWW. = P i V- g o 5 —
Monday 22 Nov 9 20AM  9:35 AM 025 WMS) BSW Helping Susan 0.25
: 0.00
Q.00
28.25 2825 Q.00 0.00
) ; i BSW Office State
Company Hours Breakdown Total
g : 2825
Evelyn Flack Estate 0.00
Woman's Ciub of Tallahassee 0.00
WIN Consulting 0.00
Ben Withers, Inc. 0.00 Pay Brea kdown
. Reg Hrs  Total Hours
Henry Graham P.A. 0.00 Hrs Wkeg  in Pefiod  Accounted For
FEFPA 0.00 Admin. Leave 0.00 -
Kid's World 0.60 Sick Day o.00
McCall Moody Law Fim 0.60 Holiday 0.00
Kiliearn Liquor 0.00 Vacation o.00
Nightlife Unlimited 0.C0 Hours 28,25 2825
Nora L. Mang Lease Acct, c.00 _ Gross C.00
Alteration Efz., Inc. ‘ 0.00 FICA 0.00
Greg Prichard Psy. D. 0.00 Medicare 0.00
OK Capital, Inc. 0.00 Federal WH 000
Blue Pelizan Seafood .00 Simple 0.00
Mahan Preschool c.00 Net Pay .00
BP 0.00
Barbara $. Withers, CPA 0.00
Tax 0.00
- Golden Book Preschool 0.00
WMSI 28.25
Other 0.00 CPA Hour Breakdown
Clarence Moses 0.00

: Barbara Office State
cC 2825 28.25 0.00 .00

e S0 %




Water Mangement Services Inc.
Updated hours worked 2010:

Previous $ Previous

Barbara Withers
Scott Hutter
Susan B. Shearer

19,582 Totals

10,650 71
2118.75 28.25
3800 76

16,569

Billed to Date 12 months at $1,500

Time in excess of Retainer

Paid to date
Balance Due on Retainer

$6.000
$12,000

This Mo.

This Month Hours/$
4 600
1.92 144
4558 2279

3023

Total
75

30.17

121.58

Rate

Total
150 11250

75 226275
50 8079

19591.75

$18,000

=

$1,591.75




vy wMGGL B UDRE Bl

-

cC cc cc ;. cC cc cc cc cc cc cc
Frack Woman's Consiilt Withers Graham FEFPA Kid's World Moady lieamn Nightlife
DayWeek Date  Start Stop # Hours CC CPA  Project BISW Office State
&
&
Wednesday 2-Dec 930 AM 4:45 PV 7'.?5 WMSH BSW  Prepare Client Binder; J/E's for Dep 7.25
2 Exp for Fixed Asset Account for July-Oc
Wednesday 2-Dec 910 AM 1:30 PM 433 WMSI BSW Finalize J/E thru 10731/10; Meeting 433
Monday 6-Dec 9:45 AM 11;30 AM 175 WMSH BSW  Prepare Office Dupiicate of Client Binde 1.75
0.00 Depreciation Matrix and Schedules
Friday 10-Dec  5:00 AM 1200 PM  3{00 WMSI BSW  Meeting w/Client re: Depreciation J/E's 3.00
1:30 PM S0 PM 350 WMSI BSW  Meeting w/Client re: Depreciation J/E's 3.50
Monday 13-Dec 915 AM 430 PM  7.25 WMSI BSW  Update Depreciation Sched. July-Dec 7.25
Wednesday 15-Dec 9:15 AM 30O0PM 575 WMSI BSW  Update Depreciation Sched. July-Dec 575
Monday 20-Dec  3:30 PM 515 PM  1.75 WMS! BSW  Make copies of revised Fixed Asset Mat 1.75
0.00 Depreciation Schedules for each accow
G.00 Client Binder Update; Phone reguest to
0,00 BobbyAWMS! re; 12/31/ Updated Balanc
0.00 Revise Matrix and Summary Sheet to in
0.0 Acquisitions from 10/31/10 to 12/34/10
Monday 27-Dec 930 AM 10:30 AM 1,00 WMS! BSW  Update Summary Sch from 10/31 to 12, 1.00
] Meeting w/Barbars re: Interest Pmts on Mortg
10:30 AM 12200 PM 150 WMSI BSW  Meeting with Bobby at WMSI to finalize 1.50
1:00 PM 4:45 PM 3:{5 Wsi BSW  Depreciation Schedules for alf F/A acco: 3.75
000
Wednesday 29-Dec 10:45 AM 330 PM 4:f5 WMSI| BSW  Make changes to Dep Sch per Entries n 4.75
000 by BobbyWMS!
0.0
iy
0.0
080
0.00
0.00
050
0,60
D.@O _
- T T - T T T - - - "
0.00
0.00
.00
0.00
Wmsl 45.?8
i CPA Hour Breakdown
:
Barbara Office State
cc 4558 4558 000 0.00
‘.:F(
-_)(.1\




v rwmpe vy aeu Uy JTOIM AUTTEr

cc cc cc - cc cc cc cc cc cc cc
Flack Woman's Consult Withers Graham. FEFPA Kid's World Moody Killearn Nightiife
DayMWeek Date __ Stant Stop #Hours GG TPA__ Project BEW Office " Staie
TWy 2-Dec 930 AM  9:45 AM 025 WMSI BSW  Depreciation Sched./Help BSW 0.25
Fr]day 3-Dec S5:55AM 10:15AM  0.33 WMSH BSW  Helping Susan/Depreciation 0.33
Friday 10-Dec 4:45PM 5:00PM 025 WMSI BSW  Helping Susan/BSW 0.25
Monday 13-Dec 11:15AM 11.35AM 033 WMmsI BSW  Helping SusanfDepreciation 0.33
Monday 13-Dec 2:00PM 2:110PM 0.7 WM3) BSW  Helping Susan/Depreciafion 0.17
Wednesday 15-Dec 925AM  9:45 AM 033 wwMsl BSW  Helping Susan/Depreciation 0.33
Monday 27-Dec 11:40 AM 11:55 AM 0.25 WMSI BSW Figuring Out Hours for Billing c.25
0.00
0.00
0.00
1.92 192 000 0.00
BSwW Office State
Company Hours Breakdown Total
1.2
Evelyn Fiack Estate 0.00
Woman's Club of Tallahassee 0.00
WIN Consulfing 0.00
i
Ben Withers, inc. 0.00 Pay Breakdown
, Reg Mrs  Total Hours
Henry Graham P.A. 0.00 Hrs Wked  in Period Accounted For:
FEFPA oég Admin. Leave 0.00
Kid's World 0.00 Sick Day .00
McCall Moody Law Firmn 0.00 Holiday 0.00
Killeamn Liquor 0.00 Vacation 0.00
e Mightlife Unfimited 000 _ R -1 - - — 182 1.92
Nora L. Mang Lease Acct. C.00 Gross 0.00
Alteration Etc., inc. 0.00 FICA 0.00
Greg Prichard Psy. D. 0.90 Mecdlicare c.op
OK Capital, Inc. O.QO Federal W/H 0.00
Blue Peiican Seafood 0.00 Simple 0.00
Mahan Preschoal 0.00 MNet Pay 0.00
BP 0.00
Barbara 8. Withers, CPA 0.00
Tax 0.00
Golden Book Preschoo! 0.0¢
WMES! 1.82
Other 0.00 CPA Hour Breakdown
Clarence Moses O.fjﬂ
g Barbara Office State
cc 1.92 182 000 0DODO
]
T
iy
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12/29/2010

4.00 Various telephone conversations w/GDB,
assiting Susan with matrix preparation etc.
during month of December 2010




BARBARA SHEEHAN WITHERS

CERTIFIED PUBLIC ACCOUNTANT

+ Member
Telephone: (850) 893-4080 411 LivE QaK PLANTATION ROAD American institute of CPA's
Facsimile: (8 893-6375 i i ’
imile: (850) 893-63 TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32312 Florida institute of CPA’s

Email: witherscpa@aol.com American Women's Society of CPA’s

November 30, 2010

Water Management Services Inc.
250 john Knax Road, #4
Tallahassee FL 32303

INVOICE #B2010-603

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with accounting and
bookkeeping policies, procedures, account classiﬁcati_ons. computations and__

~ other matters; for the monthé of Sep;fémber, October & November, 2010

3 Months’ Retainer, as per accounting and bookkeeping
services agreement at $1,500 per month $4,500.00




Barbara Shechan Witkers, Crpa
411 Iive Cak Plantation Road
Tallahassee, FL. 32312

Statement

Statement Date:
Nov 12, 2010

Voice: (850) 892-4080 Customer Account iD:
Fax: (850} 893-6375 Water
Account Of Water Management Services
" 250 John Knox Road, Suite § 4
Tallahassee, FL 32303
Amount Enclosed
$
Date Due Date ' Reference Paid Job Amount Balance
6730710 7/30720 BZ010-437 Part 3,000.00 3,000.00
8/17/10 8/16/10 B2010-478 1,500.00 4,500.00
8/31/10 9/30/10 B2010-~4688 1,500.00 6,000.00
Totaf 6,000.00
f ,0-30 31-60 ‘ 61-580 Over 90 days j
L 0.00 3,000.00 ( 5.00 3,000.00 r
|




BARBARA SHEEHAN WITHERS

CERTIFIED PUBLIC ACCOUNTANT

{ Member
Telephone: (850) 893-4080 411 LivE OAK PLANTATION ROAD American Institute of CPA’s
Facs_rmrile: (850) 893-6375 TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32312 Florida Institute of CPA’s
Email: witherscpa@aol.com American Women's Society of CPA’s

August 31, 2010

Water Management Services, Inc.
250 John Knox Road #4
Tallahassee FL 32303

INVOICE #B82010-488 ]

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with accounting and
Bookkeeping policies, procedures, account classifications, computations and
Other matters, for the month of August 201Q.

August 2010 Retainer, as per accounting and bookkeeping
Services agreement $ 1,500.00




BARBARA SHEEHAN WITHERS

CERTIFIED PUBLIC ACCOUNTANT

* Member
Tel g o r o
EEE 411 LvE OAC PANIATON RoAD
Email: witherscpa@ool.com TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32312 American Women's Sociely of CPA's

June 30, 2010

Water Management Services Inc
250 John Knox Road #4
Tallahassee FL 32303

INVOICE #82010-0437

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with accounting and
bookkeeping policies, procedures, account classifications, computations and
other matters, January through June 2010:

Retainer, 6 Months at $1,500.00 per month $ 2.000.00
As per accounting and bookkeeping services agreement

Less amount paid: June 11, 2010 (1.500.00)

Baiance Due as of June 30, 2010 $ 7.500.00




Barbara Sheehan Withers, CPA
411 Iive Cak Plantation Road

Statement

Tallahassee, FL 32312
Statement Date:
Aug 26, 2010
Voice: (850) 853-4080 Customer Account ID:
Fax: {850) 883-6375 Water
Account Of Water Management Services
250 John Knox Road, Suite # 4
Tallahassee, FL 32303
Amount Enclosed
$
Date Pue Date Reference Paid Job Amount Balance
6/30/10 7730730 B2610-437 Part 4,500.00 4,500. 00
8/17/10 /16710 n2010-478 1,500.00 €,000.00
Total 6,000.00
i
| 6-30 31-60 J €1-90 over 90 days ]
i ‘ ! '
; §,000. 00 ‘5 0.00 | 0.00 g 0.00 7
L | ? |

You may have forgotten this bili.

Thanks for your

attention.



HOURS SPENT AGAINST RETAINER
AS OF AUGUST 31, 2010

Barbara Withers 34 hrs. @$150
Scott Hutter 27.84 hrs. @$75
Susan Shearer  47.75 hrs. @$50
Total

Paid to daie

Time in excess of payments

Retainer:
Due per previous statement ~ $6,000
Add: Invoice B2010-488

August Retainer 1,500

Billings due as of 8/31/10 7,500

$5,100.00
2,088.00
2,387.50
9,575.50
(4,500.00)

5,075.50




BARBARA SHEEHAN WITHERS

CERTIHED PUBLIC ACCOUNTANT

+ Member
T, o - 3 £hed .
Telephone: {850} 893-4080 477 LivE OAK PLANTATION ROAD American Insitfute of CPAs

Florida insfitute of CP4’s

Facsimile: (850} 893-4375 -
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32372 American Women's Society of CPA's

Emnail: witherscpa@aol.com

December 29, 2009

Water Management Services inc
250 John Xnox Road #4
Tallahassee FL 32303

INVOICE #B200%-615

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED in connection with accounting and
bookkeeping policies, procedures, account classificaiions, compuiaiions and
o’rher matters, during December 2002.. S . I

Barbara § Withers, CPA, 12.75 hours @ $150.00 per hr. $ 1.912.50
scott Hutter, Accountant, 23.5 hours @  75.00.per . 1,762.50

Totdi fees and costs $3.675.00




Barbara Shechan Withers CPA
411 Live Oak Plantation Rd
Tallahassee, FL 32312-2364

(850) 893-4080

August 27, 2009

WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES INC.
250 JOHN KNOX ROAD #4
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32303

FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED IN THE PREFPARATION OF YOUR 2008 INCOME TAX RETURN.

Invoice: B2009-492

TEL: (850) 668-0440

FEDERAT
Form 1120 Page 1
NOL Summary Statement
NOL Deduction Statement (3)
NOL Worksheet (4)

..._Form 43562 . S

Form 4797

Form 7004

Detail Statements (2)
Two Year Comparison

Federal Depreciation Schedile
AMT Depreciation Schedule
Future Fed Depreciation Sch

F1L.ORIDA STATE
Form F-1120 Page 1
Form F-7004 Extension

AMOUNT DUE

$550.00

%/
7



Barbara Sheehan Withers CPA
411 Live Oak Plantation Rd
Tallahassee, FI. 32312-2364

(850) 893-4080

March 9, 2009

ST GEORGE _ISLAND UTILITY CO. LTD.
250 JOHN KNOX RD. #4
Tallahassee, FL 32303

Invoice: B2005-162

TEL: (850) 668-0440

FOR PROFESSIONAL SER VICES RENDERED IN THE PREPARATION OF YOUR 2008 INCOME TAX RETURN.

FEDERAL
Form 1065
Two Year Comparison
Detail Statements
Form 1065 SE Worksheet

Partner Summary o e

~Per Schedule K-1 (8)

AMOUNT DUE

$285.00




Post Buckley

Date Check No. Amount
3/27/2009] 5426 $5,000
4/9/2009 CC $7,500
8/6/2009 1095 $1.235
8/7/2009° 1102 | $7,500
9/9/2009] 1192 | $5,765
2/10/20100 5770 $5,000
5/7/2010/ 5995 $15,000
6/7/2010] 610t $5,000
8/9/2010] 6316 $5,000
8/31/2010| 6404 $4,000
12/10/2010 CC $5,000
1/19/2011 cC $500
2/16/2011 CcC $500
3/11/2011 cC $500
- 48201 - —CC—— $500
5/17/2011 cc $500
6/16/2011 CcC $500
7/18/2011 CcC $500
8/16/2011 cC $500
TO7T8/201T cC 7 $500
9/16/2011 cc | $500
11/16/2011 cc $500
12/16/2011| CC $500
1/17/2012 CcC $500
2/16/2012 CC $500
3/16/2012 CcC $500
| Total $73,500
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S —— A REGIONS

Business Card Pavment Coupon
Please
B Check box and indicate address change on reverse. Enter
. Amount ®
,_ . Accornt No. . Enclosed $ ’ 3 o0, GO‘
Pavment Due Date 03-18-09
Make check de 12 in:
Minimum Pavment Due B133.05 por e e et payable o
New Balance $10.282.09 Mail payment to address below.
fallyghdadldnadladohdiladtolialnddad ] FIA CARD SERVICES
; i PO BOX 15718

*xPOO0LOND

WHEMINGTON-BE—19886-5710

UNIT 4
250 JOHN KNOX RD
TALL AHASSEE FL 32303-4234




M BrcronNs

== > Credit Limit $11,000 Billing Date 022509

] I? 13%11!1311 Plus Tt Ui 511,000 Days in Billing Cycle 31

———— y : Cash Advance Batance $0.00 Pavmenr Dug Date 05-18-09

= 7 or usiness Available Cradit $718 Minimum Payment Due $133.95

—— g Cardholder Statement :

—= & New Balance $14,282.09

me—r— g UNIT 4

_—_—

= " Account Nnmber;

= Page 1 of 1

I CARDHOLDER ACTIVITY !

| Posting|Sale |

i Date | Date | Category . Reference Number Transaciions. Amount
04-10 84-09 | 09974405350000503662520 PAYMENT RECEIVED — THANK YOU 3,000.00CR
04-21 94-20 243013391101 18G0CTOO07S _PBS &.J 01 OF 01850-5751800 FL 7,500.00

Customer Service:

Finance Charges  Total Annunal Percentace Rate 7.14%

Account Sumnmary

300.392.3213, 24 hours - Average Daily Azmual Periodic  Previous Balance $3,750.65

www.frabasinesscard com Daily Perjodic  Percenmtage  Finance  Payments - $3,600.00

- Belance Rate ——Ratwy— — ~Charge  Credifs : B 000

%;‘j;ggggf g—f;m PURCHASES $2,481.62 0.02261% 8.25% $17.40  Purchases/Other + $7,500.00
e : _ CASH 30.00  0.05477% 15.55% 30.00 Debus/Other Fees

For Lost or Stolen Card- PROMO 14 8279930  0.01617% 590%  $1404  Cash Advances + $0.00

300.892.3219, 24 hows Overlimit Feas + 30.00

" Late Payment Fees & $0.00

Finance Charge + $31.44

New Balance = $10,282.0%

Send Billing Inquiries to:
Fia CARD SERVICES.

PO BOX 15184

WILMINGTON DE 19850-5184

Pleasc see the reverse side for information about your account.
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FPlease detach and send coupon with check payable to: Cardmember Service

CPN 000645012

Bank

To change your address or for
CardmemberSenvice-please call:
1-866-552-8855 Every Hour! Every Day!

000000081 1 AT 0.357 105481907384540 P
B MANAGEMENT SRVC

250 JOHN KNOX RD STE 4
TALLAHASSEE FL 32303-4234

!:rhﬂllluulllll;hl11”11];111“1[!”]1:!:i]l:i:]"”:]{]”l]

Capital City e e

Your Account Number:
Total New Balance:

$10,324.33

Minimum Payment Due:

Feb. 06, 2011

;zjéo

Cardmember Service

P.O. Box 790408
St Louis, MO 63178-0408

:izulihl{h!iiiﬁH.’i!ﬂi!iiliiiIuii{hiniﬂulllllh}:hu{[
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Capital City

oV Bank

b January Statement for activity from Dec. 1C, 2010 through Jan. 10, 2011
WATER MANAGEMENT SRVC

Inquiries: 1-866-552-8855
BUS 78 06 Pagelof2

Days in Billing Cycle

32 |

{Activity Summary Payment Information

Previcus Balance.. ... $5,223.52 New Balance ... $10,324.33

Payments . ..o $300.00cR | {Minimum Payment Due (Current Menth) $286.00

Other Credits ..ol $C.00 Minimum Payment Due (Past Due) $0.00

Purchases. ..o, $5,2186.79 Total New Minimum Payment Due £286.00
.| Balance Transters................ $0.00 Payment Due Date.................. Feb. 06, 2011
TTADVAITESS .o, $0.00

Other Debits ...ooeevevevevecnee $0.06 Late Payment Warning: I we do not receive your

Past Dus Amount ... $0.00 minimumspayvment by the date listed above, you may have
tiFees Charged.....cooeiereereee $0.00 to pay up to a $39.00 Late Fee and your APSs may be

Iinterest Charged....one. $184.02 increased up o the Penalty APR of 28.99%.

New Balance ... $10,324.33

Credit Ling ... $12,000.00

Available Gredit......cccovveennene $1,675.67

Statement Clese Date............. Jan. 10, 2011 .

To reduce or avoid paying additional fees and interest charges on your purchase balajte, pay the total new-balance of $70,324.32 by
02/06/11. Any cash bafancs or balance fransfer balance will continue o acorue dally interest until the date your payrment is received.

Post
Date

Trans Ref.

Date Nbr

Description of Transaction

Continued on Next Page

Amount Notation

$300.00cR

$5,000.00



Please detach and send coupon with check payable to: Cardmember Servics CPN 000645012

IIU‘

JBan

To change your address or for
Cardmember Service pleass can L

1-865-552-8805  Every Hotr! Every Day!

000000082 1 AT 0.357 10B481851786258 P
ATER MANAGEMENT SRVC

250 JOHN KNOX RD STE 4
TALLAHASSEE FL 32303-4234

it o g o

 Capital ﬁ*ty A Sr— e s——

Your Account Number: ‘m]

Total New Balance: $10,175.18

Minimum Payment Due:

Cardmember Service

P.O. Box 790408
St. Louis, MO 83179-0408

Wil et g pt g i fod gy




= Cap:tal City

JBan

rhfl; February Statement for activity from Jan. 11, 2011 through Feb. 08, 2011 Inquiries; 1-866-552-88¢
WATER MANAGEMENT.SRVC BUS 578 08 Page1 of

U'

|

Activity Summary ] Payment Information

Previous Balance .................. $10,324.33 New Balance ........cccccvvveeanen. $10,175.19
Payments . .......cocoviiinveireen. $2.000.00cr | | Minimum Payment Due (Current Month) $271.00
Other Credits ..o, e $0.00 Mintmum Payment Due (Past Due) $0.00
Purchases. . ettt $1,680.02 Total New Minimum Payment Due $271.00
Balance Transfers ... $0.00 Payment Due Date................ Mar. 08, 2011
Advances .. $0.00

Other Debits .. $0.00 Late Payment Warning: If we do not racaive your
Pastﬂwoum $0.00 minimum payment by the date listed above, you may have
Fess Charged...

$170.84 increasad up to the Penatly APR 01 28.99%.

$0.00 to pay up to a $39.00 Late Fee and your APRs may be
[nterest Charged

New Balance .. $10,175.19
Credit Line .. e $12,000.00
Available Credit ... ... $1.824 81
Statement Close Date............. Fab. 08, 2011
Days in Billing Cycle ............... 29

To reduces or avold paying additional Fees and interest charges on your purchase balance, pay.the total new balance of $ 10,175.18 by-
03/06/11. Any cash balance or balance transfer balance will continue to accrue daily interest until the date your payment is received.

Post Trans Ref.
_Date  Date Nbr _ Description of Transacxion . Amount Notation—-

02/02  01/30 0289

L

01/i9 01718 0193 PBS&J 01 OFBSO 5750105 FL .............................. $50000 . oo

02/08 INTEREST CHARGE........... S S —— $170.84

Continded an Next Page




Fiease detach and send coupon with check payabie fo: Cardmember Safvice

— - - R TN
____ =Eucapital Gty ) |

< ank

To change your address or for
Cardmember Service please call:
e $-886-552-8855-—Every Hourl Every Day!

000000081 1 AT 0357 106481861188433 F
WATER MANAGEMENT SRVC

250 JOHN KNOX RD STE 4
TALLAHASSEE FL 32303-4234

ll”lih”lhI!l!”!I!“l!”{hl![i!llll!lhI“Hl“"l{!!!l”h!

CPN 0006450712

Your Account Number:
Total New Balance: $1C,117.15

Minimum Payment D

Cardmember Service

P.O. Box 720408
St. Louis, MO 83179-0408

fit sl el Pl B il




Capital City
Bal:ik'

e

“E€S March Statement for activity from Feb. 02, 2011 through Mar. 09, 2011 Inquiries: 1-866-552-8855
WATER MANAGEMENT SRVC Bus 48 08 Pageiof2

r)f-\c:ti\‘rity Summary Payment Information

Previcus Balance ........cooee.e... $10,175.15 New Balance ..o $10,117.15
PAYMIENLS ..o $1,500.00¢ch | | Minimum Payment Due {Current Month) $310.00
Other Credits ... $0.00 Minimum Payment Dua (Past Due) $0.00
Purchases ..oeueeeicencer e $1,231.04 Total New Minimum Payment Due $310.00
Baiance Transfers...... $0.00 Payment Due Dats................ Apr, 06, 2011
Advances............... $0.00

Other Debiis ....4....n $0.00 Late Payment Warning: If we do not racaive your

Past Due Amount ... $0.00 minimum payment by the date listed above, you may have |
Fees Charged.....cceeoiinnens $39.00 o pay up 1o a $39.00 Late Fee and your APRs may be
Interest Charged....ccccccen.eee. $171.92 increased up 1o the Penally APR of 28 899,

New Balance ... $16,117.15 '

CreditLine ..o $12,000.00

Availabie Credit...................... , . $1,882.85

Statement Close Date............. Mar. 09, 2011

Days in Biliing Cycle .............. 29

To reduce or avoid paying additional fees and Interest charges on your purchase balance, pay the total new balance of $10,717.15 by
04/06/17. Any cash balance or halance transfer balance wif! continue to acorue dafly interest untif the date your payment is received.

Post Trans Ref.

Date Date Nbr Description of Transaction Amount Notation

$1,500.00cR

03/07 03/07 0088

PBS & J , =2 = ST

0207

02/15

Continued on Next Page
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"250 JOHN KNOX ROAD &2
TALLAHASSEE, FL. 82303

Pay TQTHE

Plaasa detach and send caupon with check payable to: Cardmember Service CPN 000845012

Your Account Number: ﬁ]
| Total New Balance; $10,479.80 -

To change your address or for
Casdmembar Service pieass call;
1-866-552-8855 Every Hour! Every Day!

Miniminun P: i Due: $326.00

May 086, 2011 |

C00000084 1 AT 0.357 108481032756220F
ir= MENT SRVC

250 JOHN KNOX RD STE 4
TALLAHASSEE FL 22203-4234

“I"Hff__‘!”i'_{fli’II'“I"!"!H"!'h"'"ff'l’}'"i‘i__f_‘{i"

A i

e

-,

Cardmember Service

P.O. Box 780408 -
St. Louts, MO £37179-0408

p’1!l:lnli”mhl“Ilhfl{l”f:”P|dgh;lllﬂhul:”!”]ni
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=ucCapital Cit
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s April Statement for activity from Mar. 10, 2011 through Apr. 08, 2011 Inquiries: 1-866-552-8855
WATER MANAGEMENT SRVC BUS 878 06 Pagetal2

Activity Summary Payment Information

Previous Balance........ccecevvn. $10,117.15 New Balance .........ccooeeeeene. $10,479.80
Payments.....c.ccoeoveceececenecne. $1,000.00ch | |Minimum Payment Due (Current Month) $326.00
Other Credits ..., $0.00 Minimum Payment Due (Past Due) $0.00
Puichases......ccocivvecececs $1,140.14 Total New Minimum Payment Due $326.00
Balance Transfers................... $0.00 Payment Due Date.................. May 06, 2011
AdVANCES oo $0.00

Other Debits .o $0.00 Late Payment Warning: if we do not receive your

Past Due Amouni ... $0.00 minimum payment by the date listed above, you may have
Fees Charged........... $39.00 to pay up to a $35.00 Lale Fee and your APRs may be
Interest Charged $183.51 increased up to the Penalty APR of 28.99%.

New Balance ........ceoeeveeninnns ' $10,479 .80

Credit LiNe ..oeeeee e $12,000.00

Availabie Credit ........ocoeeeene $1,520.20

Statement Close Date........... Apr. 08, 2011

Days in Billing Cycle ............... 30

To reduce or avoid paying additional fees and interest charges on your purchase balance, pay the total new balance of $10,479.80 by
05/06/11. Any cash balance or bafance transfer balance will continue to acorue daify interest untif the date your payment is recaived.

Post Trans
v Date  Date.._b

Description of Transaction . _ Amount MNotation

.04/02.!‘ PAYMENT THANK YOU. $1,000.00cR -

01 OF 856-57501056 FL .../ S L .. 50000 0 --------

PES & J

Continued on Next Page
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Please detach and sand coupan with check payable to; Cardmember Service CPN 000845012

€agsa*§a§ City T |
aﬂéﬁ Your Account Number: ﬁ !
S ;-:3 * Tutal New Balance: $11,054 34 :

$309.00 l

tilU'

Mfmmum Payment Due:

T Tochange youraddress or for
Cardmember Service piease call:
1-866-852-8858  Every Hour! Every Day! Bun 06. 2011 I§

. 0B, H

Mt
PR

000000084 1 AT 0.265 106481075992347 P
Cardmember Servica

WATER CMENT SRVC
ﬂ P.0. Box 790408

T LAraee e B aTE s e St. Louis, MO 63179-0408

Ty [ ety g hogg s s allf g ey et last g benfeghy D gt 1}




eoCanital Cit
Basgek L/

dfj

ST
et

e May Statement for activity from Apr. 09, 2011 through May 10, 2011 Inquiries: 1-868-552-8855
WATER MANAGEMENT SRVC BUS 78 08 Page1lof2

Activity Summary Payment Information
Previous Balance .......cccccce.o.... $10,479.80 New Balance .......ccovevveeveveeeee. $11,054.34
Payments...cccoceenenne $1,000.00cR | {Minimum Payment Due {Current Month) $309.00
Other Credits ..o.ooeeee $0.00 Minirmum Payment Due (Past Due) $0.00
PUrChases ..o eceee $854.83 Total New Minimum Payment Due $309.00
Balance Transfers ............... $0.00 Payment Due Date. ................ Jun. 06, 2011
Advances........... $500.00 :
Other Debits .o $0.00 Late Payment Warning: lf we do not receive your
Past Due Amount ..coveeeeneeene. $0.00 minimum payment by the date listed above, you may have
Fees Charged......... £20.00 o pay vp to a $39.00 Laie Fee and your APRs may be
Interist Charged....c.cvecemae. $i99. 71 increased up to the Penalty APR of 28.99%,.

“[New Balance .....eeceeeinicieeneene o $11.054 34
Credit Ling .o $12,006.00
Available Credit......ccocvven- $945.66
Siatement Close Daig May 10, 2011
Days.in Billing Cycle ............... . 32

To reduce or avoid paying additional fees and inferest charges on your purchase balance, pay the total new bafance of $71,054.34 by
06/06/17. Any cash balance or balanice transfer balance will continue to accrue daily interest until the date yeur payment is recaived.

Post
Date Description of Transaction Amount Notation
05/05 PAYMENT THANK YOU.. . $1,000.00cR

“Purchases and'Qther.Debits . ..

01 OF 850-5780105 FL ..o

0415 PBS & J

Continued on Next Page




WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES, INC.

250 JOHM KNOX ROAD 24
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32303 &-2"5 520

hunmlu-ﬂna: %

BATE

- Jun29, 2011

say @neThousand and DOHOO Dof
' ,C' RDMEMBER SER ?JCE '

% Please detach and send coupon with check payabie to; Cardmember Service CPN 000645072

fapa'%ai City

o T o Eﬁk__ - Your Account Number: . ‘
Tatal New Balance: . $10,786.99

LMinimum Paymernt Due: $339.0C .

To change your address or for
Cardmember Service piease calf:
1-868-552-8865 Eyery Houri Every Day!

[ Jal. 06, 2077

000000088 1 AT 0365 106481116625690 P
Cardimember Service

WATER EMENT SRVC
250 JOHN KNOX 80 STE 4 5.0 Box 790408
TALUAHASSEE FL 393054234 St Louis, MC 63179-0408

J if””lul“”hmufﬁ]hh[l]]l!1”1h!;]ujm“d:m::h:l “I"“I'!’I'MH{FII'I”H“Hjh'l'iiii"dhmﬂm'”ﬂm
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Bank

WATER MANAGEMENT SRVC

Capital City

£ June Statement for activity from May 11, 2011 through Jun. 09, 2011

BUs 78 08

Activity Summary

=

Payment information

Days. in Billing Cycle .............

06/08

05/16

Description of Transaction

Continued on Next Page

Previous Balance ........cce.uo..... $11,054.34 New Balance ........ccoveereeain, $10,786.99
Payments ....cooeeciveennnn $1,000.00cR | |Minimum Payment Due (Current Month) $359.00
Other Credits $0.00. Minimum Payment Due (Past Dug) $0.00
Purchaseas... e ee—— $506.00 Total New Minimum Payment Due £338.00
Balance Transfers............... $0.00 Payment Due Date............... Jul. 06, 2011
AQVaNCES ..., $0.00
Other Debits w.voveeceereciieene e $0.00 Late Payment Warning: If we do not raceive your
Past Due Amount ..cocoeeeeeennnn. $0.00 minimum payment by the date fisted above, you may have
Fees Charged........covreearenes $39.00 10 pay up to a $39.00 Late Fee and your APRs may be
Interest Charged $193.65 increased up to the Penalty APR of 28.999%,
New Balance .. $10,786.99
Credit Line .. $12,000.00
Available Credi... e B $1.213.01
Statement Close Date............. Jun. 09, 2011

- 30

To reduce or avoid paying additional fees and interest charges on your purchase balance, pay the total new baiance of $70.786.99 by
O7/06/11. Any cash balance or balance fransfer balance will continue to accrue daily interest until the date your payment is received.

Amount Notation

$1,000.00¢R

Inquiries: 1-866-552-8855
Page 1 of 2




it

- 601G |
) i
WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES, INC. Nt TP kg S |
250 JOBN KNOX ROAD #4 oy O om T A |
81-775-829 Chegk NHrrgfl;eF 6019

TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32303

BATE

A

Aug 2, 2011

Segury Taglytea, Dolallo on bagic”

oay usandand 08400 Dellars 7
MBER SERVICE

T THE L =

ORDER

Please detach and send coupon with check payakbie to: Cardmember Service CPN Q00645612

Your Acoount Number:
Total New Ealanca: 2 $1 048779

’ Minimum Payment $304.00 ‘J

=wcapital City
Ba!:;k y

dl|

To change your address or for
Cardmember Service please call:

e g 7 ] NS N
1-866-552-8855 Every Hour! Every Dayf [ Aug. 06, 2011 | 5% O§ V) E O,%
000000088 1 AT 0.365 106481153553430 P

TER MANAGEMENT SRVC SRl Rs el SR

m AD STE ¢ £ Box 790408
TALLAHASSEE FL 32303-4234 Sti%‘)f;s’ MOI Tt o
e ey ed 0 bt A g

puafrgfedlyp AL Ly g Prbang)Had [ s




swucCapital City

Za¥Bank
L July Statement for activity from Jun. 10, 2017 through Jul. 11, 2011 Inquiries: 1-866-552-8855
WATER MANAGEMENT SRVC BUS 6s 06 Pagstot2

GENE D BROWN (CPN 000645012)

Activily Summary Payment information

Previous Balance ......evvveeeeen- $10,786.99 New Balance ....cciiiiiiann, $10,487.79
Payments....c..ccooecmcmeneeneen. $1,000.00cr | {Minimum Payment Due (Cutrent Monthy) $304.00
Other Credits ....coovmvivee e $0.00 Minimum Payment Due (Past Due) $0.00
PUTChESES oo $500.00 Total New Minimum Payment Due £304.00
Balance Transfers...eeee $0.00 Payment Due Date............... Aug. 06, 2011
AdVANCES ..ot $0.00

Other Debits .....ocoeeen. $0.00 Late Payment Warning: If we do not receive your

Past Due Amount ... $0.00 minimum payment by the date listed above, you may have
Fees Charged......cccciciniinnne. $0.00 10 pay up to a $39.00 Late Fee and your APRs may be
Interest Charged.......c.cconeeeen $£200.80 increased up to the Penalty APR of 28.99%,

New Balance .....coovvrveeeaceenne $10487.79

Credit Ling s $12,006.00

Available Credit ........ccccorenene. $1.512.21

Statement Close Date............. Jul. 11, 2011

Days in Bilfing Cygle . .ooneee . 32

To reduce or avoid paying additional fees and interest charges on your purchase balance, pay the total new balance of §10,487.79 by
08/06/11. Any cash balance or balance Iransfer balance will continue to accrue daily interest until the date your payment is raceived.

Post Trans Ref.
Daie Date Nbr

Amount Notation

$1.000.00cA

07/05 0056  PAYMENT THANK YOU.

0023

08/16 ATKINS N AMERICA INC 850-575-1800 FL

Cantinied on Maxt Page




a

. 250.JOHN KNOX ROAD#4 ~ - -~ 7 707
ALUAHASSES/FL. 32308~ -

Your Accaunt Number:
' TatatNew Balgncsr— - o

To change your address or for
Cardmember Service please call: o=
1-868-552-8855  Every Hour! Every Day!

T DO0O0D0DB2 1 AT 0.565 10624871201674570 P
Cardmember Service

T EMENT SRVC
250 JOHN KNOX FD STE 4 P.Q. Box 790408
TALLAHASSEE FL 32303-4234 St. Louis, MO 83173-0408
ll|ulli]‘mm|m:|ilil|"]"}hi|iI;l]illlilI}"lzllnhliill

T N T T




2 9Bank

G

ZuaCapital City

5455 August Statement for activity from Jul. 12, 2011 through Aug. 09, 2011
WATER MANAGEMENT SRVC

Inquiries: 1-866-552-88
BUS 8578 08 Page]c

Activity Summary ] Payment Information

Previous Balance ... $10.487.79 New Balance v $10,187 40
Payments......covieeicvvemnieneen $1,000.00cR | |Minimum Payment Due {Curent Month) $280.00
Other Credits ..o $0.00 Minimum Payment Due (Past Due) $0.00
Purchases...cuvieenican $500.00 Total New Minimum Payment Due $280.00
Balance Transfers................ $0.00 Payment Due Date................ Sep. 08, 2011
Advances......ocoevceecveeecienne $0.00 . .
OCther Debits ..cccceveecee v 30.00 Late Payment Warning: If we do not receive your

Past Due Amount .......coo...... $0.00 minimum payment by the date listed above, you may have
Fees Charged............. $6.00 to pay up o a $39.00 Late Fee and your APRs may be
Interest Charged.......... $179.61 increased up to the Penalty APR of 28.99%,.

New Balance .«............... $10.167.40

Credit Ling .ccoveveeeeeenn, $12,000.00

Available Credit..........cccee.... $1,832.60 A

Statement Close Date........ Aug. 09, 2011

Days in Billing Cycie ... 29

To reduce or avoid paying additional fees and interest charges on your purchase balance, pay the totaf new balance of $10,167.40 by
09/06/11. Any cash balance or balance transfer balance wifl continue to accrire daily interest untii the date your payment is received.

Post Trans Ref.
Date Date_. Nbr

08/05 0218

Description of Transaction

Continued on Next Page

Amount Notation

$1,000.00cR




i

- @ DELE WALLET o0t DA IoATE

Please detach and send coupon with check payable tor Cardmember Service CPN 000645012

To change your address crfor
Cardmember Service please cali:
1-866-552-8855 Every Hour! Every Day!

apital Cit A
Bal::k y | -

Your Account Number: ﬁ

| ot New Bafance:——— - ——$106;720:65-}—-——
Minimum Paymeni Due; $295.00 |

Oct. 06, 2011

806000088 1~ AT-0-365—106481243603621 P
ki's EMENT SRVC

"250 JOHN KNOX AD STE 4
TALLAHASSEE FlL 32303-4234

ey fe ey iy d R I g0

Cardmember Service

P.O. Box 780408
St Louis, MO 83179-0408

Ml e gt Ly oy g g e}




- September Statement for activity from Aug. 10, 2011 through Sep. 09,2011 Inquiries: 1-866-552-885¢ :
" WATER MANAGEMENT SRVC s 6n Pege del%
RN

Activity Summary Payment Information f
Pravious Balance .................... $10,167 .40 New Balance ... $10,729.865 :
Payments........oueecveneare. $1,000.00cR | {Minimum Payment Due {(Current Month) $295.00
Other Credits .. $0.00 Minimum Payment Due (Past Due) $0.00 :
PUrchases. ... oo eeeeeieeeeeaee $1,373.42 Total New Minimum Payment Due $295.00
Balance Transfers... $0.00 Payment Due Date......ccc......... QOct. 06, 2011 i
Advances.........ccouuee $6.00

Other Debits .ooveeerece e $0.00 Late Payment Warning: If we do not receive your :
Past Due Amount.......ccceeereae $0.00 minimum payment by the date listed above, you may have |
rees Charged... .o $5.00 10 pay up ¢ a $33.00 Late Fee and your APRs may be ]
Interest Charged......oeeueeeeeees $188.83 | |increased up to the Penalty APR of 28.99%. |
New Balance ........ocovvvvvennn... $10,72965 .
Credit LINe v s $12,000.00 ‘ . '
Available Credit................... $1,270.35 -'
Statement Close Date............. Sep. 09, 2011 . i
Days in Billing Cycie ....ceee.n. 31 * :

To reduce or avoid paying additional fees and interest charges on your purchase balance, pay the total new balance of $10,729.55 by
10/06/17. Any cash balance or balance transfer balance will continue e accrue daify interest untif the date your payment is recaived.

— Post— Trans Ref.
Date Date Nbr Description of Transaction Amount Notation

- 08/25 08B/25 0248  PAYMENT THANK YOU

08/16 _ 0 FL e

Continued on Next Page




d

WATER MANAGEMENT SERWICES, ING. "
250 JOHN KNOX ROAD #4 ; =y . 5 4
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32303 81-275-829 CheckNurmher g4

DARE

- Pes2, 2011

oAy One-TFnoissang.and G0H 00 Bollars

RD MEM'B ER’ S ER\AICE

Plezse detach and send coupon with check payabie to: Cardmemser Servics CPN 000845312 |

= .Capital City |

= Bal‘lk Your Account Number: “ I
Tatal New Balance: -$11,368.03 ) I
Minimum Payment Due: $303.00

Ta change your address or for
Cardmember Service please call:
4.866-552-8865 Fvery Hour! Every Day!

Dec, 06, 2011 |

Q00Go0087 1 AT 0.365 106481328304549 P ) .
Cardmember Service ’

WATER MANBCEMENT SRVC
JCHN KNOX RD STE 4 . PO Box 790408 )
: ood
TALLAHASSEE FL 32303-4234 - St. Louis, Il\lﬂ? 6;’;‘17;?»(;408 |
proprglaj gy ity gyl gl RRHRHE B B R R




=
=
=

Bank

=ualapital City

3T L
"= November Statement for activity from Oct. 12, 2011 through Nov. 08, 2011
WATER MANAGEMENT SRVC

Inquiries: 1-866-552-8855 -

. - BUS 78 o8 Pagefof2 !

Activity Summary Payment Information

Previcus Balance.....o.oooeceeoeeet $11.,337.72 New BalanCe .. oveeeeeecenees $11,368.03
Paymenis. ... $1,000.00¢k | |Minimum Payment Oue (Current Month) $303.00
Other Credis e $0.00 | |Minimum Payment Due {Past Due) $0.00
PUrGhaseS . .vveccee et eeeeeee e $840.0C Total New Minimum Payment Due $303.00
Balance Transiers ... $0.0C Payment Due Dais......ccoceveee Dec. 06, 2011
AdVANCES o $0.00

Other Debits et $0.00 Late Payment Warning: If we do not receive your

Pagt Dus Amount ... $0.60 minimum payment by the date listad above, you may havs
Fees Charged....oceuiiieisvaeence $0.00 10 pay up to a $39.00 Late Fee and yeur APRs may be
Interest Charged...cc.cocverenne. $190.21 increased up to the Penalty APR of 28.99%.

New Balance ....cceiniriciieees $11,368.03

Credit LINe ..o $12.000.00

Available Credit....covvvvenreeeene. $631.97

Statement Close Date............ Nov. 08, 2011

Days in Billing Cycle ............... 28

To reduce or avoid paying additional fees and interest charges on your purchase balance, pay the lofal new balance of $11,368.03 by
12/06/11. Any cash baiance or balance transfer balance will conlinue to accrue daily interest until the date your payment is received.

Trans Ret.
Date

11/05

Description of Transaction

Amount Notation

$1 ,DOQ_._DOCH

Cantinued on Next Page




" WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES, INC.

PAY

FO THE
ORDER
CF:

250 JOHN KNOX ROAD =4
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32303

1Y

@ne Thousand ard 00/100 Dallars
CARD’MEMBER SERVLCE

wwwrmy i D0ban.com

81-275-828

%
W

=t Canital Cit
P!« ey

To change your address or for
Cardmember Service pleass cafl:

- Va
Please detach and send coupon with check payabie v: Cardmember Service

Minimum Payment Due:

CFN 000645012

Your Account Number:
Total New Bafance: $11,337.72

1-866-552-8865 Every Hour! Every Dayl

D00C00092 1 AT 0.365 106481267358053 P
L MENT SRVC

250 JOHN KNOX RD STE 4
TALLAHASSEE FL 32303-4234

el el oot

Cardmember Service

P.0O. Box 730408
St Louis, MO §3179-0408

il}l”:ﬂh“!ih”l:'l“]lII”ﬂ”il:llIﬁlnhui!in]hunﬂ"

L




Salapital City

sa¥Banlk i
. October Statement for activity from Sep. 10, 2011 through Get. 11, 2011 Inquiries: 1-866-552-8855

WATER MANAGEMENT SRVC BUS 5 068 Pagetofz2'’

i Activity Summary Payment Information :
] Previous Balance .....ooeeeveeenee $10,729.65 New Balance .ocoeiceeceeeines $11,337.72
Payments ... $1.000.00¢r | {Minimum Payment Due (Current Month) $361.00 :
g Other Credils .. $0.00 Minimum Payment Due (Past Due) $0.00 i
1 Purchases......cccco. $1,358.23 Total New Minimum Payment Due $361.00 i
‘I Bajance Transfers.... $0.00 Payment Due Date......occcoveee ] Nov. 06, 2011 i
i AGVANCES tiivivereeeerraeemeemeeees $0.00 ]
1 Other Debits ..o $0.00 Late Payment Warning: If we do not receive your :
E Past Due Amouri $0.60 minimum payment by the date listed above, you may have |
Fees Charged.......... $39.00 tc pay up to a $39.00 Late Fee and your APRs may be :
Interest Charged $210.84 increased up to the Penalty APR of 28.99%. :
New Balance ... [T $11.337.72 .
Credit Ling ..o, $12.,000.0¢ 25 ’
Avaijlable Credit...............c.ui. $662.28 : :
Statement Closa Date.. - Oct. 11, 2013 P
Days in Billing Cycle .vnvveeenae. 32 :

To reduce or aveid paying additional fees and interest charges on your purchase balance, pay the total new balance of §11,337.72 by .
11/06/11. Any cash balance or batance transfer balance will centinue fo accrue-dafly interestuntil-the date your payment is recaived.....

x

Post Trans Ref.
Date Daie Nbr Description of Transaction Amount Notation ¢

Payments and Other Grodits

1041 16/08 0148  PAYMENT THANK YOU..ooooooooooeoeeoeeooomeeerorire $1,000.0008 - - - - :

09/16  09/16 0019 ATKINS N AMERICA INC_ 8505751800 ML ... 930000 = --------

Continued on Next Page




- ‘ :
WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES, INC. Erae)
250 JOHN KNOX ROAD 24 im0t ;
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32303 : 81-275-829 Chegk Nurjber  65¢
DATE

JEn3, 2012

PAY Qne Thousand and 004100 Doliars
' CARBMEMBER SERMICE

Flease detach and send coupon with check payable ia: Cardmember Service CPN 0008453712

Capata! City

%ﬁ Ba I'Q . Your Account Number: ﬁ ;

: Totaf New Balancs: $11,419.44 E

Minfmum Payment Due; $324.00 | ]

Fo-ehange-your-address-or-for e Dtle: Daleds ZEme pAmon s Syt En clne i 5 - E
Cardmember Service please call; . = =, o 5 ;
1-866-652-8855  Every Hour! Every Day! Jan. 06,2012 | l 00 0:0:0 | :

' H

000GCO084 1 AT 0.385 106481373538487 F
Cardmember Service

ATE SMENT SRYC _ | ‘
P.O. Box 780408 ‘ :
20 JOHN KNOX RD STE 4 St. Louis, MO 83179-0408 :

TALLAHASSEE FL 32303-4234 g
0] oceng g gebe gt gty T bbby} ey
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Banlk

{

B

s

ECap:tal City

b r December Statement for activity from Nov. 09, 2011 through Dec. 09, 2011

Inquiries: 1-866-552-8855
BUS 78 08 Pageioci2

Activity Summary

Payment Information

Pravious Balance ..., $11,368.03
Payments.................... $1,000.00cR
Other Credits .. $0.00
Purchases... £840.00
Balance Transfers $0.00
Advances .. $0.00
Other Debits «................. $0.00
Past Due Amount ....... $0.00
. Fees Charged......... $0.00
*  |Iinterest Charged.......coeeevememe- $211.41
New Balance .....cccoeeeiiieeeneeens $11,419.44
Credit Ling .o, $12.000.00
Availabie Credit... R $580.58
Statement Close Date... Dec. 09, 2011
Days in Billing Cycle ... 31

New Balance .. .. $11,418.44
Minimum Payment Due (Current Month) $324.00
Minimum Payment Due (Past Due) $0.00
Total New Minimum Payment Due $324.00
Payment Due Date.................. Jan. 06, 2012

Late Payment Warning: if we do not receive your
minimum payment by the date listed above, you may have
o pay up to a $39.00 Late Fee and your APRs may be
increased up to the Penalty APR of 28.99%

To reduce or avoid paying additional fees and interest charges on yourpurchase balance pay zhe rofal new ba!ance of $ 11,478, 44 by
01/06/12. Any cash balance or balance transfer balance will continue to accrue daily interest until the date your payment is received,

Trans—— Refr

Post
Date Date Nbr
12/086 12/05 0135

1115 0019

Description of Transaction

ATKINS N AMERICA ING 850 575- '1800 FL

s Paymems and Other Credits -
PAYMENT THANK YOU

Continusd ori Next Page

Notation




—_
—_—
- 5602
WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES, INC. [ s
250 JOHN KNOX ROAD #4 i R

TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32303 §1.275.825 Check flumiber 602 o

DATE 7 AMOUNT - =

Eg

Feb 1,2012 ig;@oo‘..qé) '

One Thausand.and 0G/100 Dollars
CARDMEMBER SERVICE

FAY

TOTHE B |
QROER 2

 BOX.790408 -
' ST LOUIS, MQ: 53179-0408

Please detzch and send coupon with check payable to: Cardmember Sarvics CPN 000645012 - d

_ - . [
Canital Gty w e ;
" Baﬁk y Your Account Number: ﬁ |

Toial New Bafanca: $11 ,B20.30 :

Minimum Payment Due ; :
Te change your address or for ;
Cardmermber Service pleasecall: - = rEeabaeailiea i e e s [ = 8
1-863-552-8855 Every Hour! Every Day!

000000687 1 AT 0.365 106481419611096 P

WATER ~CuENT SAVE Cardmember Service

. P.0. Box 790408
TALLAHASSEE Fl. 32305-4234 St. Louis, MO 63178-0408 .
i;]:uIixi!Hliu”qmulu:hi “lllli"””liunli

............ lllxalilll
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za¥Bank

January Statement for activity from Dec. 10, 2011 through Jan. 10, 2012
WATER MANAGEMENT SRVC

ZucCapital City

Inquiries: 1-866-552-8855
BUS 8 08 Pagelof2

Activity Summary Payment Information

Previous Balance .......occceeeeeee $11,415.44 New Balance ........cccccereeeeeet $11,520.30
Paymemls ......ccoceiinioeainnnn, $1,000.00ca | | Minimum Payment Due (Current Month) $374.00
Other Credits .....ovvvveecrececenn $0.00 Minimum Payment Due {Past Dug) $0.00
Purchases....cccoceecvieeciciines $840.00 Total New Minimum Payment Due $374.00
Balance Transfers ............... $0.00 Payment Due Date................. Feb. 06. 2012
AGVAINGES 1ot creveeee e $0.00 .

Other Debils ..o iiaraaeees $0.00 Late Payment Warning: if we do not receive your

Past Dus Amount.......... $0.00 minkmum payment by the date listed above, you may have
Fees Charged............... $39.00 to pay up to a $39.00 Late Fee and your APRs may be
Interest Charged.......oeeeeeee. $221.86 increased up to the Penalty APR of 28.99%.

New Balance ... eeeeeennes $11,520.30

Credit Ling ._...ooooveeeeciinaes $12,000:00

Available Credil ... $479.70

Statement Close Date............. Jan. 10, 2012

Days in Billing Cyclg ............... 32

To reduce or avoid paying additional fees and interest charges on your purchase balance, pay the total new balance of §11,620.30 by
02/06/12. Any cash baiance or balance transfer balance wil] continue lo accrue daily inferest until the date your payment is received.

Ref.
Nbr

Trans
Date

Post
Date

Description of Transaction

Continued on Next Page

Amount Notation

$500.00




WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES, INC.

50 JOKN KNOX ROAD #4 sy 00caric com 5678
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIBA 32303 - BlZFEHE2) %
DATE 7 7 - AMODNT
| ) Mar 1, 2012 L AE0EE|

©ne Thousand and 00/100. Dallars

e —— — i amme e gy

Flaase detach and send coupon with check payable fo: Cardmember Service CPN 000845072

. - R O A
Capital City  ~ eyt L |

——)
e

y Baﬂk ‘ Your Account Number;
Total New Balance: $11 561.62 |
\

Minimum Payment Due: $315.00 _J

(il

To change your address or for

Cardmember Service piease call; % :
1-868-552-885% Every Hour! Every Day? Mar. 06. 2012 £ | G § B0 -

- b .

= i
000000085 1 AT 0.374 106481463568358 P :
WATER MANAGEMENT SRVG Cardmember Service 1
> KNOX RD STE 4 ' e e
TALLAHASSEE Fi 52303-4234 St. Louis, MO 631750408
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Bank |
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r—?Capi'&a! City | |
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¢§;E'n February Statement for activity from Jan. 11, 2012 through Feb. 08, 2012 Inquiries: 1-866-552-885:
WATER MANAGEMENT SRVC BUS 78 o0s Page1of:

Activity Summary Payment Information

Previous Balance ................... $11,520.30 New Balance ... $11,561.62

Payments .. ieeeecenneeennnn. $1,000.00¢rR | |Minimum Payment Due (Current Month) $315.00 |

Other Crediis ... $0:00 Minimum Payment Due (Past Due) $0.00 |
a Purchases........cccooieiiiences $840.00 Total New Minimum Payment Due $315.00

Balance Transfers................. $0.00 Payment Due Date.......ccoceen. Mar. 08, 2012

Advances.......coe.. $0.00

Other Debits .. ... $0.00 Late Payment Warning: If we do not receive your

rast Due Amount........ $0.060 minimum payment by the date listed above, you may nave

Fees Charged....creeveeecerenas $0.00 to pay up to a $39.00 L_ate Fee and your APRs may be

Interest Charged.......ccoveueeeeee $201.32 increased up to the Penalty APR of 28.99%.

New Balance ..........coceneene $11,561.82

Credit Line ..o $12,000.C0 |

Avaiiable Credit.....ccooeeviennee $438.38 |

Statement Close Date............ . Feb. 08,2012 i |

Days in Billing Cycle .0 29 - v

To reduce or avoid paying additional fees and interest charges on your purchase balance, pay the total new balance of $11,561.62 by
03/06/12. Any cash balance or balance transfer balance wilf continue to accrue daily interest uniil the date your payment is recaived.

Post Trans Ref.
Date Date  Nbr Description of Transaction Amount Notation

02006 02004 0272 PAYMENT THANK YOU..

0117 01718 00168 ATKINS N AMERICA INC 830-575-1800 FL........ccoooevn.,




WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES, INC. N1 Ly g ;
250 JOHN KNOX ROAD 24 A ek o Bk PR
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32303 _ 81-275-82¢ Chegk Number: 876

DATE

Aprd, 2012

One-Thousatd and 00/% 00 Doflars

_PAY
e CARDMEMBER SERVICE
orper . FoO.BOX 790408 -
JGRT L STALOUIS, MO 83179-0408

Please detach and sand catipon with check payable to: Cardmember Service CPN OODB45G12

T B ‘ Yé—EI:ACSOUanUmbEI'_' 7 =
Total New Balance: i
Minimum Payment Due:
To change your address or for
Cardmember Service please call:
1-866-552-8855 Every Hour!{ Every Day! Anr. 06 2010 | [_% , _
| ) ¥ h 'ér 1
,&
000000082 1 AT 0.374 106481507348722 P
WATER MANAGEMENT SRVC Cardmember Service i
DO D STE 4 £.C. Box 780408
NS VI3 P St. Louis, MO 63175-0408
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- ’ March Statement for activity from Feb. 09, 2012 throcugh Mar, 08, 2012 Inquiries: 1-866-552-8855
WATER MANAGEMENT SRVC BUS 8 gg

Page 1 of2 :

[ Activity Summary Payment information ‘] )
Previous Balance ................. $11.561.62 New Balance ..., $11.611.38
Payments ....c.ooomminiincnnnn $1,000.00cr | | Minimum Payment Due (Current Month) $324 00 i
Other Cradils e $0.00 Mintmum Payment Due (Past Due) $0.00 i
PUrchases...ocemreouiiecene. $840.00 Total New Minimum Payment Due $324.00 ;
Balance Transfers ., $0.00 Payment Due Daite................ Apr. 08,2012 i
Advances.............. 3 $0.00 :

Other Debits ..o $0.00 Late Payment Warning: If we do not receive your

Past Due Amount ... £0.00 minimum payment by the date listed above, vou may have
Fges Charged...eneceeen. $0.00 10 pay up to a $39.00 Late Fee and your APRs may be -
interest Charged...ceicciaees $200.76 increased up to the Penalty APR of 28.99%.

New Balance ......................... $11.611.238 |
Credit LING oo v, $12.000.00 '
Avaitabie Credit................ $388.62

Statement Close Date...... Mar. 09, 2012

Days in Billing Cycle.............. 30

To reduce or avoid paying additional feses and interest charges on your purchase balance, pay the totaf new halance of §11,5611.38 by
04/06/12. Any cash balance or balance transfer balance will continue to acorue daily interest urttil the date your payment is recefved.

Date  Date Nbr Description of Transaction Amount Notation

Payments al

. $1,000.00CR  --------

$500.00

‘Continued on Next Page




—
WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES, ING. & S
250 JOHN KNOX ROAD %4 ooy 0k sos :
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32363 31-275-829 bﬂeck Muraber: - 5827
DATE : .wauy-r
i © May 2, 2042

say One Thousand and 00/ 00 Doliars

CA RDMEM B ER: S:'?VICE

Flease defach and sand coupon with check payable to: Cardmember Sarvice GPN 000645072

é’i’.

Bank

Capr&ai {ﬁy R

Your Account Number: TRISNEREENNTEERS

Total New Balance: $11,716.51
i $380.00

To change your address or for
Cardmember Service please call:
1-866-552-8855 Every Hour! Every Day!

000000080 1 AT 0.374 106487552781120 P

WATER MANAGEMENT SRVC

250 JOHN KNOX RD STE 4
TALLAHASSEE FL 32303-4234

AU g o gy gt e

i i _;E E i =3
[ Mayos, 202 | 1 |1010] 01010
Cardmember Servfce
P.O. Box 790408
St. Louis, MO 83179-0408
[t ety p by sy pppbed gyl gy o141 2
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= April Statement for activity from Mar. 10, 2012 through Apr. 10, 2012 Inquiries: 1-866-552-885¢
WATER MANAGEMENT SRVG BUS & 08 Pageofs

Activity Summary Payment Information |
Previous Balance ... $11,611.38 New Balance................... $11,716.51 |
Payments.....ccoocineernieecene, $1,000.00ch | [Minimum Payment Bue {Current Month) $380.00
Other Crediis oo $0.00 Minimum Payment Due (Past Dus) $0.00 |
Purchases.. ... $840.00 Total New Minimum Payment Due $380.00
Balance Transfers ................ $0.00 Payment Due Dafe.............. May 08, 2012 |
Advances ... $0.00
QOther Debits ._.......... $0.00 Late Payment Warning: If we do not receive your |
Past Dus Amount ... $0.0¢ minimum pavment by the date listed above, you may have
_ |Fees Charged.......... $39.00 io payup 0 a $39.00 Late Fee and your APRs may be |
% [interest Charged.....cocccovueeeee. $226.13 incteased up 1o the Penalty APR of 28.99%. |
New Balance ... $11,716.51 -
Credit Line ... $12,000.00 |
Available Credit........o.cco... $283.49 |
Statement Close Date............. Apr. 10,2012 ) |
Days in Billing Cycle................ 32

To reduce or avoid paying additional fees and interest charges on your purchase balance, pay the fotal new balance of §11,71 6,5f byi
05/06/12. Any cash balance or balance transter balancs will continue to accrue daily interast untfl the date your payment is received. |

—- --~Post— Trans -Ref. ... :
Date Date Nbr Description of Transaction Amount Notation

04/09 04/07 0108 PAYMENT THANK YOU $‘1 000.00cR

03/16 03/16 0018  ATKINS N AMERICA INC 850-575-1800 FL.

Continued on Next Page




Rev. 10/00

',@ Private Client
/
PROFESSIONAL SERVI RE??’ /%
THIS Agreement, made and entered into by and betw€en Pbst, Buckley, Schuh, & Jemnigan, Ine. {PBS&J)

and the Client identified herein, provides for the Profess:onal Services described under ltem 2 of this Agreement.

1S CLIENT FEE OWNER OF PROJECT?

CLIENT: Water Management Services, Ing. — =
ves [ no [E]
ADDRESS: {If answer is NO, please provide namefaddress of owner.)

250 John Knox Road #4
Tallahassee, Florida 32303

NAME/ADDRESS OF OWNER:

CONTACT PERSON: Gene Brown
PHONE NO.- 850-524-6200 FAX NO.: 850-577-0441

SHORT TITLE; Water System Evaiuation DOES CLIENT HAVE OWNER'S
ALUTHORITY FOR THESE SERVICES?

Mives [CIno NIA

PROJECT NUMBER: 150

1. LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF PROJECT SITE:
Potable Water Utility on $t. Gearge Island

2. SCOPE OF SERVICES TO BE PRGVIDED BY PBS&J
.. {if additional pages are necessary, they are identified as Attachment A); _

See Attachment A

3. THE COMPENSATION TO BE PAID PBS&.J for providing the requested services shail be
{if additional pages are necessary, they are identified as Attachment B):

D Direct personnel expense plus a surcharge of , plus reimbursable costs.*
A Lump-Sum charge of M plus out-of-pocket expenses.

EI Unit Costftime Charges identified in Attachment B, plus reimbursable costs.*
* See explanation under ltem number 5 below.

4. IF PBS&J's SERVICES UNDER THIS AGREEMENT ARE DELAYED for reasons beyond PBS&J's control, the fime of
performance shall be adjusted appropriately. Except where the services provided are under a continuous service contract
for more than one year, if the services under this Agreement are delayed for a period of more than one (1) year from the
beginning date (as above provided), the fees shall be subject to renegotiation; any change in such fees shail apply only to

the unfinished services as of the effective date of such change.

IN WITNESS WHEREOQF, this Agreement is accepted on the date written above and subject to the terms and conditions

above stated.

y\gg (SIGN WITH BALL POINT PEN)
CLIENT: Water %Sj Inc. Post, Buckley, Sc /g{fnc :
SIGNED: M / ' SIGNED: '

TYPED N ME. Gene Brown TYPED NAME aei A Sciballi
TITLE: General Manager TITLE: Associate Vice President ,
DATE: DATE: FHseeT B @

Distribution: Copy 1 - PB5&J; Copy 2 - Client; Copy 3 - PBS&J Accounting
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Private Client Rev. 10/00

COMP_ENSAT]DN: Direct personnei expense shall be defined as: the cost of salaries and fringe benefit costs related fo vacation, holiday, and sick leave pay; contributions
for Social Security, V‘{orkers' Compensation Insurance, retirement benefits, and medical and insurance benefits; unemployment and payroil taxes; and other allowed benefits
of those empioyees directly engaged in the performance o the requested service.

Reimbursable costs include: fees of Professional Assotiates (whose expertise is required to complete the pioject) and oul-of-pucket expenses, the cost of which shall be charged
at actual costs plus an administrative charge of 18%, and shall be itemized and included in the invoice.

Typical out—of-pockgt expenses shall include,_ but not be limited 1o, travel expenses (ledging, meals, etc.), job-reiated mileage at the prevailing Company rate, long distance
telephone calls, courier, printing and reproduction casts, and survey suppliss and materials, In the event the requested service involves the use of electronic measuring equipment,
computers, piotters, and cther special equipment such as boats, swamp buggies, efc., an additional direct charge shali be made for the use of this equipment.

It is‘undelrsm_od and agreed that PBS&J'_s services under this Agreement are limited to those described in ltem 2 hereof {and Attachment A, if applicable) and do not inciede
participation in or conirol over the operation of any aspect of the project. Compensation under this Agreement does not include any amount for participating in or controlling any

such oparation.

DQCUMENTS: All original sketches, fracings, drawings, compulations, details, design calculations, and other documents and plans that result from PBS&J's services under
this Agreement are and remain the property of PBS&J as instruments of service. Where such documents are required to be filed with governmental agencies, PBS&J will furnish
copies ta the Client upon request. Reuse of modification by the Client is prohibited. Any unapproved use or modification shall be at Client's or others® saie nisi without liability
or legal exposure to PBS&J uniess approved in writing by PBRS&. prior to such reuse.

INVOICE PROCEDURES AND PAYMENT: PBS&J shall submit invoices to the Cliant for work accomplished during each calendar month. For services provitied on a
Lump Sum basts, the amount of gach monthiy invoice shall be determined on the "percentage of completion method”™ whereby PBS&J will estimate the percentage of the total
work (provided on a Lump Sum basis) accomplished during the invoicing period. Monthly inveices shall include, separately listed, any charges for services for which time charges
and/or unit costs shall apply. Such invoices shalf also include, separately jisted, any charges for Professional Associates and reimbursable costs, Such invoices shall be submifted
by PBS&.J as soon as possible after the end of the month in which the work was accomplished and shall be due and payabie by the Client upon receipt. The Client agrees that
the monihly invoice from PBS&J is comect, conclusive, and binding on the Client unless the Client within twenty (20) working days from the date of receipt of such invoice, notifies
PBS&J in writing of alleged inaccuracies, discrepancies. errors in the invaice, or the need for additional backup.

The Client, as owner or authorized agent for the vwner, hereby agrees that payment as provided hergin will be made for said work within 30 days from the date fhe invoice for
same is maited 1o the Client at the address sef out herein or is otherwise defivered, and, in default of such payment, hereby agrees to pay all costs of collection, including reasonabie

attorney's fees, regardless of whether Jegal action is inifiated. The Client hereby acknowledges that unpald invoices shalf acerue interest at the maximum rate allowed by law
after they have been outstanding for aver 30 days. PBS&J reserves the right to suspend all services on the Client's project without ratice & an invoice remains unpaid 45 days

afier tale of invoice. This suspension shal remain in effect until 2 unpaid invoices are paid in full.

It is understood and agreed that PES&J's services under this Agreement do not include participation, whatsoever, in any iiligation. Should such services be required, a
Supplemental Agreement may be negotiated between the Client and PBS&J describing the services desired and providing a basis for compensation to PRS&.

COST ESTIMATES: Client hereby acknowledges that PBS&J cannot warrant that any cost estimates provided by PBS&J will not vary from actual costs incurred by the Client.
LIMIT OF LIABILITY: The limit of liability of PES&. to the Chient for any cause or combination of causes shall be, in total amount, limited to the fees paid under this Agreement.

CONSTRUCTION SERVICES: If, under this Agreement, professional services are pravided during the construction phase of the project, PBS&J shall not be responsible
for.or_have-control over-means,-methedsiechniques,-sequences, or procedures;-or for-safety-precautions-and programs in-connection withthe Wark; var shall PRBSEI Be -
responsible for the Contractor's failure 1o carry out the Work in accordance with the Gontract Documenis or for the Contractor's faiiure o compiy with applicable laws, ordinances,

fules or regulations.

INSURANCE: PBS&. shall at all times camy Workers' Compensation insurance as required by statute, cammercial generat fiability insurance including bodily injury and property
darnage; automobile Fiability coverage; and professional liability coverage. Insurance certificates will be provided to the Client upon request. Client agrees 1o require that PBS&J

be narned as an additional insured on insurance coverages provided by contractors on the Project.

ASSIGNMENT: Neither the Client nar PES&J will assign or transfer its interest in this Agreement without the written consent of the other.

13
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18.
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SUSPENSION, TERMINATION, CANCELLATION OR ABANDONMENT: In the event the project described in Attachment A, or the services of PBS&.J called for under
this Agreement, isfare suspended, canceled, terminated or abandoned by the Client, PBS&J shall be given seven (7) days prior written notice of such action and stall be
compensated for the professional services provided up o the date of suspension, termination, cancellation or abandonment in accordance with the provisions of this Agreement
for all work performed up to the date of suspension, termination, cancelation ar abandonment, including reimbursable expenses.

PBS&.J may terminate this Agreement for cause by giving Client seven (7) days written notice of the cause and seven (7} days in which {o cure the cause or breach. PBS&J
shall beé compensated for all work performed up to the date of terminafion.

ENTIRETY OF AGREEMENT: This writing embodies the entire Agreement and understanding between the parties hereio, and there are no other Agreements and
understandings, aral or written, with reference o the subject matter hereof that are not merged herein and superseded hereby, No alleration. change or mudification of the terms
of this Agreement shall be valid unless made in writing $igned by both parfies hereto.

PERMITTING: In cases where the scope of services requires PBS&J to submit, on behalf of the Client, a permit application and/er approvai by a third party to this contract,
PEBS&J does not make any warranfies, guarartees or representations as to the success of our effort on behaif of the Client. Payment for services rendered by PBS&J is not
contingert upon the successful acquisition of these pormits.

WAIVER: Any failure by PBS&J to require strict compliance with any provision of this contract shaif not be consfrued as a waiver of such provision, and PRS&) may subsequently
require strick compliance at any time, notwithstanding any grior failure to do so.

HAZARDOUS WASTE, MATERIALS OR SUBSTANCES: Unless otherwise specifically provided in this Agreement, PBS&.J shall not be responsibie for or have contral
over the discovery, presence, handling, removal, transport or disposal of hazardous waste, materials or substances in any form on tne project site.

DISPUTE RESOLUTION: If a dispute arises out of or reiated to this Agreement or the breach thereof, the parties will attemnpt o settie the matier hetween themselves. If no
agreement can be reached the parties agree to use mediation with a mutually agreed upon mediator before resorting to z judicial forum. The cost of a third party mediator will
be shared equally by the parties. ln the event of litigation, the prevafing party wilt be enfitled 1o reimbursement of alt reasonabie costs and attorneys' fees. The parties mutually
agree that a similar dispute resolution dause wilf be contained in all other contracts executed by Client cancerning or refated to this contract and all subcontracts exacuted by

PBS&J.
GOVERNING LAW: This Agreement shall be governed by and construed according to the laws of the State where the situs of the work is located.

LIMITED COPYRIGHT LICENSE: PES&. grants Client a paid-up, non -transferable, non-exclusive license {o make or have made copies aof any copyrightable materials
delivered under this Agreement and specifically marked by PBS&J as "Reproduction Authorized.”

INTELLECTUAI PROPERTY: With the sole exception of specifically marked reproducible materials subject to the Limited Copyright License herein, alf worldwide right, title
and inierest in and {o any and all Intellectual Property conceived, invented, authored or otherwise made by or on this Agreement shall remain the sole and exclusive property
of PBS&J, its successors and assigns unless licensed or assigned by PESE pursuant {0 2 soparaie witien instrument. The temmn "intellectual Property™ shall be construed broaciy

-to include ali forms of intellectual property including without limitation all: inventions, discoveries, designs, pians, improvements, trademarks, service marks and copyrights in

drawings, computer programs. architectural works and in all other original works of avthorship.
ATTACHMENT A - Scope aof Services

ATTACHMENT B - Compensation
ADDENDA {if required)




Payment Schedule

Water Management Services, Inc.
St. George Island, Florida

Water System Evaluation

Lump Sum Amount: | . S61,00000*
Upon Contract Execution: $ 7,500.00 i
September 7, 2009 S 5,000.00
October 7, 2009 S 5,000.00
November 7, 2009 S 5,000.00
December 7, 2009 S 5,000.00
January 7, 2010 S 5,000.00
February 7, 2010 S 5,000.00

March 7, 2010 $ 5,000.00

Aprit 7, 2010 $ 5,000.00

May 7, 2010 S 5,000.00

June 7, 2010 S 5,000.00

July 7, 2010 S 3,500.00

Total: $61,000.00*

Includes 51,590 finance charge.
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SCOPE OF SERVICES

WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES, INC.
ST. GEORGE ISLAND, FLORIDA

WATER SYSTEM EVALUATION

Introduction

PBS&J has prepared a basic scope of services for evaluation of Water Management Services,
Inc. water system for St. George Island, Florida.

PBS&J’s approach to the evaluation includes the following services broken down into tasks as
detailed below. In general, PBS&J will review and evaluate the water system operation, review
mechanical process equipment and structures, identify water system vulnerability, develop
recommendations for capital improvements, and identify long-term goals and objectives for the
water system and update an existing 1995 water system capacity analysis.

" Part1- BASIC SERVICES

Task 1 — Corrective action alternatives for raw water line

PBS&J will develop correction action alternatives for mitigating the raw water pipeline. ——

vulnerability near the new mainland bridge. The task includes a field investigation and review of
the current pipeline routing, the identification of alternatives with preparation of engineering
sketches and estimates of construction. The intent is to provide alternatives that can be
implemented as long-term solution(s) for securing the raw water line currently exposed to
boaters and the public due to shore erosion. Survey work will be required to establish shore and

underwater conditions near the pipeline.

PBS&J will prepare a Technical Memorandum (TM) with the corrective action altermatives
included along with a recommendation for corrective action. PBS&J will provide six (6) draft
copies of the TM for review. A follow-up review meeting will be held at Water Management
Services headquarters on St. George Island to receive comments for incorporation into the final

™.
S1x (6) copies of the final TM will be provided to Water Management Services.

Task 2 — Capacity Assessment update

PBS&J will provide services to update a 1995 Capacity Assessment. The assessment and update
includes 1) a review of consumption demand calculations, 2) review and evaluation of available

T/8/2G0% g 1




documentation to assist in assessment of well field capacity, 3) review and evaluation of
transmission main capacity, 4) review and evaluation of documentation on existing distribution
capacity with determination of modifications needed to upgrade the system to meet current
Franklin County Regulations. The assessment will also review fire flow protection requirements.
Modeling of the distribution system is not included in our scope for this task. We have included
information in Part-2 Additional Services, covering anticipated costs for modeling the water

distribution system.

PBS&J will prepare an update to the Capacity Assessment in a Technical Memorandum (TM)
format including our findings and recommendations. PBS&J will provide six (6) draft copies of
the TM for review. A follow-up review meeting will be held at Water Management Services
headquarters on St. George Island to receive comments for incorporation into the final TM.

PBS&J will provide six (6) copies of the final TM to Water Management Services.

Task 3 — Water system evaluation

PBS&J will conduct a water system evaluation. The objective of this evaluation is to identify
system weaknesses, evaluate both treatment and equipment systems, evajuate structures, conduct
an evaluation of salaries and staffing requirements and identify long-term goals and objectives
for the water system. The results of the water system evaluation will enable the preparation of a
Capital Improvements Plan (CIP). The water system evalunation will include assessment.and .

review of the following water system entities:

e Supply sources and adequacy of supply- PBS&J suggests a review of the availability
and adequacy of water supply be included in the evaluation. Even though quantity of
water supply has never been a problem for Water Management Services. Inc., itisalways - ..

worthwhile to consider looking to the future. Items for inclusion include source capacity,
capacity versus peak demand, review of an emergency curtailment plan should water
supply be lost from the largest well for some period of time, and provide an assessment
of whether the current source of water is the best choice for the long-term.

e Scurce water vulaerability to contamination- the evaluation will inciude a
vulnerability assessment of the water supply to contamination. The evaluation will
investigate potential sources of contamination, review of the well depth, and zone of
contribution from any industrial establishments. The purpose of the investigation is to
become informed about the potential sources of contamination that may exist in an effort
to assess whether the source water is vulnerable to contamination, which may result in

additional treatment cost or expenditures.

Treatment facility evaluation- the treatment facility evaluation will include a review of
the existing facility operation and controls with an on-site inspection of structures and
electrical systems to assess their adequacy. An inspection of each unit process will be
included. Review of maintenance logs and operational logs will be included to review the
preventative maintenance program. The intent is to determine where restrictions or
constraints in operation exist within the treatment facility.

7/872009




¢ Water storage and distribution — PBS&J evaluation will also include a review of
current water storage tanks to determine if security measures are adequate, overflows are
operational, examine level controls and determine if the tanks are in proper condition and
in compliance with current standards. The evaluation will also consist of a review of
distribution system records and interviews with staff to assess the distribution system
maintenance including, hydrant-flushing program, dead end flushing, valve exercising
program, and unaccounted for water mitigation efforts.

e Staffing — review of staffing of the water system. This includes a review of the staff
credentials, duties and salaries to determine if appropriate levels of operational staff and
management personnel are available to properly operate, maintain and manage the water
system. The review will also look into the orgamization structure, review emergency
procedures and assess the approach to record keeping and preventative maintenance

procedures.

o Customer services — Assess Water Management Services, Inc. procedures that are in
place to track customer problems, provide information, answer phone calls and measure

customer satisfaction.

Planning - PBS&J will review Water Management Services, Inc. planning procedures
and identify strengths and weaknesses. The review will inciude an assessment of current

. financial- planning procedures, -review of-operating -cash--reserves- -and contingency
funding, long term planning and management of over expenditures.

PBS&J will prepare a Technical Memorandum (TM} presenting the findings of the water system
. evaluation. The TM will include a presentation of the-system-strengths-and weakness; provide —————-
recommendations for improvements and include a specific list of projects suggested for capital
improvements consideration and budgetary estimates. PBS&J will provide six (6) draft copies of
the TM for review. A follow-up review meeting will be held at Water Management Services, Inc
headquarters on St. George Island to receive commments for incorporation into the final TM.

Six (6) copies of the final TM will be provided to Water Management Services.

All information provided by Water Management Services, Inc. will be held confidential.

Part 2- ADDITIONAL SERVICES

Additional Services will require Water Management Services, Inc. authorization prior to PBS&J
proceeding. If authorized in writing by the Water Management Services, Inc., PBS&]J will
furnish or obtain from others Additional Services of the types listed below. The Water
Management Services, Inc. as indicated in a task order will pay for these Services.

PBS&J recommends Water Management Services, Inc. set aside § 10,000 for shore and

a.
underwater survey to accomrnodate Task 1. The survey will collect pipeline location,

7812008
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topographical information and locate horizontally existing ditches, structures, roads;
fences, etc. found within 15 feet of either side of the pipeline centerline and obtain
easement information. The survey will establish horizontal and vertical benchmarks as
necessary. The survey information will be utilized to assist in the development of
corrective action alternatives in Task 1. Payment for survey work, if performed by
PBS&J, shall be in accordance with the hourly direct labor cost times Factor of 3.00, plus

expenses.

b. Water modeling services- The objective of water modeling is to develop a hydraulic
model of the water distribution system using computer software programming. The goal
is to deliver a reliable model that will be used to make recommendations for expansion
and improvements in the future. Once prepared and calibrated, the model may be
upgraded on a periodic basis to provide information on the distribution system
performance. The first step for building the model is to collect available water system
information including: water system maps (PBS&J would use mapping available),
customer locations and billing records, operational pump station and storage tanks. This
information will be combined in order to create a water distribution model of the system
including piping, pumps and storage tanks. Next, the water demands are applied to the
model] for residential and commercial users based on billing information with typical day
and peak demands incorporated, based on typically demand pattems. The model is then
calibrated using system information collected in the field (by Water Management

. ____ _ _ Services, Inc). Calibration is the process of fine-tuning the model to. match field records.__
This is important to insure that the model results are reasonable and that it is simulating
the hydraulics in the distribution system. Field data will include information from
pressure recorders and flow tests at select locations in the system. The calibrated model is
then used to analyze the system under a variety of flow conditions including fire flow.

o The flow conditions simulated will be selected based on discussions with Water.

Management Services, Inc and are anticipated to include average day and peak day. As
the scope of services for modeling varies greatly, PBS&J recommends Water
Management Services, Inc. set aside up to $ 40,000 for a detailed model.

As an alternative to a detailed water model, a streamlined skeleton model can be a
consideration. This type of model more simplistic and generally un-calibrated. The cost
for developing this type of model is less and PBS&J recornmends that if Water
Management Services, Inc. prefers this choice, consider setting aside at least $20,000.

In either case, payment for modeling work, if performed by PBS&J, shall be in
accordance with the hourly direct labor cost times Factor of 3.00, plus expenses.

c. Services required as a result of Water Management Services, Inc. providing incomplete
or incorrect project information.

d. Fumishing services other than those identified in Basic Services.

e. Or as noted otherwise heretofore. -

Additional Services will be performed on hourly labor rates provided by PBS&J times a
multiplier of 3.00.
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Water Management Services, inc. Invoice Date:  February 12, 2010
Attn: Gene Brown Project #: 100010111
250 John Knox Road #4 Invoice #: 1070046

Tallahassee, FL 32303

Project Description : WMS - Water System Eval
Invoice Commenis:
Invoicing Period : January 01, 2010 to January 31, 2010
L " R
Basic Services o Currerﬁ - -
Lump Sum - T © $5,000.00
Rate Labor $0.00
Multiplier Labor $0.00
Survey Crews $0.00
Direct Expenses $0.00
Sub Consultants $0.00
Total Invoice $5,000.00
Retainage $0.00
Sales Tax
Total Due this lnvoice $5,000.00
Contract Amount : $61,000.00
Previous Billed: $32,500.00
Billed to Date $37,500.00
Contraci Baiance - $23,500.00
Retainage Summary
Held this Invoice: $0.00
Heid to date: $0.00
Remit to:
PBS&J

PO Box 409357
Atianta, GA 30384-9357
Tax ID #: 59-0896138




PBSy

Client;

Water Management Services, Inc.

| Invoice Number 1070046
Project Number 106010111 { Date 12-FEB-10
Project Name: WMS - Water Sysiem Eval1 A i
I Contract Fes Percent Complete Total Farned Previous Eamed Current Billing ﬁ
; !
] Basic Fee $61,000.00 61.48 $@Oﬁ.00 $32,500.00 $5,000.00
] TOTAL NOW DUE ‘ $5,000.00
b |
E |
{ :
:
!
!

————



Water Management Services, Inc. invoice Date:  March 18, 2010
Attn: Gene Brown Project #: 100010111
250 John Knox Road #4 Invoice #: 1073647

Tallahassee, FL 32303

Project Description : WMS - Water Systemn Eval
Invoice Comments:
Invoicing Period : February 01, 2010 to February 28, 2010
m
.. .._BasicServices __ ___  _____ ___  ____ Gurrent_
Lump Sum $5,000.00
Rate Labor $0.00
Multiplier Labor $0.00
Survey Crews $0.00
Direct Expenses $0.00
Sub Consultants - $0.00
Total Invoice $5,000.00
Retainage $0.00
Sales Tax
Total Due this Invoice $5,000.00
Contract Amount : $61,000.00
Previous Biiled: $37,500.00
Billed 1o Date $42 500.00
Contract Balance ; $18,500.00
Retainage Summary
Heid this Invoice: $0.00
Held to date: $0.00
Remit to:
PBS&J

PO Box 409357
Atianta, GA 30384-9357
Tax 1D #: 59-0896138
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Client: Water Management Services, Inc.
Project Number

Project Name:

100010114
WMS - Water System Eval111

[ Invoice Number 1073647

j Date

19-MAR-10

[ Contract Feg Percent Complate Total Earned Previous Eamed Current Billing ]
‘ !
Basic Fee $61,000.00 69.67 $42,500,00 $37,500.00 $5,000.00
TOTAL NOW DUE | $5,000.00




Water Management Services, inc. invoice Date:  April 22, 2010
Attn: Gene Brown Project #: 1000107111
250 Jjohn Knox Road #4 Invoice #: 1076621

Tallahassee, FL 32303

Project Description : WMS - Water System Eval
Invoice Comments:
Invoicing Period : March 01,2010 to March 31, 2010

Basic Services Current

Lump Sum $5,000.00

Total Invoice $5,000.00

Total Due this Invoice $5,000.00
Contract Amount : ' $61,000.00
Previous Billed: $42,500.00
Billed to Date $47,500.00
Contract Balance : $13,500.00
Remit to:

PBS&J

PO Box 409357
Atlanta, GA 30384-9357
Tax ID #: 59-0896138
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|
Client; Water Management Serviges, Inc. | Invoice Number 1076621
Project Number 100010111 ) Date 22-APR-10
Project Name: WMS - Water System Evali 11 |

|
[ Contract Feg Percent Complete Total Earned
] r

Previous Earned Current Billing —I

Basic Fee $61,000.00 77.87 | $47,500.00 $42,500.00 $5,000.00
TOTAL NOW DUE l $5,000.00




Water Management Services, Inc.

Atin: Gene Brown
250 John Knox Road #4
Taltahassee, FL 32303

Project Description : WMS -
Invoice Comments:
tnvoicing Period : April

Water System Eval

01, 2010 to April 30, 2010

Invoice Date: May 18,2070
Project #:
Invoice #:

100010111
1079058

Basic Services
Lump Sum

Total Invoice

Current
$5,000.00

$5,000.00

Total Due this Invoice

Contract Amount :
Previous Billed:
Billed to Date
Contract Balance :

$61,000.00
$47,500.00
$52,500.00

$8,500.00

Remit to:
PBS&J
PO Box 409357
Atlanta, GA 30384-9357
Tax ID #: 59-0896138

$5,000.00
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Client: Water Management Services, Inc. . lnvoice Number 1079058
Project Number 100010111 | Date 18-MAY-10
Project Name: WMS - Water Systern Evali11 }
| i
| Contract Fee Percent Complete Total Earned Previous Earned Current Billing
Basic Fee $61,000.00 86.07 | $52,500.00 $47,500.00 $5,000.00
TOTAL NOW DUE | % $5,000.00




Water Management Services, Inc. invoice Date:  June 15, 2010
Attn: Gene Brown Project #: 1000107111
250 John Knox Road #4 Invoice #: 1081608

Tallahassee, FL 32303

Project Description : WMS - Water System Eval
Invoice Comments:
Invoicing Period : May 01, 2010 to May 31, 2010

Basic Services Current

Lump Sum $5,000.00

Total Invoice $5,000.00

Total Due this invoice $5,000.00
Contract Amount : $61,000.00
Previous Billed: $52,500.00
Billed to Date $57,500.00
Contract Balance : $3,500.00
Remit to:

PBS&J

PO Box 409357
Atlanta, GA 30384-8357
Tax |D #: 59-0896138
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Client: Water Management Services, Inc. | Invoice Number 1081608
Proiect Number 100010111 Date 15-JUN-10
Project Name: WMS - Water Systern Eval111
| ;
Contract Fee Percent Complete Tota! Eamed Previous Earned Current Billing
Basic Fee $61,000.00 94,26 $57,500,00 $52,500.00 $5,000.00
TOTAL NOW DUE

$5,000.00




Water Management Services, Inc. tnvoice Date: March 27, 2009
Atin: Gene Brown Project #: 100007744
250 John Knox Road #4 Invoice #: 1038927

Tallahassee, FL 32303

Project Description ; StGeorge Sanitary Eval
Invoice Comments: oL
Inveicing Period : toMarch 27,2008 '
m
_ _ o ____._Basic Services . o eeene . Curremt
Lump Sum ) $5,000.00
Rate Labor $0.00
Muitiplier Labor $0.00
Survey Crews $0.00
Direct Expenses $0.00
Sub Consultants $0.00
Total Invoice $5,000.00
Retainage $0.00
Sales Tax
Total Due this Invoice $5.000.00
Contract Amount : $10,000.00
Previous Bilied: $0.00
Billed to Date $5,00_0.00
Contract Balance : $5,000.00
Retainage Summary - I"
Held this Invoice: $0.00 4: v on l
Heid to date: $0.00 v

Remit to: A l
PBS&J

PO Box 409357
Atlanta, GA 30384-9357
Tax ID #: 59-0896138
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Ciient: Water Management Services, Inc.
Project Number 100007744

Project Name: StGeorge Sanitary Eval744

Invoice Number 1038927
Date 27-MAR-09

|

K Contract Fee Percent Complete Total Earned Previous Eamed Current Billing |
Basic Fee $10,000.00 50 $5,000.00 $0.00 $5,000.00
TOTAL NOW DUE ; $5,000.00
|



Water Management Services, Inc. invoice Date: July 16, 2008
Afin: Gene Brown Project #: 100008912
250 John Knox Road #4 Invoice #: 1049703

Tallahassee, FL 32303

e e T SR BT e 7T e R Skt I e e S T (T s e e T

Project Description : WMS - Franklin Co Water Quality Research
Invoice Comments:
Invoicing Period : toJune 30, 2009
. -~~~ -~ |
. . __BasicServices_ O ._Current
Lump Sum $1,235.00
Rate Labor $0.00
Muitiplier Labor _ $0.00
Survey Crews $0.00
Direct Expenses $0.00
Sub.-Consultanis $0.00 _
Total Invoice $1,235.00
Retainage $0.00
Sales Tax
Total Due this Invoice $1,235.00
Contract Amount : $2.000.00
Previous Billed: $0.00
Billed to Date $1,235.00
Contract Balance : : $765.00
Retainage Summary
Held this invoice: $0.00
Held to date: $0.00
Remit to:
PBS&J

PO Box 409357
Atlanta, GA 30384-9357
Tax ID #: 59-0896138
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Client:
Project Number
Project Name:

Water Management Services, inc.
100008912

WMS - Franklin Co Water Quag1?

Date

invoice Number 1049703

16-JUL-2009

W‘i

[ Contract Fee Percent Complete Total Eamed Previous Earned Current Billing
Basic Fee $2,000.00 61.75 $1,235.00 $0.00 $1.235.00
TOTAL NOW DUE $1,235.00




Water Management Services, Inc.

Invoice Date:  August 05, 2009

Attn: Gene Brown Project #: . 100008912
250 John Knox Read #4 invoice #; 1051765
Tallahassee, FL 32303

Project Description : WMS - Franklin Co Water Quality Research

Invoice Comments:
Invoicing Pericd : July

Basic Services
T Lamp Sum
Rate Labor
Multiplier Labor
Survey Crews
Direct Expenses
Sub Consuitants

01, 2009 to July 31, 2009

Current
-7 §765.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

Total Invoice

Retainage
Sales Tax
Total Due this Invoice

Contract Amount :
Previous Billed:
Billed to Date
Contract Baiance :

Retainage Summary
Held this Invoice:
Held to date:

$765.00
$0.00

$765.00 %

$2,000.00
$1,235.00
$2,000.00

$0.00

$0.00
$0.00

Remit to:
PBS&J
PO Box 409357
Atlanta, GA 30384-9357
Tax ID #: 59-0896138




PBS) '

Client: Water Management Services, Inc, lf Invoice Numbar 1051765
Project Number 100008912 ; Date 05-AUG-2009
Project Name: WMS - Franklin Co Water Quag12 [ ‘
[ i
[ Contract Fee Percent Complete Total Earned Previous Earmed Current Billing ]
!
Basic Fee $2,000.00 100 $2,000.00 $1,235.00 $765.00
TOTAL NOW DUE ! $765.00




Water Management Services, Inc. invoice Date:
Aftn: Gene Brown Project #:
250 John Knox Road #4 Invoice #:

Tallahassee, FL 32303

Project Description : WMS - Water System Eval
Invoice Comments: Per Confract: Amount due upon execution
Invoicing Period : to August 13, 2009

August 13, 2009
100010111
1052539

e .~~~ " ]

Basic Services ) - B Current _ e
Lump Sum $7,500.00
Rate Labor $0.00
Multiplier Labor $0.00
Survey Crews $0.00
Direct Expenses $0.00
Sub Consultants . $0.00
Total Invoice $7,500.00

Retainage $0.00

Sales Tax
Total Due this Invoice

$7,500.00

Contract Amount : $61,000.00
Previous Billed: $0.00
Billed to Date $7.500.00
Contract Baiance : $53,500.00
Retainage Summary
Heid this Invoice: $0.00
Held to date: $0.00
Remit to:
PBS&J

PO Box 409357
Atlanta, GA 30384-9357
Tax iD #: 59-0896138
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Client: Water Management Services, Inc. | [nvoice Number 1052539
Project Number 100010111 Date 13-AUG-2009
Project Name: WMS - Water System Eval111
| l
| Contract Fee Percent Complete Total Eamed Previous Earned Current Billing |
Basic Fee $61,000.00 12.3 $7,500.00 $0.00 $7,500.00
TOTAL NOW DUE : ’ $7,500.00




Water Management Services, Inc. invoice Date:
Attn: Gene Brown Project #:
250 Johri Knox Road #4 Invoice #:

Tallahassee, FL 32303

Project Description : WMS - Water System Eval
Invoice Comments:
invoicing Period : August 14, 2009 to September 07, 2009

September 22, 2009

100010111
1056439

s

Basic Services Current
Lump Sum $5,000.00
Rate Labor $0.00
) e e o . — e s

Muttiplier Labor

T b 3 2 2 v b o T g P o B
e i 055185 E

Survey Crews $0.00
Direct Expenses $0.00
Sub Consultants $0.00
Total Invoice $5,000.00
Retainage $0.00

Sales Tax
$5,000.00

Total Due this invoice

Contract Amount : $61,000.0C
Previous Billed: $7,500.00
Billed to Date $12,500.00
Contract Balance : $48,500.00

Retainage Summary

Held this Invoice: $0.00
Held to date: $0.00
Remit to:

PBS&J

PO Box 409357
Attanta, GA 30384-9357
Tax ID #: 59-0896138
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Clignt; Water Management Services, inc, : Invoice Number 1056439
Project Number 100010111 Date 22-SEP-2009
Project Name: WMS - Water Systemn Evall 11 .
[ Contract Fee Percent Complete Total Earned Previous Earned Current Billing ]
Basic Fee $61,000.00 20.49 $12,500,00 $7,500.00 $5,000,00
TOTAL NOW DUE ‘

$5,000.00

|
|
|




Water Management Services, Inc. invoice Date:

Attn: Gene Brown Project #: 100010111
250 John Knox Road #4 Invoice #: 1060181
Tallahassee, FL 32303

Project Description : WMS - Water System Eval

Invoice Comments: Per Contract: Amount due upon execution

Invoicing Period : September 08, 2009 to October 07, 2009

Cctober 27, 2009

D —

e . Basic Services____.

Lump Sum

Rate Labor
Multiplier Labor
Survey Crews
Direct Expenses
Sub Consultants

Current

$5,000.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00

Total Invoice

Retainage
Sales Tax
Total Due this Invoice

Contract Amount :
Previous Billed:
Bilied to Date
Contract Balance :

Retainage Summary
Held this Invoice:
Held to date:

$61,000.00
$12,500.00
$17.500.00
$43,500.00

$0.00
$0.00

Remit to:
PBS&J
PO Box 409357
Atlanta, GA 30384-9357
Tax ID #: 59-0896138

$5,000.00
$0.00

$5,000.00
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Client: Water Management Services, Inc. Invoice Number 1060181
Project Number 100010111 i Date 27-0CT-09
Project Name: WMS - Water System Eval111
[ Contract Fee Percent Complete Total Earned Previous Eamed Current Billing
|
Basic Fee $61,000.00 28.69 $17,500.00 $12,500.00 $5,000.00
TOTAL NOW DUE $5,000.00

L




Water Management Services, inc. Invoice Date: December 02, 2008
Attn: Gene Brown Project #: 100010111
250 John Knox Road #4 Invoice #: 1063394

Tallahassee, FL 32303

Project Description : WMS - Water System Eval
[nvoice Comments:
Invoicing Period : October 08, 2009 to October 31, 2008
L. |
Basic Services Current
Lump Sum $5,000.00
--Rate Labor - - el e - 50,00
Muttiplier Labor $0.00
Survey Crews $0.00
Direct Expenses $0.00
Sub Consuitants $0.00
Total Invoice $5,000.00
Retainage $0.00
Sales Tax
Total Due this Invoice $5,000.00
Contract Amount : $61,000.00 ‘
Previous Billed: $17,500.00 ﬂ
Billed to Date $22,500.00
Contract Balance : $38,500.00

Retainage Summary

Held this Invoice: $0.00
Held to date: $0.00
Remit to:

PBS&J

PO Box 409357
Atlanta, GA 30384-9357
Tax ID #: 59-0896138
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Client: Water Management Services, Inc. Invoice Number 1063394
Projact Nurmber 100010111 ‘ Date 02-DEC-09
Project Name: WMS - Water System Evalt11 i
r Contract Fee Percent Complete Total Eamed Previous Earned Current Billing [
: |
} Basic Fee $61,000.00 36.89 | $22,500.00 $17,500.00 $5,000.00
TOTAL NOW DUE _ ; | $5,000.00
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Water Management Services, Inc. Invoice Date: December 29, 2009
Attn: Gene Brown Project #: 1000101114
250 John Knox Road #4 Invoice #: 1065878

Tallahassee, FL 32303

Project Description : WMS - Water System Eval
Invoice Comments:
Invoicing Period : November 01, 2009 to November 30, 2005
.|
Basic Services Current
- Lump Sum o T T 77T $5,000.00
Rate Labor $0.00
Multiplier Labor $0.00
Survey Crews $0.00
Direct Expenses $0.00
Sub Consultants $0.00
Total Invoice $5,000.00
~ .
/ Retainage $0.00
Sales Tax
Total Due this Invoice $5,000.00
Contract Amount : $61,000.00
Previous Bilied: $22,500.00
Billed to Date $27,500.00
Contract Balance : $33,500.00
Retainage Summary '
Heid this Invoice: $0.00
Held to date: - $0.00
Remit to:
PBS&J

PO Box 409357
Atlanta, GA 30384-9357
Tax ID #: 59-0896138
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PBS]

Client:
Project Number

Water Management Serviges, Inc.
1000104111

Invoice Number 1065878

Date 29-DEC-09
Project Name: WMS - Water System Eval111
|
[ Contract Fee Percent Complete Total Earned Previous Earned Current Billing |
Basic Fee $61,000.00 45.08 $27,500L00 $22,500.00 $5,000.00
TOTAL NOW DUE '

$5,000,00




Water Management Services, Inc. Invoice Date:  January 13, 2010

Attn: Gene Brown Project #: 100010111

250 John Knox Road #4 Invoice #: 1066954

Tallahassee, FL 32303

Project Description : WMS - Water System Eval

Invoice Comments:

invoicing Period : December 01, 2009 to December 31, 2008

.- - - ]
Basic Services Current
~ampSum T 850000007 T
Rate Labor $0.00
Multiplier Labor $0.00
$0.00

Survey Crews

Direct Expenses $0.00

Sub Consultants $0.00

$5,000.00

Total Invoice
Retainage $0.00
Sales Tax
Total Due this Invoice $5,000.00
Contract Amount : $61,000.00
Previous Billed: $27,500.00
Billed to Date $32,500.00
Contract Balance : $28,500.00
Retainage Summary
Heid this Invoice: ' $0.00
Held to date: $0.00
Remit to:
PBS&J

PO Box 409357
Atlanta, GA 30384-9357
Tax ID #: 59-0896138




Client;
Project Number
Project Name:

Water Mana
100010111

WMS - water System Eval111

gement Services, Inc,

Invoice Number 1066954
Date 13-JAN-10

L Contract Fee Percent Complete Total|Eamed Previous Earned Current Billing —l
, B — |
Basic Fee $61,000.00 53.28 | $32 500.00 $27,500.00 $5,000.00
TOTAL NOW DUE l $5,000.00
I

;
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Gene 1. Brown, President

Water Management Services, Inc.
250 John Knox Road, Suite 4
Taliakassee, FL 32303

Re:  Water Management Services, Inc.
Cur File No. 44012.01 '

Dear Mr. Brown: L

As a result of our discussions approximately two weeks ago, I am writing to outline my
thoughts concemning your proposal to seek rate relief for your water system located on St. George
Island in Franklin County, Florida. In evaluating your system, [ have utilized primarily your Annual
Report for the cgieﬁdar year ended December 31, 2008 and your tariffs as provided to me.

A review of Schedule F-3(a) (the operating statement); F-4 and W-2 (the statement of rate
base); and Schedule F-5 (the statement of cost of capital); suggests that your system for calendar year
2008 1s earning at ot close to what it could expect the PSC to authorize on a going-forward basis if

such a review or application were based strictly on the calendar year 2008.

As you can see from a review of Page F-4, you reflect an earned rate-of-return of 2.83% and
Schedule F-5 reflects a weighted cost of money of 3.36%. Therefere, you are approximately 0.73%
below your authorized rate-of-return which equates to a revenue deficiency of approximarely
$25,000. I am sure from your perspective given your analysis of the first quarter of 2008 that you
believe that your earnings level will be far bejow what is necessary to operate the Utility on a going-
forward basis for several reasons, Therefors, if we can take those additicnal considerations into

account in someway in seeking rate relief with the PSC, we may be able to justify some significantty

hagher request for increased rates.

Ihave outlined below my thoughts in what manner you might seck rate relief and what items
you might consider reviewing further 2s possible bases for that rate relief.
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June 13, 2009
Page 2

Service Rate Increase

Ir seeking higher rates for your water system, you will have to come up with something that
1s expected to occur in the future or is already occurring, that you cannot only present as a need, but
also as a pecessity and as a foregone conclusion that it will be undertaken and the costs will be
incurred. Severa] factors would come into play in determining whether or not you have an additional

cost that is sufficient to meet the critéria that I think the PSC would demmand:
Whether or Not the Jtem is Required - The best of all worlds is tc have
something such as a replacement of a storage tank, reconfiguration of your
water transnussion lne under the bridge, or the synchronization equipment
that we discussed that is required by a regnlatory agency. In that case, yvou
wouid be much more fikely 1o successfuily present those costs as a proforma
adjustment to rate base and/or operating expenses in a request for rate relief

based upon calendar year 2008.

T future or the addmonal costs you will ncur are not currently being mcurrad
or have been incurred, you still may be able to convince the Comrnission to
allow you to recover the related costs, if you can adequately prove the amount
of those costs by estimate or by actual confracts for construction and/or
maintenance. The more justification you have for ipcurring these costs based
upon a governmental requirement as outiined in Paragraph 1 above, the less
strict the PSC is going to be abouhecogmzmg the basis for the costs that you

ko

ask 10 recover.

Reduction in Water Usage - During our conversations you indicated that there

was 2 substantial reducticn in water usage among your customers. In order
for the PSC to recognize such a reduction as a basis for a rate increase, we

o not only show that It is ocourring for a long enough period of
time to 1nd1cate a Jong-term trend, but we would probably aiso have 1o
provide a detailed explanation of why that change 1s permanent. This is
probably more difficult than demonstrating the need for additional facilities
as outlined in Paragraphs 1 and 2 above.

G

if we were to consider these additional projects as a basis for rate increase, I believe any of
them or even the three of them togsther, could be formulated into a limited proceeding filing a1 the
PSC. As you are probably aware, a request for genera] rate relief usually costs significantly more,
gt least in the initial iling stages, than a limited proceeding. Therefore, if possible, we would like
to pursue a {imited proceeding on those items that you belisve we can justify to form the basis for

a rate Increase.

Rese, Sundsuom & Bentley, LLP
254E Rlzirstonc Pincs Drve, Trllahassee, Flockdz 32301
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June 315, 200%
Page 3

Service Availability Charge Increase

From a standpoint of generating cash flow for the Utility, you must also consider whether or
notachange in Service Availability Policy and specifically in your plant capacity and main extension
charges might also assist the Utility in dealing with shortfalls. From z review of Tariff Sheet No.
41, I see that your plant capacity charge is 8435, your main extension charge is $525, and your meter
installation fee is 5250, I believe that meter installation fee is a reasonable rniurmnber, it not an the

high side of the norm. The other two, however, appear to be relatively low from my experience.

In reviewing the rate base schedule as previously discussed (Schedule F4 and W-2), your
contribution level is presently far below that which the PSC deems not only acceptable, but
desirable. If you review the PSC rules governing the establishment of the appropriate service
availability charges for utilities, the infent is 10 attempt fo create a charge and a policy that will result
in the utility being 75% contributed at the tine of build out. It i1s difficult to tell from your Annual
Report how much additional growth you anticipate within your system, though the final page of

Schedule W-14 in the report suggests that you have a growth potential of approximarely 1,883

additional ERCs (6,000 capacity at build out minus present system capacity of 4,111). I have

assummed that service for those substantial additional units would require additional investment. A
utility can seek an increase in service availability charges based solely on estimates without
demonstrating that it is undertaking or is about tc undertake any additional investment. The PSC
1s meost interested in establishing that 75% contribution ievel.at build out. I believe it is quite
possible that you can increase your service availability charges substantially and obtain approval for
such an increase much easier and at substantially less cost than going through a rate proceeding.

However, it is quite possible this will not be adequate to meet your cash flow shortfall, especially

since your report also indicates you anticipate only 60 new connects per year.

I would however recommend additional review of this issue and analysis. The first step in
doing that will be to estimate the additional facilities that will be required in order for the Utility to
reach build out of its service territory. This will require the services of an enginesr, as well as an

accounting consulfant such as Frank Seidman or Bob Nixon

In addition, if we do seek rate relief of any kind, we may also wish to seek an increase in
service availability charges as part of that application. [ would certainly recommend that under the
circumstances that appear from your Annual Report and your Tanfi.

We would be pleased to work with you further in analyzing the possibilities and moving.
forward m seeking some sort of rate relief] either in the form of service rates or service availability

chargas.

Our legal services will be based upon our time at a rate of $320.00 per hour for partners and
$290 perhour for associates, which is billed monthly. All out-of-pocket exbenses necessarily and
reasonably incurred or expended by us In connection with the matters in which we represent you,

Rose, Sundstrom & Bentley, LLP
2548 Blaltstone Pines Drive, Taliabhassee, Fiorida 32501
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including but not limited to filing fees and costs, photocopy expenses, telephone 2nd telecopy
charges, travel expenses, court reporting and investigation expenses, and other incidental expenses
to the extent they are incurred are charged separately from our hourly fees. We will submit to you
monthly statements for reimbursement of such costs and expepses, as and when incurred by us.
Costs and expenses shall nat be deemed to be a part of the attorney's fees. At this point, I do not
anficipate the necessity for us to incur any travel expenses in connection with this proceeding, nnless

there is a contested proczeding.

In keeping with our policy concerming new clients and major matters, we will require the
payment of an advanced retainer fee of $5,000. This money will be held in our trust account and be
applied to the last bil for service undertaken on your behalf, in this matter. Those monies will not
be appliad o any of the earlier bills.

PP 5
If this arrangement for rendition of our services is acceptable, please sign the place indicated

below for that purpose for our files. We appreciate the confidence which you have shown in our firm

in selecting us to represent you in this matter. We look forward to worldng with you in confidence
< 9-ndi—ﬂ?*fd\_arggs-:—-—r———-——-——— L s

PoRR ik Sy gl i

that our efforts will prove successfinl in ohtaining needed rate

I look forward to working with you and getting started on this as quickly as possible so that
we can alleviate your revenue shortfalls as soon as possible.

Sincerely,

ROSE, SUNDSTROM 7 .
~ / |

F. Marshall Deterding
For The Firm

FMD/tms .
/

Accepted and approved on this ﬂl@?@%&y of V¥ / ¥, 2009.

s

Rose, Sundswom & Bepdey; LLP
2548 Blascstonc Pinzy Drive, Tallzhasser, Florids 32301




LAaW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLP

P.C. BOX 1567
TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32302-1567

F.E.l# 59-2783536 ' {850} 877-8555 PLEASE REFER TO INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING

WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES, INC.

GENE L. BROWN, PRESIDENT

250 JOHN KNOX RD, SUITE 4 AUGUST 10, 2003
INVOICE 40711

TALLAFASSEE, FL 32303 #
FILE # 44012-00001

PAGE 1

|
td

R: GENERAL

REVIEW ANNUAT, REPORT AND TARIFF 2ND OTHER
DOCUMENTS AND NCTES; EBEGIN DRAFPT OF LETTER TO
CLIENT, GENE BROWN, REGARDING SUGGESTIONS AND
PROPOSALS .
CONTINUE REVIEW OF DOCUMENTS; FINISH DEAFT OF 2.60
. LETTER TO GENE BROWN; REVISE, FINALIZE AND SEND ‘
TO BROWN. '
"772z/6% T TREVIEW VARIOUS PRIOR CORRESPONDENCE; REVIEW
ANNUAT, REPORT; ORGANIZE CONFERENCE CALL WITH BOE
NIXON AND SEND EMAILS TO NIXON REGARDING
BACKERGUND
REVIEW ANNUAL REPORT AND PRIOR CORRESPONDENCE;
PREPARE FOR AND PARTICIPATE IN CONFERENCE {ALL
REGARDING WATER RATE PROCEEDING AND REFINZNCING.

6/18/09

§/15/0%

[

7/24/09 .80

TOTAL HOURS

PROFESSIONAL FEES $ 2,6224.00

TELECOFIER

TOTAL COSTS ADVANCED s 3.00

TOTAL STATEMENT




LAW OFFICES

ROSE, SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY, LLp

P.C. BOX 1567

TALLAHASSEE, FLORIDA 32302-1557
F.E4#59-2783536 {850) 877-8555 PLEASE REFER T( INVOICE NUMBER
WHEN REMITTING
WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES, INC.
GENE D. BROWN, PRESIDENT
250 JOHN KWOX RD, SUITE 4 JANUARY 12, 2010
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32303 INVOICE # 416389
FILE # 44012-00001

PAGE 1

MRATTER: (GENERZL

INTRA-OFFICE CONFERENCE REGARDING FINANCING;
TELEPHONE CONFERZNCE WITH DAVE ELGART REGARDING
SAME AND EMAIL TO GENE BROWN REGARDING SAME;
REVIEW EMAILS TO AND FROM CLIENT REGARDING
FINANCING.

REVIEW EMAILS FROM BOB NIKON AND BROWN AND
FORWARD FINANCING CONTACT INFO TO BROWN. - o

12/17/08

12/28/08

=]

TOTAL HOURS .50

PROFESSIONAT, FEES $ 480.00

TOTAL CQOSTS ADVANCED

TOTAL STATEMENT ]
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ROSE SUNDSTROM & BENTLEY LLP
TRUST ACCOUNT (OTA,

PH. 850-877-6555
2548 BLAIRSTONE PIMES DRIVE
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32307

5 pay -
] = . ==
T 1Al Water Management Services, Inc.

k% ORDER OF

Capital City

Qwtalis on
Baek,

1], e
TALLAHASSEE, FL

44012.01

Since 1906 THIS IS YOUR RECEIPT

Checics 2nc other fiems are received {or deposit subject 1o the prov

ng of the Uniforrn Camm

E0RGIA

Farmers and Merchants Bank

www.imbbank.com

NORTH FLORIDA/B0UTH 3
MEMBER F.D.I.C.
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CJ I&/ Carlstedt, Jackson, Nixon & Wilson

CERTIFIED PUBLIC ACCOUNTANTS, PA

James L. Carlstedt C.PA.
Katherine U. Jackson, C.PA
Bobert H. Jackson, C.PA.
Cheryl T. Losee, C.P.A
Bobert C, Nixon, C.PA,
Jeanette Sung, C.PA.

Holly M. Towner, C.PA.
dames L. Wilson, C.PA.

INVOICE

September 14, 2002

Watel Management Services, Inc.
250 John Knox Road, #4
Tallahasses, F1L 32303

S R S — I I S 165
For professional services rendered during August 2008, as follows:
o 1. Review prior rate case order and limited proceeding order and prepare
: Initizl document reguest for preparation of the MFRs $ 2,436.50
3.08

2. Postage and copies 7
$ 243959

Total
e

2560 Guif¢o-Bay Bouievard » Suite 200 ¢+ Cleanwater, FI. 337654432 » Office: (727) 793-4020 + Fox {727) 797-3602 » unow.gjnuw net
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Bife: RCN  NIXON

. ]
Alpha: WATER :
Cflice: MAIN  Main Office

: = Group:  ALL
Engage: GEN Professional Services Biller ALL  Staff
Contract AMoUnt: $0.08 Offica: MAIN  Main Oifice
S@aff Date Type Hours Amount Bill Up/Down Remaining [nvpice Status
Aug 2008
Work Code 197 TYPING .
‘PAD DEALY . 08/19/08 BT 1.06 45.00 46.00
. Rate:  45.00

Client ID: 694 WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES, INC. Engagement: GEN Professional Services

Printed By CLH Carlsiedt, Jackson, Nixon & Wiison CPA's Page
For the Dates:  1/01/1980 - 8/31/2009 Detail Worksheet _ 0S/01/2009 11:74:41
tar Datz Type Hours Amount Bill UglDown  Remaining Invoice Status
PAD DEALY 08/18/08 BT 1.00 48.60 45.00
. . . Rate: 46.00
Work Code 197 TYPING Total: 2.00 82.G0 0.00 0.00 82.00
Wark Code 198.MISCELLANEOLS _
PAD DEALY 08/17/09 BT 0.50 23.00 23.00
e e e o - . e pte AR e ———
PAD DEALY 08/20/08 BT 0.25 11.50 11.50
. Rate: 48.00
Work Code 798 MISCELLANEOUS Total: 0.75 34.50 0.00 0.00 34.50
Work Code 902 POSTAGE : '
ALC Staff 0B/31/09 BX o (s 4G =
Work Code 902 POSTAGE Total: 0.00 1.49 0.00 0.00 149
Work Code 904 XEROX
ALL  Siaff 08/31/08 BX 0.00 1.60 1.60
Work Code 904 XEROX Total 0.00 1.60 0.G0 0.00 1.60
Work Code 2206 RC-REVIEW PRICR QRDERS ,
RGN NIXON 08/18/09 BT 6.50 4,430.00 1,430.00
Rate: 220.00
Work Code 2206 RC-REVIEW PRIOR ORDERS £.50 1,430.00 2,00 : 0.00 1,430.00
Work Code 2404 RC ADMIN-CLIENT DOC REQUEST '
RCN  NIXON 08/12/09 BT 4.00 88C.00 880C.00
2 Rate: 220.00
Work Code 2404 RC ADMIN-CLIENT DOG REQ 4.00 880.00 0.08 0.00 880.00
Aug 2008 Total: 13.25 2,432.59 Q.00 0.00 2,439.58
Client €94 Total; 13.25 2,439.59 . 0.00 0.00] 2,439.53)

D LT S P U S




CJ ]\&/ Carlstedt, Jackson, Nixon & Wilson

CERTIFIED PUBLIC ACCOUNTANTS, PA.

James L. Caristedt, C.PA.
Katherine U. Jackson, C.PA.
Robert H. Jackson, C.PA.
Cheryl T. Lesee, C.P.A.
Robert C. Nixon, C.P.A.
Jeanette Sung, C.PA

Holly M. Towner, C.P.A.
James L. Wilson, C.PA.

INVOICE
Cctober 18, 2008

Water Management Services, inc.

250 John Knox Road, #4

Tallahassee, FL 32303
- - S e P

Far professional services rendered during September 2008, as follows:

1. Prepare MER schedule of CIAC.from last rate case to the end of 2008,
1.020.00

See attached detail work shest

2560 Guifio-Bay Boulevard + Suite 200 ~ Clearwater, FI 337654432 » Office: (727) 7214020 » Faxe (727} 797-3602 » pww.gnmnet
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Alpha: WATER Biiler: RCN NIXON
N ) ‘ Office: MAIN  Main Gifice
R Group:  ALL
Engage: GEN Protessional Services Billerr ALL  Staf
Confract Amdunt $0.00 Office: MAIN  Main Office
Staif Date Type Hours Amount Bill Up/Down Remaining Invoice Status
Engagement Balance Forward  08/01/09 13.25 2,420.58 2,438.59 0.00] 0.00 R
Sep 2008
Work Code 2272 RC-REV/ADS CIAC (HISTORS C)
DAW WESSMAN 09/08/08 BT 1.50 120.00 120.00
Rate:  80.0C
DAW WESSMAN 08/0g/08 BT 825 420.00 420,00 .
. - Rate: 80.00
DAW WESSMAN 09/16/08 BT 4.00 320.00 320.00
- Rate:  80.00
DAW WESSMAN Qs/17/08 BT 2.00 180.00 150.00
Rate: 80.00
Worle Code 2212 RC-REVWADJ CIAC fHISTORIC 1275 1,020.00 0.00 0.00 1,020.00
Engagement: GEN Professicnal Services

Client 1D: 684 WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES, INC.

Staff Date Type Hours Amount Bill Up/Down  Remaining Invoice Status
Engage: GEN - Professional Services ' Biller. - ALL Staff
Contract Amount:  ©  $0.00 Office:  MAIN  Main Cffice -

7 st  Date Tvpe Hows Amm’:;t Bill " Un/Down Remaining Invoice Status

Engagement Balance Forward 05/01/02 342.00 63,240.68 63,238.56 =210 .00 R

Cliént 3836 Total: 7 342.00 63,240.6% B3,238.56 -2:10 ! 0.00

T
= e
. =
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Carlstedt, Jackson, Nixon & Wilson

CERTIFIED PUBLIC ACCOUNTANTS, PA.

James L. Carlstedt, C_PA.
Katherine U. Jacksan; CEA
Bobert H. Jackson, C.P.A.
Chervl T. Losee, C.P.A.
Robert C. Nixon, C.F.A.
Jeanetie Su-ng, C.PA

Holly M. Towner, C_P.A.
James L. Wilson, C.P.A.

INVOICE

November 8, 2009

Water Management Services, inc.
250 John Knex Road, #4
Tailahassee, FL 32303

For professional services rendered during October 2008, as foliows:
$ 1,771.50

[+

1 Preparation of a cash flow_projection for financing purpcses

T e AL L 20 ot P R

2. Begin preparation of the MFR schedules related fo utilty ptant since
lated depreciation, CIAC and accumulated
amortization of CIAC; and balance sheet working capital;, as set forth

the last rate case, accumu
on the enclosed detailed workshest

Total
| a7

s

2.880.00

2560 Guifio-Bay Boulevord + Suite 200 » Clearater, FL 33765-4232 + Office: (7T27) 791-4020 « Fex (727) 797-3602 ~ wuwne.cinw._net
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Alpha WAT=R g
. - Officer MAIN  Main Office
- Group: ALL
Engage: GEN Professional Services Biller: ALL Sk
Contrac Amourt: £0.00 Officer MAIN  Main Ofce
Stait Date Tvpe Hours Amoumi il Up/Down Remaining Invoice Stafus
Engagement Batance Forward 10/31/09 26.060 3,455.58 3,458 53- 0.00} 0.09j R
Oct 2008
Work Code 1071 CASH FLOW PROJECTION
RECN  NIXON 1Q/20/08 BT 6.0C 1,320.00 1,320.00
Rate: 220.00
RCN NIXON 10/21/08 BT 2.00 440.00 440.00
: = . Rate: 220.00
Woark Code 707 CASH FLOW PROJECTION Tot g.0c 1,760.00 0.00 ¢.00 1,760.00
Work Code 198 MISCELLANEOUS
FAD DEALY 10i22/08 BT 4.25 11.50 11.50
’ Rate: 4500
Work Code 198 MISCELLANEQUS Total: 0.25 11.50 0.0C g.0¢ 14.50
Work Code 2270 RC-REV/ADY PLANT (H)
DAW WESSMAN 10/12/08 BT 4.00 320.00 320.00
Rate: 80.00
DAW WESSMAN 10/13/Q8 BT 7.25 580.00 580.00
. : . Rate: 80.00
DAW WESSMAN : 10/26/09 BT 1.75 140.00 : i < 140.00
' ' _ Rate:  80.00
" Staff - Date—Type —Hours. - Amount .3l UB/DGwn_ Remaining nvoice Staius
DAW WESSMAN 10/27/28 BT 7.00 580.00 ) 560.00 7
Rats: 80.00
DAW WESSMAN 10/28/08 BT 7.75 £20.00 820.0C .
. Rate: 80.00
_DAW WESSMAN 10/25/08 BT 325 250.00 260.00
' Rats. 8000
Whavk Code 2210 RC-REV/ADS PLANT (H) Tatal: 31.00 2,480.00 .00 0.00 2,480.00
Work Code 2211 RC-REVWADJ DEPREC (H}
-DAW WESSMAN 10114/09 BT 8.50 520.00 520.0C
Rais: 80.0C
DAW WESSMAN 10/15/08 BT 4.00 320.00 320.00
Rate: 8C.00
DAW WESSMAN 10/30/69 BT L2.00 160.00 : 15000 '
Rafe: 80.00
Woark Code 2211 RC-REV/ADJ DEFPREC (H} Tot 12.50 1,00C.00 0,00 0.00 1,000.00
Work Code 2212 RC-REV/ADJ CIAC (HISTORIC)
DAW WESSMAN 10/15/08 BT 2.00 160.00 160.00
° Rate: 80.00
Work Code 2212 RC-REV/ADJ CIAC (HISTORIC 2.00 160.00 g.00 0.00 160.00
Worle Code 2213 RC-REV/ADY CIAC AMORT (HIST)
DAW WESSMAN 10/15/09 BT 1.258 100.6C 100.00
: Rate: 80.00
Daw W’:‘SS_MAN 10/16/08 BT 1.00 8C.00 80.00
Rate: 80.00
Work Code 22713 RC-REVADS CIAC AMORT (H! 225 180.0C 0.00 Q.00 180.00
Work Code 22715 RC-BAL SHEET WORKING CAPITAL
DAY WESSMAN 10/14/08 BT G.75 £0.00 . 80.00
. Rate: 80.00
Work Code 2295 RC-RAL SHEET WORKING CA 04.75 50.00 0.00 0.C0 60.0C
Oct 2008 Total: 58.75 5,851.50 0.00 ool 5.851.50]
8275 8,111.68 3,455.58 4.a¢ 5_.55‘1.5_0?

Client €34 Total:

i M e e s T B = e st b e AT AL e e ot st




CJ ]\&/ Carlstedt, Jackson, Nixon & Wilson

CERTIFIED PUBLIC ACCOUNTANTS, PA.

James L. Carlsiedt, C.PA.
Katherine U. Jackson, C.P.A.
Robert H. Jackson, C.P.A.
Cheryl T. Losee, C.P.A.
EBobert C. Nixon, C.P.A
Jeanetie Sung, C.P.A.

Heolly M. Towner, C.PA.
James L. Wilson, C.P.A.

INVOICE
December 7, 2009

Water Management Services, Inc.
250 John Knox Road, #4
Tallahasses, FL 32303

. e
For professional services rencered during November 2009, as follows:
1. Finalize schedules of cash flow available for debt service and amount of

o forrg ‘ce;rr_rdebtwhickreould—b&suppor—‘eeé—by—easnﬂewﬁ—_ ) : 220.00
2. Conference with Mr. Brown at our ofﬁces.on 11-4-09 .330,00

3. Review and analysis of depreciation, CIAC and accumulated amoritization to tie
out annual additions to the general ledger 1,041.25
4, Telephone charges i 15.74
3 1.606.99

Total

2560 Gulf-to-Bay Boulevard « Suite 200 « Clearwaiey, FL 337654432 « Office: (727) 7914020 + Fax: (727) 797-3602 = www.gjmo.net
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Hiler "RUN  NIXON

AIDRE VWA | X
Cfficar MAIN  Main Office

Group: ALL
Engage: GE fessi ;
gage: GEN Professional Services Biller,  ALL Staff
Contract Amournt $0.00 Office: MAIN  Main Office
Staii q : ; j
d Date Tvpe Hours Amourt Biil Un/Down Remaining [nvoice Sfatus
Nov 2008
Client ID: 594 WATE? = ; - il : s == _
: ER MANAGEMENT SERVICES, INC. Engagement: GEN Professional Servicas
Staff - Date Type Hours Amount Bilt . Up/Down Remaining INVOITE  ITEuRy
Work Code 102 FINANCING PROJECTION ’
RCN NIXCN 11/03/08 BT 1.0C 220.00 220.00
Rate: 220.00
Work Code 102 FINANCING PROJECTION Taotz 1.0C 220.00 Q.00 0.00 220.00
Work Code 901 TELESHONE '
ALL  Staff 11/13/08 BX 0.00 15.74 15.74
Werk Code 8071 TELEPHONE Total: 0.00 15.74 .00 0.00 15.74
Work Code 2211 RC-REV/ADJ DEFPREC (H)
DAW WESSMAN 11/02/05 BT 1.50 127.5C 127.50
. Rate: 85.00
DAW WESSMAN 11/13/08 BT 1.00 85.00 : 85.00
- Rate: 85.00
-DAW WESSMAN 11/16/0% BT 4.25 361.25 . 361.25
T T ) ‘ T Rate, 8500
Work Code 2211 RC-REV/ADJ DEPREC (H) Tot 8.75 573.75 0.Q0 d,OO 573.75
Work Code 2212 RC-REWADJ CIAC (HISTORIC)
DAW WESSWAN 1147/09 BT 2.00 170.00 170.00
Rate: 8560
DAW WESSMAN 11730709 BT T757 kg 4875
’ Rate: 85.00
Work Code 2272 RC-REVWADS CIAC (HISTORIC 375 318.75 0.00 0.00 318.75 :
Work Code 2213 RC-REVYADJ CIAC AMORT (HIST)
DAW WESSMAN 11/7/08 BT 1.75 148.75 148.75
' Rate; 85.00
Work Code 2213 RC-REV/ADS CIAC AMORT {H! 1.75 148.75 0.00 0.co 148.75
Work Code 2720 OTHER-CONFERENCE
RCN  NIXON 11/04/09 BT 1.50 330.00 330.00
Rafe: 22000
Work Code 2720 OTHER-CONFERENCE Total 1.50 330.00 0.00 0.00 330.00
14.75 1,606:99 0.00 0.00| 1,606.99f

Nov 2605 Total:
7 1,506.99 0.00 0.00 | 1,506.29

Ciient €24 Total: 14.75




Invoice Date \ | Account Nuomber Page.

Dec 22,2009 || e | o

14

T Bl inmacemumbgr Y
| S-442-27751

Fﬁd_!_i_}i ’g'xpresg Shi ;ﬁme_nt Dgtaii By Payor Type (Grigi;?gi}

= Fusl Surcharge - redEx has appied = fue;
+ Distanca Based Pricing, Zone 3

Aufomstion USAB Sender Recipient
Tracking 1D 870943977382 GENE I BROWN DAVID WESSMAN

Service Type FedEx 2Day WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES CPA CARLSTENT JACKSON NIM

Package Type FedEx Pak 256 JOHN KNOX RR STE 4 2560 GULF T1) BAY BLYD STE 208

Zune 03 TALLAHASSEE FL 322303-47234 S CLEARWATER FL 33785 US

Packages 1 ¥

Rated Weight 2.0 tbs, 0.8 kgs

Defivered Nov 30, 2009 11:04 -

Svc Ares A2 Transporiatun Charge ' 1685
Signed by C.HOUGHTON Fuel Surcharge - 065
Fadfx Use 037906043/0006062/_ Tatal Eharge use Lo Lo.o.sum__

R Y P N R S
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. | Invoice Namber N\ | Ipvoice Date \ | Accooni Nimher "\ Pags
, 1af3

[ 5.211-05580 ] Novid 2008 ] _inmmsms

FedEx Express Shipment Petail By Payor Type {Original)

+ Fuel Surcharge - FedEx hex applled a fusl surcharge of J.50% to this shiomen
« Distanca Basad Pricing, Zone 3 a

Ajinmation INET Sepder Becipient
Tracking iD T5F0A79767 20 Gene Brown HobertC Nixor, CPA

Senvice Type FedEx Standard Quernight WaterManagement Servicas, nc. Carlstedt, Jackson, Nixon & Wi .

Package Type FedEx Bax 250 Knox Ruad, No_ 4 2560 GULF TO BAY BLVD STE 200

Zone 03 TALLAHASSCEFL 32308 US CLEARWATER B 33785 US

Packages 1 . g

Rated Weight 8.01lbs, 27 kgs _

Declared Value UsSh 1000 g )

Dediverag Ot 26, 2009 31033 Transperiafion Charge : 2975
Sve Area A7 Fyel Surcharge 218
Sigred by PMCAMANUS Declared Value Charge a0g
FedEx Use 00000C000/0001305, Total Charge uso 3514

7




ANAGEMENT SERVIGE

WATER M

ES
FL" 32302

- 250 JORN KNOX RR. £'4




FedExhas aucied this shipmenti for correctpackeges, weight and service. Any chengas mads are reflected in the invoice smount

o
g

+ Packsge Delivered o Recipient Adoress - Reiwesa Autharized
+  Minimum Biilebie Weightwss appiied.

Automaion USAB Sender Becipient
Tracking 1D 870560220045 GENE BROWN FRANK SEHDMAN
Service Type FedEx Priority Overnighi WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES MCRI
=ckage Type FedEx Tube 250 JOHN KNOX RD STEL 15444 | ST LAKE WAY |
Zoae 04 TAULAHASSEE FL 32363-4234 US JUPITER FL 33488 US
Packages i
Actual Weight 3.0 1bs, 14 kgs
_ Hated Weight 8.0tbs, 27 kgs
Deliversd May 19, 2010 09:24 Transportation Charge 5450
Svc Area Az fuel Surchargs 4.85
Signed by sae above Residentiai Defivery 250
FedEx Use 013811895,/6001530/02 Total Chamge . ush $51.85
Shipper Subtotal usD $88.52
$88.92

Total FedEx Express UsSh
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Fue! Surcharge - FedEx nas zoplied & fuef syrc
Distanca Basad Pricing, Zone 4

FadFx'has au

nerge afg.

this shipmentor corractpackages; we

Package Delivered i Recipient Address - Reizass Ag
Minimum Silable Weight was sopiied.

Miomation
Tracking 18
Service Typs
Package Type
Zone
Packages
Acwai Weight
Rated Weight
Declared Yalue
Delivered

Svc Area
Signed by
FedExUse

USAB
8700773656567

FedEx Priority Overnight

FedEx Tube

04

1

301bs, 14 kgs

6.0 Ibs, 2.7 kgs
Ush 106.00

Fob 25, 2010 89:36
Az

see ahove

0055 13580/0001536/02

Sander

GENE BROVWN

WATER MANAGEMENT SEAVICES
250 JOHN KNOX RD STE2
TALLAHASSEE FL 223034234 US

Transportatien Charge
Residential Delivery
Fuel Surcharge
Declared Value Charge

Tetal Charge
—— e IR

Becipient

FRANK SEITMAN
MRCI

1844 LGST LAKE WAY
JUPITER FL 33458 US







B RN e e

ue - FedEx has applied 2

~ Distsnca Bassd Pricing, Zong 4

+ Pzckage Deiivered io Recipient Address - Jelesse Avthorizad

Automation USAB : Sender - Recipizat

Tracidng I 870077385825 GENE BROWN FRANK SEIDMAN

Service Type FedEx Standard Overnight YWATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES MANAGEMENT & RESULATORY CONSUL

Package Type FedEx Envelope 250 JOHN KNOXRD STE4 18444 L 0ST LAKE WAY

Zone 04 TALLABASSEE F1 32503-4734 US JUPITER FL 33458 US

Fackages 1

Hated Weight N/A

Deiivered Apr 08, 2010 32011 Transportation Charge 21.30

Sve Ares A2 Fuel Surcharge 1.57

Signed by see above Residential Delivery 2.50
usD $25.47

).
b4

. __ Totai tharge

Bl RUEBHIES Doz 22







—

Invaice Ngmber

imyoice Dat

3 oiTErg

; B s}
+ Dislancs Based

Pricing, Zona 4

9-508-85784 !

Feb 23, 2010

% 0 his saipmant

+ Pagkage Jeivsred v RecisientAddress - Aeissse Authorized

Automation
Tracking I
Service Type
Fackage Type
Zone
Packages
Rated Waight
Delbrarad

Svc Araa
Sigred by
Fagbx Use

USAB

FedEx Priorty Ovarnight
FedEx Envelape

4

i

A

Feb 17, 2610 09:51

A2

see above

004717867 /0GI0208/02

Sendar

GEME O BROWN

WATES MANABEMENT SERVICSS
250 JOAN KNOXRD STE 4
TALLAHASSEF F 57305-4234 IS

FRANK SEIBMAN
MRCi

8444 [NST LAKE WAY
JUPITER FL 33458 US

Transportation Charpe < 7340
Fuel Surcharge 1.88
Residentiai Deiivery 250
Total Charge i) 5258







City Blue Reprogranhics

1908 Captal Circle NE #5

Invoice

3
Tallzhassee, FL 32308 ! Date Invoics #
(850) 586-8989 i _ ' '
i 2/25/2010 131603
Biil To
CREDIT CARD
Tems P.C. No.r 1
Net 30 l
Cuantity Descripticn Rate Amount '
26 | Color Line drawing 12.40 312.00T
i
i
Subtota $312.00
Sales Tax (7.5%) 3340

$335.40




<




Invoice

g,

City Blue Reprographics

1908 Capital Circle NE #5 7 i
Tallahassee, FL 32308 Daie g [nvoice £ 3‘
(850) 386-8989 — ] ~ i
R 5/18/2010 | 134319 |
:
| Biil To
[casm |
Rode Cosf
| VAN AT Y
| OWATER Qepeny
i / IO 7 T AT TT 1
i i 4 4 s = Y, - 3 i
i : _
Terms P.C. No.
Due on receipt
Quaniity Description Rate Amount
52} Color Line drawing - 12.00 524 00T
Water Management B ———
]
Subtotai $624.00
Sales Tax (7.5%) S$46.80
| Total  se7080: .|. 2
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WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICE

CHECK REQUEST

DATE: LOLES\!O
AMOTNT: - 1D

PAYEE:  Jenica Dlankership

PURPOSE: Mobood, ey
ACCT. # AMOUNT VENDOR

gD 5 36 TOQEL*‘/ Aue D Seuta sy

—ET S Dok
B 16 & i '
o ke |_coll prorNaLmbiy

(0 ZO

Approired By:




L
F
3

E

L
L
L
E
o I T e e R T e IR BT s e T e Ria e R A, 5 e T S AT TGt et S et - TR g W " i 7 o 1 e 2 A R Ll T £ e PO 5 bt 155 i i




£E PitneyBowes

Postaage Detail
Meter Postage
Tran Post

Purchase Power Account Number: 8000-9006-0035-1753
Customer Identification #: 00465974004 S e S

Page 2 0f 2

Date Date Description Amount
05/28  05/30 Postage Meter Refill - ST GEORGE ISL, FL EY00/SN-3132285 PBP £ $600.00
U8/16  068/17 -Postage Meier Refill - ST GEORGE ISL, FL GEO0/SN-3132285 PBP # $600.00
06/18  08/20 Posiage Meter Befili - ST GEORGE ISL, FL GO00/SN-3132285 PBP #: | $600.00
Sub-Total Meter Postage: $1.800.00
Total Postage: $1,800.00
Payments
Tran Post
Date  Date Description Amount
DEMS  06/20 PAYMENT RECEINVED - THANK YOU - $900.00
Total Payments: - $800.00
Finance Charges , '
Average Daily ANNUAL Periodic
Daity Balance § Perodic Rate PERCENTAGE RATE FINANCE CHARGE
Posiage/Supplies $4.716.70 0.060% 22.00% £82.54
Total Finance Charges: $82.54

important Contact Information

Need Help with this bill?
i

Need Help with your Meler?

Need Help with your Permit Mail?

Calt: 1-800-243-7800 8:00 a.m. 16 800 p.m. EST
Enter your 16-digit account number located
at the lop of this page.

Call: 1-800-522-0020
8:0C a.m. to 8:00 p.m, EST

Visit www sbpermit.com

Visit www.pb.com/MyAccount 1o view your bills, detailed account history and much more

To order supplies visit www.nb.comi/supplies or call 1-B00-243-7824

e,




FITNEY BOWES PURCHASE POWER

PG BOX 5135 FAYMENT COUPON

SHELTON, 57 06484-7137

MAKE CHETKS PAYABLE TO:

Acsounts Payabile *x=NO0G98R7T - !IIIIIH“IIJ HﬂL|Liuﬂu”uuluj“iii ]ItIH‘]IIIIHI*
HATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES INC PITNEY BOWES PURCHASE POHER
253 JOHM KNOX RD STE 4

PO BOX 856042

ALLAHASSEE FL  32363-4235 LOUISVIILE KY GOPBE-5047

Check here and note changes 1o Wher making payments piease reference d
E address and phone number on back your 16-dight account number.

:r.l-i- i




’AY IO’IIIF :

ORDFR OF N

[ IR

T

' Commumtyr '
MBanl(
. 8L f‘eorge Is! I,‘L 323 8

J@M Sy f
e 7

7

PAID ] (etEck |

DUE MONEY 1 l
\L , ORDER |

km‘ DATE /) /=70 | |
EE FROM / Yoter QYIZ(’n&t?t;*mmﬂL/fé/ A T }
m 7/;/ b2 ‘7[ a4 ; DOLLARS
u CIFOR RENT

(IFoR . .
m AOCT: | \ LJjoa FAOMom TG

-G8 |

i %ps FORM 4181




Fed=:zOffice. 5=

FedEx Office is vour destination
for printing and shipping.

3425 THOMASYILLE RD
a]iahassee, FL 32308
Tel: {B50) BBB-5879

6/18/2010 B:16:42 AM EST
Team Member: Roghl G,
Customer: Gane Brown

SALE

Waier management Ser [ty 1 158,18

FS BW SS Standard 2274 8 0.G700 7
0007 Regular Price 0.10

Price per piece  159.78
Regular Total 227 .40
Discounts 58.22

* Benerz] ledger Oty 2 59.70

FS BW 55 Standard 796 @ 0.,0780
0001 Regular Price 0.10

Price per pisce  28.85

Regular Total 79.50
Discounts 19.30
Binder Qty 1 22.08

FS BR 5SS Standerd 173
0001 Regular Price 0.
FS BW Tabs per Tab 1
0072 Regular Frice 0
BinderEconVw 1in Wht 1
4412 Requiar Price 2.8

Frics per pisce 272,08

Regular Tots 23.79

Discounts 1.73
Sub~Tota] 240,94
Tax . 18.07
Ueposit 0.00
Total 258.01

‘-—:;7 AmEx { - 783,01
Ac**ourt -

_ Authi 547228 (4}

Total Tender 53.07
Change Due 0.00

TN M2 el nn nc




Fed fﬂwO

ffice.

FeaEx Klnkess Is now FadSx Office

Jupe 24,2010 14,27 Page: 1
. Receipt £ 530078
=~ MasierCard #
2010108124 10:34
—Q_@ Description Amount
1452 ES B&W S/5 White 8.5 x14 130.58
SubTotal 130,68
Taxes LR
Taotal 140.48

The Cardholder agrees o pay the {ssuer of the tharge

card in avcordante with the a

— —————ssEErendthe CErdholger

greement betwaen the

3425 Thomasville Rd.
Tallahassee, FL 32308
{B30) 688-5678
wwiw.fedexkinkos.com
Please recyzie this receipt.







I A
L%m e e /)

chume 12 Chick-f47-4

Lt Honroc Street FSU (#01370)
= (850) 385-0599
Cparzcor; Ter ry Widensr

CUSTOMER Copy
6/30/2010 12:39:27 Pij
. DRIVE THRU
breer Numer: 1355858

1 'Mzal-CFA Sand 4,00
" Bwi Tes 1§ 1,75
! .Unsut Tea LG 1.75
_SUD Totals §7.50
Tax: oo .97
Total: $6.07
-Discount Total: $0.00
-Change $C.00
Visa; - $8.07
Register:? Tran Seq No: 1355885

_ Cashier:KaRd

It was our pleasure serving vou!

Have a wonderfui day.

V'ViSa
Card Num ;

Terminal : KA13522445001
Anoroval @ 110393

Sequencs 1 064520




SR
Fed=:Office.

. FadEx Kinko's js nowy FedEx Offica
AN
AN
\\\

July 12,2040 92:02 Pags: i
Receipt #: 832112
MasterGard
2010407112 11:08
@ty Descripfion Amount
1058 ES B&W 3/5 Whits 8.5 x11 85,22
? ES B&W 8/8 White 11x17 0.36

SubTotal BS.58

Taxes 7.16

Total 102.74

The Cardholder agrees to pay the Issuer of the charge
card in accordance with the agreament batween the

lssuer and the Cardholder.

e,

3425 Thomasville Rd,
Tallahassee, FL 32308
{850) 668-5679
www.fedexkinkos.com
Please recycle this recsipt.
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Invoice |

City Blue Reprographics

1908 Capital Circle NE 5
Tallahassee, FL 32308 Date invoice # |
350) 386-8989 ' - : '
a8 7/21/2010 | 136014
8ill To
CREDIT CARD
Terms P.OI. No.
Net 30
Quantity - Description Rate Amounit
~, 1.20 4.80T

4124 %36 bond

We appreciaie your business. Thank you. -
Subtotal $4.80

Sales Tax {7.5%)  $0.36

Total $5.16




[




WATER N{ANAGE VIENT SERVICE

CEECK REQUEST

DATE: E:( 1 /.0
avount:  (09.4%
PAYEE: J&S C'P;( L% Ao DSMJQ

PURPOSE: Su ool LU«S

CACCT. # AMOUNT ‘ VEI\TDOR
A 1 tj’\Jq ‘ N c[ ¥,
¥ 20 nrxwe @ 4o kg A 65 )

Q.S ot /{‘JML'O Iy ' i
2.0 - ML/Y\CmL FL%(W/:SA& A%W‘L S d%/fﬂ |
’%"%‘ Lol nn ot Moh/ <

P —

Appro%fed By: %

S
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; ‘er Us About iz 5 -
‘Jm Boo Shrimp appe

, ith entree pyre

I-l‘;-u-\fs Seafood Bars

TaT}ahaSEEd( BRO 222
i.

Server: Sharom Mo, e .

e o SRR —  DBB: oBSigsonin L

08:42 o _ - ggi.“l‘}’;:g'a

Tabls 251 il

i FR IV VY O

|
n P e ~ i
* = Dustomer Oonw % % i
!
]
[
) ‘ |
- J - - !
& S
iy
ry
-,. 3
o
F—j '
. s :







'MINI COMUENIEHCE 570
228 FRAHKLIN ROAD
2T GRGE ISL FL 27328

MINI CONY. STORE

244 FRANKLIN BLVD.

- GEORGE ISLAND
850-927 o4

——Bal-9722 2162

BATCH: 285
§-A-L-£-8 D-R-f

o081
660868144581
REF: B0

CD TYPE: ISR
TR TYPEY PURCHASE
THU:

DATEr MG 77, 18 d8:in:ge

TOTAL $11.97

ACLTe vy L wiey
AP 264931

AKE: HATER MAMASEMERT SERVICES
18% | $6.91

CARBUEREER ACKIAN FEED TUCTRT AF §00DS
AilG/OR SERVICES IH THE AKOUNT OF THE
TUTAL SHOWY HERECH AHD AGREER 10 PERFORM
THE OBLIBATIONS SET FORTH BY THE
CARDHENBER®S ABREEMEHT WITH THE T85uER

THANK #0U! COME AGATH!

" DOZEN $4.79
GLAZED

. $3.59 $7.18
BALANCE DUE $11.97
CREDIT CARD $11.97
CHANGE — 8- 0——
SUB TOTAL $11.97
SURCHARGE  0:000% $0.00
TOTAL TAX $0.00
ToTaL $11.97

CASHIER NAME: DEBORAH KEELE

£O005 ~ #7738 8:04:25  274UG2010

500001 ROOZ

THANKS FOR SHOPPING WITH US
PLEASE COME AGAIN




STATEMENT
MARCIA M. JOHNSON ' i DATE: 8/26/2010
CLERK OF CIRCUIT COURT :

33 MARKET STREET, SUITE 203 _
APALACHICQLA, FLORIDA 32320 AMOUNT REMITIED

TO:

Water Managément Services
139 W Guif Beach Drive
St George Isiand FLL 32328 C

DETACH AND MAIL WiTH YOUR REMITTANCE. YOUR CANCELLED CHECK 1S YOUR RECEIPT.

| DATE _ DESCRIPTION , CHARGES | CREDITS | BALANCE
IEREVIOUS BALANCE :ﬂ
- 7/8/2010|(484) Copies @ $.15 sach - §7280 $72.60

(1) Plat ' ‘ $5.00 $77.60




T ;P AT IR, e 01 B4 1103

WATER MANAGEMENTT SERVlCES INC

139 W GULF BEACH DR .

' STGEORGE ISLAND: FL. 34328

| PAYTOTHE .
" ORDER OF

L% 7, g
A T B P T T B T T
11403 0505749201

DATE_£ ¢ D -/

o /{3 kP/YL]L 5

AMJ‘:‘_’,@Q : %i——

/)f" & L@M ‘La / \J}M% & /o mj 18]

/aO//o

'tﬂ?fl" SJAn

Commumty /{'

anl :

'. st Gec,gea';[FLazzza‘. L




) that was easy.
"l prices. Every item, Every day,
2941 North Monroe Street
Tallahasse, FL 323G3

(850) 3B5-9155
) 1338919 5 008 94570
9 0B/27/10.11:36

REWARDS NUMBER 3216714844

STAPLES 8.5X11 CO
135648
3-ThB FLDR LTR MAN
718103025223
3-TAB FLDR LTR MAN
718103028223
PAPERMATE DESIGNS
071641028483

SUBTDTAL

Standard Ta¥ 7 S0k

TOTAL

MasterCard
Card No.:
Auth Mo, : 080187

TOTAL ITEMS 4

Compare and Save
with Staples-brand products.

THANK YOU FOR SHOPPING &7 STAPLES !
Shop online at www.staples.com

We've updated our Ink Racycling Rewards
program: Starting July 1, 2010,.you’ !l
get $2 back in Staples Rewards
when vou recycle ANY ink or fomer.
Yisit www,.staplesrewards.com

for program details

Ji !!lllilllllfmllllil I




WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICE

CHECK REQUEST

DATE: %l APIRS

: e s a B & A Ne ,
amornt:  G22% 9,39 i) G
= ‘r\ /q j- ) ' . -

PAVEE: o0 ANt My

: 7 : ]
PURPOSE: é%xm‘\\ j e

ACCT.#  AMOUNT VENDOR







gl s rrohase Pawer Aceouni NumbarieesSiiRNINmE—,: - : Page 2 of 2
___E; ?EEﬂE‘?BQW@S Purchase Power Accouni Number L g
U Customer idantification £: 00465374004 e —
=

rnhase Fawer—
_,_——'_—_———_——

Meter Postage
Tran Posl

Dale Date Description Arrrolitt
OB/28 08/27 Postags Meter Kefiil - E900/8N-3132285 PBP & $800.00
09/13 0816 Posiage Meter Refill - GO00/SN-3132285 PBE 2 $800.00
0/24  08/°6 Postage WMeter Refill - 5 S200/SN-3732285 PEF £ $600.00
Sub-Total Meter Posiage: $1,800.00
Toial Postage: $1.800.60
Pavmeanis
Tran Post
Date Pate Description _ Amount
09417 08/7  PAYMENT RECEIVED -- THANK YOU - - $200.00
Total Paymenis: - $%00.00
Finance Charges
Average Daily ANMNUAL . Periodic
Dafiv Balance § Perodic Rate PERCENTAQGE BATE FINANCE CHARGE
Fosiags/Supplies $5.598.58 0.060% 22 D0% $92 75
Total Finance Charges: $92.75

imporiant Coniact information

Need Heip with this bilt? Naed Help with your Heter? MNead Halp with your Permit Mail?
Calk 1-800-243-7800 8:00 a.m. to 8:00 p.rr. EST Call: 1-880-522-002¢C Visit www . pbpermit.com
Enter your 16-digit account number located 8:00 a.m. to 8:00 p.m. ESF
at the fop of this page.

Visit www.pb.com/MyAccount 1o view your bills, detalied account history and much more

To order supplies visiz www.pb.com/supplies or call 1-806-243-75824




PITNEY BOWES PURCHASE POWER
PC BOX 51

SHELTON, CT 084847137

T
5=

$6,066.31 $304.00 10/24/10 $ | 500 0O 'e)

} MAKE CHECKS PAYABLE 7O:

Accounts Pavable =xNO0L0TT4
WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICES INC PURCHASE FOWER

258 JOHN KNOX RD STE 4 PO BOX 371874

TALLAHASSEE FL 32303-4234 PITTSBURGH PA 1525(-7874

Chesk here 2nd note changes to When making payments please referance
i: address and phope number on back your 18-digit account sumber.




mnne, .,

PAPA JDE"’S DYSTER BA

ﬁPAngHIEULﬂ Fl 32378 WRIET 5
B-653-1189 HPRLREHIBBLQ FL 32328
(e, L BB090ER §58-65%-1189
L1 7:28 PN Terwinal B 8R96060:
Server ID: B3 $EP 71, 18 7178 PH
UESR Seryer ID: 82
SAlLE REFH:BZ2
BATCH & 152 AUTH ¢ 713472 SALE REEH: 827
AMOUNT $66.67 BATCH &t 132 RUTH & 71342
TIP . S ___ AMOUNT $66.67
TBTH .._£ TIpP P ——— :
e I, e
TOTAL gt
APPROVED

CUSTOMER COFY

e

ﬂému@zx%

W&v\/ﬁ

WWW

/m,u,Z;

2-A)- 0.




Y

823 Thomasville Road

invoice

I??Se retain this copy for your resords.

Tallahasses, FL 3Z3C3 Dete Invoice #
. Phone {830) 2242657 . —
Fa,f?%%o; 2245658 72372610 70430
| < Bill To Project
Cash- Visa & Mastercard
Due Doie Rep
. S/23/2010 TL
| Quantity Hem Description Rate Amouovnt
I 2 | 30x42 color 24X1I5FT 55.00 110.007
4
Subtofal $11C.0C
_ Received By: ) :
: Sales Tax {7.5%) $8.25

Totat

$118.25




Ve ' T
* City Blue Reprographics

Invoice

1908 Capital Circle NE #5 :
Tallahassee, FL 32308 Date Invoice #
85() 386-8G89
(850) 3 9/13/2010 137319
Bill Te
CREDIT CARD
Terms P.O. No.
Net 30
Quantity _ Description‘ Rate Amount |
2130x175" ) 10.00 1" 20.00T
Thank you. Recat oA .
vou. Received by; Subtotal $20.00
Sales Tax (7.5%) §1.50
Total $21.50




WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICE

CHECK REQUEST

DATE:

/1) 0

AMOTINT

A1 UNT:

BRI

PAYVEE: JpSSico Panteruo

PURPOSE: i lsong o Cnb= Al oL

‘J

o COmiES.

AMOUNT
S A0

ACCT. #

YENDOR

Rode Case

iy Blbe. (SeToops)

400
10
25.90

f' & t

T2 (e Bivs mﬁja‘%@ YR B AN

To iond office. , osit o |
wadmack —=nolys

P = supolys

T uiabnank sbaak {emadis
10 bisa Seatin. o (Rgum§ 2o

ANO IR LD

£ 8.6

To Cday Bung +Fda Jonkad s - (o6

7

Qe <

/ Approved By:
{ :

L

IFL\ . - -
H il
Ly, DU

L4

o

2

———

MG_03 S&L

Lo Sostea. -89




i,




B

#2997 §/27/2010 %89.57 ' TE7008 5726/,

WATER MARACEMENT SERVICES INC ) e moww  ogag
138 W GLLF BEACH bR .
ST GECRGE SULAND FL 37328
vare_ Z=2F-/0 %
s . n
ﬁggﬁ /;V-/l[_’;/:ﬂj_é'_m /:')UjF&—d_zAl/\:r s _;:fﬁ
DOLLARS M B
Cnmmumty

= S

L%M% B

#2999 9/30/2010 $718. 38




Y

o4
Storg £30857 oALE PECELCT

}ggwa} Sandwiches g 5 a 0/05/7” 12:31:10
St ulf Be aCh rwg

G
Rso_gf?rgggga?andu

if‘fips# 52 Ft 32328

}Ef‘k 34

Dwr TROT 100510 e ~I§a§fy
S9-main
Bf? ITEH —— &TY Receipt 3 000004935
.Tr DRICE 5
Lzﬁir'gm’mi o MEHD P’
4$3
,,,,, —BUttlE Fop ) T:; "?‘ggz A
DRK-2%2 1 T§ 0.0 5583
RZoz 1 TE 1.8 )
. 1T 0.9 10020

f ————————
SUBTOTAL 0 o5,

siesTe § 6
TAKE"GUT **TGTAL S
103

CredCarditT TEND & 10

CHANGE DUES 0,00

Thagﬁ you frsm Subway

éﬂﬂrova] Mo 730497

C D ['
Aceotnt No: _3&737

Gard TIssuar; VISH
Amount : $105.17

Signature:

X
I agres
g fo Day ah
o ahove rata? an
g to the card Issuer zgigf
MmNt ,
e

e ———
TTTTTe——

\V

SALE RECEIFT
Store #30857 tko 10/08/10 12:81: 10
Subway Sandwicnes & Salats
183 E. Gulf Beach Drive
5t. George Island
B50-827-4781
Transt 52 Clerk 34 nancy

Dwrl TROT 100510 Reg-1D reg- main
Receipt # (000040381

FL 32328

— I7EW — QTY PRICE MEMD PLU

BMT fr 1 TD§  6.072.10deall213 .
TURKEY  fr 1 T0% §.072.10deat0223
JURKEY  fr 1 TD% £.072.10dea10223
TURKEY  fr 1 TU% 6.077.10deal0223
TURKEY  fr 1 D3 8.072.10dea10223
HAM&CHEESEFr 1 70§ 4.822.10deal0225

4,872 .10dea10225
4,827 .10dea10225
6.572.10ceal0221

HAMGCHEESEfr 1 D%
HAMBCHEESETr 1 TD§
ROAST BEEFfr 1 108

t:::::::::::::HAM&EHEE8£i¥:Z$::$Q$)—fr —— 4099 10deati2E—

BT . fr 1 %  5.072.10deal0213
DRK-2702 f T$ 1.432.10dea?

CHIPS 1 T§ 0,932,10d=al00Z0

TAKE-DUT #+70TAL % 108,17
GradCardAWT TEND $ 103,17

CHANGE DUES 0,00

Thank you from Subway

foproval Na: 736197
Reference No: 736197
ACCOUNT ehummae i siiding,.
Card Issuer; VISA
Amount: $1G3.17

Sigrature:
X

I agree to pay goove tatal amount
according te the Card Issuer Agreement,

Take aur T-mipute Survey at
www=@eiisubway.com and rageive & r.en
COOkiE._ Keep vour receipt and write
your unigue coupon code

fers

Host Qrder ID: O9x




TEZ B23 Thomasville Road

Talinhasses, FL 32363 B‘\ﬁfe

Phone {850} 224-249 — N

Fax {8501 224-6658 10/4/2010 l 700/ ‘,
Bill To | Project

Cash- Visa & Mastercard State Park Water Improvements

{ .DoeDate | Rep |
10/4/2010 | aM
Quaontity lrem Déscription - Rate Amounit
23 -24x36 bond o 1.25 | 41257 .
13 24336 color ' o 12.00 132.007T
Subtetal $173.25
Received By: ' ,
Sales Tax (7.5%) $12.99

Please retain this copy for your records.

Total ‘ $186.24




WATER MANAGEMENT SERVICE

CHECK REQUEST

PURPOSE:

ACCT.#  AMOUNT VENDOR A%v2ghio | ©ruten
| K éq‘ﬂ%@ A8 B o HhaSs ¥+ Loa Seety
: ¢ v U X0 ar At — S m e
i IR 7YY U S oobhae
5% 900 T SHEC B iPouwles -
L0 % Ciby Bue (3 = Bialoles
= . JQS—F @[%; { 20 =
\?\Lz Q‘-}«/ k L'EU., ““"CﬁPd\-*b’
: "aa | — Drpnbes {0 o/

5 tqw 13%’ {%).)Sp ZZ&.*D TN leﬂ_‘gﬂf—\ .

Approved By: %




!QS%Egi LANE H#B82
140 FRANKLIN BLVO.

EASTPOINT FL.

850-827-5005

TP12803402-001 EXPRESS LANE B8
140 FRANKLIN AVE

EASTPOINT FL 32328

Descr. gty amount

<CUSTOMER COPY>

DASANT 2002 4 3.96

T WRIG DOUBL 1 1.69
Sub Total 5.65

Tax 0.12

TOTAL 5.77

CREDIT $ 5.77

CARD TYPE: MASTERCARD

CARD NAME: BLANKENSHIP/JESSICA C

ACCT NUMBER: “ie iy
TRANS TYPE: SALE

APPROVAL: 258612 INVOICE: 015804
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SALE RECEIPT

+ A s o~ - -
tore #30357 i*ko 10/06/1¢ 12:38.:03

Sgbway sandwiches & Salads
gpa é' Guif Beach Drive
t. George Island Fl 3232
850-907-4787 SM?
Trans¥ 51 Llerk 54 nancy
Bwr1 TRDT 100810 Reg-ID reg-main

i Receipt # 0000040475
- ITEM -— a7y PRICE MEMD PLU
TURKEY TF 1 TD$ 6.07Z.10dea 10773

TRKEY  fr 1 D8 5 072 . 10dea 10222

: u ML Lond
;URKEV o1 10§ B.077. 10dea 10273
URKEY fro 1 10§ £.072, 10dea 10723
TURKEY o1 T8 6.072.10dea10223
TURKEY  #r 1 1D$ _B.072.10dex10997

DAt nrec-—e
SUBTOTAL § 163.87
Sales Ta& § 1.26
L
TAKE-OUT *+TOTAL £ 110.583
CredCardAHTrTEND”$ 11Q;§§ 7

CHANGE DUES 0.00

Thark you from Subway

Approval No: 0258668
Refsrence No: 0255GEY

Account o weesiuRRRRERENNS |
Card Issuer: VISA
Amount: £110.93

Signature:

X
T agree to pay above tofal amount

according to the Card Issusr Agreement.

i
Take our T-minute Survey at
www.te?]subway.eam and receive a Treg
sookiz,  Keep your receipt and write
your Unioue coupon CooE

nere

~

Host Order ID: D4v.laks

- SALE RECEIPT
tore 30057 tko 10/08 2:38:
Sfbwgy Sandwiches & Sa]adé 10 12:38:08
- 183 E. GuIT Beach Drive
ST. George Island FL 37328
850-927-4781 )
Transé 57 Clerk 34 nang
Pwrt TROT 100810 Reo-I0 reé—main
. Receint # 0000040476
;GékéTEM - ATY PRICE MEMO 2iy
oofr 118 6.072. 1008210023

%5?&55 IF T TD% 5.072 . 10dea 10723

£ ir 1703 6.072.10dea 10223
;ngzY fro 1 7ps 8.072,10dea10723
i EY fr ] ID$ 6.072.10deg 10222
TURKEY Fr 1 I 6.072 . 10dea1n772

BNAQT prrre. _
SUBTOTAL § 103,87
Saies Ta § 7.28

__CredCardT TEMD § 110,33,

TAKE-QUT *4TCTAL §  110.93

CHANGE DUE® 0.00

Thark vou from Subway

dpproval No: 025688
Reference No: (25589
Account Mo
Card Issuer: VISA
pmaunt: $110.83

Signature:

X
I agree 1o pay ahove toial amount

according to the Card Tssuer Agreement.

Tzke our 1-minute Survey at

wiw . te])subway.com and receive a free
cookie.  Keep your receipt and write
yoUr unigue cougon code

here

Host Order ID: D4y, laks




invoice Numbsr N\

lgvsice Datz \| Account Number ™\

dEx has app

.
= Histence Besed Prring, Zone 3

+ Fadfx has andited this shipmentfar carrect packages, weighi, and sersce. Any chrenges made are reflacted & his invokce amount.
. e

.

Psrkage Defiversd o Recipient Address - Red
Minimum Biifable Weightwas apofied,

Asriomatior
Tracking iD
Samvice Tvpe
Package Type
Zung
Packages
Acwal Weight
Raied Weight
Beclared Value
Dsliverad

Sve Area
Signed by
FedEx Usa

7-271-48870

Oct 25, 2010

1513-93572-7

00% 1o this shipment,

USAB
870943977447

FedEx Standard Overnight

FedEx Tube
G2

i
Z0Jbs, 0.9 kes

‘whibs, 2 7 kas

Ush 100.00

Sep 77, 2010 tx58

Ad -

" see above
G26712134/0001305/02

g Authorizad

Sentier
GENE BROWN

WATER MANABEMENT SERVICES
250 JOHN KNOX RD 5754
TALLAHASSET FL 374035238 US

Tramsportafion 31.00
flesidennal Defivery 250
Declared Value Charge .00
Fuaf Surcharge 235

LES THOMAS ,
2480 POINT VIEW CIRCLE
GAINESVILLE GA 36505 US

L T e

Total Charge

usp

o,
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