

Des Moines Public Schools

Reference Number	Type	QTY	ACP CreativIT			Anixter Inc.			CDWG			Ford Incentives - Solo NY			Howard Industries Inc.		
Device: Surface Pro 7+			Cost/Each	Ext. Cost	Make/Model	Cost/Each	Ext. Cost	Make/Model	Cost/Each	Ext. Cost	Make/Model	Cost/Each	Ext. Cost	Make/Model	Cost/Each	Ext. Cost	Make/Model
Basis of Design: Gumdrop Droptech Case, Part#01M000E01-0	Base	2,200	No Bid			No Bid			\$27.93	\$61,446.00	Spec	No Bid			No Bid		
Alternate 1.1	Alt		\$24.81	\$54,582.00	Kensington K97950WW	\$31.11	\$68,442.00	DUX STM-222-260L01	\$25.96	\$57,112.00	InfoCase AO-SNP-MSPR06	\$13.50	\$29,700.00	Solo UNS2021-4BB24	\$9.00	\$19,800.00	Belkin B2B081-C00
Alternate 1.2	Alt					\$25.56	\$56,232.00	MAX MS-ES-SP-G7BLK	\$26.04	\$57,288.00	Targus THZ804GL						
Alternate 1.3	Alt					\$25.56	\$56,232.00	CODI C30705048	\$22.33	\$49,126.00	MAX MS-ES-SP-G7BLK						
Alternate 1.4	Alt								\$16.58	\$36,476.00	Higher Ground						
Alternate 1.5	Alt								\$30.85	\$67,870.00	UAG-SFPRO4-BLK-VP						
Device: Surface Laptop Go																	
Basis of Design: UAG Rugged Case, Part#332602B14343	Base	13,200	No Bid			No Bid			\$21.32	\$281,424.00	Spec	No Bid			No Bid		
Alternate 2.1	Alt		\$19.79	\$261,228.00	Kensington K97651WW	\$28.89	\$381,348.00	DUX STM-222-314L01	\$25.96	\$342,672.00	InfoCase	\$15.75	\$207,900.00	Solo UNL2022-4BB24	\$14.00	\$184,800.00	Belkin B2A070-C01
Alternate 2.2	Alt					\$20.00	\$264,000.00	CODI C30705055									
Alternate 2.3	Alt																
Manufactured & Shipped Domestically				YES			YES			YES			NO			YES	

Reference Number	Type	QTY	HPI International			iBenzer, Inc.			Innovative Office Solutions			Malor & Company Inc			Nitsom Promotional		
Device: Surface Pro 7+			Cost/Each	Ext. Cost	Make/Model	Cost/Each	Ext. Cost	Make/Model	Cost/Each	Ext. Cost	Make/Model	Cost/Each	Ext. Cost	Make/Model	Cost/Each	Ext. Cost	Make/Model
Basis of Design: Gumdrop Droptech Case, Part#01M000E01-0	Base	2,200	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
Alternate 1.1	Alt		\$22.75	\$50,050.00	Kensington K97950WW				\$32.64	\$71,808.00	Kensington K97950WW	\$23.50	\$51,700.00	Kensington K97950WW	\$17.30	\$38,060.00	Nitsom
Alternate 1.2	Alt								\$9.01	\$19,822.00	Kensington K62610WW						
Alternate 1.3	Alt																
Alternate 1.4	Alt										OK			OK			
Alternate 1.5	Alt										No, Sleeve						
Device: Surface Laptop Go																	
Basis of Design: UAG Rugged Case, Part#332602B14343	Base	13,200				No Bid			No Bid						No Bid		
Alternate 2.1	Alt					\$18.00	\$237,600.00	iBenzer	\$27.72	\$365,904.00	Kensington K97651WW				\$12.70	\$167,640.00	Nitsom
Alternate 2.2	Alt								\$9.01	\$118,932.00	Kensington K62610WW						
Alternate 2.3	Alt																
Manufactured & Shipped Domestically				YES			YES			NO			YES			NO	

Des Moines Public Schools

Reference Number	Type	QTY	Now Micro			SHI International			Sehi Computer Products Inc			Specially Inksiland and Extras, Inc			Sterling Computers		
Device: Surface Pro 7+			Cost/Each	Ext. Cost	Make/Model	Cost/Each	Ext. Cost	Make/Model	Cost/Each	Ext. Cost	Make/Model	Cost/Each	Ext. Cost	Make/Model	Cost/Each	Ext. Cost	Make/Model
Basis of Design: Gumdrop Droptech Case, Part#01M000E01-0	Base	2,200	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
Alternate 1.1	Alt		\$22.50	\$49,500.00	MAX MS-ES-SP-G7BLK	\$46.27	\$101,794.00	Targus THD495GL	\$23.21	\$51,062.00	MAX MS-ES-SP-G7BLK	\$19.93	\$43,846.00	MAX MS-ES-SP-G7BLK	\$21.75	\$47,850.00	MAX MS-ES-SP-G7BLK
Alternate 1.2	Alt		\$27.00	\$59,400.00	Targus THZ804GL	\$21.24	\$46,728.00	Targus THZ804GL									
Alternate 1.3	Alt																
Alternate 1.4	Alt							OK			OK			OK			OK
Alternate 1.5	Alt							OK									
Device: Surface Laptop Go																	
Basis of Design: UAG Rugged Case, Part#332602B14343	Base	13,200	No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid			No Bid		
Alternate 2.1	Alt		\$21.75	\$287,100.00	Targus THZ779GL	\$21.24	\$280,368.00	Targus TZZ779GL									
Alternate 2.2	Alt																
Alternate 2.3	Alt																
Manufactured & Shipped Domestically					NO			YES			NO			NO			YES

Reference Number	Type	QTY	Staples Technology Solutions			Techcycle Solutions			Tierney			ThinkSpace IT			Zones, LLC		
Device: Surface Pro 7+			Cost/Each	Ext. Cost	Make/Model	Cost/Each	Ext. Cost	Make/Model	Cost/Each	Ext. Cost	Make/Model	Cost/Each	Ext. Cost	Make/Model	Cost/Each	Ext. Cost	Make/Model
Basis of Design: Gumdrop Droptech Case, Part#01M000E01-0	Base	2,200	No Bid			\$27.75	\$61,050.00	Spec	No Bid			No Bid			\$40.50	\$89,100.00	Spec
Alternate 1.1	Alt		\$32.77	\$72,094.00	UAG-SFPRO4-BLK-VP				\$ 22.94	\$ 50,468.00	MAX MS-ES-SP-G7BLK	\$28.44	\$62,568.00	Targus THZ804GL			
Alternate 1.2	Alt											\$59.99	\$131,978.00	Kensington K97950WW			
Alternate 1.3	Alt																
Alternate 1.4	Alt				OK			OK						OK			OK
Alternate 1.5	Alt													OK			
Device: Surface Laptop Go																	
Basis of Design: UAG Rugged Case, Part#332602B14343	Base	13,200	\$22.25	\$293,700.00	Spec	\$28.00	\$369,600.00	Spec	No Bid			No Bid			\$25.90	\$341,880.00	Spec
Alternate 2.1	Alt								\$ 17.83	\$ 235,356.00	Max MS-ESL-SLG-12-BLK	\$45.59	\$601,788.00	Targus THD491GL			
Alternate 2.2	Alt											\$59.99	\$791,868.00	Kensington K97651WW			
Alternate 2.3	Alt																
Manufactured & Shipped Domestically					NO			YES			NO			YES			Yes