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Glaziou, Auguste François Marie (1828-1906)

Herbarium Natural History Museum (BM)

Collection Plant Collectors

Resource Type Reference Sources

First name Auguste François Marie

Last name Glaziou

Dates 1828-1906

Specification Plant collector

Description Glaziou, A.F.M. Groups: ABMPS. Organisations: A, B, BM,
BORD, BR, BRG, C, CM, DPU(NY), F, FI, G, GH, H, K, L, LE,
MA, MG, MICH, MO, MPA, MPU, NY, P, PC, PH, R, RB, S, SP,
STR, U, UPS, US, W, WRSL. Collected: (1861-1895) Europe:
France; Tropical South America: Guyana; Brazilian region:
Brazil (Espírito Santo, Goiás, Minas Gerais, Rio de Janeiro).
Associates: Cavalcanti, T.B. (1961-), Lund, P.W. (1801-1880),
Moura, J.T. de (1867-), Netto, L.S.M (1837-1893), Puiggari, J.I.
(1823-1900), Regnell, A.F. (1807-1884), Saldanha da Gama, J.
de (1839-1905), Salimena-Pires, F.R. (fl.1988-2002),
Schwacke, C.A.W. (1848-1904) (co-collector, distributor for),
Wittig, E. (fl.1870-1879) (co-collector). 2:229, 3:468, 19:26,
23:227, 34:588, 35:811, 35:861 French civil engineer. Born in
Lannon (Brittany), Auguste Glaziou arrived in Brazil in 1858 at
the age of 25, after qualifying as an engineer in Paris. Soon he
was appointed General Director of Public Gardens for the city
of Rio de Janeiro, duties which later expanded to include the
entire state and its forests. He began to botanize almost
immediately, gradually extending his explorations across the
state as far as Serra dos Orgues and Serra de Hatiaia. He later
made excursions to Minas Gerais, São Paulo, and, three times,
to Espiritu Santo, and spent his last two years in Brazil on an
extensive exploration of the state of Goyaz. His herbarium
amounted to more than 24,000 numbers, representing 12,000
species. Where possible, each number was collected in at least
ten duplicate sets that were deposited in Berlin, Paris, Brussels,
Kew, St Petersburg, Copenhagen, Stockholm, Geneva,
Montpellier, Rio de Janeiro, and sometimes to others. Glaziou
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also sent seeds and live plants to European botanical gardens.
In 1895 he retired and returned to France, settling in Bouscat,
near Bordeaux, where he spent his last years organising and
studying his collections. He published nothing until 1905, when
the first volume of his ‘Plantae Brasiliae Centralis a Glaziou
lectae’ appeared in the Bulletin de la Société de la France. It
enumerates systematically the species in his collection, with
precise localities, especially important as his distributions
generally did not come with any additional information apart
from their numbers. He died of a pulmonary infection soon after
the publication of the second volume. He is commemorated in
the names of hundreds of species and several genera:
Glaziova Bureau (Bignoniaceae), Glaziostelma E. Fourn.
(Asclepidaceae), Glaziophyton Franch. (Poaceae), Bisglaziovia
Cogn. (Melatomaceae), Glaziophytum Cogn. (Melastomaceae),
Neoglaziovia Metz (Bromeliaceae) and Glaziocharis Taub.
(Burmanniaceae).

Contributor Natural History Museum (BM)
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Organisation A, B, BM, BR, C, NY, G, K, L, MO, MPU, NY, P, S, U, US, W

Associate Cavalcanti, Taciana Barbosa (1961-), Lund, Peter Wilhelm
(1801-1880), Moura, Julia Trajano de (1867-), Netto, Ladislau
de Souza Mello e (1837-1893), Puiggari, Juan Ignacio
(1823-1900), Regnell, Anders Fredrik (1807-1884), Saldanha
da Gama, José de (1839-1905), Salimena-Pires, Prof. Fátima
Regina (fl. 1988-2002), Schwacke, Carl August Wilhelm
(1848-1904), Wittig, E. (fl. 1870-1879)
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