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Total Price $3,780.00 Total Price $98,823.01 Total Price $99,386.59 Total Price $99,661.47 Total Price $99,903.38 Total Price $100,225.00 Total Price $100,397.71 Total Price $100,572.00 Total Price $101,470.00 Total Price $104,128.23
Line # Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1 VMware vRealize Operations 6 Standard (25 VM Pack)VR6-OSTD25-C VMware VR6-OSTD25-P-SSS-F 12 each No Bid $734.86 $8,818.32 $739.04 $8,868.48 $742.51 $8,910.12 $742.90 $8,914.80 $745.31 $8,943.72 $746.57 $8,958.84 $747.00 $8,964.00 $760.00 $9,120.00 $774.30 $9,291.60
2 VMware vSphere 6 Enterprise Plus for 1 processorVS5-ENT-PL-C VMware VS6-EPL-P-SSS-C 14 each No Bid $481.49 $6,740.86 $484.23 $6,779.22 $486.51 $6,811.14 $486.76 $6,814.64 $488.33 $6,836.62 $489.16 $6,848.24 $489.00 $6,846.00 $495.00 $6,930.00 $507.33 $7,102.62
3 VMware vSphere 6 Enterprise Plus for 1 processorVS4-ENT-PL-C VMware VS6-EPL-P-SSS-F 96 each No Bid $798.84 $76,688.64 $803.38 $77,124.48 $805.14 $77,293.44 $807.58 $77,527.68 $810.20 $77,779.20 $811.57 $77,910.72 $812.00 $77,952.00 $819.00 $78,624.00 $841.72 $80,805.12
4 VMware vSphere 6 Enterprise Plus for 1 processorVS6-EPL-C VMware VS6-EPL-P-SSS-C 4 each $945.00 $3,780.00 $140.07 $560.28 $140.87 $563.48 $141.54 $566.16 $141.60 $566.40 $142.06 $568.24 $142.31 $569.24 $143.00 $572.00 $145.00 $580.00 $147.59 $590.36
5 VMware vSphere 6 with Operations Management Enterprise Plus for 1 processorVS6-OENT-O VMware VS6-OEPL-P-SSS-C 4 No Bid $1,033.94 $4,135.76 $1,039.61 $4,158.44 $1,044.51 $4,178.04 $1,045.05 $4,180.20 $1,048.44 $4,193.76 $1,050.21 $4,200.84 $1,050.00 $4,200.00 $1,070.00 $4,280.00 $1,089.23 $4,356.92
6 VMware vSphere 6 Standard for 1 processorVS6-STD-C Vmware VS6-STD-3P-SSS-C 3 each No Bid $51.77 $155.31 $52.07 $156.21 $52.31 $156.93 $52.33 $156.99 $52.51 $157.53 $52.59 $157.77 $53.00 $159.00 $54.00 $162.00 $54.55 $163.65
7 U.S. Federal VMware vSphere 6 Standard for 1 processorVS6-STD-F VMware VS6-STD-P-SSS-F 1 each No Bid $76.84 $76.84 $77.28 $77.28 $77.64 $77.64 $77.67 $77.67 $77.93 $77.93 $78.06 $78.06 $79.00 $79.00 $79.00 $79.00 $80.96 $80.96
8 U.S. Federal VMware AirWatch Green Management Suite Perpetual: 1 Device - Basic Support VMware VA-GMS-D-3G-SSS-F 300 each No Bid $5.49 $1,647.00 $5.53 $1,659.00 $5.56 $1,668.00 $5.55 $1,665.00 $5.56 $1,668.00 $5.58 $1,674.00 $6.00 $1,800.00 $5.65 $1,695.00 $5.79 $1,737.00
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